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inspect comments received at https://
cara.ecosystem-management.org/Public/ 
ReadingRoom?project=ORMS-2226. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Matt 
Arnn, Recreation Staff, (917) 597–6488, 
matthew.arnn@usda.gov or joey.perry@
usda.gov. Individuals who use 
telecommunication devices for the deaf 
may call the Federal Relay Service at 
800–877–8339 between 8:00 a.m. and 
8:00 p.m., Eastern Standard Time, 
Monday through Friday. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
handbook sets forth direction for the 
operation and maintenance of recreation 
sites by the Forest Service. Chapter 50 
recodes to this Forest Service Handbook 
chapter direction that is currently set 
out in FSM 2332 governing 
construction, operation, and 
maintenance of recreation sites by the 
Forest Service. In addition, Chapter 50 
includes direction on procedures for 
assuming operation of a concession site 
during a shoulder season. 

After the public comment period 
closes, the Forest Service will consider 
timely comments that are within the 
scope of the proposed directives in the 
development of the final directives. A 
notice of the final directives, including 
a response to timely comments, will be 
posted on the Forest Service’s web page 
at https://www.fs.fed.us/about-agency/ 
regulations-policies. 

Tina Johna Terrell, 
Associate Deputy Chief, National Forest 
System. 
[FR Doc. 2020–14785 Filed 7–8–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3411–15–P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Agenda and Notice of Public Meeting 
of the Colorado Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: Commission on Civil Rights. 
ACTION: Announcement of meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission), and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA) that a meeting of the Colorado 
Advisory Committee to the Commission 
will convene by conference call on 
Wednesday, July 15, 2020 at 2:00 p.m. 
The purpose of the meeting is to review 
a statement of concern on the 
naturalization backlog. 
DATES: Wednesday, July 15, 2020 at 2:00 
p.m. (MDT). 

Public Call-In Information: 1–800– 
367–2403; Conference ID: 9178397. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Barbara Delaviez, ero@usccr.gov or by 
phone at 202–539–8246. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Interested 
members of the public may listen to the 
discussion by calling the following toll- 
free conference call number: 1–800– 
367–2403; Conference ID: 9178397. 

Please be advised that, before being 
placed into the conference call, the 
conference call operator will ask callers 
to provide their names, their 
organizational affiliations (if any), and 
email addresses (so that callers may be 
notified of future meetings). Callers can 
expect to incur charges for calls they 
initiate over wireless lines, and the 
Commission will not refund any 
incurred charges. Callers will incur no 
charge for calls they initiate over land- 
line connections to the toll-free 
telephone number provided. 

Persons with hearing impairments 
may also follow the discussion by first 
calling the Federal Relay Service at 1– 
800–877–8339 and providing the 
operator with the toll-free conference 
call number: 1–800–367–2403; 
Conference ID: 9178397. 

Members of the public are invited to 
make statements during the open 
comment period of the meeting or email 
written comments. Written comments 
may be emailed to Barbara Delaviez at 
ero@usccr.gov approximately 30 days 
after each scheduled meeting. Persons 
who desire additional information may 
also contact Barbara Delaviez at (202) 
539–8246. 

Records and documents discussed 
during the meeting will be available for 
public viewing as they become available 
at this FACA Link; click the ‘‘Meeting 
Details’’ and ‘‘Documents’’ links. 
Persons interested in the work of this 
advisory committee are advised to go to 
the Commission’s website, 
www.usccr.gov, or to contact Evelyn 
Bohor at the above phone number or 
email address. 

Agenda: Wednesday, July 15, 2020 at 
2:00 p.m. (MDT) 

I. Roll Call 
II. Review Statement of Concern on the 

Naturalization Backlog 
III. Other Business 
IV. Open Comment 
V. Adjournment 

Dated: July 2, 2020. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2020–14783 Filed 7–8–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[B–13–2020] 

Foreign-Trade Zone (FTZ) 124— 
Gramercy, Louisiana; Authorization of 
Production Activity; Offshore Energy 
Services, Inc.; (Line Pipe With Weld-On 
Housings and Connectors); Broussard, 
Louisiana 

On March 5, 2020, the Port of South 
Louisiana, grantee of FTZ 124, 
submitted a notification of proposed 
production activity to the FTZ Board on 
behalf of Offshore Energy Services, Inc., 
within Subzone 124T, in Broussard, 
Louisiana. 

The notification was processed in 
accordance with the regulations of the 
FTZ Board (15 CFR part 400), including 
notice in the Federal Register inviting 
public comment (85 FR 14460, March 
12, 2020). On July 6, 2020, the applicant 
was notified of the FTZ Board’s decision 
that no further review of the activity is 
warranted at this time. The production 
activity described in the notification 
was authorized, subject to the FTZ Act 
and the FTZ Board’s regulations, 
including Section 400.14. 

Dated: July 6, 2020. 
Andrew McGilvray, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–14800 Filed 7–8–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[S–81–2020] 

Approval of Expansion of Subzone 7F; 
Puma Energy Caribe, LLC, Carolina, 
Puerto Rico 

On May 11, 2020, the Executive 
Secretary of the Foreign-Trade Zones 
(FTZ) Board docketed an application 
submitted by the Puerto Rico Industrial 
Development Company, grantee of FTZ 
7, requesting an expansion of Subzone 
7F subject to the existing activation 
limit of FTZ 7, on behalf of Puma 
Energy Caribe, LLC, in Carolina, Puerto 
Rico. 

The application was processed in 
accordance with the FTZ Act and 
Regulations, including notice in the 
Federal Register inviting public 
comment (85 FR 20397, May 15, 2020). 
The FTZ staff examiner reviewed the 
application and determined that it 
meets the criteria for approval. 

Pursuant to the authority delegated to 
the FTZ Board’s Executive Secretary (15 
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