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Mission Areas, agencies, staff offices, 
employees, and institutions 
participating in or administering USDA 
programs are prohibited from 
discriminating based on race, color, 
national origin, religion, sex, gender 
identity (including gender expression), 
sexual orientation, disability, age, 
marital status, family/parental status, 
income derived from a public assistance 
program, political beliefs, or reprisal or 
retaliation for prior civil rights activity, 
in any program or activity conducted or 
funded by USDA (not all bases apply to 
all programs). Remedies and complaint 
filing deadlines vary by program or 
incident. 

Program information may be made 
available in languages other than 
English. Persons with disabilities who 
require alternative means of 
communication to obtain program 
information (e.g., Braille, large print, 
audiotape, American Sign Language) 
should contact the responsible Mission 
Area, agency, or staff office; the USDA 
TARGET Center at (202) 720–2600 
(voice and TTY); or the Federal Relay 
Service at (800) 877–8339. 

To file a program discrimination 
complaint, a complainant should 
complete a Form AD–3027, USDA 
Program Discrimination Complaint 
Form, which can be obtained online at 
https://www.usda.gov/forms/electronic- 
forms, from any USDA office, by calling 
(866) 632–9992, or by writing a letter 
addressed to USDA. The letter must 
contain the complainant’s name, 
address, telephone number, and a 
written description of the alleged 
discriminatory action in sufficient detail 
to inform the Assistant Secretary for 
Civil Rights (ASCR) about the nature 
and date of an alleged civil rights 
violation. The completed AD–3027 form 
or letter must be submitted to USDA by: 

(1) Mail: U.S. Department of 
Agriculture, Office of the Assistant 
Secretary for Civil Rights, 1400 
Independence Avenue SW, Washington, 
DC 20250–9410; 

(2) Fax: (833) 256–1665 or (202) 690– 
7442; or 

(3) Email: program.intake@usda.gov. 
USDA is an equal opportunity 

provider, employer, and lender. Equal 
opportunity practices in accordance 
with USDA’s policies will be followed 
in all member appointments to the 
committee. To ensure that the 
recommendations of the committee 
consider the needs of the diverse groups 
served by USDA, membership shall 
include, to the extent practicable, 
individuals with demonstrated ability to 
represent the many communities, 
identities, races, ethnicities, 
backgrounds, abilities, cultures, and 

beliefs of the American people, 
including underserved communities. 

Cikena Reid, 
Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2024–19372 Filed 8–27–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–DM–P 

CHEMICAL SAFETY AND HAZARD 
INVESTIGATION BOARD 

Sunshine Act Meetings 

TIME AND DATE:  
Thursday, October 24, 2024, 2 p.m. 

ET (2 hours). 
Thursday, January 23, 2025, 2 p.m. ET 

(2 hours). 
Thursday, April 24, 2025, 2 p.m. ET 

(2 hours). 
Thursday, July 24, 2025, 2 p.m. ET (2 

hours). 
PLACE: The meetings will be held 
virtually via ZOOM. Links are below 
and will be available at: www.csb.gov. 
October 24, 2024: https://

www.zoomgov.com/j/1603513639 
January 23, 2025: https://

www.zoomgov.com/j/1613281492 
April 24, 2025: https://

www.zoomgov.com/j/1600374067 
July 24, 2025: https://

www.zoomgov.com/j/1609072832 
STATUS: Open to the public. 
MATTERS TO BE CONSIDERED: The 
Chemical Safety and Hazard 
Investigation Board (CSB) will convene 
public meetings on October 24, 2024; 
January 23, 2025; April 24, 2025; and, 
July 24, 2025, at 2 p.m. ET. These 
meetings serve to fulfill the CSB’s 
requirement to hold a minimum of four 
public meetings for Fiscal Year 2025 
pursuant to 40 CFR 1600.5(c). The 
Board will review the CSB’s progress in 
meeting its mission and as appropriate 
highlight safety products newly released 
through investigations and safety 
recommendations. 
CONTACT PERSON FOR MORE INFORMATION: 
Hillary Cohen, Communications 
Manager, at public@csb.gov or (202) 
446–8094. Further information about 
these public meetings can be found on 
the CSB website at: www.csb.gov. 

Additional Information 

Background 

The CSB is an independent Federal 
agency charged with investigating 
incidents and hazards that result, or 
may result, in the catastrophic release of 
extremely hazardous substances. The 
agency’s Board Members are appointed 
by the President and confirmed by the 
Senate. CSB investigations look into all 
aspects of chemical accidents and 

hazards, including physical causes such 
as equipment failure as well as 
inadequacies in regulations, industry 
standards, and safety management 
systems. 

Public Participation 

The meetings are free and open to the 
public. These meetings will only be 
available via ZOOM. Close captions 
(CC) will be provided. At the close of 
each meeting, there will be an 
opportunity for public comment. To 
submit public comments for the record 
please email the agency at public@
csb.gov. 

Dated: August 23, 2024. 
Tamara Qureshi, 
Assistant General Counsel, Chemical Safety 
and Hazard Investigation Board. 
[FR Doc. 2024–19371 Filed 8–26–24; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 6350–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Economic Development Administration 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
Review and Approval; Comment 
Request; Application Materials for EDA 
Investment Assistance 

AGENCY: Economic Development 
Administration, Department of 
Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice of information collection, 
request for comment. 

SUMMARY: The Department of 
Commerce, in accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA), invites the general public and 
other Federal agencies to comment on 
proposed, and continuing information 
collections, which helps us assess the 
impact of our information collection 
requirements and minimize the public’s 
reporting burden. The purpose of this 
notice is to allow for 60 days of public 
comment preceding submission of the 
collection to OMB. 
DATES: To ensure consideration, 
comments regarding this proposed 
information collection must be received 
on or before October 28, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit written comments to 
Bernadette Grafton, Program Analyst, 
Performance, Research and National 
Technical Assistance Division, 
Economic Development Administration, 
U.S. Department of Commerce, via 
email at bgrafton1@eda.gov. You may 
also submit comments to 
PRAcomments@doc.gov. Please 
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reference OMB Control Number 0610– 
0094 in the subject line of your 
comments. Do not submit Confidential 
Business Information or otherwise 
sensitive or protected information. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional information or 
specific questions related to collection 
activities should be directed to 
Bernadette Grafton, Program Analyst, 
Performance, Research and National 
Technical Assistance Division, 
Economic Development Administration, 
U.S. Department of Commerce, via 
phone at (202) 482–2917 or via email at 
bgrafton1@eda.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Abstract 

The Economic Development 
Administration (EDA) leads the Federal 
economic development agenda by 
promoting innovation and 
competitiveness, preparing American 
regions for growth and success in the 
worldwide economy. Guided by the 
basic principle that sustainable 
economic development should be 
locally-driven, EDA works directly with 
communities and regions to help them 
build the capacity for economic 
development based on local business 
conditions and needs. The Public Works 
and Economic Development Act of 1965 
(PWEDA) (42 U.S.C. 3121 et seq.) is 
EDA’s organic authority and is the 
primary legal authority under which 
EDA awards financial assistance. Under 
PWEDA, EDA provides financial 
assistance to both rural and urban 
distressed communities by fostering 
entrepreneurship, innovation, and 
productivity through investments in 
infrastructure development, capacity 
building, and business development in 
order to attract private capital 
investments and new and better jobs to 
regions experiencing economic distress. 
Further information on EDA programs 
and financial assistance opportunities 
can be found at www.eda.gov. 

EDA must collect specific information 
from financial assistance applicants to 
evaluate whether proposed projects 
satisfy eligibility and programmatic 
requirements contained in PWEDA, 
EDA regulations at 13 CFR chapter III, 
and applicable Notices of Funding 
Opportunity (NOFOs). The purpose of 
this notice is to seek comments from the 
public and other Federal agencies 
regarding EDA’s proposed extension of 
the application materials under this 
information collection: Forms ED–900 
(General Application (GA) for EDA 
Programs), ED–900B (Beneficiary 
Information Form), ED–900C (EDA 
Application Supplement for 

Construction Programs), ED–900D 
(Requirements for Design and 
Engineering Assistance), ED–900E 
(Calculation of Estimated Relocation 
and Land Acquisition Expenses), and 
ED–900F (Additional EDA Assurances 
for Revolving Loan Fund Investments). 

II. Method of Collection 

EDA collects information from 
financial assistance applicants 
electronically through Grants.gov, or, in 
very rare instances, via email or paper 
submission. 

III. Data 

OMB Control Number: 0610–0094. 
Form Number(s): ED–900, ED–900B, 

ED–900C, ED–900D, ED–900E, ED– 
900F. Type of Review: Extension of a 
currently approved information 
collection. 

Affected Public: Entities eligible for 
EDA financial assistance, including not- 
for-profit entities; Federal, State, local, 
and Tribal governments; and businesses 
or other for-profit organizations. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
For construction projects, 977 estimated 
respondents, and for non-construction 
projects, 1,663 estimated respondents, 
for a total of 2,640 estimated 
respondents. 

Estimated Time per Response: For 
construction projects, 43.0 estimated 
hours per response, and for non- 
construction projects, 17.1 estimated 
hours per response. 

Estimated Total Annual Burden 
Hours: For construction projects, 42,011 
estimated annual burden hours, and for 
non-construction projects, 28,437 
estimated annual burden hours, for a 
total of 70,448 estimated total annual 
burden hours. 

Estimated Total Annual Cost to 
Public: $4,065,554. 

Respondent’s Obligation: Mandatory. 
Legal Authority: The Public Works 

and Economic Development Act of 1965 
(42 U.S.C. 3121 et seq.). 

IV. Request for Comments 

We are soliciting public comments to 
permit the Department/Bureau to: (a) 
Evaluate whether the proposed 
information collection is necessary for 
the proper functions of the Department, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; (b) Evaluate the 
accuracy of our estimate of the time and 
cost burden for this proposed collection, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (c) 
Evaluate ways to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information to 
be collected; and (d) Minimize the 
reporting burden on those who are to 
respond, including the use of automated 

collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

Comments that you submit in 
response to this notice are a matter of 
public record. We will include or 
summarize each comment in our request 
to OMB to approve this ICR. Before 
including your address, phone number, 
email address, or other personal 
identifying information in your 
comment, you should be aware that 
your entire comment—including your 
personal identifying information—may 
be made publicly available at any time. 
While you may ask us in your comment 
to withhold your personal identifying 
information from public review, we 
cannot guarantee that we will be able to 
do so. 

Sheleen Dumas, 
Department PRA Clearance Officer, Office of 
the Under Secretary of Economic Affairs, 
Commerce Department. 
[FR Doc. 2024–19321 Filed 8–27–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–34–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Bureau of Industry and Security 

Materials and Equipment Technical 
Advisory Committee; Notice of 
Partially Closed Meeting 

The Materials and Equipment 
Technical Advisory Committee will 
meet on September 12, 2024, 10:00 
a.m.–3:30 p.m., Eastern Daylight Time, 
in the Herbert C. Hoover Building, 
Room 3884, 1401 Constitution Avenue 
NW, Washington, DC (enter through 
Main Entrance on 14th Street between 
Constitution and Pennsylvania 
Avenues). The Committee advises and 
assists the Secretary of Commerce 
(Secretary) and other Federal officials 
and agencies with respect to actions 
designed to carry out the policy set forth 
in Section 1752(1)(A) of the Export 
Control Reform Act. The purpose of the 
meeting is to have Committee members 
and U.S. Government representatives 
mutually review updated technical data 
and policy-driving information that has 
been gathered. 

Agenda 

Open Session 
1. Opening Remarks and Introduction 

by BIS Senior Management. 
2. Report from working groups. 
3. Public comments and Proposals. 

Closed Session 
4. Discussion of matters determined to 

be exempt from the open meeting and 
public participation requirements found 
in sections 1009(a)(1) and 1009(a)(3) of 
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