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1 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(1). 
2 17 CFR 240.19b–4. 

3 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(3)(A)(ii). 
4 17 CFR 240.19b–4(f)(2). 
5 A Member is any registered broker or dealer that 

has been admitted to membership in the Exchange. 

Effective Date: 05/07/2010. 
Physical Loan Application Deadline 

Date: 07/02/2010. 
EIDL Loan Application Deadline Date: 

02/03/2011. 
ADDRESSES: Submit completed loan 
applications to: U.S. Small Business 
Administration, Processing and 
Disbursement Center, 14925 Kingsport 
Road, Fort Worth, TX 76155. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: A. 
Escobar, Office of Disaster Assistance, 
U.S. Small Business Administration, 
409 3rd Street, SW., Suite 6050, 
Washington, DC 20416. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The notice 
of the Presidential disaster declaration 
for the State of Alabama, dated 05/03/ 
2010 is hereby amended to include the 
following areas as adversely affected by 
the disaster: 
Primary Counties (Physical Damage and 

Economic Injury Loans): Walker. 
Contiguous Counties (Economic Injury 

Loans Only): 
Alabama: Fayette, Jefferson, Marion, 

Tuscaloosa, Winston. 
All other information in the original 

declaration remains unchanged. 
(Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance 
Numbers 59002 and 59008) 

James E. Rivera, 
Associate Administrator for Disaster 
Assistance. 
[FR Doc. 2010–11745 Filed 5–17–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8025–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[File No. 500–1] 

Broadengate Systems, Inc., (n/k/a Otter 
Lake Resources, Inc.); Order of 
Suspension of Trading 

May 14, 2010. 
It appears to the Securities and 

Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Broadengate 
Systems, Inc. (n/k/a Otter Lake 
Resources, Inc.) because it has not filed 
any periodic reports since the period 
ended September 30, 2002. 

The Commission is of the opinion that 
the public interest and the protection of 
investors require a suspension of trading 
in the securities of the above-listed 
company. Therefore, it is ordered, 
pursuant to Section 12(k) of the 
Securities Exchange Act of 1934, that 
trading in the securities of the above- 
listed company is suspended for the 
period from 9:30 a.m. EDT on May 14, 
2010 and terminating at 11:59 p.m. EDT 
on May 27, 2010. 

By the Commission. 
Jill M. Peterson, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2010–11953 Filed 5–14–10; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[File No. 500–1] 

China Technology Global Corp.; Order 
of Suspension of Trading 

May 14, 2010. 
It appears to the Securities and 

Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of China 
Technology Global Corp. because it has 
not filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended March 31, 2005. 

The Commission is of the opinion that 
the public interest and the protection of 
investors require a suspension of trading 
in the securities of the above-listed 
company. Therefore, it is ordered, 
pursuant to Section 12(k) of the 
Securities Exchange Act of 1934, that 
trading in the securities of the above- 
listed company is suspended for the 
period from 9:30 a.m. EDT on May 14, 
2010 and terminating at 11:59 p.m. EDT 
on May 27, 2010. 

By the Commission. 
Jill M. Peterson, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2010–11952 Filed 5–14–10; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 8010–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[Release No. 34–62074; File No. SR–BATS– 
2010–012] 

Self-Regulatory Organizations; BATS 
Exchange, Inc.; Notice of Filing and 
Immediate Effectiveness of Proposed 
Rule Change Related to Fees for Use 
of BATS Exchange, Inc. 

May 11, 2010. 
Pursuant to Section 19(b)(1) of the 

Securities Exchange Act of 1934 (the 
‘‘Act’’),1 and Rule 19b–4 thereunder,2 
notice is hereby given that on May 4, 
2010, BATS Exchange, Inc. (the 
‘‘Exchange’’ or ‘‘BATS’’) filed with the 
Securities and Exchange Commission 
(‘‘Commission’’) the proposed rule 
change as described in Items I, II and III 
below, which Items have been prepared 
by the Exchange. BATS has designated 
the proposed rule change as one 

establishing or changing a member due, 
fee, or other charge imposed by the 
Exchange under Section 19(b)(3)(A)(ii) 
of the Act 3 and Rule 19b–4(f)(2) 
thereunder,4 which renders the 
proposed rule change effective upon 
filing with the Commission. The 
Commission is publishing this notice to 
solicit comments on the proposed rule 
change from interested persons. 

I. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Terms of Substance of 
the Proposed Rule Change 

The Exchange proposes to modify its 
fee schedule applicable to Members 5 of 
the Exchange pursuant to BATS Rules 
15.1(a) and (c). Changes to the fee 
schedule pursuant to this proposal will 
be effective upon filing. 

The text of the proposed rule change 
is available at the Exchange’s Web site 
at http://www.batstrading.com, on the 
Commission’s Web site at http:// 
www.sec.gov, at the principal office of 
the Exchange, and at the Commission’s 
Public Reference Room. 

II. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Purpose of, and 
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule 
Change 

In its filing with the Commission, the 
Exchange included statements 
concerning the purpose of and basis for 
the proposed rule change and discussed 
any comments it received on the 
proposed rule change. The text of these 
statements may be examined at the 
places specified in Item IV below. The 
Exchange has prepared summaries, set 
forth in Sections A, B, and C below, of 
the most significant parts of such 
statements. 

(A) Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Purpose of, and 
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule 
Change 

1. Purpose 
The Exchange proposes to modify its 

fee schedule applicable to use of the 
Exchange in order to amend the fees for 
its BATS + NYSE destination specific 
routing option to continue to offer a 
‘‘one under’’ pricing model. 

The Exchange has previously 
provided a discounted price fee for 
Destination Specific Orders routed to 
certain of the largest market centers 
measured by volume (NYSE, NYSE Arca 
and NASDAQ), which, in each instance 
has been $0.0001 less per share for 
orders routed to such market centers by 
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