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provide comments (i.e., opinions) on 
publicly available scientific data in 
SRDR. Registration data will be 
collected from these users; (3) ‘‘General 
public’’ users only view scientific data 
publicly available in SRDR. No data will 
be collected from these type of users. 

All Contributors and Commentators 
will undergo a simple self-registration 
process by providing a username, 
password, email address, and 
institution. Collection of registration 
data from Contributors and 

Commentators is required due to the use 
of SRDR both as a database and as a tool 
for assisting in the production of a SR, 
including providing comments in the 
various sections of a particular project 
on SRDR. In addition, provision of an 
email address and institution 
information allows the administrators of 
SRDR to confirm that requests are being 
made by actual people and not 
potentially malicious software code 
such as bots and other cybersecurity 
threats. 

Estimated Annual Respondent Burden 

Exhibit 1 shows the estimated 
annualized burden hours for the 
respondents’ time to participate in the 
SRDR. In 2017, 176 users registered as 
Commentators and 206 users registered 
as Contributors. Registration will take 
approximately 2 minutes per user. We 
thus calculate the total burden hours 
required for registration for all users 
annually is 12.73 hours. 

EXHIBIT 1—ESTIMATED ANNUALIZED BURDEN HOURS 

Form name Number of 
respondents 

Number of 
responses per 

respondent 

Hours per 
response 

Total 
burden hours 

Registration of users as Commentators or Contributors ................................. 382 1 2/60 12.73 

Total .......................................................................................................... 382 ........................ ........................ 12.73 

Exhibit 2 shows the estimated cost 
burden associated with the respondents’ 

time to participate in the SRDR. The 
total cost burden to respondents is 

estimated at an average of $501.82 
annually. 

EXHIBIT 2—ESTIMATED ANNUALIZED COST BURDEN 

Form name Number of 
respondents 

Total 
burden hours 

Average 
hourly 

wage rate * 

Total cost 
burden 

Registration of users as Commentators or Contributors ................................. 382 12.73 a $39.42 $501.82 

Total .......................................................................................................... 382 12.73 ........................ 501.82 

* National Compensation Survey: Occupational wages in the United States May 2018, ‘‘U.S. Department of Labor, Bureau of Labor Statistics.’’ 
Available at: https://www.bls.gov/oes/current/oes290000.htm. 

a Based on the mean wages for Healthcare Practitioners and Technical Occupations, 29–0000. 

Request for Comments 

In accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act, comments on AHRQ’s 
information collection are requested 
with regard to any of the following: (a) 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of AHRQ’s health care 
research and health care information 
dissemination functions, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; (b) the accuracy of 
AHRQ’s estimate of burden (including 
hours and costs) of the proposed 
collection(s) of information; (c) ways to 
enhance the quality, utility and clarity 
of the information to be collected; and 
(d) ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information upon the 
respondents, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

Comments submitted in response to 
this notice will be summarized and 
included in AHRQ’s subsequent request 
for OMB approval of the proposed 
information collection. All comments 
will become a matter of public record. 

Dated: August 13, 2019. 
Virginia L. Mackay-Smith, 
Associate Director. 
[FR Doc. 2019–17652 Filed 8–15–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4160–90–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention 

Meeting of the Community Preventive 
Services Task Force (CPSTF) 

AGENCY: Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention (CDC), Department of Health 
and Human Services (HHS). 

ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention within the 
Department of Health and Human 
Services announces the next meeting of 
the Community Preventive Services 
Task Force (CPSTF) on October 16–17, 
2019, in Atlanta, Georgia. 

DATES: The meeting will be held on 
Wednesday, October 16, 2019, from 8:30 
a.m. to 6:00 p.m. EDT, and Thursday, 
October 17, 2019, from 8:30 a.m. to 1:00 
p.m. EDT. 

ADDRESSES: The CPSTF Meeting will be 
held at the CDC Edward R. Roybal 
Campus, Centers for Disease Control 
and Prevention Headquarters (Building 
19), 1600 Clifton Road NE, Atlanta, GA 
30329. You should be aware that the 
meeting location is in a Federal 
government building; therefore, Federal 
security measures are applicable. For 
additional information, please see 
Roybal Campus Security Guidelines 
under SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION. 
Information regarding meeting logistics 
will be available on the Community 
Guide website 
(www.thecommunityguide.org) closer to 
the date of the meeting. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Onslow Smith, Center for Surveillance, 
Epidemiology and Laboratory Services; 
Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention, 1600 Clifton Road NE, MS– 
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E–69, Atlanta, GA 30329, phone: (404) 
498–6778, email: CPSTF@cdc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Meeting Accessibility: This space- 
limited meeting is open to the public. 
All meeting attendees must register. To 
ensure completion of required security 
procedures and access to the CDC’s 
Global Communications Center, U.S. 
citizens intending to attend in person 
must register by October 11, 2019, and 
non-U.S. citizens intending to attend in 
person must register by September 11, 
2019. Failure to register by the dates 
identified could result in the inability to 
attend the CPSTF meeting in person. 

Those unable to attend the meeting in 
person are able to do so via Webcast. 
CDC will send the Webcast URL to 
registrants upon receipt of their 
registration. All meeting attendees must 
register by October 11, 2019 to receive 
the webcast information. CDC will email 
webcast information from the CPSTF@
cdc.gov mailbox. 

To register for the meeting, whether to 
attend in person or via webcast, 
individuals should send an email to 
CPSTF@cdc.gov and include the 
following information: name, title, 
organization name, organization 
address, phone, email, and whether 
attending in person or via webcast. 

Public Comment: A public comment 
period, limited to three minutes per 
person, will follow the CPSTF’s 
discussion of each systematic review. 
Individuals wishing to make public 
comments must indicate their desire to 
do so with their registration by 
providing their name, organizational 
affiliation, and the topic to be addressed 
(if known). Public comments will 
become part of the meeting summary. 
Public comment is not possible via 
Webcast. 

Background on the CPSTF: The 
CPSTF is an independent, nonfederal 
panel whose members are appointed by 
the CDC Director. CPSTF members 
represent a broad range of research, 
practice, and policy expertise in 
prevention, wellness, health promotion, 
and public health. The CPSTF was 
convened in 1996 by the Department of 
Health and Human Services (HHS) to 
identify community preventive 
programs, services, and policies that 
increase healthy longevity, save lives 
and dollars, and improve Americans’ 
quality of life. CDC is mandated to 
provide ongoing administrative, 
research, and technical support for the 
operations of the CPSTF. During its 
meetings, the CPSTF considers the 
findings of systematic reviews on 
existing research and practice-based 
evidence and issues recommendations. 

CPSTF recommendations are not 
mandates for compliance or spending. 
Instead, they provide information about 
evidence-based options that decision 
makers and stakeholders can consider 
when they are determining what best 
meets the specific needs, preferences, 
available resources, and constraints of 
their jurisdictions and constituents. The 
CPSTF’s recommendations, along with 
the systematic reviews of the evidence 
on which they are based, are compiled 
in the The Community Guide. 

Matters proposed for discussion: 
Cancer Prevention and Control; Obesity 
Prevention and Control; Pregnancy 
Health; and Tobacco Cessation. 

The agenda is subject to change 
without notice. 

Roybal Campus Security Guidelines: 
The Edward R. Roybal Campus is the 
headquarters of the CDC and is located 
at 1600 Clifton Road NE, Atlanta, 
Georgia. The meeting is being held in a 
Federal government building; therefore, 
Federal security measures are 
applicable. 

All meeting attendees must register by 
the dates outlined under Meeting 
Accessability. In planning your arrival 
time, please take into account the need 
to park and clear security. All visitors 
must enter the Edward R. Roybal 
Campus through the front entrance on 
Clifton Road. Vehicles may be searched, 
and the guard force will then direct 
visitors to the designated parking area. 
Upon arrival at the facility, visitors must 
present government-issued photo 
identification (e.g., a valid federal 
identification badge, state driver’s 
license, state non-driver’s identification 
card, or passport). Non-United States 
citizens must complete the required 
security paperwork prior to the meeting 
date and must present a valid passport, 
visa, Permanent Resident Card, or other 
type of work authorization document 
upon arrival at the facility. Instructions 
for completing the required security 
paperwork will be provided after 
registration. All persons entering the 
building must pass through a metal 
detector. CDC Security personnel will 
issue a visitor’s ID badge at the entrance 
to Building 19. Visitors may receive an 
escort to the meeting room. All items 
brought to HHS/CDC are subject to 
inspection. 

Dated: August 13, 2019. 

Sandra Cashman, 
Executive Secretary, Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention. 
[FR Doc. 2019–17658 Filed 8–15–19; 8:45 am] 
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AGENCY: Centers for Medicare & 
Medicaid Services, HHS. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Centers for Medicare & 
Medicaid Services (CMS) is announcing 
an opportunity for the public to 
comment on CMS’ intention to collect 
information from the public. Under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (the 
PRA), federal agencies are required to 
publish notice in the Federal Register 
concerning each proposed collection of 
information (including each proposed 
extension or reinstatement of an existing 
collection of information) and to allow 
60 days for public comment on the 
proposed action. Interested persons are 
invited to send comments regarding our 
burden estimates or any other aspect of 
this collection of information, including 
the necessity and utility of the proposed 
information collection for the proper 
performance of the agency’s functions, 
the accuracy of the estimated burden, 
ways to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected, and the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology to minimize the 
information collection burden. 
DATES: Comments must be received by 
October 15, 2019. 
ADDRESSES: When commenting, please 
reference the document identifier or 
OMB control number. To be assured 
consideration, comments and 
recommendations must be submitted in 
any one of the following ways: 

1. Electronically. You may send your 
comments electronically to http://
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for ‘‘Comment or 
Submission’’ or ‘‘More Search Options’’ 
to find the information collection 
document(s) that are accepting 
comments. 

2. By regular mail. You may mail 
written comments to the following 
address: CMS, Office of Strategic 
Operations and Regulatory Affairs, 
Division of Regulations Development, 
Attention: Document Identifier/OMB 
Control Number ll, Room C4–26–05, 
7500 Security Boulevard, Baltimore, 
Maryland 21244–1850. 
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