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DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Delegation of Authority No. 453] 

Delegation of Authority to the Under 
Secretary of State for Arms Control 
and International Security To Concur 
With the Use of the Coalition Support 
Fund, Including the Coalition 
Readiness Support Program 

By virtue of the authority vested in 
the Secretary of State, including section 
1 of the State Department Basic 
Authorities Act (22 U.S.C. 2651a) and 
section 1233 of the National Defense 
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2008 
(Pub. L. 110–181) (FY 2008 NDAA), I 
hereby delegate to the Under Secretary 
of State for Arms Control and 
International Security, to the extent 
authorized by law, the authority to 
concur with the Secretary of Defense’s 
use of the Coalition Support Fund, 
including the Coalition Readiness 
Support Program, pursuant to section 
1233 of the FY 2008 NDAA. 

Notwithstanding this delegation of 
authority, any function or authority 
delegated herein may be exercised by 
the Secretary or the Deputy Secretary. 
Any reference in this delegation of 
authority to any statute shall be deemed 
to be a reference to such statute as 
amended from time to time, and shall be 
deemed to apply to any provision of law 
that is the same or substantially the 
same as such statute. 

This delegation of authority shall be 
published in the Federal Register. 

Dated: August 21, 2018. 
Michael R. Pompeo, 
Secretary of State. 
[FR Doc. 2018–20060 Filed 9–13–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–25–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Delegation of Authority No. 458] 

Delegation of Authority to the Under 
Secretary of State for Arms Control 
and International Security To Concur 
With the Use of Security Assistance for 
Baltic Nations for a Joint Program for 
Interoperability and Deterrence 
Against Aggression 

By virtue of the authority vested in 
the Secretary of State, including section 
1 of the State Department Basic 
Authorities Act (22 U.S.C. 2651a) and 
section 1279D of the National Defense 
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2018 
(Pub. L. 115–91) (FY 2018 NOAA), I 
hereby delegate to the Under Secretary 
of State for Arms Control and 
International Security, to the extent 
authorized by law, the authority to 

concur with the Secretary of Defense’s 
use of the authority to provide security 
assistance for Baltic nations for a joint 
program for interoperability and 
deterrence against aggression, pursuant 
to section 1279D of the FY 2018 NDAA. 

Notwithstanding this delegation of 
authority, any function or authority 
delegated herein may be exercised by 
the Secretary or the Deputy Secretary. 
Any reference in this delegation of 
authority to any statute shall be deemed 
to be a reference to such statute as 
amended from time to time, and shall be 
deemed to apply to any provision of law 
that is the same or substantially the 
same as such statute. 

This delegation of authority shall be 
published in the Federal Register. 

Dated: August 21, 2018. 
Michael R. Pompeo, 
Secretary of State. 
[FR Doc. 2018–20057 Filed 9–13–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–25–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Delegation of Authority No. 452] 

Delegation of Authority to the Under 
Secretary of State for Arms Control 
and International Security To Concur 
With the Use of the Southeast Asia 
Maritime Security Initiative Authority 

By virtue of the authority vested in 
the Secretary of State, including section 
1 of the State Department Basic 
Authorities Act (22 U.S.C. 2651a) and 
section 1263 of the National Defense 
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2016 
(Pub. L. 114–92) (FY 2016 NDAA), I 
hereby delegate to the Under Secretary 
of State for Arms Control and 
International Security, to the extent 
authorized by law, the authority to 
concur with the Secretary of Defense’s 
use of the Southeast Asia Maritime 
Security Initiative authority, pursuant to 
section 1263 of the FY 2016 NDAA. 

Notwithstanding this delegation of 
authority, any function or authority 
delegated herein may be exercised by 
the Secretary or the Deputy Secretary. 
Any reference in this delegation of 
authority to any statute shall be deemed 
to be a reference to such statute as 
amended from time to time, and shall be 
deemed to apply to any provision of law 
that is the same or substantially the 
same as such statute. 

This delegation of authority shall be 
published in the Federal Register. 

Dated: August 21, 2018. 
Michael R. Pompeo, 
Secretary of State. 
[FR Doc. 2018–20056 Filed 9–13–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–25–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Delegation of Authority No. 459] 

Delegation of Authority to the Director 
of the Office of U.S. Foreign 
Assistance Resources Under Section 
7076(b)(3) of the Department of State, 
Foreign Operations, and Related 
Programs Appropriations Act, 2018 

By virtue of the authority vested in 
the Secretary of State, including section 
1 of the State Department Basic 
Authorities Act (22 U.S.C. 2651a) and 
section 7076(b)(3) of the Department of 
State, Foreign Operations, and Related 
Programs Appropriations Act, 2018 
(Division K, Pub. L. 115–141) (FY 2018 
SFOAA), I hereby delegate to the 
Director of the Office of U.S. Foreign 
Assistance Resources, to the extent 
authorized by law, the authority to 
determine whether the obligation of up 
to 10 percent of the funds contained in 
a spend plan required by section 
7076(b) of the FY 2018 SFOAA is 
necessary to avoid significant 
programmatic disruption. 

Notwithstanding this delegation of 
authority, any function or authority 
delegated herein may be exercised by 
the Secretary or the Deputy Secretary. 
Any reference in this delegation of 
authority to a statute shall be deemed to 
be a reference to such statute as 
amended from time to time and shall be 
deemed to apply to any provision of law 
that is the same or substantially the 
same as such statute. 

This delegation of authority shall be 
published in the Federal Register. 

Dated: September 5, 2018. 
Michael R. Pompeo, 
Secretary of State, Department of State. 
[FR Doc. 2018–20062 Filed 9–13–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–10–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Delegation of Authority No. 456] 

Delegation of Authority to the Under 
Secretary of State for Arms Control 
and International Security To Concur 
With the Use of the Counter-Isis Train 
and Equip Fund 

By virtue of the authority vested in 
the Secretary of State, including section 
1 of the State Department Basic 
Authorities Act (22 U.S.C. 2651a) and 
the Counter-ISIS Train and Equip 
(CTEF) heading of the Department of 
Defense Appropriations Act, 2018 (Div. 
C, Pub. L. 115–141) (FY 2018 DoD 
Appropriations Act) and section 1236 of 
the National Defense Authorization Act 
for Fiscal Year 2015 (Pub. L. 113–291), 
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I hereby delegate to the Under Secretary 
of State for Arms Control and 
International Security, to the extent 
authorized by law, the authority to 
concur with the Secretary of Defense’s 
use of the CTEF authority, consistent 
with the CTEF heading of the FY 2018 
DoD Appropriations Act and section 
1236. 

Notwithstanding this delegation of 
authority, any function or authority 
delegated herein may be exercised by 
the Secretary or the Deputy Secretary. 
Any reference in this delegation of 
authority to any statute shall be deemed 
to be a reference to such statute as 
amended from time to time, and shall be 
deemed to apply to any provision of law 
that is the same or substantially the 
same as such statute. 

This delegation of authority shall be 
published in the Federal Register. 

Dated: August 21, 2018. 
Michael R. Pompeo, 
Secretary of State. 
[FR Doc. 2018–20053 Filed 9–13–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–25–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Delegation of Authority No. 454] 

Delegation to the Under Secretary of 
State for Arms Control and 
International Security To Concur With 
the Use of the Authority To Provide 
Support to Certain Governments for 
Border Security Operations 

By virtue of the authority vested in 
the Secretary of State, including section 
1 of the State Department Basic 
Authorities Act (22 U.S.C. 2651a) and 
section 1226 of the National Defense 
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2016 
(Pub. L. 114–92) (FY 2016 NDAA), I 
hereby delegate to the Under Secretary 
of State for Arms Control and 
International Security, to the extent 
authorized by law, the authority to 
concur with the Secretary of Defense’s 
use of the authority to provide support 
to certain governments for border 
security operations, pursuant to section 
1226 of the FY 2016 NDAA. 

Notwithstanding this delegation of 
authority, any function or authority 
delegated herein may be exercised by 
the Secretary or the Deputy Secretary. 
Any reference in this delegation of 
authority to any statute shall be deemed 
to be a reference to such statute as 
amended from time to time, and shall be 
deemed to apply to any provision of law 
that is the same or substantially the 
same as such statute. 

This delegation of authority shall be 
published in the Federal Register. 

Dated: August 21, 2018. 
Michael R. Pompeo, 
Secretary of State. 
[FR Doc. 2018–20059 Filed 9–13–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–25–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Delegation of Authority No. 457] 

Delegation of Authority to the Under 
Secretary of State for Arms Control 
and International Security To Concur 
With the Use of the Authority for 
Training Eastern European National 
Security Forces in the Course of 
Multilateral Exercises 

By virtue of the authority vested in 
the Secretary of State, including section 
1 of the State Department Basic 
Authorities Act (22 U.S.C. 2651a) and 
section 1251 of the National Defense 
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2016 
(Pub. L. 114–92) (FY 2016 NDAA), I 
hereby delegate to the Under Secretary 
of State for Arms Control and 
International Security, to the extent 
authorized by law, the authority to 
concur with the Secretary of Defense’s 
use of the authority for training for 
Eastern European national security 
forces in the course of multilateral 
exercises, pursuant to section 1251 of 
the FY 2016 NDAA. 

Notwithstanding this delegation of 
authority, any function or authority 
delegated herein may be exercised by 
the Secretary or the Deputy Secretary. 
Any reference in this delegation of 
authority to any statute shall be deemed 
to be a reference to such statute as 
amended from time to time, and shall be 
deemed to apply to any provision of law 
that is the same or substantially the 
same as such statute. 

This delegation of authority shall be 
published in the Federal Register. 

Dated: August 21, 2018. 
Michael R. Pompeo, 
Secretary of State. 
[FR Doc. 2018–20054 Filed 9–13–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–25–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Delegation of Authority No. 451] 

Delegation of Authority to the Under 
Secretary of State for Arms Control 
and International Security To Concur 
With the Use of the Joint Improvised 
Explosive Device Defeat Fund 
Authority 

By virtue of the authority vested in 
the Secretary of State, including section 
1 of the State Department Basic 

Authorities Act (22 U.S.C. 2651a) and 
section 1532(c) of the National Defense 
Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2013 
(Pub. L. 112–239) (FY 2013 NDAA), I 
hereby delegate to the Under Secretary 
of State for Arms Control and 
International Security, to the extent 
authorized by law, the authority to 
concur with the Secretary of Defense’s 
use of the Joint Improvised Explosive 
Device Defeat Fund authority, pursuant 
to section 1532(c) of the FY 2013 
NDAA. 

Notwithstanding this delegation of 
authority, any function or authority 
delegated herein may be exercised by 
the Secretary or the Deputy Secretary. 
Any reference in this delegation of 
authority to any statute shall be deemed 
to be a reference to such statute as 
amended from time to time, and shall be 
deemed to apply to any provision of law 
that is the same or substantially the 
same as such statute. 

This delegation of authority shall be 
published in the Federal Register. 

Dated: August 21, 2018. 
Michael R. Pompeo, 
Secretary of State. 
[FR Doc. 2018–20058 Filed 9–13–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–25–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Aviation Administration 

[Summary Notice No. 2018–65] 

Petition for Exemption; Summary of 
Petition Received; Russell Timmerman 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: This notice contains a 
summary of a petition seeking relief 
from specified requirements of Title 14 
of the Code of Federal Regulations. The 
purpose of this notice is to improve the 
public’s awareness of, and participation 
in, the FAA’s exemption process. 
Neither publication of this notice nor 
the inclusion or omission of information 
in the summary is intended to affect the 
legal status of the petition or its final 
disposition. 
DATES: Comments on this petition must 
identify the petition docket number and 
must be received on or before October 
4, 2018. 
ADDRESSES: Send comments identified 
by docket number FAA–2018–0609 
using any of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: Go to 
http://www.regulations.gov and follow 
the online instructions for sending your 
comments electronically. 
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