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At this time, the Commission has 
suspended access to the Commission’s 
Public Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, call 1–866–208–3676 or 
email FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, for 
TTY, call (202) 502–8659. Agencies may 
obtain copies of the application directly 
from the applicant. 

m. Individuals desiring to be included 
on the Commission’s mailing list should 
so indicate by writing to the Secretary 
of the Commission. 

n. Comments, Protests, or Motions to 
Intervene: Anyone may submit 
comments, a protest, or a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214, 
respectively. In determining the 
appropriate action to take, the 
Commission will consider all protests or 
other comments filed, but only those 
who file a motion to intervene in 
accordance with the Commission’s 
Rules may become a party to the 
proceeding. Any comments, protests, or 
motions to intervene must be received 
on or before the specified comment date 
for the particular application. 

o. Filing and Service of Documents: 
Any filing must (1) bear in all capital 
letters the title ‘‘COMMENTS’’, 
‘‘PROTEST’’, or ‘‘MOTION TO 
INTERVENE’’ as applicable; (2) set forth 
in the heading the name of the applicant 
and the project number of the 
application to which the filing 
responds; (3) furnish the name, address, 
and telephone number of the person 
commenting, protesting or intervening; 
and (4) otherwise comply with the 
requirements of 18 CFR 385.2001 
through 385.2005. All comments, 
motions to intervene, or protests must 
set forth their evidentiary basis. Any 
filing made by an intervenor must be 
accompanied by proof of service on all 
persons listed in the service list 
prepared by the Commission in this 
proceeding, in accordance with 18 CFR 
385.2010. 

Dated: April 28, 2022. 

Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–09546 Filed 5–3–22; 8:45 am] 
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Assessment 

In accordance with the National 
Environmental Policy Act of 1969 and 
the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission’s (Commission) 
regulations, 18 CFR part 380, the Office 
of Energy Projects has reviewed the 
application for a new license for the 
North Hartland Hydroelectric Project 
No. 2816 (North Hartland Project), and 
the application for a new license for the 
Clay Hill Road Line 66 Transmission 
Project No. 12766 (Clay Hill Project), 
and has prepared an Environmental 
Assessment (EA) for the projects. The 
North Hartland Project is on the 
Ottauquechee River in Windsor County, 
Vermont, and occupies 20.8 acres of 
federal land administered by the U.S. 
Army Corps of Engineers. The Clay Hill 
Project serves as part of the primary 
transmission line for the North Hartland 
Project, and is located along Clay Hill 
Road in Windsor County, Vermont. 

The EA contains staff’s analysis of the 
potential environmental effects of the 
projects and concludes that licensing 
the projects, with appropriate 
environmental protective measures, 
would not constitute a major federal 
action that would significantly affect the 
quality of the human environment. 

The Commission provides all 
interested persons with an opportunity 
to view and/or print the EA via the 
internet through the Commission’s 
Home Page (http://www.ferc.gov) using 
the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. Enter the docket 
number, excluding the last three digits 
in the docket number field, to access the 
document. For assistance, contact FERC 
Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or toll- 
free at (866) 208–3676, or for TTY, (202) 
502–8659. 

You may also register online at 
https://ferconline.ferc.gov/ 
eSubscription.aspx to be notified via 
email of new filings and issuances 
related to this or other pending projects. 
For assistance, contact FERC Online 
Support. 

Any comments should be filed within 
45 days from the date of this notice. The 
Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings. Please file comments 
using the Commission’s eFiling system 
at https://ferconline.ferc.gov/ 

eFiling.aspx. Commenters can submit 
brief comments up to 6,000 characters, 
without prior registration, using the 
eComment system at https://
ferconline.ferc.gov/ 
QuickComment.aspx. You must include 
your name and contact information at 
the end of your comments. For 
assistance, please contact FERC Online 
Support. In lieu of electronic filing, you 
may submit a paper copy. Submissions 
sent via the U.S. Postal Service must be 
addressed to: Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 888 First Street NE, Room 
1A, Washington, DC 20426. 
Submissions sent via any other carrier 
must be addressed to: Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. The first 
page of any filing should include docket 
number P–2816–050 for the North 
Hartland Project and/or docket number 
P–12766–007 for the Clay Hill Project. 

For further information, contact Bill 
Connelly at (202) 502–8587 or by email 
at william.connelly@ferc.gov. 

Dated: April 28, 2022. 
Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–09545 Filed 5–3–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OGC–2022–0406; FRL–9811–01– 
OGC] 

Proposed Consent Decree, 
Unreasonable Delay Claim Regarding 
Discarded Polyvinyl Chloride Listing 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice of proposed consent 
decree; request for public comment. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) 
Administrator’s March 18, 2022, 
Memorandum entitled Consent Decrees 
and Settlement Agreements to Resolve 
Environmental Claims Against the 
Agency, notice is hereby given of a 
proposed consent decree that resolves 
Center for Biological Diversity v. U.S. 
Environmental Protection Agency, et al., 
a case in the United States District Court 
for the District of Columbia (1:21–cv– 
2210–JDB) that alleges EPA 
unreasonably delayed taking action on a 
petition to list discarded polyvinyl 
chloride (PVC) as hazardous waste 
under the Resource Conservation and 
Recovery Act (RCRA). 
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DATES: Written comments on the 
proposed consent decree must be 
received by June 3, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by Docket ID No. EPA–HQ– 
OGC–2022–0406 online at https://
www.regulations.gov (EPA’s preferred 
method). Follow the online instructions 
for submitting comments. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the Docket ID number for 
this action. Comments received may be 
posted without change to https://
www.regulations.gov, including any 
personal information provided. For 
detailed instructions on sending 
comments, see the ‘‘Additional 
Information about Commenting on the 
Proposed Consent Decree’’ heading 
under the SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION 
section of this document. Out of an 
abundance of caution for members of 
the public and our staff, the EPA Docket 
Center and Reading Room is open to 
visitors by appointment only. Our 
Docket Center staff continues to provide 
remote customer service via email, 
phone, and webform. We encourage the 
public to submit comments via https:// 
www.regulations.gov, as there may be a 
delay in processing mail and faxes. 
Hand-deliveries and couriers may be 
received by scheduled appointment 
only. For further information on EPA 
Docket Center services and the latest 
status information, please visit us online 
at https://www.epa.gov/dockets. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Clayton Cope, Solid Waste and 
Emergency Response Law Office, Office 
of General Counsel, U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave. NW, Washington, DC 20460; 
telephone number: (202) 564–2647; 
email address: cope.clayton@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Obtaining a Copy of the Proposed 
Consent Decree 

The official public docket for this 
action (identified by Docket ID No. 
EPA–HQ–OGC–2022–0406) contains a 
copy of the proposed consent decree. 

The electronic version of the public 
docket for this action contains a copy of 
the proposed consent decree and is 
available through https://
www.regulations.gov. You may use 
https://www.regulations.gov to submit 
or view public comments, access the 
index listing of the contents of the 
official public docket, and access those 
documents in the public docket that are 
available electronically. Once in the 
system, key in the appropriate docket 

identification number then select 
‘‘search.’’ 

II. Additional Information About the 
Proposed Consent Decree 

Prior to this lawsuit being filed EPA 
received a petition from Plaintiff, dated 
July 24, 2014, to list discarded PVC as 
hazardous waste under RCRA. Plaintiff 
alleges EPA has failed to take action 
with respect to the petition within a 
reasonable time. 

This proposed consent decree states 
that no later than January 20, 2023, 
pursuant to 40 CFR 260.20(c), EPA shall 
sign a tentative decision on Plaintiff’s 
petition to classify discarded PVC as 
hazardous waste under RCRA. 
Furthermore, it states that no later than 
two years after the signature of the 
consent decree by CBD, April 12, 2024, 
EPA shall sign a final decision on 
Plaintiff’s petition. Court approval of 
this proposed consent decree would 
resolve all claims in this case except for 
any claim for the costs of litigation, 
including attorneys’ fees. 

For a period of thirty (30) days 
following the date of publication of this 
document, the Agency will accept 
written comments relating to the 
proposed consent decree from persons 
who are not named as parties to the 
litigation in question. EPA or the 
Department of Justice may withdraw or 
withhold consent to the proposed 
consent decree if the comments disclose 
facts or considerations that indicate that 
such consent is inappropriate, 
improper, inadequate, or inconsistent 
with the requirements of the APA or 
RCRA. Unless EPA or the Department of 
Justice determines that consent should 
be withdrawn, the terms of the proposed 
consent decree will be affirmed. 

III. Additional Information About 
Commenting on the Proposed Consent 
Decree 

Submit your comments, identified by 
Docket ID No. EPA–HQ–OGC–2022– 
0406 via https://www.regulations.gov. 
Once submitted, comments cannot be 
edited or removed from this docket. 
EPA may publish any comment received 
to its public docket. Do not submit to 
EPA’s docket at https://
www.regulations.gov any information 
you consider to be Confidential 
Business Information (CBI) or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Multimedia 
submissions (audio, video, etc.) must be 
accompanied by a written comment. 
The written comment is considered the 
official comment and should include 

discussion of all points you wish to 
make. EPA will generally not consider 
comments or comment contents located 
outside of the primary submission (i.e., 
on the web, cloud, or other file sharing 
system). For additional submission 
methods, the full EPA public comment 
policy, information about CBI or 
multimedia submissions, and general 
guidance on making effective 
comments, please visit https://
www.epa.gov/dockets/commenting-epa- 
dockets. For additional information 
about submitting information identified 
as CBI, please contact the person listed 
in the FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT section of this document. Note 
that written comments containing CBI 
and submitted by mail may be delayed 
and deliveries or couriers will be 
received by scheduled appointment 
only. 

If you submit an electronic comment, 
EPA recommends that you include your 
name, mailing address, and an email 
address or other contact information in 
the body of your comment. This ensures 
that you can be identified as the 
submitter of the comment and allows 
EPA to contact you in case EPA cannot 
read your comment due to technical 
difficulties or needs further information 
on the substance of your comment. Any 
identifying or contact information 
provided in the body of a comment will 
be included as part of the comment that 
is placed in the official public docket 
and made available in EPA’s electronic 
public docket. If EPA cannot read your 
comment due to technical difficulties 
and cannot contact you for clarification, 
EPA may not be able to consider your 
comment. 

Use of the https://
www.regulations.gov website to submit 
comments to EPA electronically is 
EPA’s preferred method for receiving 
comments. The electronic public docket 
system is an ‘‘anonymous access’’ 
system, which means EPA will not 
know your identity, email address, or 
other contact information unless you 
provide it in the body of your comment. 

Please ensure that your comments are 
submitted within the specified comment 
period. Comments received after the 
close of the comment period will be 
marked ‘‘late.’’ EPA is not required to 
consider these late comments. 

Dated: April 26, 2022 . 
Lorie Schmidt, 
Associate General Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2022–09542 Filed 5–3–22; 8:45 am] 
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