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location. For non-fixed devices, when 
dispatchable location is not technically 
feasible, internet-based TRS providers 
may fall back to Registered Location or 
provide alternative location 
information. As a last resort, internet- 
based providers may route calls to 
Emergency Relay Calling Centers after 
making a good faith effort to obtain 
location data from all available 
alternative location sources. 
Dispatchable location means a location 
delivered to the PSAP with a 911 call 
that consists of the validated street 
address of the calling party, plus 
additional information such as suite, 
apartment or similar information 
necessary to adequately identify the 
location of the calling party. Automated 
dispatchable location means automatic 
generation of dispatchable location. 
Alternative location information is 
location information (which may be 
coordinate-based) sufficient to identify 
the caller’s civic address and 
approximate in-building location, 
including floor level, in large buildings. 

On January 31, 2020, the Commission 
released Structure and Practices of the 
Video Relay Service Program; 
Telecommunications Relay Services and 
Speech-to-Speech Services for 
Individuals with Hearing and Speech 
Disabilities, FCC 20–7, 85 FR 27309, 
May 8, 2020 (VRS At-Home Call 
Handling Order). The Commission 
amended its rules to convert the VRS at- 
home call handling pilot program into a 
permanent one, thereby allowing CAs to 
work from home. To ensure user privacy 
and call confidentiality and to help 
prevent waste, fraud, and abuse, the 
modified information collections 
include requirements for VRS providers 
to apply for certification to allow their 
communications assistants to handle 
calls while working at home; monitoring 
and oversight requirements; and 
reporting requirements. 

On June 30, 2022, the Commission 
released Telecommunications Relay 
Services and Speech-to-Speech Services 
for Individuals with Hearing and Speech 
Disabilities; Structure and Practices of 
the Video Relay Service Program; 
Misuse of internet Protocol Captioned 
Telephone Service, FCC 22–51, 
published at 87 FR 57645, September 
21, 2022 (Registration Grace Period 
Order). To offer more efficient service to 
VRS and IP CTS users without risk of 
waste, fraud, and abuse to the TRS 
Fund, the Commission amended its 
rules to allow VRS and IP CTS providers 
to provide compensable service to a new 
user for up to two weeks after 
submitting the user’s information to the 
TRS URD if the user’s identity is 
verified within that period. 

On September 30, 2022, the 
Commission released Rates for 
Interstate Inmate Calling Services, FCC 
22–76, published at 87 FR 75496, 
December 9, 2022 (Accessible Carceral 
Communications Order). To improve 
access to communications services for 
incarcerated people with 
communications disabilities, the 
Commission adopted modifications to 
the user registration and verification 
requirements for use of internet-based 
TRS in correctional facilities. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–17008 Filed 8–8–23; 8:45 am] 
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AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act of 1995 (PRA), the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
Commission) invites the general public 
and other Federal agencies to take this 
opportunity to comment on the 
following information collections. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 
DATES: Written PRA comments should 
be submitted on or before October 10, 
2023. If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 

advise the contact listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Cathy Williams, FCC, via email to PRA@
fcc.gov and to Cathy.Williams@fcc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection, contact Cathy 
Williams at (202) 418–2918. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The FCC 
may not conduct or sponsor a collection 
of information unless it displays a 
currently valid Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) control number. No 
person shall be subject to any penalty 
for failing to comply with a collection 
of information subject to the PRA that 
does not display a valid OMB control 
number. 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0214. 
Title: Sections 73.3526 and 73.3527, 

Local Public Inspection Files; Sections 
73.1212, 76.1701 and 73.1943, Political 
Files. 

Form Number: N/A. 
Type of Review: Revision of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for 

profit entities; Not for profit institutions; 
State, Local or Tribal government; 
Individuals or households. 

Number of Respondents: 23,819 
respondents; 66,392 responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 1–52 
hours. 

Frequency of Response: On occasion 
reporting requirement, Recordkeeping 
requirement, Third party disclosure 
requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. Statutory 
authority for these collections is 
contained in Sections 151, 152, 154(i), 
303, 307, 308, and 315 of the 
Communications Act of 1934, as 
amended. 

Total Annual Burden: 2,065,841 
hours. 

Total Annual Cost: No cost. 
Needs and Uses: On July 20, 2023, the 

Commission adopted Amendment of 
Parts 73 and 74 of the Commission’s 
Rules to Establish Rules for Digital Low 
Power Television and Television 
Translator Stations, Fifth Report and 
Order, FCC 23–58 (rel. July 20, 2023) 
(FM6 Report and Order). The 
Commission adopted a new requirement 
that FM6 LPTV stations maintain a 
public inspection file similar to the 
requirement in the rule for FM radio 
stations. This submission is being made 
to the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for approval of the local public 
inspection file requirement for FM6 
LPTV stations as adopted in the FM6 
Report and Order. This requirement is 
contained in 47 CFR 73.3526. 
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OMB Control Number: 3060–0110. 
Title: FCC Form 2100, Application for 

Renewal of Broadcast Station License, 
LMS Schedule 303–S. 

Form Number: FCC 2100, LMS 
Schedule 303–S. 

Type of Review: Revision of a 
currently approved collection. 

Respondents: Business or other for- 
profit entities; Not for profit institutions; 
State, Local or Tribal Governments. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 5,140 respondents, 5,140 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.5 
hours–12 hours. 

Frequency of Response: On occasion 
reporting requirement; Every eight-year 
reporting requirement; Third party 
disclosure requirement. 

Total Annual Burden: 14,868 hours. 
Total Annual Costs: $3,994,164. 
Obligation of Response: Required to 

obtain or retain benefits. The statutory 
authority for the collection is contained 
Sections 154(i), 303, 307 and 308 of the 
Communications Act of 1934, as 
amended, and Section 204 of the 
Telecommunications Act of 1996. 

Needs and Uses: On July 20, 2023, the 
Commission adopted Amendment of 
Parts 73 and 74 of the Commission’s 
Rules to Establish Rules for Digital Low 
Power Television and Television 
Translator Stations, Fifth Report and 
Order, FCC 23–58 (rel. July 20, 2023) 
(FM6 Report and Order). The 
Commission adopted a new requirement 
that FM6 LPTV stations certify in their 
license renewal application that they 
have continued to provide FM6 
operations in accordance with the FM6 
rules during their prior license term. 
The Commission delegated authority to 
the Media Bureau to determine the most 
appropriate means for these stations to 
make such certification, be it by an 
attachment to the renewal application or 
some other reasonable means. This 
requirement is contained in 47 CFR 
74.790(o)(10). 

This submission is being made to the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for approval of the renewal 
certification requirement for FM6 LPTV 
stations as adopted in the FM6 Report 
and Order. Since the certification will 
be included as an additional exhibit to 
the existing form, it did not necessitate 
changes to LMS Form 2100 Schedule 
303–S. 

OMB Control No.: 3060–0386. 
Title: Special Temporary 

Authorization (STA) Requests; 
Notifications; and Informal Filings; 
Sections 1.5, 73.1615, 73.1635, 73.1740 
and 73.3598; CDBS Informal Forms; 
Section 74.788; Low Power Television, 
TV Translator and Class A Television 
Digital Transition Notifications; Section 
73.3700(b)(5), Post Auction Licensing; 
Section 73.3700(f). 

Form No.: None. 
Type of Review: Revision of a 

currently information collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit entities; Not for profit institutions; 
State, local or Tribal government. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 5,537 respondents and 5,537 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.50– 
4.0 hours. 

Frequency of Response: One-time 
reporting requirement and on occasion 
reporting requirement. 

Obligation To Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. The statutory 
authority for this collection is contained 
in 47 U.S.C. 151, 154(i), 157 and 309(j) 
as amended; Middle Class Tax Relief 
and Job Creation Act of 2012, Public 
Law 112–96, 6402 (codified at 47 U.S.C. 
309(j)(8)(G)), 6403 (codified at 47 U.S.C. 
1452), 126 Stat. 156 (2012) (Spectrum 
Act); and Sections 1, 4(i) and (j), 7, 301, 
302, 303, 307, 308, 309, 312, 316, 318, 
319, 324, 325, 336, and 337 of the 
Communications Act of 1934, as 
amended. 

Total Annual Burden: 4,353 hours. 
Annual Cost Burden: $1,834,210. 

Needs and Uses: On July 20, 2023, the 
Commission adopted Amendment of 
Parts 73 and 74 of the Commission’s 
Rules to Establish Rules for Digital Low 
Power Television and Television 
Translator Stations, Fifth Report and 
Order, FCC 23–58 (rel. July 20, 2023) 
(FM6 Report and Order). The 
Commission adopted a one-time 
requirement that FM6 LPTV stations 
notify the Media Bureau via letter filing 
as to whether they will continue FM6 
operations and confirm their precise 
FM6 operational parameters. In 
addition, in the FM6 Report and Order, 
the Commission adopted a rule, 47 CFR 
74.790(o)(9) that requires FM6 LPTV 
stations that are permanently 
discontinuing their FM6 operations to 
notify the Commission pursuant to 
section 73.1750 of the rules. This 
submission is being made to the Office 
of Management and Budget (OMB) for 
approval of the one-time letter 
notification and discontinuation of 
operations notification requirements for 
FM6 LPTV stations as adopted in the 
FM6 Report and Order. 

Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–17007 Filed 8–8–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[FR ID 160740] 

Deletion of Item From August 3, 2023 
Open Meeting 

August 1, 2023. 

The following item was adopted by 
the Commission on July 31, 2023 and 
deleted from the list of items scheduled 
for consideration at the Thursday, 
August 3, 2023, Open Meeting. The item 
was previously listed in the 
Commission’s Sunshine Notice on 
Thursday, July 27, 2023. 

2 ............. MEDIA ............................. Title: Updating Digital FM Radio Service (MB Docket No. 22–405). 
Summary: The Commission will consider an Order and Notice of Proposed Rulemaking seeking com-

ment on proposed changes to the methodology used to determine maximum power levels for digital 
FM broadcast stations and to the process for authorizing digital transmissions at different power lev-
els on the upper and lower digital sidebands. 

Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–17009 Filed 8–8–23; 8:45 am] 
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