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1 The record is defined in § 207.2(f) of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and Procedure (19 
CFR 207.2(f)). 

2 88 FR 1042 and 88 FR 1052 (January 6, 2023). 

and the Department of Veterans Affairs, 
San Joaquin Valley National Cemetery. 

27. Contra Costa WD, CVP, California: 
Title transfer of lands and features of the 
Contra Costa Canal System of the CVP. 

28. Title transfer agreements; 
California, Nevada, and Oregon: 
Potential title transfers agreements 
pursuant to the John D. Dingell, Jr. 
Conservation, Management, and 
Recreation Act of March 12, 2019 (Pub. 
L. 116–9). 

29. CVP, California: Operational 
agreements, exchange agreements, and 
contract amendments with non-Federal 
project entities as required for Federal 
participation in non-Federal storage 
projects pursuant to the WIIN Act. 

30. Shasta County Water Agency, 
CVP, California: Proposed partial 
assignment of 400 acre-feet of the Shasta 
County Water Agency’s CVP water 
supply to the Shasta Community 
Services District for M&I use. 

31. Sacramento River Settlement 
Contractors, CVP, California: Temporary 
agreements for the purchase of 
conserved water for fish and wildlife 
purposes. 

32. Solano County Water Agency, 
Solano Project, California: Renewal of 
water service and OM&R contracts. 

33. Water user entities responsible for 
payment of reimbursable costs for 
Reclamation projects in California, 
Nevada, and Oregon: Contracts to be 
executed pursuant to title IX of the 
Infrastructure Investment and Jobs Act 
of November 15, 2021 (Pub. L. 117–58), 
and/or contracts for XM pursuant to title 
IX, subtitle G of Omnibus Public Land 
Management Act of March 30, 2009 
(Pub. L. 111–11). For more information, 
please see the Reclamation press release 
at https://www.usbr.gov/newsroom/#/ 
news-release/4205. 

34. San Luis Canal Company, Central 
California ID, Firebaugh Canal WD, 
Columbia Canal Company (collectively 
San Joaquin River Exchange 
Contractors); CVP; California: Amend 
1968 second amended contract for 
exchange of water. 

35. Napa County Flood Control and 
Water Conservation District, Solano 
Project, California: Renewal of long-term 
water service contract for up to 1,500 
acre-feet from Lake Berryessa. 

36. San Juan WD, CVP, California: 
Long-term Warren Act contract for up to 
25,000 acre-feet annually for 
conveyance through Folsom Reservoir 
and associated facilities. 

37. California Department of Water 
Resources, CVP, California: Contributed 

Funds Agreement for SOD costs related 
to the B.F. Sisk SOD project. 

Christopher Beardsley, 
Director, Policy and Programs. 
[FR Doc. 2023–03963 Filed 2–24–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4332–90–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation Nos. 701–TA–679 and 731– 
TA–1585 (Final)] 

Sodium Nitrite From India 

Determination 
On the basis of the record 1 developed 

in the subject investigations, the United 
States International Trade Commission 
(‘‘Commission’’) determines, pursuant 
to the Tariff Act of 1930 (‘‘the Act’’), 
that an industry in the United States is 
materially injured by reason of imports 
of sodium nitrite from India, provided 
for in subheading 2834.10.10 of the 
Harmonized Tariff Schedule of the 
United States, that have been found by 
the U.S. Department of Commerce 
(‘‘Commerce’’) to be sold in the United 
States at less than fair value (‘‘LTFV’’), 
and to be subsidized by the government 
of India.2 

Background 
The Commission instituted these 

investigations effective January 13, 
2022, following receipt of petitions filed 
with the Commission and Commerce by 
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC, 
Parsippany, New Jersey. The 
Commission established a general 
schedule for the conduct of the final 
phase of its investigations of sodium 
nitrite from India and Russia following 
publication of a preliminary 
determination by Commerce that 
imports of sodium nitrite were 
subsidized by the government of Russia. 
Notice of the scheduling of the final 
phase of the Commission’s investigation 
and of a public hearing to be held in 
connection therewith was given by 
posting copies of the notice in the Office 
of the Secretary, U.S. International 
Trade Commission, Washington, DC, 
and by publishing the notice in the 
Federal Register of April 20, 2022 (87 
FR 23567). In light of the restrictions on 
access to the Commission building due 
to the COVID–19 pandemic, the 
Commission conducted its hearing 
through written testimony and video 
conference on Tuesday, June 21, 2022. 

All persons who requested the 
opportunity were permitted to 
participate. 

The investigation schedules became 
staggered when Commerce did not align 
its countervailing duty investigation on 
Russia with either of the corresponding 
antidumping duty investigations, did 
not postpone the final determination of 
its antidumping duty investigation on 
Russia, and aligned its countervailing 
duty investigation on sodium nitrite 
from India with its antidumping duty 
investigation regarding India. On 
August 15, 2022, the Commission issued 
a final affirmative determination in its 
countervailing duty investigation of 
sodium nitrite from Russia (87 FR 
51141, August 19, 2022). On October 28, 
2022, the Commission issued a final 
affirmative determination in its 
antidumping duty investigation of 
sodium nitrite from Russia (87 FR 
66323, November 3, 2022). Following 
publication of final determinations by 
Commerce that imports of sodium 
nitrite from India were being sold at 
LTFV within the meaning of section 
735(a) of the Act (19 U.S.C. 1673d(a)), 
and subsidized within the meaning of 
section 705(a) of the Act (19 U.S.C. 
1671d(a)), notice of the supplemental 
scheduling of the final phase of the 
Commission’s antidumping and 
countervailing duty investigations of 
sodium nitrite from India was given by 
posting copies of the notice in the Office 
of the Secretary, U.S. International 
Trade Commission, Washington, DC, 
and by publishing the notice in the 
Federal Register of January 19, 2023 (88 
FR 3438). 

The Commission made these 
determinations pursuant to §§ 705(b) 
and 735(b) of the Act (19 U.S.C. 
1671d(b) and 19 U.S.C. 1673d(b)). It 
completed and filed its determinations 
in these investigations on February 20, 
2023. The views of the Commission are 
contained in USITC Publication 5408 
(February 2023), entitled Sodium Nitrite 
from India: Investigation Nos. 701–TA– 
679 and 731–TA–1585 (Final). 

By order of the Commission. 

Issued: February 21, 2023. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2023–03917 Filed 2–24–23; 8:45 am] 
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