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free DDIY tax prep solution, there 
should be consideration to sell Credit 
Karma Tax to the IRS so that the IRS 
may directly provide this service to the 
American people for free. The $50 
million sale would account for <0.5% of 
the IRS’s operating budget. While this 
may be an extreme suggestion to some, 
I believe it is time that the American 
taxpayers get what they were promised 
when the industry successfully lobbied 
and created the Free File Alliance. The 
FFA program has been a failure since its 
creation and this is a once in a lifetime 
opportunity to fix it and truly put the 
taxpayer first, all for less than one half 
of a percent of the IRS budget. 
Sincerely, 
Travis Curtis. 

[FR Doc. 2021–08971 Filed 4–28–21; 8:45 am] 
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National Institute of Corrections 

Advisory Board; Notice of Meeting 

This notice announces a forthcoming 
meeting of the National Institute of 
Corrections (NIC) Advisory Board. At 
least one portion of the meeting will be 
closed to the public. 

Name of the Committee: NIC 
Advisory Board. 

General Function of the Committee: 
To aid the National Institute of 
Corrections in developing long-range 
plans, advise on program development, 
and recommend guidance to assist NIC’s 
efforts in the areas of training, technical 
assistance, information services, and 
policy/program development assistance 
to Federal, state, and local corrections 
agencies. 

Date and Time: 2:00–5:00 p.m. EDT 
on Wednesday, May 26, 2021: 2:00–5:00 
p.m. EDT on Thursday, May 27, 2021 
(approximate times). 

Location: Virtual Platform. 
Contact Person: Leslie LeMaster, 

Executive Assistant, National Institute 
of Corrections, 320 First Street NW, 
Room 901–3, Washington, DC 20534. To 
contact Ms. LeMaster, please call (303) 
338–6620. 

Agenda: On May 26–27, 2021, the 
Advisory Board will: (1) Receive a brief 
Agency Report from the NIC Acting 
Director, (2) receive project-specific 
updates from both the NIC prisons and 
jails divisions, and (3) receive a 
Subcommittee Report related to the 
identification of potential NIC Director 
candidates. Time for questions and 
counsel from the Board is built in to the 
agenda. 

Procedure: On May 26, 2021, from 
2:00 p.m. until 5:00 p.m. and on May 
27, 2021, from 2:00 p.m. until 4:00 p.m., 
the meeting is open to the public. 
Interested persons may request to attend 
virtually, present data, information, or 
views, orally or in writing, on issues 
pending before the committee. Such 
requests must be made to the contact 
person on or before May 14, 2021. Oral 
presentations from the public will be 
scheduled between approximately 4:00 
p.m. to 4:15 p.m. on May 26, 2021. Time 
allotted for each presentation may be 
limited. Those who wish to make formal 
oral presentations should notify the 
contact person and submit a brief 
statement of the general nature of the 
evidence or arguments they wish to 
present, the names and addresses of 
proposed participants, and an 
indication of the approximate time 
requested to make their presentation on 
or before May 14, 2021. 

Closed Committee Deliberations: On 
May 27, 2021, between 4:00 p.m. and 
5:00 p.m., the meeting will be closed to 
permit discussion of information that (1) 
relates solely to the internal personnel 
rules and practices of an agency (5 
U.S.C. 552b(c)(2)), and (2) is of a 
personal nature where disclosure would 
constitute a clearly unwarranted 
invasion of personal privacy (5 U.S.C. 
552b(c)(6)). The Advisory Board will 
discuss the outcomes of the 
subcommittee’s review of potential 
candidates for the position of Director of 
the National Institute of Corrections and 
make determinations as to the Advisory 
Board’s recommendations to the U.S. 
Attorney General. 

General Information: NIC welcomes 
the attendance of the public at its 
advisory committee meetings and will 
make every effort to accommodate 
persons with physical disabilities or 
special needs. If you require special 
accommodations due to a disability, 
please contact Leslie LeMaster at least 7 
days in advance of the meeting. Notice 
of this meeting is given under the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (5 
U.S.C. app. 2). 

Shaina Vanek, 
Acting Director, National Institute of 
Corrections. 
[FR Doc. 2021–08918 Filed 4–28–21; 8:45 am] 
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Activities; Comment Request; EARN 
Perspectives of Jobseekers With 
Disabilities: The Impact of Employer 
Messaging 

ACTION: Notice of information 
collections and request for comments. 

SUMMARY: In compliance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, the 
DOL is soliciting public comments 
regarding this ODEP-sponsored 
information collection to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval. 
DATES: Comments pertaining to this 
information collection are due on or 
before June 28, 2021. 
ADDRESSES: 

Electronic submission: You may 
submit comments and attachments 
electronically at http://
www.regulations.gov. Follow the online 
instructions for submitting comments. 
Mail submission: 200 Constitution Ave. 
NW, Room S–5315, Washington, DC 
2020. Comments are invited on: (1) 
Whether the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the DOL, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; (2) if the information 
will be processed and used in a timely 
manner; (3) the accuracy of the DOL’s 
estimates of the burden and cost of the 
collection of information, including the 
validity of the methodology and 
assumptions used; (4) ways to enhance 
the quality, utility and clarity of the 
information collection; and (5) ways to 
minimize the burden of the collection of 
information on those who are to 
respond, including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Lou 
Orslene by telephone at 202–693–7928 
(this is not a toll-free number) or by 
email at DOL_PRA_PUBLIC@dol.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Employer Assistance and Resource 
Network on Disability Inclusion (EARN) 
is a resource for employers seeking to 
recruit, hire, retain, and advance 
qualified employees with disabilities. 
EARN assists employers through online 
support and a range of education and 
outreach activities, including webinars, 
a website with employer-focused 
resources such as toolkits, a monthly e- 
newsletter, social media posts, and 
training videos. It is funded by the U.S. 
Department of Labor’s Office of 
Disability Employment Policy under a 
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