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representative of miners) on the other 
party. 

Under 30 CFR 44.11(a), the petition 
for modification must contain the 
petitioner’s name and address; the 
mailing address and mine identification 
number of the mine or mines affected; 
the mandatory safety standard to which 
the petition is directed; a concise 
statement of the modification requested 
and whether the petitioner (1) proposes 
to establish an alternate method in lieu 
of the mandatory safety standard, or (2) 
alleges that application of the standard 
will result in diminution of safety to the 
miners affected, or (3) requests relief 
based on both grounds; a detailed 
statement of the facts that show the 
grounds upon which a modification is 
claimed or warranted; and, if the 
petitioner is a mine operator, the 
identity of any representative of miners 
at the affected mine. 

Type of Review: Extension. 
Agency: Mine Safety and Health 

Administration. 
Title: Petitions for Modification of 

Mandatory Safety Standards. 
OMB Number: 1219–0065. 
Recordkeeping: Under 30 CFR 44.9, 

mine operators must post a copy of each 
petition for modification concerning the 
mine on the mine’s bulletin board and 
maintain the posting until a ruling on 
the petition becomes final. This applies 
only to mines for which there is no 
representative of miners. 

Under 30 CFR 44.10 The petition 
must be in writing, filed with the 
Assistant Secretary of Labor for Mine 
Safety and Health, and a copy of the 
petition served by the filing party (the 
mine operator or representative of 
miners) on the other party.

Under 30 CFR 44.11(a), the petition 
for modification must contain the 
petitioner’s name and address; the 
mailing address and mine identification 
number of the mine or mines affected; 
the mandatory safety standard to which 
the petition is directed; a concise 
statement of the modification requested 
and whether the petitioner (1) proposes 
to establish an alternate method in lieu 
of the mandatory safety standard, or (2) 
alleges that application of the standard 
will result in diminution of safety to the 
miners affected, or (3) requests relief 
based on both grounds; a detailed 
statement of the facts that show the 
grounds upon which a modification is 
claimed or warranted; and, if the 
petitioner is a mine operator, the 
identity of any representative of miners 
at the affected mine. 

Frequency: On Occasion. 
Affected Public: Business or other for-

profit. 
Respondents: 158. 

Estimated Average Time Per 
Respondent: 35 hours. 

Total Burden Hours: 5,520 hours. 
Total Burden Cost (capital/startup): 

$0. 
Total Burden Cost (operating/

maintaining): $41. 
Comments submitted in response to 

this notice will be summarized and/or 
included in the request for Office of 
Management and Budget approval of the 
information collection request; they will 
also become a matter of public record.

Dated at Arlington, Virginia, this fourth 
day of June, 2003. 
David L. Meyer, 
Director, Office of Administration and 
Management.
[FR Doc. 03–14527 Filed 6–9–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4510–43–P

NATIONAL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS 
ADMINISTRATION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request

AGENCY: National Archives and Records 
Administration (NARA).
ACTION: Notice.

SUMMARY: NARA is giving public notice 
that the agency proposes to request use 
of the Financial Disclosure Form, a new 
Standard Form, that will be used to 
make personnel security 
determinations, including whether to 
grant a security clearance, to allow 
access to classified information, 
sensitive areas, and equipment; or to 
permit assignment to a sensitive 
national security position. The public is 
invited to comment on the proposed 
information collection pursuant to the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995.
DATES: Written comments must be 
received on or before August 11, 2003 
to be assured of consideration.
ADDRESSES: Comments should be sent 
to: Paperwork Reduction Act Comments 
(NHP), Room 4400, National Archives 
and Records Administration, 8601 
Adelphi Rd, College Park, MD 20740–
6001; or faxed to 301–837–3213; or 
electronically mailed to 
tamee.fechhelm@nara.gov.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional information or 
copies of the proposed information 
collection and supporting statement 
should be directed to Tamee Fechhelm 
at telephone number 301–837–1694, or 
fax number 301–837–3213.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Pursuant 
to the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(Pub. L. 104–13), NARA invites the 

general public and other Federal 
agencies to comment on proposed 
information collections. The comments 
and suggestions should address one or 
more of the following points: (a) 
whether the proposed information 
collection is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of NARA; 
(b) the accuracy of NARA’s estimate of 
the burden of the proposed information 
collection; (c) ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (d) 
ways, including the use of information 
technology, to minimize the burden of 
the collection of information on 
respondents. The comments that are 
submitted will be summarized and 
included in the NARA request for Office 
of Management and Budget (OMB) 
approval. All comments will become a 
matter of public record. In this notice, 
NARA is soliciting comments 
concerning the following information 
collection: 

Title: Financial Disclosure Form. 
OMB number: 3095–NEW. 
Agency form number: Standard Form 

NEW. 
Type of review: Regular. 
Affected public: Business or other for-

profit, Federal government. 
Estimated number of respondents: 

25,897. 
Estimated time per response: 2 hours. 
Frequency of response: On occasion. 
Estimated total annual burden hours: 

51,794 hours. 
Abstract: Executive Order 12958 as 

amended, ‘‘Classified National Security 
Information’’ authorizes the Information 
Security Oversight Office (ISOO) to 
develop standard forms that promote 
the implementation of the Government’s 
security classification program. This is a 
continuing authority, which was first 
given to ISOO with the issuance of the 
predecessor executive order on security 
classification, Executive Order 12356. 
Prior to E.O. 12356, executive branch 
agencies developed their own forms to 
address security needs. For example, 
each agency had a different cover sheet 
for each of the classification levels. With 
the issuance of Standard Forms SF 703, 
704 and 705 in 1985, executive branch 
agencies began using the same standard 
form to serve as a shield to protect 
classified information at the Top Secret, 
Secret and Confidential levels. These 
forms promoted and continue to 
promote consistency and uniformity in 
the protection of classified information. 
An individual can go from one agency 
to another and know that an orange 
cover sheet has Top Secret information 
attached to it (SF 703). 

In the wake of the Aldrich Ames 
espionage case, Congress passed 
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legislation in 1994 (50 U.S.C. 436) that 
authorized investigative agencies to 
obtain financial information about 
Government employees with access to 
classified information who are 
suspected of compromising classified 
information. To facilitate investigations 
and as a condition for obtaining a 
security clearance, Executive Order 
12968, ‘‘Access to Classified 
Information,’’ issued on August 4, 1995, 
required: (1) All employees granted 
access to classified information to 
provide written consent (SF 713) for 
access to certain financial records under 
specified conditions; and (2) that 
employees who have regular access to 
particularly sensitive classified 
information submit, as a condition of 
maintaining access to such information, 
relevant information concerning their 
financial condition as may be necessary 
to ensure appropriate security. The 
Security Policy Board, created in 1993 
by Presidential Directive to consolidate 
security policy groups and abolished in 
February, 2001 by National Security 
Presidential Directive Number 1, 
originally developed a draft consent 
form and a draft financial disclosure 
form after lengthy meetings/negotiations 
with the major classifying agencies. 

Under the new policy coordinating 
structure created by National Security 
Presidential Directive 1 of April 21, 
2001, several policy coordinating 
committees (PCCs) were established to 
serve as the main ‘‘day-to-day’’ forum 
for interagency coordination of national 
security policy. The PCC on Records 
Access and Information Security is the 
PCC that handles security classification 
and personnel security matters. It is this 
PCC that resurrected the Financial 
Disclosure Form to solicit views from its 
members and to obtain final approval. 
The members of this PCC include NSC 
as Chairman, NSC as Executive 
Secretary, Department of Defense, 
Director Central Intelligence Agency, 
Department of State, Department of 
Justice, Department of Energy, Office of 
Management and Budget, Information 
Security Oversight Office and an 
industry observer. The Director of 
Records Access at the NSC chairs this 
committee. All members unanimously 
endorsed the Financial Disclosure Form 
now submitted for processing as a 
Standard Form. 

The Financial Disclosure Form will 
contain information that will be used to 
make personnel security 
determinations, including whether to 
grant a security clearance; to allow 
access to classified information, 
sensitive areas, and equipment; or to 
permit assignment to sensitive national 
security positions. The data may later be 

used as a part of a review process to 
evaluate continued eligibility for access 
to classified information or as evidence 
in legal proceedings. 

The Financial Disclosure Form will 
help law enforcement obtain pertinent 
information in the preliminary stages of 
potential espionage and counter 
terrorism cases. The PCC on Records 
Access and Information Security 
forwarded the current form to the 
Information Security Oversight Office 
for issuance. The Office of Management 
and Budget is aware of the form.

Dated: June 2, 2003. 
L. Reynolds Cahoon, 
Assistant Archivist for Human Resources and 
Information Services.
[FR Doc. 03–14530 Filed 6–9–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 7515–01–P

NATIONAL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS 
ADMINISTRATION 

Records Schedules; Availability and 
Request for Comments

AGENCY: National Archives and Records 
Administration (NARA).
ACTION: Notice of availability of 
proposed records schedules; request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The National Archives and 
Records Administration (NARA) 
publishes notice at least once monthly 
of certain Federal agency requests for 
records disposition authority (records 
schedules). Once approved by NARA, 
records schedules provide mandatory 
instructions on what happens to records 
when no longer needed for current 
Government business. They authorize 
the preservation of records of 
continuing value in the National 
Archives of the United States and the 
destruction, after a specified period, of 
records lacking administrative, legal, 
research, or other value. Notice is 
published for records schedules in 
which agencies propose to destroy 
records not previously authorized for 
disposal or reduce the retention period 
of records already authorized for 
disposal. NARA invites public 
comments on such records schedules, as 
required by 44 U.S.C. 3303a(a).
DATES: Requests for copies must be 
received in writing on or before July 25, 
2003. Once the appraisal of the records 
is completed, NARA will send a copy of 
the schedule. NARA staff usually 
prepare appraisal memorandums that 
contain additional information 
concerning the records covered by a 
proposed schedule. These, too, may be 
requested and will be provided once the 

appraisal is completed. Requesters will 
be given 30 days to submit comments.
ADDRESSES: To request a copy of any 
records schedule identified in this 
notice, write to the Life Cycle 
Management Division (NWML), 
National Archives and Records 
Administration (NARA), 8601 Adelphi 
Road, College Park, MD 20740–6001. 
Requests also may be transmitted by 
FAX to 301–837–3698 or by e-mail to 
records.mgt@nara.gov. Requesters must 
cite the control number, which appears 
in parentheses after the name of the 
agency which submitted the schedule, 
and must provide a mailing address. 
Those who desire appraisal reports 
should so indicate in their request.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Paul 
M. Wester, Jr., Director, Life Cycle 
Management Division (NWML), 
National Archives and Records 
Administration, 8601 Adelphi Road, 
College Park, MD 20740–6001. 
Telephone: 301–837–3120. E-mail: 
records.mgt@nara.gov.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Each year 
Federal agencies create billions of 
records on paper, film, magnetic tape, 
and other media. To control this 
accumulation, agency records managers 
prepare schedules proposing retention 
periods for records and submit these 
schedules for NARA’s approval, using 
the Standard Form (SF) 115, Request for 
Records Disposition Authority. These 
schedules provide for the timely transfer 
into the National Archives of 
historically valuable records and 
authorize the disposal of all other 
records after the agency no longer needs 
them to conduct its business. Some 
schedules are comprehensive and cover 
all the records of an agency or one of its 
major subdivisions. Most schedules, 
however, cover records of only one 
office or program or a few series of 
records. Many of these update 
previously approved schedules, and 
some include records proposed as 
permanent. 

No Federal records are authorized for 
destruction without the approval of the 
Archivist of the United States. This 
approval is granted only after a 
thorough consideration of their 
administrative use by the agency of 
origin, the rights of the Government and 
of private persons directly affected by 
the Government’s activities, and 
whether or not they have historical or 
other value. 

Besides identifying the Federal 
agencies and any subdivisions 
requesting disposition authority, this 
public notice lists the organizational 
unit(s) accumulating the records or 
indicates agency-wide applicability in 

VerDate Jan<31>2003 15:33 Jun 09, 2003 Jkt 200001 PO 00000 Frm 00078 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\10JNN1.SGM 10JNN1


		Superintendent of Documents
	2010-07-17T12:33:16-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




