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not filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended September 30, 2000. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of CFI 
Mortgage, Inc. because it has not filed 
any periodic reports since the period 
ended September 30, 2001. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Commodore 
Holdings Ltd. because it has not filed 
any periodic reports since the period 
ended June 30, 2000. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Conversion 
Technologies International, Inc. because 
it has not filed any periodic reports 
since the period ended June 30, 2000. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Cyntech 
Technologies, Inc. because it has not 
filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended July 31, 2002. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Diversified 
Senior Services, Inc. because it has not 
filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended September 30, 2001. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Dyersburg 
Corp. because it has not filed any 
periodic reports since the period ended 
March 31, 2001. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Flour City 
International, Inc. because it has not 
filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended July 31, 2001. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Gerald 
Stevens, Inc. because it has not filed any 
periodic reports since the period ended 
November 30, 2000. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Leisure 
Time Casinos & Resorts, Inc. because it 
has not filed any periodic reports since 
the period ended June 30, 2000. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Platinum 

Entertainment, Inc. (n/k/a Vidalia 
Gichner Holdings, Inc.) because it has 
not filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended March 31, 2000. 

The Commission is of the opinion that 
the public interest and the protection of 
investors require a suspension of trading 
in the securities of the above-listed 
companies. Therefore, it is ordered, 
pursuant to Section 12(k) of the 
Securities Exchange Act of 1934, that 
trading in the securities of the above- 
listed companies is suspended for the 
period from 9:30 a.m. EDT on October 
16, 2009, through 11:59 p.m. EDT on 
October 29, 2009. 

By the Commission. 

Elizabeth M. Murphy, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E9–25286 Filed 10–16–09; 11:15 
am] 
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[Public Notice 6742] 

Industry Advisory Panel: Notice of 
Charter Renewal 

Summary: The Under Secretary for 
Management has approved the renewal 
of the charter for the Bureau of Overseas 
Buildings Operations’ Industry 
Advisory Panel for an additional two- 
year period. The panel meets quarterly 
in the Harry S Truman Building, U.S. 
Department of State, located at 2201 C 
Street, NW., 23rd Street entrance in 
Washington, DC. The majority of each 
meeting is devoted to an exchange of 
ideas between the Department’s Bureau 
of Overseas Buildings Operations’ 
senior management and the panel 
members on design, operations, 
security, and building maintenance. The 
meetings are open to the public and are 
subject to advance registration and 
provision of required security 
information. Procedures for registration 
are included with each meeting 
announcement. 

If you have any questions, please 
contact Jonathan Blyth at 
BlythJJ@state.gov or on (703) 875–4131. 

Adam E. Namm, 
Acting Director, Bureau of Overseas Buildings 
Operations, U.S. Department of State. 
[FR Doc. E9–25225 Filed 10–19–09; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Public Notice 6711] 

Shipping Coordinating Committee; 
Notice of Committee Meeting 

The Shipping Coordinating 
Committee (SHC) will conduct an open 
meeting at 9:30 a.m. Wednesday 
November 4, 2009, Tuesday December 
15, 2009, and Tuesday February 23, 
2010 in suite 1060 of the Radio 
Technical Commission for Maritime 
Services (RTCM), 1800 North Kent 
Street, Arlington, VA 22209. The 
primary purpose of the meetings is to 
prepare for the 14th Session of the 
International Maritime Organization 
(IMO) Subcommittee on 
Radiocommunications and Search and 
Rescue scheduled for the week of March 
8–12, 2010, in London, England. 

The primary matters to be considered 
include: 
—Adoption of the agenda. 
—Decisions of other IMO bodies. 
—Global Maritime Distress and Safety 

System (GMDSS). 
—ITU Radiocommunication matters. 
—Satellite services (Inmarsat and 

COSPAS–SARSAT). 
—Matters concerning search and rescue, 

including those related to the 1979 
SAR Conference and the 
implementation of the GMDSS. 

—Developments in maritime 
radiocommunication systems and 
technology. 

—Revision of the IAMSAR Manual. 
—Development of procedures for 

updating shipborne navigation and 
communication equipment. 

—Measures to protect the safety of 
persons rescued at sea. 

—Safety provisions applicable to 
tenders operating from passenger 
ships. 

—Development of an e-navigation 
strategy implementation plan. 

—Revision of Performance Standards for 
Float-Free Satellite EPIRBs operating 
on 406 MHz (resolution A.810(19)). 

—Any other business such as papers 
submitted by other delegations to the 
Subcommittee. 
Members of the public may attend 

this meeting up to the seating capacity 
of the room. To facilitate attendance, 
those who plan to attend should contact 
the meeting coordinator, Mr. Russell S. 
Levin, by writing: U.S. Coast Guard 
Headquarters, Commandant (CG–622), 
2100 Second Street, SW., Stop 7101, 
Washington DC, 20593–7101 or by 
sending Internet electronic mail to 
Russell.S.Levin@USCG.mil not later 
than 72 hours before the meeting. A 
member of the public needing 
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