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Needs and Uses: FCC Form 601 is a 
consolidated, multi-part application 
form that is used for market-based and 
site-based licensing for wireless 
telecommunications services, including 
public safety licenses, which are filed 
through the Commission’s Universal 
Licensing System (ULS). FCC Form 601 
is composed of a main form that 
contains administrative information and 
a series of schedules used for filing 
technical and other information. This 
form is used to apply for a new license, 
to amend or withdraw a pending 
application, to modify or renew an 
existing license, cancel a license, 
request a duplicate license, submit 
required notifications, request an 
extension of time to satisfy construction 
requirements, or request an 
administrative update to an existing 
license (such as mailing address 
change), request a Special Temporary 
Authority or Developmental License. 
Respondents are encouraged to submit 
FCC Form 601 electronically and are 
required to do so when submitting FCC 
Form 601 to apply for an authorization 
for which the applicant was the winning 
bidder in a spectrum auction. 

The data collected on FCC Form 601 
includes the FCC Registration Number 
(FRN), which serves as a ‘‘common 
link’’ for all filings an entity has with 
the FCC. The Debt Collection 
Improvement Act of 1996 requires 
entities filing with the Commission use 
an FRN. 

On July 14, 2016, the Commission 
released a Report and Order in which it 
established the Upper Microwave 
Flexible Use Service authorizing mobile 
use in the 27.5–28.35 GHz, 37–38.6 
GHz, and 38.6–40 GHz (39 GHz) bands, 
See Use of Spectrum Bands Above 24 
GHz For Mobile Radio Services, et al., 
Report and Order and Further Notice of 
Proposed Rulemaking, FCC 16–89, 31 
FCC Rcd 8014 (2016). Of relevance to 
the information collection at issue here, 
the Commission established a process 
by which 39 GHz licensees can conduct 
a voluntary, pre-auction license swap or 
exchange which would give licensees 
the opportunity to consolidate their 
licensed blocks into larger tranches of 
contiguous spectrum thereby leaving 
more valuable empty contiguous 
channel blocks for the Commission to 
auction. 

The Commission seeks approval for 
revisions to its currently approved 
collection of information under OMB 
Control Number 3060–0798 to permit 
the collection of the additional 
information for Commission licenses 
and permits, pursuant to the 
information collection requirements 
adopted by the Commission in the 

Spectrum Frontiers R&O, including the 
provisions authorizing voluntary 
channel swaps. We are proposing to 
revise schedule E of form 601 to allow 
licensees to file a modification to 
indicate active licenses and leases they 
are requesting authorization to swap. 
We do not anticipate that this revision 
will have any impact on the burden to 
complete the form. 

The Commission therefore seeks 
approval for a revision to its currently 
approved information collection on FCC 
Form 601 to revise FCC Form 601 
accordingly. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Sheryl D. Todd, 
Deputy Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2017–06486 Filed 3–31–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0874 and 3060–1203] 

Information Collections Being 
Submitted for Review and Approval to 
the Office of Management and Budget 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995, the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
the Commission) invites the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 

The Commission may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless it displays a currently valid 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) control number. No person shall 
be subject to any penalty for failing to 

comply with a collection of information 
subject to the PRA that does not display 
a valid OMB control number. 
DATES: Written comments should be 
submitted on or before May 3, 2017. If 
you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments, but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contacts listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Nicholas A. Fraser, OMB, via email 
Nicholas_A._Fraser@omb.eop.gov; and 
to Cathy Williams, FCC, via email PRA@
fcc.gov and to Cathy.Williams@fcc.gov. 
Include in the comments the OMB 
control number as shown in the 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION below. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information or copies of the 
information collection, contact Cathy 
Williams at (202) 418–2918. To view a 
copy of this information collection 
request (ICR) submitted to OMB: (1) Go 
to the Web page http://www.reginfo.gov/ 
public/do/PRAMain, (2) look for the 
section of the Web page called 
‘‘Currently Under Review,’’ (3) click on 
the downward-pointing arrow in the 
‘‘Select Agency’’ box below the 
‘‘Currently Under Review’’ heading, (4) 
select ‘‘Federal Communications 
Commission’’ from the list of agencies 
presented in the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box, 
(5) click the ‘‘Submit’’ button to the 
right of the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box, (6) 
when the list of FCC ICRs currently 
under review appears, look for the OMB 
control number of this ICR and then 
click on the ICR Reference Number. A 
copy of the FCC submission to OMB 
will be displayed. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: As part of 
its continuing effort to reduce 
paperwork burdens, and as required by 
the Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) of 
1995 (44 U.S.C. 3501–3520), the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
the Commission) invites the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
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further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 

OMB Control No.: 3060–1203. 
Title: Section 79.107 User Interfaces 

Provided by Digital Apparatus; Section 
*4878 79.108 Video Programming 
Guides and Menus Provided by 
Navigation Devices; Section 79.110 
Complaint Procedures for User 
Interfaces, Menus and Guides, and 
Activating Accessibility Features on 
Digital Apparatus and Navigation 
Devices. 

Form No.: N/A. 
Type of Review: Revision of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Individuals or 

households; Business or other for-profit 
entities; Not for profit institutions; State, 
Local or Tribal government. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 4,175 respondents and 
516,982 responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.0167 
hours to 10 hours. 

Frequency of Response: On occasion 
reporting requirement; Third party 
disclosure requirement; Recordkeeping 
requirement. 

Obligation To Respond: Voluntary. 
The statutory authority for this 
information collection is contained in 
the Twenty-First Century 
Communications and Video 
Accessibility Act of 2010 (CVAA), 
Public Law 111–260, 124 Stat. 2751, and 
sections 4(i), 4(j), 303(r), 303(u), 303(aa), 
303(bb), and 716(g) of the 
Communications Act of 1934, as 
amended, 47 U.S.C. 154(i), 154(j), 
303(r), 303(u), 303(aa), 303(bb), and 
617(g). 

Total Annual Burden: 24,043 hours. 
Annual Cost Burden: $70,500. 
Nature and Extent of Confidentiality: 

Confidentiality is an issue to the extent 
that individuals and households 
provide personally identifiable 
information, which is covered under the 
FCC’s updated system of records notice 
(SORN), FCC/CGB–1, ‘‘Informal 
Complaints, Inquiries, and Requests for 
Dispute Assistance.’’ As required by the 
Privacy Act, 5 U.S.C. 552a, the 
Commission also published a SORN, 
FCC/CGB–1 ‘‘Informal Complaints, 
Inquiries, and Requests for Dispute 
Assistance,’’ in the Federal Register on 
August 15, 2014 (79 FR 48152) which 
became effective on September 24, 2014. 

Privacy Act Impact Assessment: The 
FCC completed a Privacy Impact 
Assessment (PIA) on June 28, 2007. It 
may be reviewed at http://www.fcc.gov/ 
omd/privacyact/Privacy-Impact- 
Assessment.html. The Commission is in 
the process of updating the PIA to 

incorporate various revisions to it as a 
result of revisions to the SORN. 

Needs and Uses: On October 29, 2013, 
in document FCC 13–138, Report and 
Order and Further Notice of Proposed 
Rulemaking (the User Interfaces 
Accessibility Order), MB Docket Nos. 
12–108, 12–107, published at 78 FR 
77210, December 20, 2013, the 
Commission adopted rules 
implementing sections 204 and 205 of 
the CVAA related to making accessible 
the user interfaces, text menus and 
guides of digital apparatus designed to 
receive or play back video programming 
and navigation devices for the display 
or selection of multichannel video 
programming. On November 20, 2015, 
in document FCC 15–156, the 
Commission released a Second Report 
and Order, Order on Reconsideration, 
and Second Further Notice of Proposed 
Rulemaking (the Second User Interfaces 
Accessibility Order), MB Docket No. 12– 
108, published at 81 FR 5921, February 
14, 2016, adopting additional rules to 
ensure that consumers are able to find 
out about what accessible devices and 
features are available from covered 
manufacturers and multichannel video 
programming distributors (MVPDs) and 
how to use such devices and features. 
Collectively, these rules are codified at 
47 CFR 79.107–79.110. 

Covered entities are required to 
comply with the rules and information 
collection requirements contained in the 
User Interfaces Accessibility Order and 
in the Second User Interfaces 
Accessibility Order beginning December 
20, 2016. 

The Commission is submitting this 
revised information collection to 
transfer certain information collection 
burdens associated with this OMB 
Control Number 3060–1203 to OMB 
Control Number 3060–0874. This 
transfer is being made because the 
Commission’s online consumer 
complaint portal, which is part of the 
information collection contained in 
OMB Control Number 3060–0874, is 
being revised to enable consumers to 
file complaints related to the 
Commission’s user interfaces 
accessibility requirements through the 
Commission’s online complaint portal. 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0874. 
Title: Consumer Complaint Portal: 

General Complaints, Obscenity or 
Indecency Complaints, Complaints 
under the Telephone Consumer 
Protection Act, Slamming Complaints, 
RDAs and Communications 
Accessibility Complaints. 

Form Number: N/A. 
Type of Review: Revision of a 

currently approved collection. 

Respondents: Individuals or 
households; Business or other for-profit 
entities; Not for profit institutions; State, 
Local or Tribal Government. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 335,979 respondents; 
335,979 responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 15 
minutes (.25 hours) to 30 minutes (.50 
hours). 

Frequency of Response: On occasion 
reporting requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Voluntary. 
The statutory authority for this 
collection is contained in 47 U.S.C. 208 
of the Communications Act of 1934, as 
amended (the Act). 

Total Annual Burden: 84,006 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: None. 
Nature and Extent of Confidentiality: 

Confidentiality is an issue to the extent 
that individuals and households 
provide personally identifiable 
information, which is covered under the 
FCC’s updated system of records notice 
(SORN), FCC/CGB–1, ‘‘Informal 
Complaints, Inquiries and Requests for 
Dispute Assistance.’’ As required by the 
Privacy Act, 5 U.S.C. 552a, the 
Commission also published a SORN, 
FCC/CGB–1 ‘‘Informal Complaints, 
Inquiries, and Requests for Dispute 
Assistance,’’ in the Federal Register on 
August 15, 2014 (79 FR 48152) which 
became effective on September 24, 2014. 

Privacy Impact Assessment: The FCC 
completed a Privacy Impact Assessment 
(PIA) on June 28, 2007. It may be 
reviewed at http://www.fcc.gov/omd/ 
privacyact/Privacy-Impact- 
Assessment.html. The Commission is in 
the process of updating the PIA to 
incorporate various revisions to it as a 
result of revisions to the SORN. 

Needs and Uses: The Commission 
consolidated all of the FCC informal 
consumer complaint intake into an 
online consumer complaint portal, 
which allows the Commission to better 
manage the collection of informal 
consumer complaints. Informal 
consumer complaints consist of 
informal consumer complaints, 
inquiries and comments. This revised 
information collection requests OMB 
approval for the addition of a layer of 
consumer reported complaint 
information related to the FCC’s 
disability accessibility requirements for 
video programming digital apparatus 
and navigation device user interfaces 
(e.g., TV and set-top box controls, 
menus, and program guides). 

The information collection burdens 
associated with these complaints is 
being transferred from OMB Control 
Number 3060–1203 to OMB Control 
Number 3060–0874 to enable consumers 
to file complaints related to the 
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Commission’s user interfaces 
accessibility requirements through the 
Commission’s online complaint portal. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Sheryl D. Todd, 
Deputy Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2017–06484 Filed 3–31–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL ELECTION COMMISSION 

Sunshine Act Meeting 

AGENCY: Federal Election Commission. 
DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, March 21, 2017 
At 10:00 a.m. and Its Continuation at the 
Conclusion of the Open Meeting on 
March 23, 2017. 
PLACE: 999 E Street NW., Washington, 
DC. 
STATUS: This Meeting Was Closed To 
The Public. 

Federal Register Notice of Previous 
Announcement—82 FR 14000 

Change in the Meeting: This meeting 
was continued on March 29, 2017. 

This meeting also discussed: 
Investigatory records compiled for law 
enforcement purposes and production 
would disclose investigative techniques. 
* * * * * 

Person To Contact for Information: 
Judith Ingram, Press Officer, Telephone: 
(202) 694–1220. 

Dayna C. Brown, 
Secretary and Clerk of the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2017–06559 Filed 3–30–17; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 6715–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Proposed Agency Information 
Collection Activities; Comment 
Request 

AGENCY: Board of Governors of the 
Federal Reserve System. 
ACTION: Notice, request for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Board of Governors of the 
Federal Reserve System (Board or 
Federal Reserve) invites comment on a 
proposal to extend, without revision, 
the recordkeeping and disclosure 
requirements associated with 
Regulation R. 

On June 15, 1984, the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) 
delegated to the Board authority under 
the Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) to 
approve of and assign OMB control 
numbers to collection of information 
requests and requirements conducted or 
sponsored by the Board. In exercising 

this delegated authority, the Board is 
directed to take every reasonable step to 
solicit comment. In determining 
whether to approve a collection of 
information, the Board will consider all 
comments received from the public and 
other agencies. 
DATES: Comments must be submitted on 
or before June 2, 2017. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by FR 4025, by any of the 
following methods: 

• Agency Web site: http://
www.federalreserve.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments at 
http://www.federalreserve.gov/apps/ 
foia/proposedregs.aspx. 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Email: regs.comments@
federalreserve.gov. Include OMB 
number in the subject line of the 
message. 

• Fax: (202) 452–3819 or (202) 452– 
3102. 

• Mail: Robert deV. Frierson, 
Secretary, Board of Governors of the 
Federal Reserve System, 20th Street and 
Constitution Avenue NW., Washington, 
DC 20551. 
All public comments are available from 
the Board’s Web site at http://
www.federalreserve.gov/apps/foia/ 
proposedregs.aspx as submitted, unless 
modified for technical reasons. 
Accordingly, your comments will not be 
edited to remove any identifying or 
contact information. Public comments 
may also be viewed electronically or in 
paper form in Room 3515, 1801 K Street 
(between 18th and 19th Streets NW.,) 
Washington, DC 20006 between 9:00 
a.m. and 5:00 p.m. on weekdays. 

Additionally, commenters may send a 
copy of their comments to the OMB 
Desk Officer—Shagufta Ahmed—Office 
of Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget, New 
Executive Office Building, Room 10235 
725 17th Street NW., Washington, DC 
20503 or by fax to (202) 395–6974. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: A 
copy of the PRA OMB submission, 
including the proposed reporting form 
and instructions, supporting statement, 
and other documentation will be placed 
into OMB’s public docket files, once 
approved. These documents will also be 
made available on the Federal Reserve 
Board’s public Web site at: http://
www.federalreserve.gov/apps/ 
reportforms/review.aspx or may be 
requested from the agency clearance 
officer, whose name appears below. 

Federal Reserve Board Clearance 
Officer—Nuha Elmaghrabi—Office of 
the Chief Data Officer, Board of 

Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, Washington, DC 20551 (202) 
452–3829. Telecommunications Device 
for the Deaf (TDD) users may contact 
(202) 263–4869, Board of Governors of 
the Federal Reserve System, 
Washington, DC 20551. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Request for Comment on Information 
Collection Proposal 

The Board invites public comment on 
the following information collection, 
which is being reviewed under 
authority delegated by the OMB under 
the PRA. Comments are invited on the 
following: 

a. Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the Federal Reserve’s 
functions; including whether the 
information has practical utility; 

b. The accuracy of the Federal 
Reserve’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed information collection, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

c. Ways to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information to 
be collected; 

d. Ways to minimize the burden of 
information collection on respondents, 
including through the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and 

e. Estimates of capital or startup costs 
and costs of operation, maintenance, 
and purchase of services to provide 
information. 
At the end of the comment period, the 
comments and recommendations 
received will be analyzed to determine 
the extent to which the Federal Reserve 
should modify the proposed revisions 
prior to giving final approval. 

Proposal to approve under OMB 
delegated authority the extension for 
three years, without revision, of the 
following report(s): 

Report title: Recordkeeping and 
Disclosure Requirements Associated 
with Regulation R. 

OMB control number: 7100–0316. 
Frequency: On occasion. 
Respondents: Commercial banks and 

savings associations. 
Estimated number of respondents: 

Section 701 disclosures to customers: 
1,500; Section 701 disclosures to 
brokers: 1,500, Section 723 
recordkeeping: 75; Section 741 
disclosures to customers: 750. 

Estimated average hours per response: 
Section 701 disclosures to customers: 5 
minutes; Section 701 disclosures to 
brokers: 15 minutes, Section 723 
recordkeeping: 15 minutes; Section 741 
disclosures to customers: 5 minutes. 
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