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1 The record is defined in § 207.2(f) of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and Procedure (19 
CFR 207.2(f)). 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation No. 731–TA–747 (Fifth 
Review)] 

Fresh Tomatoes From Mexico; Revised 
Schedule for the Subject Review 

AGENCY: United States International 
Trade Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

DATES: May 12, 2025. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Lawrence Jones (202–205–3358), Office 
of Investigations, U.S. International 
Trade Commission, 500 E Street SW, 
Washington, DC 20436. Hearing- 
impaired persons can obtain 
information on this matter by contacting 
the Commission’s TDD terminal on 202– 
205–1810. Persons with mobility 
impairments who will need special 
assistance in gaining access to the 
Commission should contact the Office 
of the Secretary at 202–205–2000. 
General information concerning the 
Commission may also be obtained by 
accessing its internet server (https://
www.usitc.gov). The public record for 
this review may be viewed on the 
Commission’s electronic docket (EDIS) 
at https://edis.usitc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Effective 
March 20, 2025, the Commission 
established a schedule for the conduct 
of the full review (90 FR 13627, March 
25, 2025). On April 14, 2025, Commerce 
announced the date for its antidumping 
duty order as July 14, 2025, following its 
announcement of its intent to withdraw 
from the 2019 Tomato Suspension 
Agreement. The Commission is revising 
its schedule in light of Commerce’s 
pending antidumping duty order. 
Specifically, the Commission is revising 
the date when the prehearing staff 
report will be placed in the nonpublic 
record to July 31, 2025. 

For further information concerning 
this proceeding, see the Commission’s 
notice cited above and the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, part 201, subparts A through 
E (19 CFR part 201), and part 207, 
subparts A and C (19 CFR part 207). 

Authority: This review is being 
conducted under authority of title VII of 
the Tariff Act of 1930; this notice is 
published pursuant to § 207.21 of the 
Commission’s rules. 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: May 14, 2025. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2025–08946 Filed 5–19–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation No. 731–TA–1424 (Review)] 

Mattresses From China 

Determination 
On the basis of the record 1 developed 

in the subject five-year review, the 
United States International Trade 
Commission (‘‘Commission’’) 
determines, pursuant to the Tariff Act of 
1930 (‘‘the Act’’), that revocation of the 
antidumping duty order on mattresses 
from China would be likely to lead to 
continuation or recurrence of material 
injury to an industry in the United 
States within a reasonably foreseeable 
time. 

Background 
The Commission instituted this 

review on November 1, 2024 (89 FR 
87404) and determined on February 4, 
2025, that it would conduct an 
expedited review (90 FR 11546, March 
7, 2025). 

The Commission made this 
determination pursuant to section 
751(c) of the Act (19 U.S.C. 1675(c)). It 
completed and filed its determination in 
this review on May 15, 2025. The views 
of the Commission are contained in 
USITC Publication 5621 (May 2025), 
entitled Mattresses from China: 
Investigation No. 731–TA–1424 
(Review). 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: May 15, 2025. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2025–09015 Filed 5–19–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

Notice of Receipt of Complaint; 
Solicitation of Comments Relating to 
the Public Interest 

AGENCY: U.S. International Trade 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given that 
the U.S. International Trade 
Commission has received a complaint 
entitled ‘‘Certain Boiler Protection for 
Absorption Refrigeration Systems, 
Components Thereof, and Products 
Containing the Same, DN 3829;’’ the 
Commission is soliciting comments on 
any public interest issues raised by the 

complaint or complainant’s filing 
pursuant to the Commission’s Rules of 
Practice and Procedure. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Lisa 
R. Barton, Secretary to the Commission, 
U.S. International Trade Commission, 
500 E Street SW, Washington, DC 
20436, telephone (202) 205–2000. The 
public version of the complaint can be 
accessed on the Commission’s 
Electronic Document Information 
System (EDIS) at https://edis.usitc.gov. 
For help accessing EDIS, please email 
EDIS3Help@usitc.gov. 

General information concerning the 
Commission may also be obtained by 
accessing its internet server at United 
States International Trade Commission 
(USITC) at https://www.usitc.gov. The 
public record for this investigation may 
be viewed on the Commission’s 
Electronic Document Information 
System (EDIS) at https://edis.usitc.gov. 
Hearing-impaired persons are advised 
that information on this matter can be 
obtained by contacting the 
Commission’s TDD terminal on (202) 
205–1810. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Commission has received a complaint 
and a submission pursuant to § 210.8(b) 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure filed on behalf of Paul N 
Unmack DBA ARPC LLC (Manufacture 
of ‘Fridge Defend®’ product) on May 14, 
2025. The complaint alleges violations 
of section 337 of the Tariff Act of 1930 
(19 U.S.C. 1337) in the importation into 
the United States, the sale for 
importation, and the sale within the 
United States after importation of 
certain boiler protection for absorption 
refrigeration systems, components 
thereof, and products containing the 
same. The complaint names as 
respondents: Kuofanghenan
maoyiyouxiangongsi of China; 
Wuhujiaoxiangdianzishangwuyouxian
gongsi of China; Wang Hai Ping of 
China; Shenzhenshi Xiangfan 
Xinxizixun Youxiangongsi of China; 
Ruianshichensumaoyiyouxiangongsi of 
China; Qingyuannuozedianzishangwu
youxianzerengongsi of China; Wuhu 
Tianhao e-commerce Co., Ltd. of China; 
shen zhen shi hong kang da ke ji you 
xian gong si of China; guangzhou 
yingpeng dianzi shangwu 
youxiangongsi of China; and shen zhen 
shi xing han xing dian zi shang wu you 
xian gong si of China. The complainant 
requests that the Commission issue a 
general exclusion order, or, in the 
alternative, a limited exclusion order, 
cease and desist orders, and impose a 
bond upon respondents’ alleged 
infringing articles during the 60-day 
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