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You may also submit comments and 
recommendations, identified by Docket 
ID number and title, by the following 
method: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name, Docket 
ID number, and title for this Federal 
Register document. The general policy 
for comments and other submissions 
from members of the public is to make 
these submissions available for public 
viewing on the internet at http://
www.regulations.gov as they are 
received without change, including any 
personal identifiers or contact 
information. 

DOD Clearance Officer: Ms. Angela 
Duncan. 

Requests for copies of the information 
collection proposal should be sent to 
Ms. Duncan at whs.mc-alex.esd.mbx.dd- 
dod-information-collections@mail.mil. 

Dated: February 7, 2022. 
Aaron T. Siegel, 
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison 
Officer, Department of Defense. 
[FR Doc. 2022–02989 Filed 2–10–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–06–P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Federal Perkins Loan, Federal Work- 
Study, and Federal Supplemental 
Educational Opportunity Grant 
Programs; 2022–23 Award Year 
Deadline Dates 

In notice document 2022–01897 
beginning on page 4871 in the issue of 
Monday, January 31, 2022, make the 
following correction: 

On page 4872, in the table, under the 
heading ‘‘What is the deadline for 
submission?’’, entry five should read 
‘‘Tuesday, November 1, 2022.’’. 
[FR Doc. C1–2022–01897 Filed 2–10–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 1505–01–D 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

[Docket No.: ED–2022–SCC–0011] 

Supplemental Support Under the 
American Rescue Plan (SSARP) 
Application; Correction 

AGENCY: Office of Postsecondary 
Education (OPE), Department of 
Education (ED). 
ACTION: Correction notice. 

On February 8, 2022, the U.S. 
Department of Education published a 
correction notice in the Federal Register 

(Vol. 87, No 26, Page 7163, Column 2) 
seeking to correct the public comment 
period closing date for an information 
collection entitled, ‘‘Supplemental 
Support under the American Rescue 
Plan (SSARP) Application.’’ The Docket 
Number for the correction (ED–2020– 
SCC–0011), is incorrect, and the correct 
Docket Number is ED–2022–SCC–0011. 

The PRA Coordinator, Strategic 
Collections and Clearance, Office of the 
Chief Data Officer, Office of Planning, 
Evaluation and Policy Development, 
hereby issues a correction notice as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act of 1995. 

Dated: February 8, 2022. 
Kate Mullan, 
PRA Coordinator, Strategic Collections and 
Clearance Office of the Chief Data Officer, 
Office of Planning, Evaluation and Policy 
Development. 
[FR Doc. 2022–02997 Filed 2–10–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

[OE Docket No. EA–431–A] 

Application To Export Electric Energy; 
Tenaska Power Services Co. 

AGENCY: Office of Electricity, 
Department of Energy. 
ACTION: Notice of application. 

SUMMARY: Tenaska Power Services Co. 
(Applicant or TPS) has applied for 
authorization to transmit electric energy 
from the United States to Mexico 
pursuant to the Federal Power Act. 
DATES: Comments, protests, or motions 
to intervene must be submitted on or 
before February 28, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: Comments, protests, 
motions to intervene, or requests for 
more information should be addressed 
by electronic mail to 
Electricity.Exports@hq.doe.gov, or by 
facsimile to (202) 586–8008. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Matt 
Aronoff, 202–586–5863, 
matthew.aronoff@hq.doe.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Department of Energy (DOE) regulates 
exports of electricity from the United 
States to a foreign country, pursuant to 
sections 301(b) and 402(f) of the 
Department of Energy Organization Act 
(42 U.S.C. 7151(b) and 42 U.S.C. 
7172(f)). Such exports require 
authorization under section 202(e) of 
the Federal Power Act (FPA) (16 U.S.C. 
824a(e)). 

On November 3, 2021, TPS filed an 
application with DOE (Application or 
App.) ‘‘for renewal of its blanket 

authorization to transmit electric energy 
from the United States to Mexico for a 
period of five years.’’ App. at 1. TPS 
states that it ‘‘is authorized to do 
business in the State of Nebraska and 
such other states as required by the 
current nature of its business,’’ adding 
that it ‘‘is a power marketer authorized 
by the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission (FERC) to make sales of 
electric power at wholesale in interstate 
commerce at market-based rates.’’ Id. 
TPS represents that it ‘‘does not own or 
control any transmission facilities and 
does not have a franchised service 
area.’’ Id. 

TPS further claims that it would 
‘‘purchase the electricity that it may 
export, on either a firm or an 
interruptible basis, from wholesale 
generators, electric utilities, federal 
power marketing agencies and affiliates 
through negotiated agreements that have 
been voluntarily executed by the selling 
parties after considering their own need 
for any such electricity.’’ App. at 3. TPS 
contends that its ‘‘proposed electricity 
exports will not impair or tend to 
impede the sufficiency of electric power 
supplies in the United States or the 
regional coordination of electric utility 
planning or operations.’’ App. at 3–4. 

TPS applied to renew the 
authorization granted in DOE Order No. 
EA–431, which expired on January 26, 
2022. Due to an unexpected delay in 
processing the renewal application, 
DOE has not yet evaluated whether the 
application satisfies the requirements of 
FPA section 202(e). TPS has requested 
expedited treatment of its application, 
to avoid any continued lapse in its 
export authority and to minimize the 
disruption to its electricity trade. TPS 
has also indicated that it has not 
engaged in the export of electricity since 
its authorization expired and will not do 
so unless and until it receives an Order 
granting renewal of its export authority 
in this proceeding. In response to TPS’s 
request for expedited treatment, DOE 
has shortened the public comment 
period to 15 days. 

The existing international 
transmission facilities to be utilized by 
the Applicant have previously been 
authorized by Presidential permits 
issued pursuant to Executive Order 
10485, as amended, and are appropriate 
for open access transmission by third 
parties. 

Procedural Matters: Any person 
desiring to be heard in this proceeding 
should file a comment or protest to the 
Application at the address provided 
above. Protests should be filed in 
accordance with Rule 211 of the FERC 
Rules of Practice and Procedure (18 CFR 
385.211). Any person desiring to 
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1 Texas Eastern Transmission Corp., 21 FERC 
¶ 62,199 (1982). 

become a party to this proceeding 
should file a motion to intervene at the 
above address in accordance with FERC 
Rule 214 (18 CFR 385.214). 

Comments and other filings 
concerning TPS’s application to export 
electric energy to Canada should be 
clearly marked with OE Docket No. EA– 
431–A. Additional copies are to be 
provided directly to Norma Rosner 
Iacovo, 300 East John Carpenter 
Freeway, Suite 100, Irving, TX 75062, 
niacovo@tnsk.com; and Neil L. Levy, 
500 North Capitol Street NW, 
Washington, DC 20001, nlevy@
mwe.com. 

A final decision will be made on the 
requested authorization after the 
environmental impacts have been 
evaluated pursuant to DOE’s National 
Environmental Policy Act Implementing 
Procedures (10 CFR part 1021) and after 
DOE evaluates whether the proposed 
action will have an adverse impact on 
the sufficiency of supply or reliability of 
the U.S. electric power supply system. 

Copies of the Application will be 
made available, upon request, by 
accessing the program website at 
https://energy.gov/node/11845, or by 
emailing Matt Aronoff at 
matthew.aronoff@hq.doe.gov. 

Signed in Washington, DC, on February 8, 
2022. 
Christopher Lawrence, 
Management and Program Analyst, Electricity 
Delivery Division, Office of Electricity. 
[FR Doc. 2022–02970 Filed 2–10–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 2879–012] 

Green Mountain Power; Notice of 
Meeting 

a. Project Name and Number: Bolton 
Falls Hydroelectric Project No. 2879– 
012. 

b. Applicant: Green Mountain Power 
(GMP). 

c. Date and Time of Meeting: February 
23, 2022 at 10:00 a.m. EST. 

d. FERC Contact: Michael Tust, (202) 
502–6522, michael.tust@ferc.gov. 

e. Purpose of Meeting: Commission 
staff will hold a teleconference with 
staff from GMP and the Vermont State 
Historic Preservation Office to discuss 
the status of pending revisions to GMP’s 
Historic Properties Management Plan 
and a projected schedule for finalizing 
and signing a Programmatic Agreement. 

f. All local, state, and federal agencies, 
Indian tribes, and other interested 

parties are invited to attend the meeting. 
Please call or email Michael Tust at 
(202) 502–6522 or michael.tust@ferc.gov 
by February 18, 2022 at 4:30 p.m. EST, 
to RSVP and to receive specific 
instructions on how to participate. 

Dated: February 7, 2022. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–02954 Filed 2–10–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings 

Take notice that the Commission has 
received the following Natural Gas 
Pipeline Rate and Refund Report filings: 

Filings Instituting Proceedings 

Docket Numbers: RP22–539–000. 
Applicants: Texas Eastern 

Transmission, LP. 
Description: Compliance filing: 

TETLP Ministerial Compliance Filing 
RP21–1001–000 to be effective 9/1/ 
2021. 

Filed Date: 2/4/22. 
Accession Number: 20220204–5199. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 2/16/22. 
Any person desiring to intervene or 

protest in any of the above proceedings 
must file in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s 
Regulations (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 
Protests may be considered, but 
intervention is necessary to become a 
party to the proceeding. 

The filings are accessible in the 
Commission’s eLibrary system (https://
elibrary.ferc.gov/idmws/search/ 
fercgensearch.asp) by querying the 
docket number. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

Dated: February 7, 2022. 

Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–02958 Filed 2–10–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP22–43–000] 

Texas Eastern Transmission, LP; 
Notice of Request Under Blanket 
Authorization and Establishing 
Intervention and Protest Deadline 

Take notice that on January 27, 2022, 
Texas Eastern Transmission, LP (Texas 
Eastern), 5400 Westheimer Court, 
Houston, Texas 77056, filed in the 
above referenced docket a prior notice 
pursuant to Section 157.205 and 
157.208 of the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission’s regulations 
under the Natural Gas Act and the 
blanket certificate issued by the 
Commission in Docket No. CP82–535– 
000, 1 seeking authorization to construct 
and operate interconnection facilities 
between Texas Eastern and Venture 
Global Gator Express, LLC (Gator 
Express) in Plaquemines Parish, 
Louisiana. Specifically, Texas Eastern 
proposes to construct a new metering 
and regulating facilities (M&R Facilities) 
which will be installed on a platform 
owned by Gator Express with 
approximately 0.2 mile of 30-inch- 
diameter interconnecting piping and a 
riser to connect Texas Eastern’s Line to 
M&R Facilities on the Gator Express 
platform. The proposed construction 
will have a delivery capacity of 240,000 
dekatherms per day and is estimated to 
cost approximately $30,600,000, all as 
more fully set forth in the request which 
is on file with the Commission and open 
to public inspection. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. At this 
time, the Commission has suspended 
access to the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 
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