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1 Handbook for Electronic Filing Procedures: 
https://www.usitc.gov/documents/handbook_on_
filing_procedures.pdf. 

2 All contract personnel will sign appropriate 
nondisclosure agreements. 

3 Electronic Document Information System 
(EDIS): https://edis.usitc.gov. 

replace the volume of articles 
potentially subject to the requested 
exclusion order and/or a cease and 
desist order within a commercially 
reasonable time; and 

(v) explain how the requested 
remedial orders would impact United 
States consumers. 

Written submissions on the public 
interest must be filed no later than by 
close of business, eight calendar days 
after the date of publication of this 
notice in the Federal Register. There 
will be further opportunities for 
comment on the public interest after the 
issuance of any final initial 
determination in this investigation. Any 
written submissions on other issues 
must also be filed by no later than the 
close of business, eight calendar days 
after publication of this notice in the 
Federal Register. Complainant may file 
replies to any written submissions no 
later than three calendar days after the 
date on which any initial submissions 
were due. No other submissions will be 
accepted, unless requested by the 
Commission. Any submissions and 
replies filed in response to this Notice 
are limited to five (5) pages in length, 
inclusive of attachments. 

Persons filing written submissions 
must file the original document 
electronically on or before the deadlines 
stated above. Submissions should refer 
to the docket number (‘‘Docket No. 
3625’’) in a prominent place on the 
cover page and/or the first page. (See 
Handbook for Electronic Filing 
Procedures, Electronic Filing 
Procedures 1). Please note the 
Secretary’s Office will accept only 
electronic filings during this time. 
Filings must be made through the 
Commission’s Electronic Document 
Information System (EDIS, https://
edis.usitc.gov.) No in-person paper- 
based filings or paper copies of any 
electronic filings will be accepted until 
further notice. Persons with questions 
regarding filing should contact the 
Secretary at EDIS3Help@usitc.gov. 

Any person desiring to submit a 
document to the Commission in 
confidence must request confidential 
treatment. All such requests should be 
directed to the Secretary to the 
Commission and must include a full 
statement of the reasons why the 
Commission should grant such 
treatment. See 19 CFR 201.6. Documents 
for which confidential treatment by the 
Commission is properly sought will be 
treated accordingly. All information, 
including confidential business 

information and documents for which 
confidential treatment is properly 
sought, submitted to the Commission for 
purposes of this Investigation may be 
disclosed to and used: (i) by the 
Commission, its employees and Offices, 
and contract personnel (a) for 
developing or maintaining the records 
of this or a related proceeding, or (b) in 
internal investigations, audits, reviews, 
and evaluations relating to the 
programs, personnel, and operations of 
the Commission including under 5 
U.S.C. Appendix 3; or (ii) by U.S. 
government employees and contract 
personnel,2 solely for cybersecurity 
purposes. All nonconfidential written 
submissions will be available for public 
inspection at the Office of the Secretary 
and on EDIS.3 

This action is taken under the 
authority of section 337 of the Tariff Act 
of 1930, as amended (19 U.S.C. 1337), 
and of §§ 201.10 and 210.8(c) of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (19 CFR 201.10, 210.8(c)). 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: June 17, 2022. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2022–13463 Filed 6–23–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Office of Disability Employment Policy 

[Agency Docket Number DOL–2022–0002] 

RIN 1230–ZA01 

Request for Information on Current 
Population Survey Disability 
Supplement 2024 

AGENCY: Office of Disability 
Employment Policy, U.S. Department of 
Labor. 
ACTION: Request for information. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor 
(Department) is seeking information 
from the public regarding a supplement 
to the Current Population Survey (CPS) 
on disability employment issues, which 
will be conducted by the Bureau of 
Labor Statistics (BLS) and the Census 
Bureau and is expected to be fielded in 
2024. The Department is publishing this 
Request for Information (RFI) to gather 
information to aid in revising this CPS 
Disability Supplement and to inform its 
general disability employment research 
agenda. 

DATES: Comments must be received by 
August 8, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: To facilitate the receipt and 
processing of written comments on this 
RFI, the Department encourages 
interested persons to submit their 
comments electronically. You may 
submit comments, identified by 
Regulatory Information Number (RIN) 
1230–ZA01, by either of the following 
methods: 

Electronic Comments: Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments 
on the Federal eRulemaking Portal 
http://www.regulations.gov. 

Mail: Address written submissions to 
David Rosenblum, Senior Economist, 
Research & Evaluation, Office of 
Disability Employment Policy, U.S. 
Department of Labor, Room S–1313, 200 
Constitution Avenue NW, Washington, 
DC 20210. 

Instructions: This RFI is available 
through the Federal Register and the 
http://www.regulations.gov website. 
You may also access this document via 
the Office of Disability Employment 
Policy’s (ODEP) website at http://
www.dol.gov/odep. All comment 
submissions must include the agency 
name and Regulatory Information 
Number (RIN 1230–ZA01) for this RFI. 
Response to this RFI is voluntary and 
commenters need not reply to all 
questions listed below. The Department 
requests that no business proprietary 
information, copyrighted information, 
or personally identifiable information be 
submitted in response to this RFI. 
Submit only one copy of your comment 
by only one method (e.g., persons 
submitting comments electronically are 
encouraged not to submit paper copies). 
Please be advised that comments 
received will become a matter of public 
record and will be posted without 
change to http://www.regulations.gov, 
including any personal information 
provided. All comments must be 
received by 11:59 p.m. on the date 
indicated for consideration in this RFI; 
comments received after the comment 
period closes will not be considered. 
Commenters should transmit comments 
early to ensure timely receipt prior to 
the close of the comment period. 
Electronic submission via http://
www.regulations.gov enables prompt 
receipt of comments submitted as the 
Department continues to experience 
delays in the receipt of mail in our area. 
For access to the docket to read 
background documents or comments, go 
to the Federal eRulemaking Portal at 
http://www.regulations.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
David Rosenblum, Senior Economist, 
Office of Disability Employment Policy, 
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1 Technical documentation for the 2021 CPS 
Disability Supplement can be downloaded at 
https://www.census.gov/data/datasets/time-series/ 
demo/cps/cps-supp_cps-repwgt/cps-disability.html. 
The supplement begins on page 113 of the PDF file. 

U.S. Department of Labor, Room S– 
1313, 200 Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20210; telephone: (202) 
693–7840 or visit https://www.dol.gov/ 
dol/contact/contactphonecallcenter.htm 
(TTY), for information about this notice. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Background 
BLS and the Census Bureau have 

previously conducted three 
supplements to the CPS on disability 
employment issues, in May 2012, July 
2019, and July 2021. The basic monthly 
CPS has existed since the 1940s and is 
the source of official government 
statistics on the unemployment rate and 
other labor market measures. Similar to 
the previous versions, the 2024 
Disability Supplement will be 
conducted alongside the basic monthly 
CPS, and therefore the same detailed 
demographic information collected in 
the basic monthly CPS will be available 
for respondents to the Disability 
Supplement, allowing for comparisons 
across demographic characteristics, 
including sex, race, ethnicity, age, and 
educational attainment. It will also be 
possible to create estimates for those 
who are employed, unemployed, and 
not in the labor force. Because the CPS 
is a rich source of information on the 
employment status of the population, it 
will be possible to examine in detail the 
nature of various employment and 
unemployment situations for 
individuals with disabilities. 

The CPS began tracking disability 
status in June 2008 by asking six 
questions, with anyone answering 
affirmatively to at least one question 
classified as having a disability. These 
six questions are also used in other 
national surveys such as the American 
Community Survey and various other 
federal surveys. The six questions ask 
whether a person: (1) is deaf or has 
serious difficulty hearing, (2) is blind or 
has serious difficulty seeing (even with 
the assistance of corrective lenses), (3) 
has serious difficulty concentrating, 
remembering, or making decisions, (4) 
has serious difficulty walking or 
climbing stairs, (5) has difficulty 
dressing or bathing, and (6) has 
difficulty doing errands alone. 

Data from the basic monthly CPS had 
revealed large disparities in labor 
market outcomes between people with 
and without disabilities, but more 
information was needed to understand 
the challenges facing people with 
disabilities and to improve programs 
and policies designed to help people 
with disabilities. To respond to this 
need, BLS and the Census Bureau have 
conducted three supplements to the CPS 
on disability employment issues, in May 

2012, July 2019, and July 2021. The first 
round was sponsored by ODEP while 
the subsequent rounds were sponsored 
by DOL’s Chief Evaluation Office. Given 
the work-related focus of the CPS, the 
Disability Supplement was designed to 
capture data on specific issues relating 
to employment. It aimed to (1) uncover 
more detail about the low labor force 
participation rates for people with 
disabilities, (2) understand the 
effectiveness of existing programs 
intended to prepare people with 
disabilities for employment, (3) provide 
more information about the work 
history of people with disabilities, (4) 
identify barriers to employment for 
people with disabilities, (5) learn more 
about workplace accommodations that 
assist people with disabilities, and (6) 
measure the extent and effectiveness of 
financial assistance programs. The 2012 
Disability Supplement found that, of 
people with disabilities who were 
employed, more than half had some 
difficulty completing their work duties 
due to their disability. Barriers to 
employment included lack of education 
or training, lack of transportation, need 
for accommodations at the workplace, 
and a person’s own disability. 

The 2019 CPS Disability Supplement, 
which included the same set of 
questions as the 2012 version, was 
conducted to capture the effects of 
changes in the intervening seven years 
in work patterns, assistive technologies, 
and public policies on employment 
barriers for people with disabilities. Of 
people with disabilities who were not 
employed, almost half reported at least 
one barrier to employment, such as a 
person’s own disability, lack of 
education or training, lack of 
transportation, or the need for job 
accommodations. 

The third CPS Disability Supplement 
was conducted in July 2021 during the 
COVID–19 pandemic, using the same set 
of questions from the prior versions of 
the survey. This update provided 
information about how barriers to 
employment for people with disabilities 
may have changed as a result of the 
pandemic. The 2021 survey showed, of 
persons with a disability who were not 
employed, there had been a small 
decrease in the proportion of those 
reporting some type of barrier to 
employment, relative to the 2019 CPS 
Disability Supplement. 

A fourth CPS Disability Supplement 
is being prepared, to be conducted in 
2024. This Disability Supplement 
provides an opportunity to reconsider 
the questions asked in the survey in 
light of the socioeconomic changes that 
have taken places since the 

development of the current set of 
questions more than ten years ago. 

Interested parties can find the most 
recent questionnaire at Attachment 8 of: 
https://www2.census.gov/programs- 
surveys/cps/techdocs/cpsjul21.pdf. 

Request for Information 
Through this RFI, we are soliciting 

feedback from interested and affected 
parties on the data collection that will 
be undertaken via the fourth CPS 
Disability Supplement, for addressing 
disability employment related issues 
addressed in the previous three 
Disability Supplements.1 Comments to 
this RFI will inform decisions regarding 
the topics, questions, and response 
options included in the Disability 
Supplement. We encourage commenters 
to provide detail about why they 
recommend certain revisions, which 
could include, but are not limited to, 
informing policy, identifying a relevant 
subpopulation of the disability 
community, reducing respondent 
burden, or making the questions clearer 
to survey respondents. This RFI notice 
is for internal planning purposes only 
and should not be construed as a 
solicitation or as an obligation on the 
part of DOL or any participating federal 
agencies. 

We ask commenters to address the 
following questions in the context of the 
preceding discussion in this document. 
Commenters do not need to address 
every question and should focus on 
those that relate to their expertise or 
perspective. To the extent possible, 
please clearly indicate the question(s) 
addressed in your response. 

Questions 

Work History 
1. Should the question about 

difficulty completing current work 
duties (location 1003–1004) be 
rephrased in any way? Should the 
response options be altered? 

2. Should there be more extensive 
questions about past work experience 
than the single one (location 1005–1006) 
previously used? 

3. Should the question on departure 
from a job (location 1007–1008) due to 
disability distinguish between 
voluntarily leaving a job and being 
terminated from a job in the response 
options? 

Barriers to Employment 
4. Should the set of questions about 

barriers to employment (locations 1009– 
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1010 through—1025–1026), also be 
asked of those currently employed and/ 
or those who are not identified as 
having a disability? 

5. Should the categorization of 
barriers (locations 1009–1010 through 
1025–1026) be altered in any way, 
whether by adding to, removing, or 
rephrasing the existing categories? 

6. Should the question asking about 
ability to work in the absence of barriers 
(location 1027–1028) consist of a set of 
questions, with the response to each 
recorded separately for each type of 
barrier identified in the preceding set of 
questions? 

Employment Services and Vocational 
Rehabilitation 

7. Should the categorization of 
employment services (locations 1029– 
1030 through 1055–1056) be altered in 
any way, whether by adding to, 
removing, or rephrasing the existing 
categories? 

8. Should the response options be 
altered for the corresponding set of 
questions (locations 1031–1032, 1035– 
1036, 1039–1040, 1043–1044, 1047– 
1048, 1051–1052, and 1055–1056) 
asking, of those who received assistance 
from a particular type of employment 
service, how helpful these services 
were? 

Job Accommodations 

9. Should the categorization of job 
accommodations (locations 1059–1060 
through 1075–1076) be altered in any 
way, whether by adding to, removing, or 
rephrasing the existing categories? 

10. Should there be any questions 
asked about past requests for job 
accommodations, prior to the job in the 
current workplace? 

Commuting and Work Hours 

11. Should the categorization of 
transportation commuting modes 
(locations 1079–1080 through 1099– 
1100) be altered in any way, whether by 
adding to, removing, or rephrasing the 
existing categories? 

12. Should there be any questions 
about how telework/work-at-home 
options have changed since the onset of 
the COVID–19 pandemic? 

13. Should the categorization of 
reasons for work-at-home (locations 
1109–1110 through 1127–1128) be 
altered in any way, whether by adding 
to, removing, or rephrasing the existing 
categories? 

Financial Assistance 

14. Should the categorization of 
financial assistance programs (locations 
1133–1134 through 1151–1152) be 
altered in any way, whether by adding 

to, removing, or rephrasing the existing 
categories? 

15. Should the question asking about 
having worked less due to a constraint 
from a financial assistance program 
(location 1153–1154) instead consist of 
a set of questions, with the response to 
each recorded separately, for each type 
of financial assistance program 
identified in the preceding set of 
questions? 

General 

16. Are there any gaps in existing 
information about disability 
employment that have not been 
addressed by the questions contained in 
the past disability supplements but that 
could be considered for this future CPS 
Disability Supplement? 

17. Which existing questions or sets of 
questions, if any, should be removed 
from the survey? Please include a reason 
for your suggested removal. Some 
possible reasons for suggesting removal 
may include: lack of practical utility (or 
lesser utility compared with potential 
new questions), challenges to collecting 
accurate data through a household 
survey, or socioeconomic or policy 
changes obviating the continued need 
for a previously important question. 

Signed at Washington, DC this 17th day of 
June, 2022. 
Taryn Williams, 
Assistant Secretary for Disability Employment 
Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2022–13481 Filed 6–23–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–FK–P 

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND 
SPACE ADMINISTRATION 

[Notice (22–046)] 

NASA Advisory Council; Human 
Exploration and Operations Committee 
and Science Committee; Meeting 

AGENCY: National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration. 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, as 
amended, the National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration (NASA) 
announces a meeting of the Human 
Exploration Committee and the Science 
Committee of the NASA Advisory 
Council (NAC). These Committees 
report to the NAC. 
DATES: Wednesday, July 13, 2022, 1:00 
p.m. to 5:00 p.m. Eastern Time. 
ADDRESSES: Due to current COVID–19 
issues affecting NASA Headquarters 
occupancy, public attendance will be 
virtual only. See dial-in and WebEx 

information below under 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Dr. 
Bette Siegel, Designated Federal Officer, 
Human Exploration Committee, NASA 
Headquarters, Washington, DC 20546, 
via email at bette.siegel@nasa.gov or 
202–358–2245. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: As noted 
above, this meeting will be open to the 
public via Webex and telephonically. 
Webex connectivity information is 
provided below. For audio, when you 
join the Webex event, you may use your 
computer or provide your phone 
number to receive a call back, 
otherwise, call the U.S. toll conference 
number listed. 

On Wednesday, July 13, the event 
address for attendees is: https://
nasaevents.webex.com/nasaevents/ 
j.php?MTID=m81dc0850afc7f558575
eab0b5be037b8. The event number is 
2763 382 5527 and the event password 
is bEGEucws379 (72783872 from 
phones). If needed, the U.S. toll 
conference number is 1–415–527–5035 
or 1–312–500–3163 and access code is 
2763 382 5527. 

The agenda for the meeting includes 
the following topics: 
—Moon to Mars Architecture Status 
—Cross Directorate Science Utilization 
—Artemis Science Team formation 
—Processes on Integration and 

Implementation of Science in Artemis 
—Discussion on the Planetary Decadal 

It is imperative that this meeting be 
held on this day to accommodate the 
scheduling priorities of the key 
participants. 

Carol J. Hamilton, 
Acting Advisory Committee Management 
Officer, National Aeronautics and Space 
Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2022–13534 Filed 6–23–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7510–13–P 

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND 
SPACE ADMINISTRATION 

[Notice (22–045)] 

NASA Advisory Council; Science 
Committee; Meeting 

AGENCY: National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration. 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, as 
amended, the National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration (NASA) 
announces a meeting of the Science 
Committee of the NASA Advisory 
Council (NAC). This Committee reports 
to the NAC. The meeting will be held 
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