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members of the public, including 
landowners, community organizations, 
Tribal members and others, access 
publicly available information and 
navigate Commission processes. For 
public inquiries and assistance with 
making filings such as interventions, 
comments, or requests for rehearing, the 
public is encouraged to contact OPP at 
(202) 502–6595 or OPP@ferc.gov. 

Dated: February 6, 2025. 
Carlos D. Clay, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–02530 Filed 2–11–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. EF25–4–000] 

Notice of Filing; Western Area Power 
Administration 

Take notice that on February 4, 2025, 
Western Area Power Administration 
submitted a tariff filing: Formula Rate 
for Western Area Power 
Administration—Rate Order No. 
WAPA–221 to be effective 4/1/2025. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. On or before the 
comment date, it is not necessary to 
serve motions to intervene or protests 
on persons other than the Applicant. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings of comments, protests 
and interventions in lieu of paper using 
the ‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://
www.ferc.gov. Persons unable to file 
electronically may mail similar 
pleadings to the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First Street 
NE, Washington, DC 20426. Hand 
delivered submissions in docketed 
proceedings should be delivered to 
Health and Human Services, 12225 
Wilkins Avenue, Rockville, Maryland 
20852. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 

members of the public, including 
landowners, community organizations, 
Tribal members and others, access 
publicly available information and 
navigate Commission processes. For 
public inquiries and assistance with 
making filings such as interventions, 
comments, or requests for rehearing, the 
public is encouraged to contact OPP at 
(202) 502–6595 or OPP@ferc.gov. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on March 6, 2025. 

Dated: February 6, 2025. 
Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–02515 Filed 2–11–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 2310–263] 

Pacific Gas & Electric Company; 
Notice of Application for Temporary 
Flow Modification Accepted for Filing, 
Soliciting Comments, Motions To 
Intervene, and Protests 

Take notice that the following 
hydroelectric application has been filed 
with the Commission and is available 
for public inspection: 

a. Application Type: Request for a 
temporary minimum instream flow 
variance of Article 39. 

b. Project No: 2310–263. 
c. Date Filed: October 31, 2024. 
d. Applicant: Pacific Gas & Electric 

Company. 
e. Name of Project: Drum-Spaulding 

Hydroelectric Project. 
f. Location: The project is located on 

the upper reaches of the South Yuba 
and Bear Rivers in Nevada and Placer 
Counties, California, near the cities of 
Auburn, Colfax, Grass Valley and 
Nevada City. The project occupies 
federal lands within the Tahoe National 
Forest managed by the U.S. Department 
of Agriculture Forest Service. 

g. Filed Pursuant to: Federal Power 
Act, 16 U.S.C. 791a–825r. 

h. Applicant Contact: Trevor Moore, 
P.O. Box 28209, Oakland, California 
94604 TQMI@pge.com, (530) 205–7345. 

i. FERC Contact: Katherine Schmidt, 
katherine.schmidt@ferc.gov, (415) 369– 
3348. 

j. Cooperating Agencies: With this 
notice, the Commission is inviting 
federal, state, local, and Tribal agencies 
with jurisdiction and/or special 
expertise with respect to environmental 
issues affected by the proposal, that 
wish to cooperate in the preparation of 

any environmental document, if 
applicable, to follow the instructions for 
filing such requests described in item k 
below. Cooperating agencies should 
note the Commission’s policy that 
agencies that cooperate in the 
preparation of any environmental 
document cannot also intervene. See 94 
FERC ¶ 61,076 (2001). 

k. Deadline for filing comments, 
motions to intervene, and protests: 
March 10, 2025. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filing. Please file comments, 
motions to intervene, and protests using 
the Commission’s eFiling system at 
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/efiling.
asp. Commenters can submit brief 
comments up to 6,000 characters, 
without prior registration, using the 
eComment system at http://
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
ecomment.asp. For assistance, please 
contact FERC Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, (866) 
208–3676 (toll free), or (202) 502–8659 
(TTY). In lieu of electronic filing, you 
may submit a paper copy. Submissions 
sent via the U.S. Postal Service must be 
addressed to: Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 888 First Street NE, Room 
1A, Washington, DC 20426. 
Submissions sent via any other carrier 
must be addressed to: Debbie-Anne A. 
Reese, Secretary, Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 12225 Wilkins 
Avenue, Rockville, MD 20852. The first 
page of any filing should include the 
docket number P–2310–263. Comments 
emailed to Commission staff are not 
considered part of the Commission 
record. 

The Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure require all intervenors 
filing documents with the Commission 
to serve a copy of that document on 
each person whose name appears on the 
official service list for the project. 
Further, if an intervenor files comments 
or documents with the Commission 
relating to the merits of an issue that 
may affect the responsibilities of a 
particular resource agency, they must 
also serve a copy of the document on 
that resource agency. 

l. Description of Request: Pacific Gas 
& Electric Company is proposing restore 
the Lower Feeley Lake Dam (Carr Lake) 
Crest to its original design elevation and 
associated upstream toe along with 
enhanced protection to the upstream 
slope. A variance in the minimum flows 
required by Article 39 is necessary to 
facilitate the work. Approving the 
variance would allow the licensee to 
reduce flows released from the Lower 
Feeley Dam from the required flow of 
0.5 cubic-feet-per-second (cfs) target to a 
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0.4 cfs target and reduce the allowable 
minimum flow from 0.2 cfs to 0.1 cfs. 
The described reduction in flows would 
occur from June 1, 2025 until November 
30, 2025. 

m. Locations of the Application: This 
filing may be viewed on the 
Commission’s website at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. You may 
also register online at http://
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/esubscription.
asp to be notified via email of new 
filings and issuances related to this or 
other pending projects. For assistance, 
call 1–866–208–3676 or email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, for TTY, 
call (202) 502–8659. Agencies may 
obtain copies of the application directly 
from the applicant. 

n. Individuals desiring to be included 
on the Commission’s mailing list should 
so indicate by writing to the Secretary 
of the Commission. 

o. Comments, Protests, or Motions to 
Intervene: Anyone may submit 
comments, a protest, or a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214, 
respectively. In determining the 
appropriate action to take, the 
Commission will consider all protests or 
other comments filed, but only those 
who file a motion to intervene in 
accordance with the Commission’s 
Rules may become a party to the 
proceeding. Any comments, protests, or 
motions to intervene must be received 
on or before the specified comment date 
for the particular application. 

p. Filing and Service of Documents: 
Any filing must (1) bear in all capital 
letters the title ‘‘COMMENTS’’, 
‘‘PROTEST’’, or ‘‘MOTION TO 
INTERVENE’’ as applicable; (2) set forth 
in the heading the name of the applicant 
and the project number of the 
application to which the filing 
responds; (3) furnish the name, address, 
and telephone number of the person 
commenting, protesting or intervening; 
and (4) otherwise comply with the 
requirements of 18 CFR 385.2001 
through 385.2005. All comments, 
motions to intervene, or protests must 
set forth their evidentiary basis. Any 
filing made by an intervenor must be 
accompanied by proof of service on all 
persons listed in the service list 
prepared by the Commission in this 
proceeding, in accordance with 18 CFR 
385.2010. 

q. The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 

members of the public, including 
landowners, community organizations, 
Tribal members and others, access 
publicly available information and 
navigate Commission processes. For 
public inquiries and assistance with 
making filings such as interventions, 
comments, or requests for rehearing, the 
public is encouraged to contact OPP at 
(202) 502–6595 or OPP@ferc.gov. 

Dated: February 6, 2025. 
Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–02517 Filed 2–11–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings #4 

Take notice that the Commission 
received the following electric corporate 
filings: 

Docket Numbers: EC19–68–002. 
Applicants: Clearway Energy Group 

LLC, Clearway Energy, Inc. 
Description: Clearway Energy Group 

LLC and Clearway Energy, Inc., submit 
notification of additional applicants as 
required by FERC’s Order Extending 
Blanket Authorization to Acquire 
Securities. 

Filed Date: 1/27/25. 
Accession Number: 20250127–5104. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 2/18/25. 
Take notice that the Commission 

received the following electric rate 
filings: 

Docket Numbers: ER25–1241–000. 
Applicants: El Paso Electric Company. 
Description: § 205(d) Rate Filing: 

Service Agreement No. 419 EPE LGIA 
with Santa Teresa Solar, LLC to be 
effective 1/28/2025. 

Filed Date: 2/6/25. 
Accession Number: 20250206–5143. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 2/27/25. 
The filings are accessible in the 

Commission’s eLibrary system (https://
elibrary.ferc.gov/idmws/search/ 
fercgensearch.asp) by querying the 
docket number. 

Any person desiring to intervene, to 
protest, or to answer a complaint in any 
of the above proceedings must file in 
accordance with Rules 211, 214, or 206 
of the Commission’s Regulations (18 
CFR 385.211, 385.214, or 385.206) on or 
before 5:00 p.m. Eastern time on the 
specified comment date. Protests may be 
considered, but intervention is 
necessary to become a party to the 
proceeding. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 

requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, community organizations, 
Tribal members and others, access 
publicly available information and 
navigate Commission processes. For 
public inquiries and assistance with 
making filings such as interventions, 
comments, or requests for rehearing, the 
public is encouraged to contact OPP at 
(202) 502–6595 or OPP@ferc.gov. 

Dated: February 6, 2025. 
Carlos D. Clay, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–02533 Filed 2–11–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings #1 

Take notice that the Commission 
received the following electric corporate 
filings: 

Docket Numbers: EC25–48–000. 
Applicants: Hunlock Creek 

Generating LLC, Hunlock Energy, LLC, 
Castleton Commodities Merchant 
Trading, L.P., Castleton Commodities 
Energy Services LLC, Castleton 
Commodities Energy Trading LLC, 
Rensselaer Generating LLC, Roseton 
Generating LLC, Salem Harbor Power 
Development LP. 

Description: Joint Application for 
Authorization Under Section 203 of the 
Federal Power Act of Hunlock Creek 
Generating LLC, et al. 

Filed Date: 2/5/25. 
Accession Number: 20250205–5202. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 2/26/25. 
Docket Numbers: EC25–49–000. 
Applicants: DATC Path 15, LLC, 

Viridon California LLC. 
Description: Joint Application for 

Authorization Under Section 203 of the 
Federal Power Act of DATC Path 15, 
LLC, et al. 

Filed Date: 2/5/25. 
Accession Number: 20250205–5204. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 2/26/25. 
Docket Numbers: EC25–50–000. 
Applicants: AltaGas Brush Energy, 

Inc. 
Description: Application for 

Authorization Under Section 203 of the 
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