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SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This is a
synopsis of the Commission’s Notice of
Proposed Rule Making, MB Docket No.
02–83, adopted April 22, 2002, and
released April 26, 2002. The full text of
this document is available for public
inspection and copying during regular
business hours in the FCC Reference
Information Center, Portals II, 445 12th
Street, SW., Room CY–A257,
Washington, DC 20554. This document
may also be purchased from the
Commission’s duplicating contractor,
Qualex International, Portals II, 445
12th Street, SW, Room CY–B402,
Washington, DC 20554, telephone 202–
863–2893, facsimile 202–863–2898, or
via-e-mail qualexint@aol.com.

Provisions of the Regulatory
Flexibility Act of 1980 do not apply to
this proceeding.

Members of the public should note
that from the time a Notice of Proposed
Rule Making is issued until the matter
is no longer subject to Commission
consideration or court review, all ex
parte contacts are prohibited in
Commission proceedings, such as this
one, which involve channel allotments.
See 47 CFR 1.1204(b) for rules
governing permissible ex parte contacts.

For information regarding proper
filing procedures for comments, see 47
CFR 1.415 and 1.420.

List of Subjects in 47 CFR Part 73

Television, Digital television
broadcasting.

For the reasons discussed in the
preamble, the Federal Communications
Commission proposes to amend 47 CFR
part 73 as follows:

PART 73—TELEVISION BROADCAST
SERVICES

1. The authority citation for part 73
continues to read as follows:

Authority: 47 U.S.C. 154, 303, 334, and
336.

§ 73.622 [Amended]

2. Section 73.622(b), the Table of
Digital Television Allotments under
Michigan is amended by removing DTV
channel 56 and adding DTV channel 9
at Sault Saint Marie.

Federal Communications Commission.

Barbara A. Kreisman,
Chief, Video Division, Media Bureau.
[FR Doc. 02–10478 Filed 4–26–02; 8:45 am]

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS
COMMISSION

47 CFR Part 73

[DA 02–928, MB Docket No. 02–84, RM–
10339]

Digital Television Broadcast Service;
San Mateo, CA

AGENCY: Federal Communications
Commission.
ACTION: Proposed rule.

SUMMARY: The Commission requests
comments on a petition filed by San
Mateo County Community College
District, licensee of noncommercial
station KCSM–TV, NTSC channel *60,
San Mateo, California, requesting the
substitution of DTV channel *43 for
DTV channel *59 at San Mateo. DTV
Channel *43 can be allotted to San
Mateo, California, in compliance with
the principle community coverage
requirements of Section 73.625(a) at
reference coordinates 37–45–19 N. and
122–27–06 W. As requested, we propose
to allot DTV Channel *43 to San Mateo
with a power of 1000 and a height above
average terrain (HAAT) of 444 meters.
DATES: Comments must be filed on or
before June 17, 2002, and reply
comments on or before July 2, 2002.
ADDRESSES: The Commission permits
the electronic filing of all pleadings and
comments in proceeding involving
petitions for rule making (except in
broadcast allotment proceedings). See
Electronic Filing of Documents in Rule
Making Proceedings, GC Docket No. 97–
113 (rel. April 6, 1998). Filings by paper
can be sent by hand or messenger
delivery, by commercial overnight
courier, or by first-class or overnight
U.S. Postal Service mail (although we
continue to experience delays in
receiving U.S. Postal Service mail). The
Commission’s contractor, Vistronix,
Inc., will receive hand-delivered or
messenger-delivered paper filings for
the Commission’s Secretary at 236
Massachusetts Avenue, NE., Suite 110,
Washington, DC 20002. The filing hours
at this location are 8 a.m. to 7 p.m. All
hand deliveries must be held together
with rubber bands or fasteners. Any
envelopes must be disposed of before
entering the building. Commercial
overnight mail (other than U.S. Postal
Service Express Mail and Priority Mail)
must be sent to 9300 East Hampton
Drive, Capitol Heights, MD 20743. U.S.
Postal Service first-class mail, Express
Mail, and Priority Mail should be
addressed to 445 12th Street, SW,
Washington, DC 20554. All filings must
be addressed to the Commission’s
Secretary, Office of the Secretary,

Federal Communications Commission,
Washington, DC 20554. In addition to
filing comments with the FCC,
interested parties should serve the
petitioner, or its counsel or consultant,
as follows: Margaret L. Tobey, Morrison
and Foerster LLP, 2000 Pennsylvania
Avenue, NW, Suite 5500, Washington,
DC 20006 (Counsel for San Mateo
County Community College District).
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Pam
Blumenthal, Media Bureau, (202) 418–
1600.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This is a
synopsis of the Commission’s Notice of
Proposed Rule Making, MB Docket No.
02–84, adopted April 22, 2002, and
released April 26, 2002. The full text of
this document is available for public
inspection and copying during regular
business hours in the FCC Reference
Information Center, Portals II, 445 12th
Street, S.W., Room CY–A257,
Washington, DC, 20554. This document
may also be purchased from the
Commission’s duplicating contractor,
Qualex International, Portals II, 445
12th Street, SW, Room CY–B402,
Washington, DC, 20554, telephone 202–
863–2893, facsimile 202–863–2898, or
via e-mail qualexint@aol.com.

Provisions of the Regulatory
Flexibility Act of 1980 do not apply to
this proceeding.

Members of the public should note
that from the time a Notice of Proposed
Rule Making is issued until the matter
is no longer subject to Commission
consideration or court review, all ex
parte contacts are prohibited in
Commission proceedings, such as this
one, which involve channel allotments.
See 47 CFR 1.1204(b) for rules
governing permissible ex parte contacts.

For information regarding proper
filing procedures for comments, see 47
CFR 1.415 and 1.420.

List of Subjects in 47 CFR Part 73

Television, Digital television
broadcasting.

For the reasons discussed in the
preamble, the Federal Communications
Commission proposes to amend 47 CFR
part 73 as follows:

PART 73—TELEVISION BROADCAST
SERVICES

1. The authority citation for part 73
continues to read as follows:

Authority: 47 U.S.C. 154, 303, 334, and
336.

§ 73.622 [Amended]

2. Section 73.622(b), the Table of
Digital Television Allotments under
California is amended by removing DTV
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Channel *59 and adding DTV Channel 
*43 at San Mateo.
Federal Communications Commission. 
Barbara A. Kreisman, 
Chief, Video Division, Media Bureau.
[FR Doc. 02–10479 Filed 4–26–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6712–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

National Highway Traffic Safety 
Administration 

49 CFR Parts 567, 571, 574 and 575 

[Docket No. NHTSA–00–8011] 

RIN 2127–AI54 

Federal Motor Vehicle Safety 
Standards; Tires

AGENCY: National Highway Traffic 
Safety Administration (NHTSA), 
Department of Transportation.
ACTION: Extension of comment period.

SUMMARY: NHTSA has received a 
petition asking the agency to extend the 
comment period for its proposal to 
establish new and more stringent tire 
performance requirements in a new 
Federal motor vehicle safety standard. 
The standard would apply to all new 
tires for use on vehicles with a gross 
vehicle weight rating of 10,000 pounds 
or less. In the proposal, NTHSA 
established a deadline for the 
submission of written comments of May 
6, 2002. In light of that petition and the 
need to ensure that all interested parties 
have a sufficient amount of time to fully 
develop their comments, the agency is 
extending the deadline for the 
submission of written comments.
DATES: Written comments must be 
received by June 5, 2002.
ADDRESSES: You may submit your 
comments in writing to: Docket 
Management, Room PL–401, 400 
Seventh Street, SW., Washington, DC, 
20590. Alternatively, you may submit 
your comments electronically by logging 
onto the Docket Management System 
website at http://dms.dot.gov. Click on 
‘‘Help & Information’’ or ‘‘Help/Info’’ to 
view instructions for filing your 
comments electronically. Regardless of 
how you submit your comments, you 
should mention the docket number of 
this document.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 

For technical and policy issues: Mr. 
George Soodoo or Mr. Joseph Scott, 
Office of Crash Avoidance Standards, 
National Highway Traffic Safety 
Administration, 400 Seventh Street, 
SW., Washington, DC, 20590. 

Telephone: (202) 366–2720. Fax: (202) 
366–4329. 

For legal issues: Nancy Bell, Attorney 
Advisor, Office of the Chief Counsel, 
NCC–20, National Highway Traffic 
Safety Administration, 400 Seventh 
Street, SW, Washington, DC, 20590. 
Telephone: (202) 366–2992. Fax: (202) 
366–3820.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
agency issued the notice of proposed 
rulemaking pursuant to the 
Transportation Recall Enhancement, 
Accountability, and Documentation 
(TREAD) Act, Pub. L. 106–414. The 
NPRM was published on Tuesday, 
March 5, 2002 (67 FR 10050). Section 10 
of the Act directs the Secretary of 
Transportation to conduct a rulemaking 
to revise and update the tire safety 
standards published at 49 CFR 571.109 
and 571.119, and to complete the 
rulemaking, i.e., issue a final rule, by 
June 1, 2002. 

The Rubber Manufacturers 
Association, which represents 
manufacturers of finished rubber 
products, including tire manufacturers, 
has petitioned for an extension of the 
comment period on the notice of 
proposed rulemaking (NPRM). RMA 
said that it was requesting an extension 
so that it can complete the testing 
contemplated in a test matrix it has 
designed to generate data that will 
enable it to analyze tire temperature as 
a function of load, inflation pressure 
and speed relationships and so that it 
can then evaluate the results of that 
testing. The RMA’s petition and its test 
matrix have been submitted to the 
above-mentioned docket. 

In considering the extension request, 
NHTSA weighed the statutory deadline, 
the complexity and importance of this 
rulemaking, and the basis for the 
request. The agency does not wish to 
inhibit the ability of any party to fully 
develop useful technical information 
and seeks to provide additional time for 
all interested parties to prepare and 
submit useful information. 
Consequently, NHTSA believes that it is 
in the best interest of all parties 
involved to extend the period for the 
submission of written comments in this 
proceeding to June 5, 2002. 

However, given the statutory 
deadline, NHTSA wishes to note that it 
does not anticipate granting any further 
extensions of the comment period in 
this proceeding. Please note also that 
the agency will consider comments 
submitted after June 5, 2002, only to the 
extent that it is possible to do so 
without causing additional expense or 
delay.

Issued: April 23, 2002. 
Stephen R. Kratzke, 
Associate Administrator for Safety 
Performance Standards.
[FR Doc. 02–10406 Filed 4–26–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4910–59–P

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE

National Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration

50 CFR Part 600

[I.D. 041802D]

Magnuson-Stevens Act Provisions; 
General Provisions for Domestic 
Fisheries; Applications for Exempted 
Fishing Permits (EFPs)

AGENCY: National Marine Fisheries 
Service (NMFS), National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA), 
Commerce.
ACTION: Notification of a proposal for 
EFPs to conduct experimental fishing; 
request for comments.

SUMMARY: NMFS has made a 
preliminary determination that an 
application to issue an EFP to one vessel 
submitted by the Mount Desert 
Oceanarium of Southwest Harbor, ME 
contains all the information required by 
the regulations governing exempted 
experimental fishing under the 
provisions of the Magnuson-Stevens 
Fishery Conservation and Management 
Act (Magnuson-Stevens Act) and 
warrants further consideration.

The exemption would allow one 
fishing vessel to fish for, retain and land 
small numbers of regulated 
multispecies, monkfish, spiny dogfish, 
and several unmanaged species for the 
purpose of public display. NMFS has 
made a preliminary determination that 
the activities authorized under this EFP 
would be consistent with the goals and 
objectives of the Fishery Management 
Plans (FMPs) for these species. 
However, further review and 
consultation may be necessary before a 
final determination is made to issue an 
EFP. Therefore, NMFS announces that it 
intends to issue an EFP that would 
allow one vessel to conduct fishing 
operations otherwise restricted by the 
regulations governing fisheries of the 
northeastern United States.

Regulations under the Magnuson-
Stevens Act require publication of this 
notification to provide interested parties 
the opportunity to comment on 
applications for proposed EFPs (see 50 
CFR 600.745).
DATES: Comments on this notification 
must be received at the appropriate 
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