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Justin Rey, Sioux Falls, South Dakota, 
individually and as trustee of ESOP; to 
acquire additional shares of Heritage 
Bancshares Group, Inc., Spicer, 
Minnesota, and thereby indirectly 
acquire shares of Heritage Bank, 
National Association, Spicer, 
Minnesota. 

B. Federal Reserve Bank of Kansas 
City (Dennis Denney, Assistant Vice 
President) 1 Memorial Drive, Kansas 
City, Missouri 64198–0001: 

1. John T. Phillips, Yukon, Oklahoma; 
to acquire voting shares of Bank7 Corp. 
f/k/a Haines Financial Corporation, and 
thereby indirectly acquire control of 
Bank 7, both of Oklahoma City, 
Oklahoma. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, July 19, 2018. 
Ann Misback, 
Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2018–15789 Filed 7–23–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The applications will also be 
available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 
writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors not later than August 20, 
2018. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of 
Minneapolis (Mark A. Rauzi, Vice 
President), 90 Hennepin Avenue, 
Minneapolis, Minnesota 55480–0291: 

1. PF Investors, Inc., Whitehall, 
Wisconsin; to become a bank holding 
company by acquiring 100 percent of 
the voting shares of PFSB 
Bancorporation, Inc., Whitehall, 
Wisconsin, and thereby indirectly 
acquire Pigeon Falls State Bank, Pigeon 
Falls, Wisconsin. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, July 19, 2018. 

Ann Misback, 
Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2018–15790 Filed 7–23–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Agency for Healthcare Research and 
Quality 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request 

AGENCY: Agency for Healthcare Research 
and Quality, HHS. 

ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces the 
intention of the Agency for Healthcare 
Research and Quality (AHRQ) to request 
that the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) approve the proposed 
information collection project ‘‘Medical 
Office Survey on Patient Safety Culture 
Database.’’ 

This proposed information collection 
was previously published in the Federal 
Register on May 10th, 2018 and allowed 
60 days for public comment. AHRQ did 
not receive substantive comments. The 
purpose of this notice is to allow an 
additional 30 days for public comment. 

DATES: Comments on this notice must be 
received by August 23, 2018. 

ADDRESSES: Written comments should 
be submitted to: AHRQ’s OMB Desk 
Officer by fax at (202) 395–6974 
(attention: AHRQ’s desk officer) or by 
email at OIRA_submission@
omb.eop.gov (attention: AHRQ’s desk 
officer). 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Doris Lefkowitz, AHRQ Reports 
Clearance Officer, (301) 427–1477, or by 
email at doris.lefkowitz@AHRQ.hhs.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Proposed Project 

Medical Office Survey on Patient Safety 
Culture Database 

In accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act, 44 U.S.C. 3501–3521, 
AHRQ invites the public to comment on 
this proposed information collection. In 
1999, the Institute of Medicine called 
for health care organizations to develop 
a ‘‘culture of safety’’ such that their 
workforce and processes focus on 
improving the reliability and safety of 
care for patients (IOM, 1999; To Err is 
Human: Building a Safer Health 
System). To respond to the need for 
tools to assess patient safety culture in 
health care, AHRQ developed and pilot 
tested the Medical Office Survey on 
Patient Safety Culture with OMB 
approval (OMB No. 0935–0131; 
Approved July 5, 2007). 

The survey is designed to enable 
medical offices to assess provider and 
staff perspectives about patient safety 
issues, medical error, and error 
reporting. The survey includes 38 items 
that measure 10 composites of patient 
safety culture. In addition to the 
composite items, 14 items measure staff 
perceptions of how often medical offices 
have problems exchanging information 
with other settings as well as other 
patient safety and quality issues. AHRQ 
made the survey publicly available 
along with a Survey User’s Guide and 
other toolkit materials in December, 
2008 on the AHRQ website (located at 
https://www.ahrq.gov/sops/quality- 
patient-safety/patientsafetyculture/ 
medical-office/index.html). 

The AHRQ Medical Office SOPS 
Database consists of data from the 
AHRQ Medical Office Survey on Patient 
Safety Culture and may include 
reportable, non-required supplemental 
items. Medical offices in the U.S. can 
voluntarily submit data from the survey 
to AHRQ, through its contractor, Westat. 
The Medical Office SOPS Database 
(OMB No. 0935–0196, last approved on 
August 25, 2015) was developed by 
AHRQ in 2011 in response to requests 
from medical offices interested in 
tracking their own survey results. Those 
organizations submitting data receive a 
feedback report, as well as a report of 
the aggregated, de-identified findings of 
the other medical offices submitting 
data. These reports are used to assist 
medical office staff in their efforts to 
improve patient safety culture in their 
organizations. 

Rationale for the information 
collection. The Medical Office SOPS 
and the Medical Office SOPS Database 
support AHRQ’s goals of promoting 
improvements in the quality and safety 
of health care in medical office settings. 
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