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of State, located at 2201 C Street NW., 
Washington, DC. The majority of each 
meeting is devoted to an exchange of 
ideas between OBO’s senior 
management and the panel members on 
acquisitions, design, operations, 
security, and building maintenance. The 
meetings are open to the public and are 
subject to advance registration and 
provision of required security 
information. Procedures for registration 
are included with each meeting 
announcement, no later than fifteen 
business days before each meeting. 

OBO’s mission is to provide safe, 
secure, and functional facilities for the 
conduct of U.S. diplomacy and the 
promotion of U.S. interests worldwide. 
These facilities represent American 
values and the best in American 
architecture, engineering, technology, 
sustainability, art, culture, and 
construction execution. For further 
information, please contact Christine 
Foushee at FousheeCT@state.gov or 
(703) 875–4131. 

Dated: December 14, 2011. 
Lydia Muniz, 
Acting Director, Overseas Buildings 
Operations, U.S. Department of State. 
[FR Doc. 2011–32813 Filed 12–21–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–24–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Office of the Secretary 

Notice of Applications for Certificates 
of Public Convenience and Necessity 
and Foreign Air Carrier Permits Filed 
Under Subpart B (Formerly Subpart Q) 
During the Week Ending December 10, 
2011 

The following Applications for 
Certificates of Public Convenience and 
Necessity and Foreign Air Carrier 
Permits were filed under Subpart B 
(formerly Subpart Q) of the Department 
of Transportation’s Procedural 
Regulations (see 14 CFR 301.201 et. 
seq.). The due date for Answers, 
Conforming Applications, or Motions to 
Modify Scope are set forth below for 
each application. Following the Answer 
period DOT may process the application 
by expedited procedures. Such 
procedures may consist of the adoption 
of a show-cause order, a tentative order, 
or in appropriate cases a final order 
without further proceedings. 

Docket Number: DOT–OST–2011– 
0227. 

Date Filed: December 7, 2011. 
Due Date for Answers, Conforming 

Applications, or Motion to Modify 
Scope: December 28, 2011. 

Description: Application of Aviation 
Safety & Security Consultants, Ltd., 
d/b/a Butler’s Aviation requesting 
issuance of a foreign air carrier permit 
to the extent necessary to permit it to 
engage in charter foreign air 
transportation of persons, property, and 
mail between a point or points in the 
Bahamas and a point or points in 
Florida, and other charters using small 
aircraft. 

Docket Number: DOT–OST–2010– 
0264. 

Date Filed: December 6, 2011. 
Due Date for Answers, Conforming 

Applications, or Motion to Modify 
Scope: December 27, 2011. 

Description: Application of Whitejets 
Transportes Aéreos Ltda. (‘‘Whitejets’’) 
requesting amendment of its foreign air 
carrier permit to remove the prior 
approval requirement imposed by Order 
2011–3–15 consistent with the 
Department’s decisions in other recent 
cases involving Brazilian carriers. 
Whitejets also requests an exemption to 
the extent necessary to allow Whitejets 
to operate charters between Brazil and 
the United States without needing to 
obtain prior approval from the 
Department in the form of a statement 
of authorization. 

Renee V. Wright, 
Program Manager, Docket Operations, 
Federal Register Liaison. 
[FR Doc. 2011–32770 Filed 12–21–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–9X–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Office of the Secretary 

Notice of Applications for Certificates 
of Public Convenience and Necessity 
and Foreign Air Carrier Permits Filed 
Under Subpart B (Formerly Subpart Q) 
During the Week Ending December 3, 
2011 

The following Applications for 
Certificates of Public Convenience and 
Necessity and Foreign Air Carrier 
Permits were filed under Subpart B 
(formerly Subpart Q) of the Department 
of Transportation’s Procedural 
Regulations (See 14 CFR 301.201 et. 
seq.). The due date for Answers, 
Conforming Applications, or Motions to 
ModifyScope are set forth below for 
each application. Following the Answer 
period DOT may process the application 
by expedited procedures. Such 
procedures may consist of the adoption 
of a show-cause order, a tentative order, 
or inappropriate cases a final order 
without further proceedings. 

Docket Number: DOT–OST–2001– 
11158. 

Date Filed: December 2, 2011. 
Due Date for Answers, Conforming 

Applications, or Motion to Modify 
Scope: December 23, 2011. 

Description: Application of WestJet 
requesting renewal of its exemption 
authority to engagein: (i) Scheduled 
foreign air transportation of persons, 
property and mail from points behind 
Canada via Canada and intermediate 
points to a point or points in theUnited 
States and beyond; (ii) charter foreign 
air transportation between any point or 
points in Canada and any point or 
points in the United States and beyond, 
provided that, except with respect to 
cargo charters, such service constitutes 
part of a continuous operation, with or 
without a change of aircraft, that 
includes service to Canada for the 
purpose of carrying local traffic between 
Canada and the United States; and (iii) 
other charters.WestJet further requests 
issuance of a foreign air carrier permit 
to enableWestJet to engage in the same 
foreign air transportation described 
above. 

Renee V. Wright, 
Program Manager, Docket Operations, 
Federal Register Liaison. 
[FR Doc. 2011–32772 Filed 12–21–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–9X–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Aviation Administration 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Requests for Comments; 
Clearance of Renewed Approval of 
Information Collection: Notice of 
Proposed Construction or Alteration, 
Notice of Actual Construction or 
Alteration, Project Status Report 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, FAA 
invites public comments about our 
intention to request the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) 
approval to renew an information 
collection. The FAA uses the 
information collected on form 7460–1 to 
determine the effect a proposed 
construction or alteration would have 
on air navigation and the National 
Airspace System (NAS), and the 
information collected on form 7460–2 to 
measure the progress of actual 
construction. 
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