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21 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(12). 

Commission, 100 F Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20549–1090. 
All submissions should refer to file 
number SR–NYSE–2023–48. This file 
number should be included on the 
subject line if email is used. To help the 
Commission process and review your 
comments more efficiently, please use 
only one method. The Commission will 
post all comments on the Commission’s 
internet website (https://www.sec.gov/ 
rules/sro.shtml). Copies of the 
submission, all subsequent 
amendments, all written statements 
with respect to the proposed rule 
change that are filed with the 
Commission, and all written 
communications relating to the 
proposed rule change between the 
Commission and any person, other than 
those that may be withheld from the 
public in accordance with the 
provisions of 5 U.S.C. 552, will be 
available for website viewing and 
printing in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, 100 F Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20549, on official 
business days between the hours of 10 
a.m. and 3 p.m. Copies of the filing also 
will be available for inspection and 
copying at the principal office of the 
Exchange. Do not include personal 
identifiable information in submissions; 
you should submit only information 
that you wish to make available 
publicly. We may redact in part or 
withhold entirely from publication 
submitted material that is obscene or 
subject to copyright protection. All 
submissions should refer to file number 
SR–NYSE–2023–48 and should be 
submitted on or before January 9, 2024. 

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Trading and Markets, pursuant to delegated 
authority.21 
Sherry R. Haywood, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–27807 Filed 12–18–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SMALL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 

Reporting and Recordkeeping 
Requirements Under OMB Review 

AGENCY: Small Business Administration 
ACTION: 30-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Small Business 
Administration (SBA) is seeking 
approval from the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) for the information 
collection described below. In 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act and OMB procedures, 
SBA is publishing this notice to allow 

all interested member of the public an 
additional 30 days to provide comments 
on the proposed collection of 
information. 

DATES: Submit comments on or before 
January 18, 2024. 

ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for this information 
collection request should be sent within 
30 days of publication of this notice to 
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain. 
Find this particular information 
collection request by selecting ‘‘Small 
Business Administration’’; ‘‘Currently 
Under Review,’’ then select the ‘‘Only 
Show ICR for Public Comment’’ 
checkbox. This information collection 
can be identified by title and/or OMB 
Control Number. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: You 
may obtain a copy of the information 
collection and supporting documents 
from the Agency Clearance Office at 
Curtis.Rich@sba.gov; (202) 205–7030, or 
from www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with regulations and policy, 
the Small Business Development 
Centers (SBDC’s) must submit with their 
proposal SBA Form 1224, Grant/ 
Cooperative Agreement Cost Sharing 
Proposal, to SBA for verification of the 
recipient’s share of the project cost. 

Solicitation of Public Comments 

Comments may be submitted on (a) 
whether the collection of information is 
necessary for the agency to properly 
perform its functions; (b) whether the 
burden estimates are accurate; (c) 
whether there are ways to minimize the 
burden, including through the use of 
automated techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and (d) whether 
there are ways to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information. 

OMB Control: 3245–0140. 
Title: ‘‘SBA Form 1224, Grant/ 

Cooperative Agreement Cost Sharing 
Proposal’’. 

Description of Respondents: SBDC 
Directors. 

SBA Form Number: SBA Form 1224. 
Estimated Number of Respondents: 

168. 
Estimated Annual Responses: 168. 
Estimated Annual Hour Burden: 418. 

Curtis Rich, 
Agency Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2023–27846 Filed 12–18–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8026–09–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Public Notice: 12257] 

Designation of Three Entities 
Contributing to Ballistic Missile 
Proliferation 

ACTION: Notice of designation. 

SUMMARY: Pursuant to the authority in 
the Executive Order, ‘‘Blocking Property 
of Weapons of Mass Destruction 
Proliferators and Their Supporters,’’ and 
delegated authority, the Under Secretary 
of State for Arms Control and 
International Security, in consultation 
with the Secretary of the Treasury and 
the Attorney General, has determined 
that General Technology Limited, 
Beijing Luo Luo Technology 
Development Co Ltd, and Changzhou 
Utek Composite Company Ltd, engaged, 
or attempted to engage, in activities or 
transactions that have materially 
contributed to, or pose a risk of 
materially contributing to, the 
proliferation of weapons of mass 
destruction or their means of delivery 
(including missiles capable of delivering 
such weapons), including any efforts to 
manufacture, acquire, possess, develop, 
transport, transfer or use such items, by 
Pakistan. 
DATES: The Under Secretary for Arms 
Control and International Security made 
these designations pursuant to E.O. 
13382 and delegated authorities, on 
October 18, 2023. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Thomas Zarzecki, Director, Office of 
Counterproliferation Initiatives, Bureau 
of International Security and 
Nonproliferation, Department of State, 
Washington, DC 20520, tel.: 202–647– 
5193. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: On June 
28, 2005, the President, invoking the 
authority, inter alia, of the International 
Emergency Economic Powers Act (50 
U.S.C. 1701–1706) (‘‘IEEPA’’), issued 
Executive Order 13382 (70 CFR 38567, 
July 1, 2005) (the ‘‘Order’’), effective at 
12:01 a.m. eastern daylight time on June 
30, 2005. In the Order the President took 
additional steps with respect to the 
national emergency described and 
declared in Executive Order 12938 of 
November 14, 1994, regarding the 
proliferation of weapons of mass 
destruction and the means of delivering 
them. 

Section 1 of the Order blocks, with 
certain exceptions, all property and 
interests in property that are in the 
United States, or that hereafter come 
within the United States or that are or 
hereafter come within the possession or 
control of United States persons, of: (1) 
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