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VII. Comment Procedures 

45. The Commission invites interested 
persons to submit comments on the 
matters and issues proposed in this 
notice to be adopted, including any 
related matters or alternative proposals 
that commenters may wish to discuss. 
Comments are due November 25, 2013. 
Comments must refer to Docket No. 
RM13–16–000, and must include the 
commenter’s name, the organization 
they represent, if applicable, and their 
address in their comments. 

46. The Commission encourages 
comments to be filed electronically via 
the eFiling link on the Commission’s 
Web site at http://www.ferc.gov. The 
Commission accepts most standard 
word processing formats. Documents 
created electronically using word 
processing software should be filed in 
native applications or print-to-PDF 
format and not in a scanned format. 
Commenters filing electronically do not 
need to make a paper filing. 

47. Commenters that are not able to 
file comments electronically must send 
original and 14 copies of their 
comments to: Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, Secretary of the 
Commission, 888 First Street NE., 
Washington, DC 20426. 

48. All comments will be placed in 
the Commission’s public files and may 
be viewed, printed, or downloaded 
remotely as described in the Document 
Availability section below. Commenters 
on this proposal are not required to 
serve copies of their comments on other 
commenters. 

VIII. Document Availability 

49. In addition to publishing the full 
text of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the Internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
www.ferc.gov) and in the Commission’s 
Public Reference Room during normal 
business hours (8:30 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. 
Eastern time) at 888 First Street NE., 
Room 2A, Washington DC 20426. 

50. From the Commission’s Home 
Page on the Internet, this information is 
available on eLibrary. The full text of 
this document is available on eLibrary 
in PDF and Microsoft Word format for 
viewing, printing, and/or downloading. 
To access this document in eLibrary, 
type the docket number excluding the 
last three digits of this document in the 
docket number field. 

51. User assistance is available for 
eLibrary and the Commission’s Web site 
during normal business hours from the 
Commission’s Online Support at (202) 

502–6652 (toll free at 1–866–208–3676) 
or email at ferconlinesupport@ferc.gov, 
or the Public Reference Room at (202) 
502–8371, TTY (202) 502–8659. Email 
the Public Reference Room at 
public.referenceroom@ferc.gov. 

By the direction of the Commission. 
Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2013–23169 Filed 9–23–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

40 CFR Part 131 

[EPA–HQ–OW–2010–0606; FRL–9901–25– 
OW] 

Water Quality Standards Regulatory 
Clarifications Proposed Rule; Public 
Meeting and Public Webinars 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Announcement of public 
meeting and public webinars. 

SUMMARY: The Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA) is announcing one public 
meeting and two public webinars to be 
held for the proposed rule ‘‘Water 
Quality Standards Regulatory 
Clarifications,’’ which was published 
separately in the Federal Register 
(September 4, 2013). 
DATES: The public meeting will be held 
in Washington, DC on October 23, 2013 
from 10:00 a.m. to 3:00 p.m. Eastern. 
The two public webinars will be held on 
September 24, 2013 from 1:00 p.m. to 
3:00 p.m. Eastern and November 14, 
2013 from 1:00 p.m. to 3:00 p.m. 
Eastern. The comment period for the 
proposed rulemaking will end on 
December 3, 2013. To register for the 
public meeting or either public webinar, 
please visit: http://www.tetratech- 
ffx.com/wqsregs/public/ or contact the 
person listed under FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT. Information 
regarding the time of the public meeting 
and public webinars is also listed below 
in SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION. 
ADDRESSES: To register for the public 
meeting or either public webinar, please 
visit: http://www.tetratech-ffx.com/
wqsregs/public/. You will receive an 
email confirmation after your 
registration has been submitted. 
Information about the public meeting 
and webinars can also be found at the 
EPA Web site for the rulemaking at, 
http://water.epa.gov/lawsregs/
lawsguidance/wqs_index.cfm, under the 
‘‘Current Outreach’’ section. 

The public meeting will be held at the 
Smithsonian National Zoological Park 
in the Visitor Center Auditorium. The 
Zoo address is 3001 Connecticut 
Avenue NW. in Washington, DC. The 
Visitor Center Auditorium is located at 
the Connecticut Avenue entrance to the 
zoo. More information about travel to 
the Zoo is available at http://
nationalzoo.si.edu/Visit/
gettingtozoo.cfm. 

The public webinars will be held 
using Adobe® Connect. Following 
registration and within one week of the 
scheduled webinars, you will receive an 
email with information for accessing the 
webinar on the day of the event. 

The proposed rule was published 
separately in the Federal Register and a 
complete set of documents related to the 
proposal are available for public 
inspection at the EPA Docket Center, 
located at 1301 Constitution Avenue 
NW., Room 3334, Washington, DC 
between 8:30 a.m. and 4:30 p.m., 
Monday through Friday, excluding legal 
holidays. A reasonable fee may be 
charged for copying. Documents are also 
available through the electronic docket 
system at http://www.regulations.gov 
under Docket ID No. EPA–HQ–OW– 
2010–0606. The EPA Web site for the 
rulemaking can be found at: http://
water.epa.gov/lawsregs/lawsguidance/
wqs_index.cfm. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Janita Aguirre, EPA Headquarters, Office 
of Water, Office of Science and 
Technology, at 202–566–1860 or email 
address: WQSRegulatoryClarifications@
epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
proposal for which EPA is holding the 
public meeting and public webinars has 
been published separately in the 
Federal Register (78 FR 54517; 
September 4, 2013). In the proposed 
rulemaking, EPA is proposing changes 
to the federal water quality standards 
(WQS) regulation at 40 CFR Part 131 
which helps implement the Clean Water 
Act in order to improve effectiveness in 
restoring and maintaining the chemical, 
physical, and biological integrity of the 
nation’s waters. The proposed rule 
addresses the following key program 
areas: Administrator’s determinations 
that new or revised WQS are necessary, 
designated uses, triennial reviews, 
antidegradation, variances to WQS, and 
compliance schedule authorizing 
provisions. Once final, the proposed 
rule will lead to improved water quality 
standard development, implementation 
and compliance as well as improving 
the ability of water systems to adapt and 
respond to the impacts of climate 
change. 
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EPA will discuss the contents of the 
proposed rule during the webinars and 
meeting and will provide the 
opportunity for interested parties to ask 
clarifying questions prior to the close of 
the comment period. These clarifying 
questions or any public views expressed 
during the webinars and meeting will 
not be considered formal comments and 
will not be recorded for inclusion in the 
official administrative record. If anyone 
wishes their comments to be considered 
formal comment and want a formal 
response from EPA, they must submit 
their comments on the proposed rule to 
the associated docket (Docket ID No. 
EPA–HQ–OW–2010–0606) by one of the 
following methods: Electronically, by 
mail, by facsimile, or through hand 
delivery/courier. Please refer to the 
notice of proposed rulemaking for the 
addresses and detailed instructions for 
submitting written comments. Written 
comments must be received by the 
December 3, 2013. 

Public Meeting: The public meeting 
will be open to all stakeholders 
interested in the rule. The meeting will 
be held on Wednesday, October 23, 
2013 from 10:00 a.m. until 3:00 p.m. 
Eastern. The meeting will be held at the 
Smithsonian National Zoological Park’s 
Visitor Center Auditorium, 3001 
Connecticut Avenue NW., Washington, 
DC. If you are interested in attending the 
public meeting, EPA prefers that you 
pre-register at http://www.tetratech- 
ffx.com/wqsregs/public/ by October 21, 
2013. EPA will prepare a pre- 
registration list to streamline the check- 
in process on the day of the public 
meeting. If you choose not to pre- 
register, you will be asked to provide 
the following information on a sign-in 
sheet at the public meeting: Name, 
affiliation, address, email address and 
telephone number. 

Public Webinars: The public webinars 
will be open to all stakeholders 
interested in the rule. The public 
webinars will be held on Tuesday, 
September 24, 2013 from 1:00 p.m. to 
3:00 p.m. Eastern and Thursday, 
November 14, 2013 from 1:00 p.m. to 
3:00 p.m. Eastern using Adobe® 
Connect. However, there is a limitation 
of 500 participants for each webinar. In 
order to ensure access to the webinar of 
choice, interested individuals should 
register in advance following 
instructions on the Internet at http://
www.tetratech-ffx.com/wqsregs/public/. 
Although you may register at any time 
prior to the session of your choice, EPA 
prefers that you register at least three 
days in advance. You will receive an 
email confirmation after your 
registration has been submitted. 
Following registration and within one 

week of the scheduled webinars, you 
will receive an email with information 
for accessing the webinar on the day of 
the event. The agenda and resource 
material will be identical for the two 
public webinars. You do not need to 
attend both sessions. If you do not have 
Internet access, please contact the 
person named in the FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT section above. 

Other EPA Outreach: Throughout the 
comment period, EPA expects to 
conduct outreach with additional 
stakeholders as well as state and tribal 
governments. This outreach includes 
discussions and consultation with 
federally-recognized Indian tribes, 
consistent with Executive Order 13175 
(Tribal Consultation) and outreach with 
state water quality program officials as 
co-regulators. 

Comment Period: The comment 
period will remain open until December 
3, 2013. 

How can I get copies of this document 
and other related information? 

The EPA has established a docket for 
this action under Docket ID No. EPA– 
HQ–OW–2010–0606. The EPA has also 
developed a Web site for the proposed 
rulemaking at: http://water.epa.gov/
lawsregs/lawsguidance/wqs_index.cfm. 
Please refer to the notice of proposed 
rulemaking for detailed information on 
accessing information related to the 
proposal. 

Dated: September 16, 2013. 
Elizabeth Southerland, 
Director, Office of Science and Technology. 
[FR Doc. 2013–23103 Filed 9–23–13; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Pipeline and Hazardous Materials 
Safety Administration 

49 CFR Parts 107 and 109 

[Docket No. PHMSA–2012–0258 (HM–258A)] 

RIN 2137–AE97 

Hazardous Materials: Failure To Pay 
Civil Penalties 

AGENCY: Pipeline and Hazardous 
Materials Safety Administration 
(PHMSA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice of Proposed Rulemaking 
(NPRM). 

SUMMARY: PHMSA proposes to amend 
the hazardous materials procedural 
found under our regulations. 
Specifically, this proposed action would 
prohibit a person who fails to pay a civil 
penalty as ordered, or fails to abide by 

a payment agreement, from performing 
activities regulated by the Hazardous 
Materials Regulations until payment is 
made. 
DATES: Comments must be received by 
November 25, 2013. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments 
by any of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Fax: 1–202–493–2251. 
• Mail: Docket Management System; 

U.S. Department of Transportation, 
Docket Operations, M–30, West 
Building, Ground Floor, Room W12– 
140, 1200 New Jersey Avenue SE., 
Washington, DC 20590–0001. 

• Hand Delivery: To the U.S. 
Department of Transportation, Docket 
Operations, M–30, West Building, 
Ground Floor, Room W12–140, 1200 
New Jersey Avenue SE., Washington, 
DC 20590, between 9 a.m. and 5 p.m., 
Monday through Friday, except Federal 
holidays. 

Instructions: Include the agency name 
and docket number PHMSA–2012–0258 
(HM–258A) or the Regulatory 
Identification Number (RIN) 2137–AE97 
for this notice of proposed rulemaking 
at the beginning of your comment. 
Please note that all comments received 
will be posted without change to 
http://www.regulations.gov, including 
any personal information provided. 

Privacy Act: Anyone is able to search 
the electronic form of any written 
communications and comments 
received into any of our dockets by the 
name of the individual submitting the 
document (or signing the document, if 
submitted on behalf of an association, 
business, labor union, etc.). You may 
review DOT’s complete Privacy Act 
Statement in the Federal Register 
published on April 11, 2000 (65 FR 
19477) or you may visit http://
www.regulations.gov. 

Docket: For access to the dockets to 
read background documents or 
comments received, go to http://
www.regulations.gov or DOT’s Docket 
Operations Office (see ADDRESSES). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Tyler Patterson, Office of Chief Counsel, 
telephone (202) 366–0505, Pipeline and 
Hazardous Materials Safety 
Administration, U.S. Department of 
Transportation, 1200 New Jersey Ave., 
SE., Washington, DC 20590–0001. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION:

Table of Contents 

I. Overview of Penalty Procedures 
A. Pipeline and Hazardous Materials Safety 

Administration 
B. Federal Aviation Administration 
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