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efforts to address potential intermarket trading 
abuses and manipulations. 

16 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(3)(A)(ii). 
17 17 CFR 240.19b–4(f)(2). 

18 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(12). 
1 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(1). 
2 17 CFR 240.19b–4. 
3 See Exchange Rule 1901. 

information and coordinates inquiries 
and investigations with other exchanges 
designed to address potential 
intermarket manipulation and trading 
abuses. Accordingly, there is a strong 
nexus between the ORF and the 
Exchange’s regulatory activities with 
respect to customer trading activity of 
its Participants. 

B. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement on Burden on Competition 

The Exchange does not believe that 
the proposed rule change will impose 
any burden on competition not 
necessary or appropriate in furtherance 
of the purposes of the Act. This 
proposal does not create an unnecessary 
or inappropriate intra-market burden on 
competition because the ORF applies to 
all customer activity, thereby raising 
regulatory revenue to offset regulatory 
expenses. It also supplements the 
regulatory revenue derived from non- 
customer activity. The Exchange notes, 
however, the proposed change is not 
designed to address any competitive 
issues. Indeed, this proposal does not 
create an unnecessary or inappropriate 
inter-market burden on competition 
because it is a regulatory fee that 
supports regulation in furtherance of the 
purposes of the Act. The Exchange is 
obligated to ensure that the amount of 
regulatory revenue collected from the 
ORF, in combination with its other 
regulatory fees and fines, does not 
exceed regulatory costs. 

C. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement on Comments on the 
Proposed Rule Change Received From 
Members, Participants, or Others 

No written comments were either 
solicited or received. 

III. Date of Effectiveness of the 
Proposed Rule Change and Timing for 
Commission Action 

The foregoing rule change has become 
effective pursuant to Section 
19(b)(3)(A)(ii) of the Exchange Act 16 
and Rule 19b–4(f)(2) thereunder,17 
because it establishes or changes a due, 
or fee. 

At any time within 60 days of the 
filing of the proposed rule change, the 
Commission summarily may 
temporarily suspend the rule change if 
it appears to the Commission that the 
action is necessary or appropriate in the 
public interest, for the protection of 
investors, or would otherwise further 
the purposes of the Act. If the 

Commission takes such action, the 
Commission shall institute proceedings 
to determine whether the proposed rule 
should be approved or disapproved. 

IV. Solicitation of Comments 

Interested persons are invited to 
submit written data, views, and 
arguments concerning the foregoing, 
including whether the proposed rule 
change is consistent with the Act. 
Comments may be submitted by any of 
the following methods: 

Electronic Comments 

• Use the Commission’s internet 
comment form (http://www.sec.gov/ 
rules/sro.shtml); or 

• Send an email to rule-comments@
sec.gov. Please include File Number SR– 
BOX–2021–22 on the subject line. 

Paper Comments 

• Send paper comments in triplicate 
to Secretary, Securities and Exchange 
Commission, 100 F Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20549–1090. 
All submissions should refer to File 
Number SR–BOX–2021–22. This file 
number should be included on the 
subject line if email is used. To help the 
Commission process and review your 
comments more efficiently, please use 
only one method. The Commission will 
post all comments on the Commission’s 
internet website (http://www.sec.gov/ 
rules/sro.shtml). Copies of the 
submission, all subsequent 
amendments, all written statements 
with respect to the proposed rule 
change that are filed with the 
Commission, and all written 
communications relating to the 
proposed rule change between the 
Commission and any person, other than 
those that may be withheld from the 
public in accordance with the 
provisions of 5 U.S.C. 552, will be 
available for website viewing and 
printing in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, 100 F Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20549 on official 
business days between the hours of 
10:00 a.m. and 3:00 p.m. Copies of such 
filing also will be available for 
inspection and copying at the principal 
office of the Exchange. All comments 
received will be posted without change. 
Persons submitting comments are 
cautioned that we do not redact or edit 
personal identifying information from 
comment submissions. You should 
submit only information that you wish 
to make available publicly. All 
submissions should refer to File 
Number SR–BOX–2021–22, and should 
be submitted on or before October 14, 
2021. 

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Trading and Markets, pursuant to delegated 
authority.18 
J. Matthew DeLesDernier, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2021–20552 Filed 9–22–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[Release No. 34–93047; File No. SR– 
PEARL–2021–42] 

Self-Regulatory Organizations; MIAX 
PEARL, LLC; Notice of Filing and 
Immediate Effectiveness of a Proposed 
Rule Change To Amend the MIAX Pearl 
Equities Fee Schedule Relating to 
Disaster Recovery Facility 1 Gigabit 
ULL per Connection Fee for Members 

September 17, 2021. 
Pursuant to Section 19(b)(1) of the 

Securities Exchange Act of 1934 
(‘‘Act’’),1 and Rule 19b–4 thereunder,2 
notice is hereby given that on 
September 10, 2021, MIAX PEARL, LLC 
(‘‘MIAX Pearl’’ or ‘‘Exchange’’) filed 
with the Securities and Exchange 
Commission (‘‘Commission’’) a 
proposed rule change as described in 
Items I, II, and III below, which Items 
have been prepared by the Exchange. 
The Commission is publishing this 
notice to solicit comments on the 
proposed rule change from interested 
persons. 

I. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Terms of Substance of 
the Proposed Rule Change 

The Exchange is filing a proposal to 
amend the fee schedule applicable for 
MIAX Pearl Equities, an equities trading 
facility of the Exchange (the ‘‘Fee 
Schedule’’).3 

The text of the proposed rule change 
is available on the Exchange’s website at 
http://www.miaxoptions.com/rule- 
filings/pearl at MIAX Pearl’s principal 
office, and at the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room. 

II. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Purpose of, and 
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule 
Change 

In its filing with the Commission, the 
Exchange included statements 
concerning the purpose of and basis for 
the proposed rule change and discussed 
any comments it received on the 
proposed rule change. The text of these 
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4 The term ‘‘Equity Member’’ is a Member 
authorized by the Exchange to transact business on 
MIAX Pearl Equities. See Exchange Rule 1901. 

5 See Securities Exchange Act Release No. 73639 
(November 19, 2014), 79 FR 72252 (December 5, 
2014) (‘‘SCI Adopting Release’’). 

6 15 U.S.C. 78f(b). 
7 15 U.S.C. 78f(b)(4). 
8 15 U.S.C. 78f(b)(1) and (b)(5). 
9 See supra note 5. 
10 17 CFR 242.1004(a). 
11 17 CFR 242.1004(b). 

statements may be examined at the 
places specified in Item IV below. The 
Exchange has prepared summaries, set 
forth in sections A, B, and C below, of 
the most significant aspects of such 
statements. 

A. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Purpose of, and 
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule 
Change 

1. Purpose 

The Exchange proposes to amend 
Section 2) of the Fee Schedule to: (1) 
Waive certain monthly connectivity fees 
for Equity Members 4 who connect to 
the Exchange’s disaster recovery facility; 
and (2) make a minor, non-substantive 
correction to the headings for Sections 
2)a) and b). The Exchange originally 
filed this proposal on September 1, 2021 
(SR–PEARL–2021–39). The Exchange 
has withdrawn SR–PEARL–2021–39 
and refiled this proposal. 

Fee Waiver for Connection to the 
Disaster Recovery Facility 

The Exchange proposes to amend 
Section 2)a) of the Fee Schedule to 
waive certain monthly connectivity fees 
for Equity Members who connect to the 
Exchange’s disaster recovery facility for 
testing purposes only, as described 
below. Currently, the Exchange assesses 
monthly fees of $1,000 per connection 
and $3,000 per connection for Equity 
Members that connect to the Exchange’s 
disaster recovery facility via a 1 Gigabit 
(‘‘Gb’’) ultra-low latency (‘‘ULL’’) 
connection or a 10Gb ULL connection, 
respectively. 

The Exchange now proposes to waive 
the disaster recovery facility 1Gb ULL 
monthly fee for a single 1Gb ULL 
connection for each Equity Member that 
is designated by the Exchange to 
participate in required testing in 
accordance with Regulation Systems 
Compliance and Integrity (‘‘Regulation 
SCI’’),5 and pursuant to Chapter III of 
the Exchange’s Rules, so long as that 
same single connection is used for 
Regulation SCI testing purposes only. 
The Exchange proposes that this waiver 
apply to each month in which the 
designated Equity Member is required to 
maintain that single 1Gb ULL 
connection to the disaster recovery 
facility for Regulation SCI testing 
purposes, as described above. 
Accordingly, each Equity Member that 
is required to connect to the Exchange’s 

disaster recovery facility in accordance 
with Regulation SCI and Chapter III of 
the Exchange’s Rules and who uses that 
connection solely to fulfill those testing 
requirements, will receive the fee 
waiver for a single 1Gb ULL connection. 
The proposed fee waiver will not be 
available to an Equity Member that 
utilizes that same 1Gb ULL connection 
to the disaster recovery facility for 
trading in addition to Regulation SCI 
testing purposes. 

The Exchange notes that the proposed 
waiver will apply uniformly to Equity 
Members who currently maintain a 1Gb 
ULL connection to the disaster recovery 
facility and those Equity Members that 
newly elect to connect to the disaster 
recovery facility. Again, both current 
and future 1Gb ULL connections must 
be used for Regulation SCI testing 
purposes only. The proposed fee waiver 
will only apply to a single 1Gb ULL 
connection to the disaster recovery 
facility and each additional 1Gb ULL 
connection to the disaster recovery 
facility will continue to be charged the 
current monthly rate of $1,000 per 
connection. The Exchange does not 
propose to waive the monthly network 
connectivity fee for the 10Gb ULL 
connection to the disaster recovery 
facility or make any other changes to 
network connectivity fees. 

Technical Corrections to the Fee 
Schedule 

Next, the Exchange proposes to 
amend the headings for Sections 2)a) 
and b) of the Fee Schedule to make 
minor, non-substantive edits. Currently, 
the headings for Sections 2)a) and b) of 
the Fee Schedule read as follows, 
‘‘Monthly Member Network 
Connectivity Fee,’’ and ‘‘Monthly Non- 
Member Network Connectivity Fee,’’ 
respectively. The Exchange now 
proposes to make a minor, non- 
substantive correction to amend each 
heading to make the word ‘‘Fee’’ plural 
to reflect that more than one fee is 
provided for in each section. With the 
proposed changes, the headings for 
Sections 2)a) and b) of the Fee Schedule 
will read as follows, ‘‘Monthly Member 
Network Connectivity Fees,’’ and 
‘‘Monthly Non-Member Network 
Connectivity Fees,’’ respectively. 

Implementation 

The proposed changes are 
immediately effective. The Exchange 
does not propose any other changes to 
the MIAX Pearl Equities Fee Schedule. 

2. Statutory Basis 

The Exchange believes that its 
proposal to amend its Fee Schedule is 

consistent with Section 6(b) of the Act 6 
in general, and furthers the objectives of 
Section 6(b)(4) of the Act,7 in that it is 
an equitable allocation of reasonable 
dues, fees and other charges among 
Exchange members and issuers and 
other persons using its facilities, and 
6(b)(5) of the Act,8 in that it is designed 
to prevent fraudulent and manipulative 
acts and practices, to promote just and 
equitable principles of trade, to foster 
cooperation and coordination with 
persons engaged in facilitating 
transactions in securities, to remove 
impediments to and perfect the 
mechanisms of a free and open market 
and a national market system and, in 
general, to protect investors and the 
public interest. 

Equity Members connect to the 
disaster recovery facility for several 
reasons, including: (1) To fulfill the 
requirement to participate in the 
Exchange’s annual business continuity 
and disaster recovery (‘‘BC/DR’’) testing 
in connection with the requirements of 
Regulation SCI; 9 and (2) for redundancy 
and trading purposes in a fail over 
situation. With respect to the BC/DR 
plans of the Exchange (defined as an 
‘‘SCI entity’’ under Regulation SCI), 
including the Exchange’s backup 
systems, paragraph (a) of Rule 1004 of 
Regulation SCI requires each SCI entity 
to, ‘‘[e]stablish standards for the 
designation of those members or 
participants that the SCI entity 
reasonably determines are, taken as a 
whole, the minimum necessary for the 
maintenance of fair and orderly markets 
in the event of the activation of such 
plans.’’ 10 Paragraph (b) of Rule 1004 
further requires each SCI entity to 
‘‘[d]esignate members or participants 
pursuant to the standards established in 
paragraph (a) of [Rule 1004] and require 
participation by such designated 
members or participants in scheduled 
functional and performance testing of 
the operation of such plans, in the 
manner and frequency specified by the 
SCI entity, provided that such frequency 
shall not be less than once every 12 
months.’’ 11 Pursuant to Rule 1004 of 
Regulation SCI, each Equity Member of 
the Exchange is required to connect to 
the disaster recovery facility and take 
part in the annual testing. This means 
that, as currently contemplated in the 
Fee Schedule, each Equity Member 
must utilize and purchase at least one 
1Gb ULL connection to the disaster 
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12 See SCI Adopting Release, supra note 5, at 
72350. 

13 15 U.S.C. 78f(b). 
14 15 U.S.C. 78f(b)(4) and (5). 

recovery facility to fulfill this testing 
requirement. Accordingly, the Exchange 
believes it is reasonable to waive the 
monthly fee for Equity Members that are 
designated by the Exchange for required 
testing in accordance with Regulation 
SCI, and pursuant to Chapter III of the 
Exchange’s Rules, where that same 
single connection is used for Regulation 
SCI testing purposes only. 

The Exchange believes that its 
proposal is reasonable because it waives 
the monthly fee for Equity Members that 
are required to connect to the disaster 
recovery facility and only utilize one 
1Gb ULL connection solely to fulfill the 
annual BC/DR testing requirements 
under Rule 1004 of Regulation SCI and 
do not use that same connection for 
trading purposes. The Exchange 
believes that the proposed waiver is 
reasonable to further ensure Equity 
Members that need to participate in 
Exchange testing are able to do so 
without also incurring a charge for the 
required connection. As set forth in the 
SCI Adopting Release, ‘‘SROs have the 
authority, and legal responsibility, 
under Section 6 of the Exchange Act, to 
adopt and enforce rules (including rules 
to comply with Regulation SCI’s 
requirements relating to BC/DR testing) 
applicable to their members or 
participants that are designed to, among 
other things, foster cooperation and 
coordination with persons engaged in 
regulating, clearing, settling, processing 
information with respect to, and 
facilitating transactions in securities, to 
remove impediments to and perfect the 
mechanism of a free and open market 
and a national market system, and, in 
general, to protect investors and the 
public interest.’’ 12 The Exchange 
believes that this proposal is consistent 
with such authority and legal 
responsibility. 

The Exchange believes that the 
proposal represents an equitable 
allocation of reasonable dues, fees, and 
other charges and is not unreasonably 
discriminatory in that it applies 
uniformly to all similarly situated 
Equity Members. The proposed waiver 
for a single 1Gb ULL connection to the 
disaster recovery facility will apply 
uniformly to Equity Members 
designated by the Exchange to fulfill 
their Regulation SCI testing 
requirements. Specifically, an Equity 
Member who currently has a 1Gb ULL 
connection to the disaster recovery 
facility and only utilizes such 
connection for Regulation SCI testing 
purposes will receive the fee waiver for 
that single connection going forward. 

Likewise, any Equity Member newly 
designated by the Exchange for 
Regulation SCI testing who does not 
currently have a 1Gb ULL connection 
will now be able to utilize a single 1Gb 
ULL connection to the disaster recovery 
facility for free, so long as that Equity 
Member only utilizes the new 
connection for Regulation SCI testing 
purposes only, as described herein. The 
Exchange does not propose to amend 
any of the rates for its connectivity fees. 

Further, the Exchange believes that 
the proposal represents an equitable 
allocation of reasonable dues, fees, and 
other charges and is not unreasonably 
discriminatory to firms that utilize the 
10Gb ULL connection to the disaster 
recovery facility because those firms 
likely not only utilize those connections 
for testing, but also trading and 
redundancy purposes due to the 
increased size of the connection. Each 
Equity Member that has a 10Gb ULL 
connection to the disaster recovery 
facility is able to utilize a single 1Gb 
ULL connection solely for Regulation 
SCI testing purposes if that firm so 
desired. 

The Exchange believes that its 
proposal is consistent with Section 6(b) 
of the Act 13 in general, and furthers the 
objectives of Section 6(b)(4) of the Act 14 
in particular, in that it is an equitable 
allocation of reasonable fees and not 
unfairly discriminatory because non- 
Members do not have the same 
requirements as Equity Members 
relating to Regulation SCI’s 
requirements for BC/DR testing. As 
such, non-Members are not required to 
connect to the disaster recovery facility 
at all. It is a business decision of each 
non-Member whether to connect to the 
disaster recovery facility and, if so, 
whether to utilize a 1Gb ULL 
connection and/or a 10Gb ULL 
connection. Further, non-Members 
themselves can and often do have their 
own customer base that utilizes the non- 
Member’s connection to the Exchange. 
However, that non-Member can charge 
its customers any amount it wants and 
recoup its costs to connect to the 
Exchange. 

B. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement on Burden on Competition 

The Exchange does not believe that 
the proposed fee change will impose 
any burden on competition not 
necessary or appropriate in furtherance 
of the purposes of the Act. 

Inter-Market Competition 

The Exchange believes that the 
proposed rule change will not impose 
any burden on inter-market 
competition. The proposed rule change 
is not a competitive filing but rather is 
designed to ensure that Equity Members 
that are designated by the Exchange and 
required to connect to the disaster 
recovery facility solely to fulfill their 
annual BC/DR testing requirements 
under Rule 1004 of Regulation SCI are 
able to do so. Accordingly, the Exchange 
believes that the proposed change will 
not impose any burden on competition 
that is not necessary or appropriate in 
furtherance of the purposes of the Act 
because the proposal is not a 
competitive proposal but rather is 
necessary for the Exchange and 
designated Equity Members to comply 
with annual testing requirements of 
Regulation SCI. 

Intra-Market Competition 

The Exchange believes that its 
proposal will not impose any undue 
burden on intra-market competition 
because the fee waiver applies equally 
to all Equity Members that only utilize 
a single 1Gb ULL connection to the 
disaster recovery facility to participate 
in Regulation SCI testing. The fee 
waiver will apply to designated Equity 
Members who currently have at least 
one 1Gb ULL connection to the disaster 
recovery facility and to newly 
designated Equity Members who all 
have to participate in Regulation SCI 
testing. The Exchange believes the 
proposal does not impose any undue 
burden on intra-market competition 
between Equity Members who utilize 
10Gb ULL connections to the disaster 
recovery facility because those firms 
utilize the 10Gb ULL connections for 
redundancy and trading purposes 
throughout the course of the year. Each 
Equity Member with a 10Gb ULL 
connection that is designated by the 
Exchange to participate in the annual 
BC/DR testing already uses that 
connection for the Regulation SCI 
testing. Additionally, the Exchange 
believes that its proposal will not 
impose any undue burden on intra- 
market competition on non-Members 
because non-Members do not have the 
same requirements as Equity Members 
relating to Regulation SCI’s 
requirements for BC/DR testing. Non- 
Members are not required to connect to 
the disaster recovery facility at all and 
it is a business decision of each non- 
Member whether to connect to the 
disaster recovery facility and, if so, 
whether to utilize a 1Gb ULL 
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15 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(3)(A)(ii). 
16 17 CFR 240.19b–4(f)(2). 17 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(12). 

connection and/or a 10Gb ULL 
connection. 

C. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement on Comments on the 
Proposed Rule Change Received From 
Members, Participants, or Others 

Written comments were neither 
solicited nor received. 

III. Date of Effectiveness of the 
Proposed Rule Change and Timing for 
Commission Action 

The foregoing rule change has become 
effective pursuant to Section 
19(b)(3)(A)(ii) of the Act,15 and Rule 
19b–4(f)(2) 16 thereunder. At any time 
within 60 days of the filing of the 
proposed rule change, the Commission 
summarily may temporarily suspend 
such rule change if it appears to the 
Commission that such action is 
necessary or appropriate in the public 
interest, for the protection of investors, 
or otherwise in furtherance of the 
purposes of the Act. If the Commission 
takes such action, the Commission shall 
institute proceedings to determine 
whether the proposed rule should be 
approved or disapproved. 

IV. Solicitation of Comments 

Interested persons are invited to 
submit written data, views and 
arguments concerning the foregoing, 
including whether the proposed rule 
change is consistent with the Act. 
Comments may be submitted by any of 
the following methods: 

Electronic Comments 

• Use the Commission’s internet 
comment form (http://www.sec.gov/ 
rules/sro.shtml); or 

• Send an email to rule-comments@
sec.gov. Please include File Number SR– 
PEARL–2021–42 on the subject line. 

Paper Comments 

• Send paper comments in triplicate 
to Secretary, Securities and Exchange 
Commission, 100 F Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20549–1090. 
All submissions should refer to File 
Number SR–PEARL–2021–42. This file 
number should be included on the 
subject line if email is used. To help the 
Commission process and review your 
comments more efficiently, please use 
only one method. The Commission will 
post all comments on the Commission’s 
internet website (http://www.sec.gov/ 
rules/sro.shtml). Copies of the 
submission, all subsequent 
amendments, all written statements 
with respect to the proposed rule 

change that are filed with the 
Commission, and all written 
communications relating to the 
proposed rule change between the 
Commission and any person, other than 
those that may be withheld from the 
public in accordance with the 
provisions of 5 U.S.C. 552, will be 
available for website viewing and 
printing in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, 100 F Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20549, on official 
business days between the hours of 
10:00 a.m. and 3:00 p.m. Copies of the 
filing also will be available for 
inspection and copying at the principal 
office of the Exchange. All comments 
received will be posted without change. 
Persons submitting comments are 
cautioned that we do not redact or edit 
personal identifying information from 
comment submissions. You should 
submit only information that you wish 
to make available publicly. All 
submissions should refer to File 
Number SR–PEARL–2021–42 and 
should be submitted on or before 
October 14, 2021. 

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Trading and Markets, pursuant to delegated 
authority.17 
J. Matthew DeLesDernier, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2021–20553 Filed 9–22–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SMALL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 

[Disaster Declaration #17119 and #17120; 
California Disaster Number CA–00340] 

Presidential Declaration Amendment of 
a Major Disaster for the State of 
California 

AGENCY: Small Business Administration. 
ACTION: Amendment 1. 

SUMMARY: This is an amendment of the 
Presidential declaration of a major 
disaster for the State of California 
(FEMA–4610–DR), dated 08/24/2021. 

Incident: Wildfires. 
Incident Period: 07/14/2021 and 

continuing. 

DATES: Issued on 09/18/2021. 
Physical Loan Application Deadline 

Date: 10/25/2021. 
Economic Injury (EIDL) Loan 

Application Deadline Date: 05/24/2022. 
ADDRESSES: Submit completed loan 
applications to: U.S. Small Business 
Administration, Processing and 
Disbursement Center, 14925 Kingsport 
Road, Fort Worth, TX 76155. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: A. 
Escobar, Office of Disaster Assistance, 
U.S. Small Business Administration, 
409 3rd Street SW, Suite 6050, 
Washington, DC 20416, (202) 205–6734. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The notice 
of the President’s major disaster 
declaration for the State of California, 
dated 08/24/2021, is hereby amended to 
include the following areas as adversely 
affected by the disaster: 
Primary Counties (Physical Damage and 

Economic Injury Loans): Tehama, 
Trinity. 

Contiguous Counties (Economic Injury 
Loans Only): 

California: Glenn, Humboldt, 
Mendocino, Siskiyou. 

All other information in the original 
declaration remains unchanged. 
(Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance 
Number 59008) 

James Rivera, 
Associate Administrator for Disaster 
Assistance. 
[FR Doc. 2021–20589 Filed 9–22–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8026–03–P 

SMALL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 

[Disaster Declaration #17143 and #17144; 
New Jersey Disaster Number NJ–00062] 

Presidential Declaration Amendment of 
a Major Disaster for the State of New 
Jersey 

AGENCY: U.S. Small Business 
Administration. 
ACTION: Amendment 3. 

SUMMARY: This is an amendment of the 
Presidential declaration of a major 
disaster for the State of New Jersey 
(FEMA–4614–DR), dated 09/05/2021. 

Incident: Remnants of Hurricane Ida. 
Incident Period: 09/01/2021 through 

09/03/2021. 
DATES: Issued on 09/19/2021. 

Physical Loan Application Deadline 
Date: 11/04/2021. 

Economic Injury (EIDL) Loan 
Application Deadline Date: 06/06/2022. 
ADDRESSES: Submit completed loan 
applications to: U.S. Small Business 
Administration, Processing and 
Disbursement Center, 14925 Kingsport 
Road, Fort Worth, TX 76155. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: A. 
Escobar, Office of Disaster Assistance, 
U.S. Small Business Administration, 
409 3rd Street SW, Suite 6050, 
Washington, DC 20416, (202) 205–6734. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The notice 
of the President’s major disaster 
declaration for the State of New Jersey, 
dated 09/05/2021, is hereby amended to 
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