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collection of information on contractors 
performing private security functions 
outside the US will require rulemaking. 

Comment on the Burden Estimate: A 
respondent stated that ‘‘the estimate of 
70 burden hours annually appears low 
given the complexity and seriousness of 
the required reporting on weapons 
discharge incidents, personnel injuries, 
and military vehicle registration.’’ The 
respondent recommended reassessing 
the burden estimate ‘‘using recent case 
studies of contractor reporting 
complexity in areas like Iraq and 
Afghanistan.’’ 

Response: The information collection 
burden estimate covers only contractors 
of non-DoD agencies. The information is 
collected from DoD contractors under 
OMB Control Number 0704–0460, 
Synchronized Predeployment and 
Operational Tracker Enterprise Suite 
(SPOT–ES) System. 

Comments on expanding reporting 
requirements: Two respondents 
provided many recommendations to 
improve accuracy, timeliness, oversight, 
accountability, and the transparency of 
the collected information. Key 
recommendations include clarifying the 
definitions of ‘‘significant military 
operations,’’ ‘‘security incidents,’’ and 
‘‘use of force’’; requiring readiness 
certifications for medical evacuation 
resources; increasing transparency 
through public incident reports; 
implementing post-contract reviews; 
incorporating third-party incident 
reporting and independent audits; 
mandating human rights and 
environmental impact reporting; 
collecting data on contractor workforce 
protections, gender, and diversity; and 
encouraging broader adoption of 
automated, secure digital reporting 
platforms. 

Response: The respondents’ input is 
appreciated. Any changes to the 
collection of information on contractors 
performing private security functions 
outside the US will require rulemaking. 

Obtaining Copies: Requesters may 
obtain a copy of the information 
collection documents from the GSA 
Regulatory Secretariat Division, by 
calling 202–501–4755 or emailing 
GSARegSec@gsa.gov. Please cite OMB 
Control No. 9000–0184, Contractors 
Performing Private Security Functions 
Outside the United States. 

Janet Fry, 
Director, Federal Acquisition Policy Division, 
Office of Governmentwide Acquisition Policy, 
Office of Acquisition Policy, Office of 
Governmentwide Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2025–12450 Filed 7–2–25; 8:45 am] 
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ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act, the 
Regulatory Secretariat Division has 
submitted to OMB a request to review 
and approve an extension and revision 
of a previously approved information 
collection requirement regarding change 
order accounting and notification of 
changes. 

DATES: Submit comments on or before 
August 4, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for this information 
collection should be sent within 30 days 
of publication of this notice to 
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain. 
Find this particular information 
collection by selecting ‘‘Currently under 
Review—Open for Public Comments’’ or 
by using the search function. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
FARPolicy@gsa.gov or call 202–969– 
4075. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

A. OMB Control Number, Title, and 
Any Associated Form(s) 

9000–0026, Change Order Accounting 
and Notification of Changes. 

B. Need and Uses 

This clearance covers the information 
that contractors must submit to comply 
with the Federal Acquisition Regulation 
(FAR) part 43 requirements as stated in 
the following clauses: 

FAR 52.243–1, Changes—Fixed-Price, 
52.243–2 Changes—Cost- 
Reimbursement, and 52.243–3 
Changes—Time-and-Materials or Labor- 

Hours. Contractors are required to assert 
their right to an adjustment under these 
clauses within 30 days after receipt of 
a written change order from the 
contracting officer. 

FAR 52.243–4, Changes. For 
acquisitions for dismantling, 
demolition, or removal of 
improvements; and fixed-price 
construction contracts that exceed the 
simplified acquisition threshold, the 
contractor must assert its right to an 
adjustment under this clause within 30 
days after receipt of a written change 
order or the furnishing of a written 
notice, by submitting to the contracting 
officer a written statement describing 
the general nature and amount of 
proposal, unless this period is extended 
by the Government. The written notice 
covers any other written or oral order 
(which includes direction, instruction, 
interpretation, or determination) from 
the contracting officer that causes a 
change. The contractor gives the 
contracting officer written notice stating 
(1) the date, circumstances, and source 
of the order and (2) that the contractor 
regards the order as a change order. The 
statement of proposal for adjustment 
may be included in the written notice. 

FAR 52.243–6, Change Order 
Accounting. The contracting officer may 
require change order accounting 
whenever the estimated cost of a change 
or series of related changes exceeds 
$100,000. The contractor, for each 
change or series of related changes, shall 
maintain separate accounts, by job order 
or other suitable accounting procedure, 
of all incurred segregable, direct costs 
(less allocable credits) of work, both 
changed and not changed, allocable to 
the change. The contractor shall 
maintain these accounts until the 
parties agree to an equitable adjustment 
or the matter is conclusively disposed of 
under the Disputes clause. This 
requirement is necessary in order to be 
able to account properly for costs 
associated with changes in supply and 
research and development (R&D) 
contracts of significant technical 
complexity, if numerous changes are 
anticipated, or construction contracts if 
deemed appropriate by the contracting 
officer. 

FAR 52.243–7, Notification of 
Changes. The clause is available for use 
primarily in negotiated R&D or supply 
contracts for the acquisition of major 
weapon systems or principal 
subsystems. If the contract amount is 
expected to be less than $1,000,000, the 
clause shall not be used, unless the 
contracting officer anticipates that 
situations will arise that may result in 
a contractor alleging that the 
Government has effected changes other 
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than those identified as such in writing 
and signed by the contracting officer. 
The contractor shall notify the 
Administrative Contracting Officer in 
writing if the contractor identifies any 
Government conduct (including actions, 
inactions, and written or oral 
communications) that the contractor 
regards as a change to the contract terms 
and conditions. This excludes changes 
identified as such in writing and signed 
by the contracting officer. On the basis 
of the most accurate information 
available to the contractor, the notice 
shall state— 

(1) The date, nature, and 
circumstances of the conduct regarded 
as a change; 

(2) The name, function, and activity of 
each Government individual and 
Contractor official or employee involved 
in or knowledgeable about such 
conduct; 

(3) The identification of any 
documents and the substance of any 
oral communication involved in such 
conduct; 

(4) In the instance of alleged 
acceleration of scheduled performance 
or delivery, the basis upon which it 
arose; 

(5) The particular elements of contract 
performance for which the Contractor 
may seek an equitable adjustment under 
this clause, including— 

(i) What line items have been or may 
be affected by the alleged change; 

(ii) What labor or materials or both 
have been or may be added, deleted, or 
wasted by the alleged change; 

(iii) To the extent practicable, what 
delay and disruption in the manner and 
sequence of performance and effect on 
continued performance have been or 
may be caused by the alleged change; 

(iv) What adjustments to contract 
price, delivery schedule, and other 
provisions affected by the alleged 
change are estimated; and 

(6) The Contractor’s estimate of the 
time by which the Government must 
respond to the Contractor’s notice to 
minimize cost, delay or disruption of 
performance. 

Contracting officers use the notices 
and information provided by contractors 
in response to a change notice to 
negotiate an equitable adjustment under 
the contract that may result from the 
change order. 

C. Annual Burden 

Respondents and Recordkeepers: 
4,774. 

Total Annual Responses: 11,532. 
Total Burden Hours: 11,532. (9,656 

reporting hours + 1,876 recordkeeping 
hours). 

D. Public Comment 

A 60-day notice was published in the 
Federal Register at 90 FR 15464, on 
April 11, 2025. A comment was 
received; however, it did not change the 
estimate of the burden. 

Comment: The respondent expressed 
the following: ‘‘This agency collection 
should not be renewed based on 
improper implementation of the original 
contract and noncompliance of the 
regulations associated with the 
agreement. This also has legal 
implications for the agreement in place 
and this is an additional taxpayer 
burden for country.’’ 

Response: The respondents’ input is 
appreciated. Any changes to the 
collection of information on change 
order accounting and notification of 
changes will require rulemaking. 

Obtaining Copies: Requesters may 
obtain a copy of the information 
collection documents from the GSA 
Regulatory Secretariat Division by 
calling 202–501–4755 or emailing 
GSARegSec@gsa.gov. Please cite OMB 
Control No. 9000–0026, Change Order 
Accounting and Notification of Changes. 

Janet Fry, 
Director, Federal Acquisition Policy Division, 
Office of Governmentwide Acquisition Policy, 
Office of Acquisition Policy, Office of 
Governmentwide Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2025–12449 Filed 7–2–25; 8:45 am] 
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ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act, the 

Regulatory Secretariat Division has 
submitted to OMB a request to review 
and approve an extension of a 
previously approved information 
collection requirement regarding 
extraordinary contractual action 
requests. 

DATES: Submit comments on or before 
August 4, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for this information 
collection should be sent within 30 days 
of publication of this notice to 
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain. 
Find this particular information 
collection by selecting ‘‘Currently under 
Review—Open for Public Comments’’ or 
by using the search function. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
FARPolicy@gsa.gov or call 202–969– 
4075. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

A. OMB Control Number, Title, and 
Any Associated Form(s) 

9000–0029, Extraordinary Contractual 
Action Requests. 

B. Need and Uses 

This clearance covers the information 
that contractors must submit to comply 
with the following Federal Acquisition 
Regulation (FAR) requirements: 

FAR 50.103–3, Contract Adjustment. 
This section specifies the minimum 
information that a contractor must 
include when seeking a contract 
adjustment that would facilitate the 
national defense, as set forth in Public 
Law 85–804. The request, normally a 
letter, shall state as a minimum - 

(1) The precise adjustment requested; 
(2) The essential facts, summarized 

chronologically in narrative form; 
(3) The contractor’s conclusions based 

on these facts, showing, in terms of the 
considerations set forth in FAR 50.103– 
1 and 50.103–2, when the contractor 
considers itself entitled to the 
adjustment; and 

(4) Whether or not - 
(i) All obligations under the contracts 

involved have been discharged; 
(ii) Final payment under the contracts 

involved has been made; 
(iii) Any proceeds from the request 

will be subject to assignment or other 
transfer, and to whom; and 

(iv) The contractor has sought the 
same, or a similar or related, adjustment 
from the Government Accountability 
Office or any other part of the 
Government, or anticipates doing so. 

If the request exceeds the simplified 
acquisition threshold, the contractor 
must certify that the request is made in 
good faith and the data are accurate and 
complete. 
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