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DATES: The OMB will consider all 
written comments that the agency 
receives on or before June 17, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Michael Howell by telephone at 202– 
693–6782, or by email at DOL_PRA_
PUBLIC@dol.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Prior to 
the enactment of the Taxpayer Relief 
Act of 1997 (Pub. L. 105–34, August 5, 
1997) (TRA ’97), section 104(a) of the 
Employee Retirement Security Act of 
1974 (ERISA) required administrators of 
employee benefit plans automatically to 
file the plan’s summary plan description 
(SPD) and any summaries of material 
modification (SMMs) with the Secretary 
of the Department of Labor (the 
Department). TRA ’97 eliminated the 
requirement that these documents be 
filed automatically with the 
Department, but added ERISA section 
104(a)(6), requiring a plan administrator 
to furnish documents related to an 
employee benefit plan to the 
Department upon request. The 
requirement that administrators furnish 
the Department requested plan 
documents other than SPDs and SMMs 
was part of section 104(a) prior to 
enactment of TRA ’97; that requirement 
was moved by TRA ’97 to section 
104(a)(6) and consolidated with the new 
furnishing requirement pertaining to 
SPDs and SMMs. 

Pursuant to the regulation, the 
Department requests documents under 
section 104(a)(6) when a participant or 
beneficiary has previously requested the 
documents directly from the plan 
administrator and the administrator has 
failed or refused to provide them. The 
Department therefore uses the requested 
information to respond to participants’ 
requests to the Department for 
documents that the participants were 
unable to obtain from their plan 
administrators. For additional 
substantive information about this ICR, 
see the related notice published in the 
Federal Register on August 25, 2023 (88 
FR 58312). 

Comments are invited on: (1) whether 
the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the Department, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; (2) the accuracy of 

the agency’s estimates of the burden and 
cost of the collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (3) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information collection; and 
(4) ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

This information collection is subject 
to the PRA. A Federal agency generally 
cannot conduct or sponsor a collection 
of information, and the public is 
generally not required to respond to an 
information collection, unless the OMB 
approves it and displays a currently 
valid OMB Control Number. In addition, 
notwithstanding any other provisions of 
law, no person shall generally be subject 
to penalty for failing to comply with a 
collection of information that does not 
display a valid OMB Control Number. 
See 5 CFR 1320.5(a) and 1320.6. 

DOL seeks PRA authorization for this 
information collection for three (3) 
years. OMB authorization for an ICR 
cannot be for more than three (3) years 
without renewal. The DOL notes that 
information collection requirements 
submitted to the OMB for existing ICRs 
receive a month-to-month extension 
while they undergo review. 

Agency: DOL–EBSA. 
Title of Collection: Furnishing 

Documents to the Secretary of Labor on 
Request Under Employee Retirement 
Income Security Act Section 104(a)(6). 

OMB Control Number: 1210–0112. 
Affected Public: Businesses or other 

for-profits. 
Total Estimated Number of 

Respondents: 1,181. 
Total Estimated Number of 

Responses: 1,181. 
Total Estimated Annual Time Burden: 

53 hours. 
Total Estimated Annual Other Costs 

Burden: $826. 
(Authority: 44 U.S.C. 3507(a)(1)(D)) 

Michael Howell, 
Senior Paperwork Reduction Act Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2024–10806 Filed 5–16–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–29–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request; Grain 
Handling Facilities Standard 

ACTION: Notice of availability; request 
for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor 
(DOL) is submitting this Occupational 

Safety & Health Administration (OSHA)- 
sponsored information collection 
request (ICR) to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA). Public comments on the ICR are 
invited. 
DATES: The OMB will consider all 
written comments that the agency 
receives on or before June 17, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Nicole Bouchet by telephone at 202– 
693–0213, or by email at DOL_PRA_
PUBLIC@dol.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
information collection requirements are 
directed toward assuring the safety of 
workers in grain handling through 
development of a housekeeping plan, an 
emergency action plan, procedures for 
the use of tags and locks, the issuance 
of hot work permits, and permits for 
entry into grain storage structures. 
Certification records are required after 
inspections of the mechanical and safety 
control equipment associated with 
dryers, grain stream processing 
equipment, etc. For additional 
substantive information about this ICR, 
see the related notice published in the 
Federal Register on February 23, 2024 
(89 FR 13753). 

Comments are invited on: (1) whether 
the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the Department, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; (2) the accuracy of 
the agency’s estimates of the burden and 
cost of the collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (3) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information collection; and 
(4) ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

This information collection is subject 
to the PRA. A Federal agency generally 
cannot conduct or sponsor a collection 
of information, and the public is 
generally not required to respond to an 
information collection, unless the OMB 
approves it and displays a currently 
valid OMB Control Number. In addition, 
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notwithstanding any other provisions of 
law, no person shall generally be subject 
to penalty for failing to comply with a 
collection of information that does not 
display a valid OMB Control Number. 
See 5 CFR 1320.5(a) and 1320.6. 

DOL seeks PRA authorization for this 
information collection for three (3) 
years. OMB authorization for an ICR 
cannot be for more than three (3) years 
without renewal. The DOL notes that 
information collection requirements 
submitted to the OMB for existing ICRs 
receive a month-to-month extension 
while they undergo review. 

Agency: DOL–OSHA. 
Title of Collection: Grain Handling 

Facilities Standard. 
OMB Control Number: 1218–0206. 
Affected Public: Farms. 
Total Estimated Number of 

Respondents: 14,940. 
Total Estimated Number of 

Responses: 1,105,635. 
Total Estimated Annual Time Burden: 

57,837 hours. 
Total Estimated Annual Other Costs 

Burden: $0. 
(Authority: 44 U.S.C. 3507(a)(1)(D)) 

Nicole Bouchet, 
Certifying Official. 
[FR Doc. 2024–10794 Filed 5–16–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–26–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request; Powered 
Industrial Trucks Standard 

ACTION: Notice of availability; request 
for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor 
(DOL) is submitting this Occupational 
Safety & Health Administration (OSHA)- 
sponsored information collection 
request (ICR) to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA). Public comments on the ICR are 
invited. 
DATES: The OMB will consider all 
written comments that the agency 
receives on or before June 17, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Nicole Bouchet by telephone at 202– 
693–0213, or by email at DOL_PRA_
PUBLIC@dol.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Powered Industrial Trucks Standard 
contains several information collection 
requirements addressing truck design, 
construction, and modification, as well 
as certification of training and 
evaluation for truck operators. For 
additional substantive information 
about this ICR, see the related notice 
published in the Federal Register on 
February 23, 2024 (89 FR 13752). 

Comments are invited on: (1) whether 
the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the Department, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; (2) the accuracy of 
the agency’s estimates of the burden and 
cost of the collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (3) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information collection; and 
(4) ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

This information collection is subject 
to the PRA. A Federal agency generally 
cannot conduct or sponsor a collection 
of information, and the public is 
generally not required to respond to an 
information collection, unless the OMB 
approves it and displays a currently 
valid OMB Control Number. In addition, 
notwithstanding any other provisions of 
law, no person shall generally be subject 
to penalty for failing to comply with a 
collection of information that does not 
display a valid OMB Control Number. 
See 5 CFR 1320.5(a) and 1320.6. 

DOL seeks PRA authorization for this 
information collection for three (3) 
years. OMB authorization for an ICR 
cannot be for more than three (3) years 
without renewal. The DOL notes that 
information collection requirements 
submitted to the OMB for existing ICRs 
receive a month-to-month extension 
while they undergo review. 

Agency: DOL–OSHA. 
Title of Collection: Powered Industrial 

Trucks Standard. 
OMB Control Number: 1218–0242. 
Affected Public: Private Sector— 

Businesses or other for-profits. 
Total Estimated Number of 

Respondents: 1,239,687. 
Total Estimated Number of 

Responses: 2,451,732. 
Total Estimated Annual Time Burden: 

437,198 hours. 
Total Estimated Annual Other Costs 

Burden: $262,774. 

(Authority: 44 U.S.C. 3507(a)(1)(D)) 

Nicole Bouchet, 
Certifying Official. 
[FR Doc. 2024–10795 Filed 5–16–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–26–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Cognitive and Psychological 
Research 

ACTION: Notice of availability; request 
for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor 
(DOL) is submitting this Bureau of Labor 
Statistics (BLS)-sponsored information 
collection request (ICR) to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA). Public comments on the ICR are 
invited. 
DATES: The OMB will consider all 
written comments that the agency 
receives on or before June 17, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 

Comments are invited on: (1) whether 
the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the Department, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; (2) the accuracy of 
the agency’s estimates of the burden and 
cost of the collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (3) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information collection; and 
(4) ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Nicole Bouchet by telephone at 202– 
693–0213, or by email at DOL_PRA_
PUBLIC@dol.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Bureau of Labor Statistics’ Behavioral 
Science Research Center (BSRC) 
conducts psychological research 
focusing on the design and execution of 
the data collection process in order to 
improve the quality of data collected by 
the Bureau. The BSRC conducts 
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