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8. Estimated Total Annual Cost 
Burden: $0.00. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Darwin Arceo, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE, 4W–218, 
Washington, DC. 

Dated: July 22, 2025. 
Darwin Arceo, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2025–13935 Filed 7–23–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–04–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

[OMB Number 1110–0026] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed eCollection 
eComments Requested; Revision of a 
Previously Approved Collection; 
Title—Federal Firearms Licensee (FFL) 
Enrollment/National Instant Criminal 
Background Check System (NICS) E- 
Check Enrollment Form, Federal 
Firearms Licensee (FFL) Officer/ 
Employee Acknowledgment of 
Responsibilities Under the NICS Form, 
Responsibilities of a Federal Firearms 
Licensee (FFL) Under the National 
Instant Criminal Background Check 
System (NICS) Form 

AGENCY: Department of Justice, Federal 
Bureau of Investigation, Criminal Justice 
Information Services Division. 
ACTION: 60-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Justice 
(DOJ), Federal Bureau of Investigation 
(FBI), Criminal Justice Information 
Services (CJIS) Division, will be 
submitting the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 60 days until 
September 22, 2025. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have additional comments 
especially on the estimated public 
burden or associated response time, 
suggestions, or need a copy of the 
proposed information collection 
instrument with instructions or 
additional information, please contact 
Jill Montgomery, FBI NICS Section, 

1000 Custer Hollow Road, Clarksburg, 
WV 26306, or jamontgomery@fbi.gov, 
304–709–1476. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Bureau of Justice 
Statistics, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Evaluate whether and if so how the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected can be 
enhanced; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Abstract: The Brady Handgun 
Violence Prevention Act of 1993 
required the United States Attorney 
General to establish a National Instant 
Criminal Background Check System that 
any federal firearms licensee (FFL) may 
contact, by telephone or other electronic 
means, for information to be supplied 
immediately on whether receipt of a 
firearm by a prospective purchaser 
would violate State or Federal law. 
Information pertaining to FFLs who may 
contact the NICS is being collected to 
manage and control access to the NICS 
and to the NICS Electronic (E-Check), to 
ensure appropriate resources are 
available to support the NICS, and also 
to ensure the privacy and security of 
NICS information. More information can 
be obtained at https://www.fbi.gov/ 
services/cjis/nics. The proposed 2025 
revision to the form captures four new 
fields. The first two fields ask for the 
FFL’s date of birth and mother’s maiden 
name for security measures. An 
additional question is asked if an FFL 
operates in a point of contact (POC) 
state. If the FFL answers in the 
affirmative, the FFL is asked to initial to 

acknowledge use of the FBI NICS for 
authorized purposes only so they may 
avail themselves of the additional 
resources for FFLs from POC states as 
they become available. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

1. Type of Information Collection: 
Revision of a previously approved 
collection. 

2. The Title of the Form/Collection: 
Federal Firearms Licensee (FFL) 
Enrollment/National Instant Criminal 
Background Check System (NICS) E- 
Check Enrollment Form, Federal 
Firearms Licensee (FFL) Officer/ 
Employee Acknowledgment of 
Responsibilities under the NICS Form, 
Responsibilities of a Federal Firearms 
Licensee (FFL) under the National 
Instant Criminal Background Check 
System (NICS) Form. 

3. The agency form number, if any, 
and the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
Federal Firearms Licensee (FFL) 
Enrollment/NICS E-Check Enrollment 
Form. 

4. Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as the 
obligation to respond: Affected Public— 
Any FFL or Point of Contact (POC) state 
requesting access to conduct National 
Instant Criminal Background Check 
System (NICS) checks telephonically or 
by the internet through the NICS E- 
Check. The obligation to respond is 
required in order to required obtain/the 
ability to utilize the NICS system to 
conduct background checks. 

5. An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: The entire process of reading 
the material and completing the forms 
would take 15 minutes per respondent. 
The average hour burden for completing 
the forms and reading the material 
would be 6,160 × 15/60 = 1,540 hours. 

6. An estimate of the total annual 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: The average hour burden for 
completing the forms and reading the 
material would be 6,160 × 15/60 = 1,540 
hours. 

7. An estimate of the total annual cost 
burden associated with the collection, if 
applicable: $0. Forms are available 
online and can be signed digitally. 
Copies and postage costs are no longer 
applicable. 
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TOTAL BURDEN HOURS 

Activity Number of 
respondents 

Frequency 
(time) 

Total annual 
responses 

Time per 
response 

(min) 

Total annual 
burden 
(hours) 

Read and complete survey .............................................................. 6,160 1 6,160 15 1,540 

Unduplicated Totals .................................................................. 6,160 1 6,160 15 1,540 

If additional information is required 
contact: Darwin Arceo, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE, 4W–218, 
Washington, DC. 

Dated: July 22, 2025. 
Darwin Arceo, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2025–13934 Filed 7–23–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

[OMB Number 1122–0NEW] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed eCollection 
eComments Requested; New 
Collection; Semi-Annual and Annual 
Performance Reporting Data Catalog 
for Formula and Discretionary Grant 
Programs 

AGENCY: Office on Violence Against 
Women, Department of Justice. 

ACTION: 60-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Office on Violence 
Against Women, Department of Justice, 
will be submitting the following 
information collection request to the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. 

DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 60 days until 
September 22, 2025. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have additional comments 
especially on the estimated public 
burden or associated response time, 
suggestions, or need a copy of the 
proposed information collection 
instrument with instructions or 
additional information, please contact 
Tiffany Watson, Office on Violence 

Against Women, at 202–307–6026 or 
Tiffany.Watson@usdoj.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Office on Violence 
Against Women, including whether 
the information will have practical 
utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Evaluate whether and if so, how the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected can be 
enhanced; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Abstract: The Office on Violence 
Against Women (OVW)’s formula and 
discretionary grant programs were 
authorized through the Violence Against 
Women Act of 1994 (VAWA) and 
subsequent legislation, including 
VAWA reauthorizations in 2000, 2005, 
2013 and 2022. The four formula 
programs are STOP (Services, Training, 
Officers, Prosecutors), SASP (Sexual 
Assault Services Program), State 
Coalitions, and Tribal Coalitions. 
Funding under OVW’s two largest 
formula grant programs—the STOP and 
SASP Programs—is distributed to states 
and territories according to a statutory 
formula. The STOP and SASP 
Administrators in each state and 

territory then make subgrants to 
organizations within their states and 
territories. OVW posts notices of 
funding opportunities for each 
discretionary program every fiscal year 
and, after a competitive application 
review process, makes awards directly 
to local, state, and Tribal governments, 
courts, non-profit organizations, 
community-based organizations, 
secondary schools, institutions of higher 
education, state and Tribal coalitions 
and any other organizations authorized 
to receive funding under the different 
grant programs. OVW grants help 
develop effective responses to violence 
against women through activities that 
include direct services, crisis 
intervention, transitional housing, legal 
assistance to survivors, court 
improvement, and training for law 
enforcement and courts. OVW 
determines grantee performance 
measures and reporting requirements for 
each grant program based on the 
authorizing statute and what is 
necessary for monitoring the awards. 
The questions on each grant program’s 
performance report form address the 
different types of permissible grant- 
funded activities as outlined in the 
purpose areas in each program’s 
authorizing statute. 

Currently, OVW uses up to 19 
individual OMB-approved PDF forms to 
collect performance and monitoring 
data from grantees. These forms each 
collect slightly different data points and 
may use different questions to collect 
information about the same activities. 
OVW is submitting this new 
information collection request to 
consolidate existing and previously 
OMB-approved OVW information 
collections under a single collection 
with a new consolidated OMB number. 
This ‘‘new’’ collection would simply 
aggregate and streamline the 
performance reporting process covered 
by the 19 approved collections. This 
request leverages technology to 
streamline, modernize, and reduce 
paperwork. 
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