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May 18, 2023, and will conclude 18 
months after the effective date. 
ADDRESSES: Send comments to Elliot S. 
Tarloff, FCC, 45 L Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20554, or to Privacy@
fcc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Elliot S. Tarloff at 202–418–0886 or 
Privacy@fcc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In the 
Consolidated Appropriations Act, 2021, 
Public Law 116–260, 134 Stat. 1182, 
2129–36 (2020), Congress created the 
Emergency Broadband Benefit Program, 
and directed use of the National Verifier 
to determine eligibility based on various 
criteria, including the qualifications for 
Lifeline (Medicaid, SNAP, etc.). EBBP 
provided $3.2 billion in monthly 
consumer discounts for broadband 
service and one-time provider 
reimbursement for a connected device 
(laptop, desktop computer or tablet). In 
the Infrastructure Investment and Jobs 
Act, Public Law 117–58, 135 Stat. 429, 
1238–44 (2021) (codified at 47 U.S.C. 
1751–52), Congress modified and 
extended EBBP, provided an additional 
$14.2 billion, and renamed it the 
Affordable Connectivity Program (ACP). 
A household may qualify for the ACP 
benefit under various criteria, including 
an individual qualifying for the FCC’s 
Lifeline program. 

In a Report and Order adopted on 
March 31, 2016, (81 FR 33026, May 24, 
2016) (2016 Lifeline Modernization 
Order), the Commission ordered USAC 
to create a National Lifeline Eligibility 
Verifier (‘‘National Verifier’’), including 
the National Lifeline Eligibility Database 
(LED), that would match data about 
Lifeline applicants and subscribers with 
other data sources to verify the 
eligibility of an applicant or subscriber. 
The Commission found that the 
National Verifier would reduce 
compliance costs for Lifeline service 
providers, improve service for Lifeline 
subscribers, and reduce waste, fraud, 
and abuse in the program. 

The Consolidated Appropriations Act 
of 2021 directs the FCC to leverage the 
National Verifier to verify applicants’ 
eligibility for ACP. The purpose of this 
matching program is to verify the 
eligibility of ACP applicants and 
subscribers by determining whether 
they receive Federal Pell Grant benefits 
administered by the Department of 
Education. 

Participating Agencies 

Department of Education (source 
agency), Federal Communications 
Commission (recipient agency) and 
Universal Service Administrative 
Company 

Authority for Conducting the Matching 
Program 

The authority for the FCC’s ACP is 
Infrastructure Investment and Jobs Act, 
Public Law 117–58, 135 Stat. 429, 1238– 
44 (2021) (codified at 47 U.S.C. 1751– 
52); 47 CFR part 54. 

The Department of Education’s legal 
authority for this matching program and 
the associated disclosures is provided 
by Section 904 of division N of the 
Consolidated Appropriations Act, 2021 
(Pub. L. 116–260) as amended by 
Division F, Title V of the Infrastructure 
and Investment Jobs Act, Public Law 
117–58, and the Privacy Act, 5 U.S.C. 
552a. Prior to sending any records under 
this matching program to the 
Department of Education, USAC will 
obtain the prior written consent of all 
applicants for and subscribers to the 
ACP benefits whose eligibility is based 
on being a recipient of a Federal Pell 
Grant so as to permit the Department of 
Education to disclose their receipt of a 
Federal Pell Grant disbursement in an 
active award year to USAC and the FCC 
under the Family Educational Rights 
and Privacy Act (FERPA), 20 U.S.C. 
1232g(b) and 34 CFR 99.30, and the 
Privacy Act. 

Purpose(s) 
The purpose of this modified 

matching agreement is to verify the 
eligibility of applicants and subscribers 
to Lifeline, as well as to ACP and other 
Federal programs that use qualification 
for Lifeline as an eligibility criterion. 
This new agreement will permit 
eligibility verification for ACP by 
checking an applicant’s/subscriber’s 
participation in the Federal Pell Grant 
Program. Under FCC rules, consumers 
receiving these benefits qualify for ACP 
benefits. 

Categories of Individuals 
The categories of individuals whose 

information is involved in the matching 
program include, but are not limited to, 
those individuals who have applied for 
ACP benefits; are currently receiving 
ACP benefits; or who have received ACP 
benefits. 

Categories of Records 
The categories of records involved in 

the matching program include the last 
four digits of the applicant’s Social 
Security Number, date of birth, and first 
and last name. The National Verifier 
will transfer these data elements to the 
Department of Education, which will 
respond either ‘‘yes’’ or ‘‘no’’ that the 
individual is enrolled in a qualifying 
assistance program: Federal Pell Grant 
administered by the Department of 
Education. 

System(s) of Records 
The records shared as part of this 

matching program reside in the ACP 
system of records, FCC/WCB–3, 
Affordable Connectivity Program, which 
was published in the Federal Register at 
86 FR 71494 (Dec. 16, 2021). 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08123 Filed 4–17–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0075; FR ID 136313] 

Information Collection Being Reviewed 
by the Federal Communications 
Commission Under Delegated 
Authority 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act of 1995 (PRA), the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
Commission) invites the general public 
and other Federal agencies to take this 
opportunity to comment on the 
following information collections. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 
The FCC may not conduct or sponsor a 
collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) control 
number. No person shall be subject to 
any penalty for failing to comply with 
a collection of information subject to the 
PRA that does not display a valid OMB 
control number. 
DATES: Written PRA comments should 
be submitted on or before June 20, 2023. 
If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments but find it 
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difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contact listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Cathy Williams, FCC, via email to PRA@
fcc.gov and to Cathy.Williams@fcc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection, contact Cathy 
Williams at (202) 418–2918. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0075. 
Title: Form 2100, Schedule 345— 

Application for Consent to Assign 
Construction Permit or License for TV 
or FM Translator Station or Low Power 
Television Station or to Transfer Control 
of Entity Holding TV or FM Translator 
or Low Power Television Station. 

Type of Review: Extension of a 
currently approved collection. 

Respondents: Business or other for- 
profit entities; Not for profit institutions; 
Local or Tribal Government. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 1,700 respondents; 3,900 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.075– 
1.25 hours. 

Frequency of Response: Third party 
disclosure requirement and on occasion 
reporting requirement. 

Total Annual Burden: 3,013 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: $3,943,979. 
Obligation To Respond: Required to 

obtain or retain benefits. The statutory 
authority for this collection of 
information is contained in Sections 
154(i) and 310 of the Communications 
Act of 1934, as amended. 

Needs and Uses: Filing of Schedule 
345 is required when applying for 
authority for assignment of license or 
permit, or for consent to transfer of 
control of a corporate licensee or 
permittee for an FM or TV translator 
station, or low power TV station. 

This collection also includes the 
third-party disclosure requirement of 47 
CFR 73.3580 (OMB approval was 
received for Section 73.3580 under 
OMB Control Number 3060–0031). 
Section 73.3580, as amended in the 
Commission’s 2020 Public Notice 
Second Report and Order, discussed 
below, requires local public notice of 
the filing of all applications to assign or 
transfer control of a broadcast station 
authorization, including those of an FM 
or TV translator or booster station or 
LPTV station. Notice is given by an 
applicant posting notice of the 
application filing on its station website, 
its licensee website, its parent entity 
website, or on a publicly accessible, 
locally targeted website, for 30 
consecutive days beginning within five 

business days of acceptance of the 
application for filing. The online notice 
must link to a copy of the application 
*36405 as filed in the Commission’s 
LMS licensing database. Applicants for 
assignment or transfer of control of a 
low-power television (LPTV) station 
that locally originates programming 
must also make a total of six on-air 
announcements giving notice that their 
applications have been accepted for 
filing. 

On May 12, 2020, the Commission 
adopted Amendment of Section 73.3580 
of the Commission’s Rules Regarding 
Public Notice of the Filing of 
Applications; Modernization of Media 
Regulation Initiative; Revision of the 
Public Notice Requirements of Section 
73.3580, Second Report and Order, MB 
Docket Nos. 17–254, 17–105, & 05–6, 
FCC 20–65 (rel. May 13, 2020). The 
Commission adopted new, streamlined 
procedures for stations to provide 
public notice of the filing of certain 
applications. Applicants, including 
applicants for assignment or transfer of 
control of authorizations for FM or TV 
translators or LPTV stations, that were 
previously required to post public 
notice in a local newspaper, must now 
post notice online, either on the station 
website or a website affiliated with the 
station, its licensee, or its parent entity, 
or else must post notice on a publicly 
accessible, locally targeted website, for 
30 continuous days following 
acceptance of the application for filing. 
Stations that are required to make on-air 
announcements of the filing of certain 
applications, including an applicant for 
assignment or transfer of control of an 
LPTV station that locally originates 
programming, must continue to do so, 
but the announcements are shorter and 
direct viewers and listeners to the 
application as filed and displayed in 
either the station’s Online Public 
Inspection File or another Commission 
database. A total of six on-air 
announcements are required, at least 
one per week and no more than one per 
day or two per week, to be broadcast 
between 7:00 a.m. and 11:00 p.m. local 
time, Monday through Friday, beginning 
after the application is accepted for 
filing. 

Upon adoption of the 2020 Public 
Notice Second Report and Order, this 
submission was sent to OMB for 
approval of the modified third-party 
disclosure requirements for this 
Information Collection. The changes 
pertaining to this Information Collection 
and to 47 CFR 73.3580 adopted in the 
2020 Public Notice Second Report and 
Order did not necessitate changes to the 
Schedule 345, nor did they affect the 
substance, burden hours, or costs of 

completing the forms. The rule changes 
did, however, reduce burdens and costs 
associated with filing the application. 

Federal Communications Commission. 

Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08125 Filed 4–17–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL RETIREMENT THRIFT 
INVESTMENT BOARD 

Notice of Board Meeting 

DATES: April 25, 2023 at 10 a.m. 

ADDRESSES: Telephonic. Dial-in (listen 
only) information: Number: 1–202–599– 
1426, Code: 298 441 996#; or via web: 
https://teams.microsoft.com/l/meetup- 
join/19%3ameeting_
NWFmM2U5Y2QtZGFiYi00YTFjLThk
ZWItNDQ0Y2EyZTM4OGIw%40thread.
v2/0?context=%7b%22Tid
%22%3a%223f6323b7-e3fd-4f35-b43d- 
1a7afae5910d%22%2c%22Oid%22
%3a%221a441fb8-5318-4ad0-995b- 
f28a737f4128%22%7d. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Kimberly Weaver, Director, Office of 
External Affairs, (202) 942–1640. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Board Meeting Agenda 

Open Session 

1. Approval of the March 28, 2023 
Board Meeting Minutes 

2. Monthly Reports 
(a) Participant Activity Report 
(b) Legislative Report 

3. Quarterly Reports 
(c) Budget Review 
(d) Audit Status 
(e) Investment Review 

4. OI Presentation 
5. Enterprise Risk Management Update 

Closed Session 

6. Information covered under 5 U.S.C. 
552b (c)(9)(B) and (c)(10) 

Authority: 5 U.S.C. 552b (e)(1). 

Dated: April 13, 2023. 

Dharmesh Vashee, 
General Counsel, Federal Retirement Thrift 
Investment Board. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08154 Filed 4–17–23; 8:45 am] 
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