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DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Coast Guard 

33 CFR Part 165 

[Docket No. USCG 2011–1038] 

Safety Zone; San Francisco New 
Year’s Eve Fireworks Display, San 
Francisco, CA 

AGENCY: Coast Guard, DHS. 
ACTION: Notice of enforcement of 
regulation. 

SUMMARY: The Coast Guard will enforce 
the safety zone for the annual San 
Francisco New Year’s Eve Fireworks 
Display in the Captain of the Port, San 
Francisco area of responsibility during 
the dates and times noted below. This 
action is necessary to protect life and 
property of the maritime public from the 
hazards associated with the fireworks 
display. During the enforcement period, 
unauthorized persons or vessels are 
prohibited from entering into, transiting 
through, or anchoring in the safety zone, 
unless authorized by the Patrol 
Commander (PATCOM). 
DATES: The regulations in 33 CFR 
165.1191 will be enforced from 11 a.m. 
on December 31, 2011 to 12:30 a.m. on 
January 1, 2012. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have questions on this notice, call 
or email Ensign William Hawn, U.S. 
Coast Guard Sector San Francisco; 
telephone (415) 399–7442 or email at 
D11-PF-MarineEvents@uscg.mil. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

The Coast Guard will enforce a 100 
foot safety zone in the navigable waters 
around the fireworks barge off of Pier 50 
in position 37°46′28″ N., 122°23′06″ W. 
(NAD 83) from 11 a.m. on December 31, 
2011 until 11:55 p.m. on December 31, 
2011 during the loading, transit, and 
arrival of the fireworks barge to the 
display location off of Pier 2 in position 
37°47′42.6″ N. 122°23′19.1″ W. 
(NAD83). Upon the commencement of 
the fireworks display, scheduled to take 
place from 11:55 p.m. on December 31, 
2011 to 12:15 a.m. on January 1, 2012, 
the safety zone will increase in size and 
encompass the navigable waters 1,000 
feet around the display location near 
Pier 2 in position 37°47′42.6″ N. 
122°23′19.1″ W. (NAD83) for the annual 
San Francisco New Year’s Eve 
Fireworks Display in 33 CFR 165.1191. 

Under the provisions of 33 CFR 
165.1191, unauthorized persons or 
vessels are prohibited from entering 
into, transiting through, or anchoring in 
the safety zone during all applicable 

effective dates and times, unless 
authorized to do so by the PATCOM. 
Additionally, each person who receives 
notice of a lawful order or direction 
issued by an official patrol vessel shall 
obey the order or direction. 

The PATCOM is empowered to forbid 
entry into and control the regulated 
area. The PATCOM shall be designated 
by the Commander, Coast Guard Sector 
San Francisco. The PATCOM may, upon 
request, allow the transit of commercial 
vessels through regulated areas when it 
is safe to do so. 

This notice is issued under authority 
of 33 CFR 165.1191 and 5 U.S.C. 552(a). 
In addition to this notice in the Federal 
Register, the Coast Guard will provide 
the maritime community with extensive 
advance notification of the safety zone 
and its enforcement period via the Local 
Notice to Mariners. 

If the Captain of the Port determines 
that the regulated area need not be 
enforced for the full duration stated in 
this notice, a Broadcast Notice to 
Mariners may be used to grant general 
permission to enter the regulated area. 

Dated: December 8, 2011. 
Cynthia L. Stowe, 
Captain, U.S. Coast Guard, Captain of the 
Port San Francisco. 
[FR Doc. 2011–33234 Filed 12–27–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9110–04–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

40 CFR Part 52 

[EPA–R06–OAR–2008–0638; FRL–9613–7] 

Approval and Disapproval and 
Promulgation of Implementation Plans; 
Texas; Infrastructure and Interstate 
Transport Requirements for the 1997 
Ozone and the 1997 and 2006 PM2.5 
NAAQS 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Final rule. 

SUMMARY: The EPA is partially 
approving and partially disapproving 
submittals from the state of Texas 
pursuant to the Clean Air Act (CAA or 
Act) that address the infrastructure 
elements specified in the CAA section 
110(a)(2), necessary to implement, 
maintain, and enforce the 1997 8-hour 
ozone and 1997 and 2006 fine 
particulate matter (PM2.5) national 
ambient air quality standards (NAAQS 
or standards). We are determining that 
the current Texas State Implementation 
Plan (SIP) meets the infrastructure 
requirements for the 1997 8-hour ozone 

and the 1997 and 2006 PM 2.5 NAAQS 
at 110(a)(2)(A), (B), (E), (F), (G), (H), (K), 
(L), (M), and portions of (C), (D)(ii) and 
(J). We are determining that the current 
Texas SIP does not meet the 
infrastructure requirements for the 1997 
8-hour ozone and the 1997 and 2006 
PM2.5 NAAQS at 110(a)(2) for portions 
of (C), (D)(ii) and (J). The EPA is also 
partially approving and partially 
disapproving SIP revisions submitted by 
the state of Texas for the purpose of 
addressing the provisions of CAA 
section 110(a)(2)(D)(i) for the 1997 8- 
hour ozone NAAQS and the 1997 and 
2006 PM2.5 NAAQS. These SIP revisions 
address the requirement that the Texas 
SIP have adequate provisions to prohibit 
air emissions from adversely affecting 
another state’s air quality through 
interstate transport. The EPA is partially 
approving and partially disapproving 
the provisions of these SIP submissions 
that emissions from sources in Texas do 
not interfere with measures required in 
the SIP of any other state under part C 
of the CAA to prevent significant 
deterioration of air quality, with regard 
to the 1997 8-hour ozone NAAQS and 
the 1997 and 2006 PM2.5 NAAQS. The 
partial disapprovals herein are because 
Texas has stated it cannot issue permits 
for and does not intend to regulate 
greenhouse gas (GHG) emissions. The 
EPA is also approving SIP revisions that 
modify the Texas SIP for Prevention of 
Significant Deterioration (PSD) to 
include nitrogen oxides (NOX) as an 
ozone precursor. This action is being 
taken under section 110 and part C of 
the Act. 
DATES: This rule is effective on January 
27, 2012. 
ADDRESSES: The EPA established a 
docket for this action under Docket ID 
No. EPA–R06–OAR–2008–0638. All 
documents in the docket are listed at 
www.regulations.gov. Although listed in 
the index, some information is not 
publicly available, e.g., Confidential 
Business Information or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Certain other 
material, such as copyrighted material, 
is not placed on the Internet and will be 
publicly available only in hard copy 
form. Publicly available docket 
materials are available either 
electronically through 
www.regulations.gov or in hard copy at 
the Air Planning Section (6PD–L), 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1445 
Ross Avenue, Suite 700, Dallas, Texas 
75202–2733. The file will be made 
available by appointment for public 
inspection in the Region 6 Freedom of 
Information Act (FOIA) Review Room 
between the hours of 8:30 a.m. and 4:30 
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