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The first page of any filing should 
include docket number P–10773–030. 

k. Description of Request: The 
licensee is proposing to install at the 
powerhouse an additional 140-kilowatt 
(kW) generating unit coupled to the 
existing 80-kW unit, for a combined 
project installed capacity of 220 kW. 
The new unit will result in an increase 
of the project’s hydraulic capacity from 
6 to 15 cubic feet per second. The 
installation of the new unit will not 
require any physical changes to the 
project features since the powerhouse 
was designed to accommodate an 
additional generating unit. All work will 
occur within the existing powerhouse. 
The licensee is requesting the 
amendment to increase hatchery 
production at the project. 

l. Locations of the Applications: A 
copy of the application is available for 
inspection and reproduction at the 
Commission’s Public Reference Room, 
located at 888 First Street NE., Room 
2A, Washington, DC 20426, or by calling 
(202) 502–8371. The filing may also be 
viewed on the Commission’s Web site at 
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
elibrary.asp. Enter the docket number 
excluding the last three digits in the 
docket number field to access the 
document (i.e., P–10773). You may also 
register online at http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/esubscription.asp to be 
notified via email of new filings and 
issuances related to this or other 
pending projects. For assistance, call 1– 
866–208–3676 or email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, for TTY, 
call (202) 502–8659. 

m. Individuals desiring to be included 
on the Commission’s mailing list should 
so indicate by writing to the Secretary 
of the Commission. 

n. Comments, Motions To Intervene or 
Protests: Anyone may submit 
comments, a motion to intervene, or a 
protest in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214. 
In determining the appropriate action to 
take, the Commission will consider all 
protests or other comments filed, but 
only those who file a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
Commission’s Rules may become a 
party to the proceeding. Any comments, 
motions to intervene, or protests must 
be received on or before the specified 
comment date for the particular 
application. 

o. Filing and Service of Responsive 
Documents: Any filing must (1) bear in 
all capital letters the title 
‘‘COMMENTS’’, ‘‘MOTION TO 
INTERVENE’’, ‘‘PROTEST’’, ‘‘TERMS 
AND CONDITIONS’’ or ‘‘FISHWAY 
PRESCRIPTIONS’’, as applicable; (2) set 

forth in the heading the name of the 
applicant and the project number of the 
application to which the filing 
responds; (3) furnish the name, address, 
and telephone number of the person 
protesting or intervening; and (4) 
otherwise comply with the requirements 
of 18 CFR 385.2001 through 385.2005. 
All comments, motions to intervene, or 
protests must set forth their evidentiary 
basis and otherwise comply with the 
requirements of 18 CFR 4.34(b). All 
comments, motions to intervene, 
protests, recommendations, terms and 
conditions, or prescriptions should 
relate to project works which are the 
subject of the amendment request. 
Agencies may obtain copies of the 
application directly from the applicant. 
A copy of any protest or motion to 
intervene must be served upon each 
representative of the applicant specified 
in the particular application. If an 
intervener files comments or documents 
with the Commission relating to the 
merits of an issue that may affect the 
responsibilities of a particular resource 
agency, they must also serve a copy of 
the document on that resource agency. 
A copy of all other filings in reference 
to this application must be accompanied 
by proof of service on all persons listed 
in the service list prepared by the 
Commission in this proceeding, in 
accordance with 18 CFR 4.34(b) and 
385.2010. 

Dated: May 5, 2017. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2017–09626 Filed 5–11–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings 

Take notice that the Commission has 
received the following Natural Gas 
Pipeline Rate and Refund Report filings: 

Filings Instituting Proceedings 

Docket Numbers: RP17–730–000. 
Applicants: Great Lakes Gas 

Transmission Limited Par. 
Description: Operational Purchases 

and Sales Report of Great Lakes Gas 
Transmission LP. 

Filed Date: 05/01/2017. 
Accession Number: 20170501–5456. 
Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 

Time on Monday, May 15, 2017. 
Docket Numbers: RP17–731–000. 
Applicants: Blue Lake Gas Storage 

Company. 

Description: Operational Purchases 
and Sales Report of Blue Lake Gas 
Storage Company. 

Filed Date: 05/01/2017. 
Accession Number: 20170501–5457. 
Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 

Time on Monday, May 15, 2017. 
Docket Numbers: RP17–732–000. 
Applicants: Bison Pipeline LLC. 
Description: Operational Purchases 

and Sales Report of Bison Pipeline LLC. 
Filed Date: 05/01/2017. 
Accession Number: 20170501–5458. 
Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 

Time on Monday, May 15, 2017. 
Docket Numbers: RP17–733–000. 
Applicants: ANR Storage Company. 
Description: Operational Purchases 

and Sales Report of ANR Storage 
Company. 

Filed Date: 05/01/2017. 
Accession Number: 20170501–5459. 
Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 

Time on Monday, May 15, 2017. 
Docket Numbers: RP17–734–000. 
Applicants: ANR Pipeline Company. 
Description: Operational Purchases 

and Sales Report of ANR Pipeline 
Company. 

Filed Date: 05/01/2017. 
Accession Number: 20170501–5460. 
Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 

Time on Monday, May 15, 2017. 
Docket Numbers: RP17–735–000. 
Applicants: ANR Pipeline Company. 
Description: Annual Cashout 

Surcharge Report of ANR Storage 
Company. 

Filed Date: 05/01/2017. 
Accession Number: 20170501–5461. 
Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 

Time on Monday, May 15, 2017. 
Docket Numbers: RP17–736–000. 
Applicants: Northern Border Pipeline 

Company. 
Description: Operational Purchases 

and Sales Report of Northern Border 
Pipeline Company. 

Filed Date: 05/01/2017. 
Accession Number: 20170501–5471. 
Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 

Time on Monday, May 15, 2017. 
Docket Numbers: RP16–975–001. 
Applicants: Venice Gathering System, 

L.L.C. 
Description: Venice Gathering System, 

L.L.C. submits tariff filing per 385.602: 
Motion to Place Interim Settlement 
Rates Into Effect to be effective 6/1/ 
2017. 

Filed Date: 05/05/2017. 
Accession Number: 20170505–5084. 
Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 

Time on Wednesday, May 17, 2017. 
Docket Numbers: RP17–724–000. 
Applicants: Venice Gathering System, 

L.L.C. 
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Description: Venice Gathering System, 
L.L.C. submits tariff filing per 
154.205(a): Motion to Withdraw Filing. 

Filed Date: 05/05/2017. 
Accession Number: 20170505–5170. 
Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 

Time on Wednesday, May 17, 2017. 
Docket Numbers: RP17–737–000. 
Applicants: Equitrans, L.P. 
Description: Equitrans, L.P. submits 

tariff filing per 154.204: Equitrans’ 
Clean-Up Filing—May 2017 to be 
effective 6/5/2017. 

Filed Date: 05/05/2017. 
Accession Number: 20170505–5026. 
Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 

Time on Wednesday, May 17, 2017. 
Docket Numbers: RP17–738–000. 
Applicants: Transcontinental Gas 

Pipe Line Company. 
Description: Transcontinental Gas 

Pipe Line Company, LLC submits tariff 
filing per 154.203: Refund Report— 
Texas Eastern OFO Penalty Disbursment 
(Rate Schedule S–2). 

Filed Date: 05/05/2017. 
Accession Number: 20170505–5041. 
Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 

Time on Wednesday, May 17, 2017. 
The filings are accessible in the 

Commission’s eLibrary system by 
clicking on the links or querying the 
docket number. 

Any person desiring to intervene or 
protest in any of the above proceedings 
must file in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s 
Regulations (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 
Protests may be considered, but 
intervention is necessary to become a 
party to the proceeding. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

Dated: May 8, 2017. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2017–09672 Filed 5–11–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[ER–FRL–9033–1] 

Environmental Impact Statements; 
Notice of Availability 

Responsible Agency: Office of Federal 
Activities, General Information (202) 
564–7146 or http://www.epa.gov/nepa. 

Weekly receipt of Environmental Impact 
Statements (EISs) 

Filed 05/01/2017 Through 05/05/2017 
Pursuant to 40 CFR 1506.9 

Notice: 
Section 309(a) of the Clean Air Act 

requires that EPA make public its 
comments on EISs issued by other 
Federal agencies. EPA’s comment letters 
on EISs are available at: http://
www.epa.gov/compliance/nepa/ 
eisdata.html. 
EIS No. 20170073, Draft, USACE, NC, 

Bogue Banks Master Beach 
Nourishment Project, Comment 
Period Ends: 06/26/2017, Contact: 
Mickey Sugg 910–251–4811 

EIS No. 20170074, Final Supplement, 
USACE, WV, Bluestone Dam Safety 
Modification, Review Period Ends: 
06/12/2017, Contact: Rebecca 
Rutherford 304–399–5924 

EIS No. 20170075, Draft, BPA, ID, 
Crystal Springs Hatchery Program, 
Comment Period Ends: 06/26/2017, 
Contact: Jenna Peterson 503–230– 
3018 

EIS No. 20170076, Final Supplement, 
USACE, MO, Mississippi River 
Between the Ohio and Missouri 
Rivers (Regulating Works), Review 
Period Ends: 06/12/2017, Contact: Kip 
Runyon 314–331–8396 

EIS No. 20170077, Final, USFS, CO, 
Upper Monument Creek Landscape 
Restoration, Review Period Ends: 06/ 
26/2017, Contact: John Dow 719–553– 
1476 

EIS No. 20170078, Draft, USFWS, NE., 
Issuance of an Incidental Take Permit 
and Implementation of a Habitat 
Conservation Plan for the R-Project 
Transmission Line, Comment Period 
Ends: 07/11/2017, Contact: Eliza 
Hines 308–382–6468 ext. 204 

EIS No. 20170079, Draft Supplement, 
USFS, WY, Shoshone National Forest 
Land Management Plan, Comment 
Period Ends: 08/10/2017, Contact: 
Casey McQuiston 307–578–5134 
Dated: May 9, 2017. 

Dawn Roberts, 
Management Analyst, NEPA Compliance 
Division, Office of Federal Activities. 
[FR Doc. 2017–09680 Filed 5–11–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL MEDIATION AND 
CONCILIATION SERVICE 

Labor-Management Cooperation Grant 
Program Information Collection 
Request 

AGENCY: Federal Mediation and 
Conciliation Service. 

ACTION: 60-Day notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The Federal Mediation and 
Conciliation Service (FMCS), as part of 
its continuing effort to reduce the 
paperwork burden of grant applicants 
and awardees in accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
invites the general public and other 
Federal Agencies to take this 
opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. The 
information collection requests are 
FMCS forms: Application for Federal 
Assistance (SF–424), Accounting 
System and Financial Capability 
Questionnaire (LM–3), Request for 
Advance or Reimbursement SF–270 
(LM–6), Financial Status Report SF– 
269a (LM–7), Project Performance (LM– 
8), and Grants Program Grantee 
Evaluation Questionnaire (LM–9). This 
information collection activity was 
previously approved by the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) and is 
requesting a reinstatement without 
change to the collection. This collection 
was assigned the control number 3076– 
0006. 
DATES: Comments on this information 
collection must be received within 60 
days of the Federal Register publication 
date to be assured of consideration. 
ADDRESSES: Submit written comments 
by mail to the Labor-Management 
Cooperation Grants Program, Federal 
Mediation and Conciliation Service, 250 
E Street SW., Washington, DC 20427 or 
by contacting the person whose name 
appears under the section headed, FOR 
FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT. 

Comments may be submitted by fax at 
(202) 606–3434 or via email to Linda 
Gray-Broughton, Grants Specialist at 
lgbroughton@fmcs.gov. All comments 
must be identified by the appropriate 
agency form number. No confidential 
business information (CBI) should be 
submitted through email. Information 
submitted as a comment concerning this 
document may be claimed confidential 
by marking any part or all of the 
information as ‘‘CBI’’. A copy of the 
comment that contains CBI will be 
submitted for inclusion in the public 
record. Information not marked 
confidential may be disclosed publicly 
by FMCS without prior notice. All 
written comments will be available for 
inspection on the 7th floor at the 
Washington, DC address above from 
9:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m., Monday through 
Friday, excluding legal holidays. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Linda Gray-Broughton, Grants 
Specialist, FMCS, 250 E Street SW., 
Washington, DC 20427. Telephone 
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