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e. Site habitat condition. 
3. Method used to survey the colony 

(i.e., ground count or aerial count). 
4. Nest counts: 
a. Number of active or inactive nests 

(with number of unknown); 
b. Whether the entire colony was 

surveyed; 
c. Whether co-nesting species were 

observed; and 
d. Whether photos and/or videos were 

taken. 
5. General comments from the 

observer. 
To be flexible, States will have the 

option to use an electronic version of 
the datasheet (ArcGIS Survey123 
software) or a paper-based survey form. 
The data the Service collects through 
the range-wide cormorant monitoring 
program will be used to update 
cormorant population estimates and to 
update PTL assessments with the most 
up-to-date information as specified in 
the 2020 EIS. The updated take limits 
would also inform future Service permit 
allocation. The Service will share the 
population estimates and PTL 
assessments with State and Tribal fish 
and wildlife agencies to inform their 
respective management actions, as well 
as with other Federal agencies, 
including the U.S. Department of 
Agriculture Wildlife Services program. 

Title of Collection: National Double- 
Crested Cormorant Survey. 

OMB Control Number: 1018–New. 
Form Number: None. 
Type of Review: New. 
Respondents/Affected Public: State/ 

local/Tribal government (State biologists 
coordinated through the four North 
American Flyways (Pacific, Central, 
Mississippi, and Atlantic)). 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Respondents: 40. 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Responses: 1,016. 

Estimated Completion Time per 
Response: 4 hours (30 minutes reporting 
and 3.5 hours recordkeeping). 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Burden Hours: 4,064. 

Respondent’s Obligation: Voluntary. 
Frequency of Collection: One time. 
Total Estimated Annual Nonhour 

Burden Cost: None. 
An agency may not conduct or 

sponsor and a person is not required to 
respond to a collection of information 
unless it displays a currently valid OMB 
control number. 

The authority for this action is the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44 
U.S.C. 3501 et seq.). 

Madonna Baucum, 
Information Collection Clearance Officer, U.S. 
Fish and Wildlife Service. 
[FR Doc. 2024–17234 Filed 8–2–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4333–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

Bureau of Land Management 

[MTM–56312–01] 

Public Land Order No. 7945; Extension 
of Public Land Order No. 6560, as 
Extended by Public Land Order No. 
7610; Withdrawal of Wisdom 
Administrative Site; Montana 

AGENCY: Bureau of Land Management, 
Interior. 
ACTION: Public land order. 

SUMMARY: This Public Land Order (PLO) 
extends the duration of the withdrawal 
created by PLO No. 6560, as extended 
by PLO No. 7610, which would 
otherwise expire August 5, 2024, for an 
additional 20-year period. PLO No. 6560 
withdrew 59.99 acres of public domain 
land outside the exterior boundary of 
the Beaverhead-Deerlodge National 
Forest from settlement, sale, location, or 
entry, under the general land laws, 
including the mining laws, subject to 
valid existing rights, and transferred 
administrative jurisdiction to the United 
States Forest Service (USFS) for use as 
the Wisdom Administrative Site. 
DATES: This PLO takes effect on August 
6, 2024. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Adam Carr, Branch Chief, Realty Lands 
and Renewable Energy, BLM Montana/ 
Dakotas, 5001 South Gate Drive, 
Billings, Montana 59101, telephone: 
(406) 538–1957; email: acarr@blm.gov; 
or Nathan Teats, Land Status Program 
Manager, U.S. Forest Service Region 
One, Office of the Regional Forester, 26 
Fort Missoula Road, Missoula Montana 
59804, telephone: (406) 329–3193 or 
email: nathan.e.teats@usda.gov. 

Individuals in the United States who 
are deaf, deafblind, hard of hearing, or 
have a speech disability may dial 711 
(TTY, TDD, or TeleBraille) to access 
telecommunications relay services. 
Individuals outside the United States 
should use the relay services offered 
within their country to make 
international calls to the point-of- 
contact in the United States. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
purpose for which the withdrawal was 
first made requires the withdrawal 

extension in order to continue to protect 
and preserve the USFS managed 
Wisdom Administrative Site, facilities, 
and capital improvements. 

Order 

By virtue of the authority vested in 
the Secretary of the Interior by section 
204 of the Federal Land Policy and 
Management Act of 1976, 43 U.S.C. 
1714, it is ordered as follows: 

1. Subject to valid existing rights, PLO 
No. 6560 (49 FR 32068, (1984)), as 
extended 

by PLO No. 7610 (69 FR 50213, 
(2004)), which withdrew 59.99 acres of 
public domain land outside the exterior 
boundary of the Beaverhead-Deerlodge 
National Forest from settlement, sale, 
location, or entry under the general land 
laws, including the mining laws, and 
transferred administrative jurisdiction 
to the USFS to protect and preserve the 
Wisdom Administrative Site, is hereby 
extended for an additional 20-year 
period. The lands being withdrawn in 
this order are described as follows: 

Principal Meridian, Montana 

T. 2 S., R. 15 W., 
Sec. 34, Tract A of Certificate of Survey 

369, document number 171983 recorded 
June 25, 1982, filed in Beaverhead 
County, Montana. 

T. 3 S., R. 15 W., 
Sec. 3, Tract B of Certificate of Survey 369, 

document number 171983 recorded June 
25, 1982, filed in Beaverhead County, 
Montana. 

The area described contains 59.99 acres. 

2. The withdrawal made by this order 
does not alter the applicability of those 
public land laws governing the use of 
land other than under the United States 
mining laws. 

3. The withdrawal extended by this 
Order will expire 20 years from the 
effective date of this order, unless, as a 
result of review conducted prior to the 
expiration date pursuant to section 
204(f) of the Federal Land Policy and 
Management Act of 1976, 43 U.S.C. 
1714(f), the Secretary determines the 
withdrawal shall be further extended. 

(Authority: 43 U.S.C. 1714) 

Robert T. Anderson, 
Solicitor. 
[FR Doc. 2024–17357 Filed 8–2–24; 8:45 am] 
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