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10 15 U.S.C. 78f(b)(5). 11 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(12). 

responsibility of functions, activities 
and areas which can reasonably be 
expected to overlap. [no understanding 
or agreement purporting to apportion or 
limit such responsibility will be 
recognized by the Exchange.] In 
addition, in the case of co-CCOs, the 
written approval request submitted in 
accordance with this Interpretation 
shall include a representation to the 
Exchange, to the effect that the CEO’s 
Annual Report and Certification 
required by Rule 342.30(e) will further 
state, in addition to the fact that each 
such CCO has met the qualification 
requirements set forth at 342.30(d)/01, 
that the collective authority, 
accountability, and responsibility of 
such co-equal CCOs encompasses, 
without exception, every aspect of the 
business of such member organization. 

Implementation Date 

The proposed amendments would be 
effective upon SEC approval. 

2. Statutory Basis 

The proposed rule change is 
consistent with the requirements of the 
Act and the rules and regulations 
thereunder applicable to a national 
securities exchange, and in particular, 
with the requirements of Sections 
6(b)(5)10 of the Act. Section 6(b)(5) 
requires, among other things, that the 
rules of an exchange be designed to 
promote just and equitable principles of 
trade, to remove impediments to and 
perfect the mechanism of a free and 
open market and national market 
system, and in general, to protect 
investors and the public interest. The 
proposed amendments will provide 
member organizations with 
organizational flexibility in the 
allocation of certain regulatory 
responsibilities. 

B. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement on Burden on Competition 

The Exchange does not believe that 
the proposed rule change will impose 
any burden on competition that is not 
necessary or appropriate in furtherance 
of the purposes of the Act. 

C. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement on Comments on the 
Proposed Rule Change Received From 
Members, Participants or Others 

The Exchange has neither solicited 
nor received written comments on the 
proposed rule change. 

III. Date of Effectiveness of the 
Proposed Rule Change and Timing for 
Commission Action 

Within 35 days of the date of 
publication of this notice in the Federal 
Register or within such longer period (i) 
as the Commission may designate up to 
90 days of such date if it finds such 
longer period to be appropriate and 
publishes its reasons for so finding or 
(ii) as to which the Exchange consents, 
the Commission will: 

(A) By order approve such proposed 
rule change, or 

(B) Institute proceedings to determine 
whether the proposed rule change 
should be disapproved. 

IV. Solicitation of Comments 

Interested persons are invited to 
submit written data, views and 
arguments concerning the foregoing, 
including whether the proposed rule 
change is consistent with the Act. 
Comments may be submitted by any of 
the following methods: 

Electronic Comments 

• Use the Commission’s Internet 
comment form (http://www.sec.gov/ 
rules/sro.shtml); or 

• Send an e-mail to rule- 
comments@sec.gov. Please include File 
Number SR–NYSE–2007–10 on the 
subject line. 

Paper Comments 

• Send paper comments in triplicate 
to Nancy M. Morris, Secretary, 
Securities and Exchange Commission, 
100 F Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20549–1090. 
All submissions should refer to File 
Number SR–NYSE–2007–10. This file 
number should be included on the 
subject line if e-mail is used. To help the 
Commission process and review your 
comments more efficiently, please use 
only one method. The Commission will 
post all comments on the Commission’s 
Internet Web site http://www.sec.gov/ 
rules/sro/shtml. Copies of the 
submission, all subsequent 
amendments, all written statements 
with respect to the proposed rule 
change that are filed with the 
Commission, and all written 
communications relating to the 
proposed rule change between the 
Commission and any person, other than 
those that may be withheld from the 
public in accordance with the 
provisions of 5 U.S.C. 552, will be 
available for inspection and copying in 
the Commission’s Public Reference 
Room. Copies of such filing will also be 
available for inspection and copying at 
the principal office of the NYSE. All 

comments received will be posted 
without change; the Commission does 
not edit personal identifying 
information be posted without change; 
the Commission does not edit personal 
identifying information from 
submissions. You should submit only 
information that you wish to make 
available publicly. All submissions 
should refer to File number SR–NYSE– 
2007–10 and should be submitted by 
May 17, 2007. 

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Market Regulation, pursuant to delegated 
authority.11 

Florence E. Harmon, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E7–7939 Filed 4–25–07; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8010–01–P 

SMALL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 

National Small Business Development 
Center Advisory Board; Public Meeting 

The U.S. Small Business 
Administration National Small Business 
Development Center Advisory Board 
will be hosting a public meeting via 
conference call to discuss such matters 
that may be presented by members, and 
the staff of the U.S. Small Business 
Administration or interested others. The 
conference call will take place on 
Tuesday, May 15, 2007 at 1 p.m. Eastern 
Standard Time. 

The purpose of the meeting is to 
discuss the initial White Paper draft 
regarding management of the SBDC 
program, and arrangements for the 
Board site visit in June to visit the Ohio 
SBDC network in Columbus. 

Anyone wishing to make an oral 
presentation to the Board must contact 
Erika Fischer, Senior Program Analyst, 
U.S. Small Business Administration, 
Office of Small Business Development 
Centers, 409 3rd Street, SW., 
Washington, DC 20416, telephone (202) 
205–7045 or fax (202) 481–0681. 

Matthew Teague, 
Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. E7–8021 Filed 4–25–07; 8:45 am] 
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