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from unauthorized release and to handle 
it in accordance with the FIFRA 
Information Security Manual. In 
addition, Computer Sciences 
Corporation and its Systems Integration 
Group, are required to submit for EPA 
approval a security plan under which 
any CBI will be secured and protected 
against unauthorized release or 
compromise. No information will be 
provided to Computer Sciences 
Corporation and its subcontractor, 
Systems Integration Group, until the 
requirements in this document have 
been fully satisfied. Records of 
information provided to Computer 
Sciences Corporation and its 
subcontractor, Systems Integration 
Group, will be maintained by EPA 
Project Officers for this contract. All 
information supplied to Computer 
Sciences Corporation and its 
subcontractor, Systems Integration 
Group, by EPA for use in connection 
with this contract will be returned to 
EPA when ComputerSciences 
Corporation and its subcontractor, 
Systems Integration Group, have 
completed their work. 

List of Subjects 

Environmental protection, Business 
and industry, Government contracts, 
Government property, Security 
measures. 

Dated: September 22, 2005. 
Robert Forrest, 
Acting Director, Information Technology and 
Resource Management Division, Office of 
Pesticide Programs. 
[FR Doc. 05–20007 Filed 10–4–05; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6560–50–S 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 
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National Pollution Prevention and 
Toxics Advisory Committee (NPPTAC); 
Notice of Public Meeting 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Under the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act (FACA), 5 U.S. App.2 
(Public Law 92–463), EPA gives notice 
of a 2–day meeting of the National 
Pollution Prevention and Toxics 
Advisory Committee (NPPTAC). The 
purpose of the meeting is to provide 
advice and recommendations to EPA 
regarding the overall policy and 
operations of the programs of the Office 
of Pollution, Prevention and Toxics 
(OPPT). 

DATES: The meeting will be held on 
October 13, 2005 from 8 a.m. to 4:45 
p.m., and October 14, 2005 from 9:30 
a.m.to 3:30 p.m. 

Registration to attend the meeting 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number OPPT–2002–0001, must be 
received on or before October 7, 2005. 
Registration will also be accepted at the 
meeting. 

Request to provide oral comments at 
the meeting, identified as (NPPTAC) 
October, 2005 meeting, must be received 
in writing on or before October 7, 2005. 

Request to participate in the meeting, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number OPPT–2002–0001, must be 
received on or before October 7, 2005. 

For information on access or services 
for individuals with disabilities, please 
contact John Alter at (202) 564–9891 or 
npptac.oppt@epa.gov. To request 
accommodation of a disability, please 
contact John Alter, preferably at least 10 
days prior to the meeting, to give EPA 
as much time as possible to process 
your request. 

Meetings of the 5 Work Groups of the 
Committee will take place as follows. 
The High Production Volume (HPV) 
Work Group will meet on October 12, 
2005, from 2 p.m. to 3:45 p.m., to 
discuss activities related to EPA’s HPV 
Challenge Program. The Pollution 
Prevention (P2) Work Group will meet 
on October 12, 2005 from 8 a.m. to 
noon, to discuss activities related to 
EPA’s Pollution Programs. The Tribal 
Issues Work Group will meet on October 
12, 2005 from 2 p.m. to 5:30 p.m., to 
discuss activities related to EPA’s 
coordination with Tribes and Tribal 
Organizations. The Broader Issues Work 
Group will meet on October 12, 2005 
from 2 p.m to 5 p.m, to discuss activities 
related to EPA’s New Chemicals and 
Existing Chemicals Programs. The 
Interim Ad Hoc Work Group on 
Nanoscale Materials will meet on 
October 12, 2005 from 4 p.m. to 5:30 
p.m., to discuss issues regarding a 
potential voluntary pilot reporting 
program for nanoscale materials that are 
existing chemical substances and 
associated issues related to the 
regulations of nanoscale materials that 
are new chemical substances. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will be held at 
the Sheraton Crystal City 1800 Jefferson 
Davis Highway Arlington, VA. 

Requests to participate in the meeting 
may be submitted to the technical 
person listed under FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
general information contact: Colby 
Lintner, Regulatory Coordinator, 
Environmental Assistance Division 

(7408M), Office of Pollution Prevention 
and Toxics, Environmental Protection 
Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania Ave., NW., 
Washington, DC 20460–0001; telephone 
number: (202) 554–1404; e-mail address: 
TSCA-Hotline@epa.gov. 

For technical information contact: 
John Alter, (7408), Office of Pollution 
Prevention and Toxics, Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave., NW., Washington, DC 20460– 
0001; telephone number: (202) 564– 
9891; e-mail 
address:npptac.oppt@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. General Information 

A. Does This Action Apply to Me? 
This action is directed to the public 

in general, and may be of particular 
interest to those persons who have an 
interest in or may be required to manage 
pollution prevention and toxic chemical 
programs, individual groups concerned 
with environmental justice, children’s 
health, or animal welfare, as they relate 
to OPPT’s programs under the Toxic 
Substances Control Act (TSCA) and the 
Pollution Prevention Act (PPA). Since 
other entities may also be interested, the 
Agency has not attempted to describe all 
the specific entities that may be 
interested in the activities of the 
NPPTAC. If you have any questions 
regarding the applicability of this action 
to a particular entity, consult the person 
listed under FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT. 

B. How Can I Get Copies of This 
Document and Other Related 
Information? 

1. Docket. EPA has established an 
official public docket for this action 
under docket ID number OPPT–2002– 
0001. The official public docket consists 
of the documents specifically referenced 
in this action, any public comments 
received, and other information related 
to this action. Although a part of the 
official docket, the public docket does 
not include Confidential Business 
Information (CBI) or other information 
whose disclosure is restricted by statute. 
The official public docket is the 
collection of materials that is available 
for public viewing at the EPA Docket 
Center, Rm. B102–Reading Room, EPA 
West, 1301 Constitution Ave., NW., 
Washington, DC. The EPA Docket 
Center is open from 8:30 a.m. to 4:30 
p.m., Monday through Friday, excluding 
legal holidays. The EPA Docket Center 
Reading Room telephone number is 
(202) 566–1744 and the telephone 
number for the OPPT Docket, which is 
located in the EPA Docket Center, is 
(202) 566–0280. 
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2. Electronic access. You may access 
this Federal Register document 
electronically through the EPA Internet 
under the ‘‘Federal Register’’ listings at 
http://www.epa.gov/fedrgstr/. 

An electronic version of the public 
docket is available through EPA’s 
electronic public docket and comment 
system, EPA Dockets. You may use EPA 
Dockets at http://www.epa.gov/edocket/ 
to submit or view public comments, 
access the index listing of the contents 
of the official public docket, and to 
access those documents in the public 
docket that are available electronically. 
Although not all docket materials may 
be available electronically, you may still 
access any of the publicly available 
docket materials through the docket 
facility identified in Unit I.B.1. Once in 
the system, select ‘‘search,’’ then key in 
the appropriate docket ID number. 

C. How and to Whom Do I Submit 
Comments? 

You may submit comments 
electronically, by mail, or through hand 
delivery/courier. To ensure proper 
receipt by EPA, identify the appropriate 
docket ID number OPPT–2002–0001, 
include NPPTAC October 2005 meeting 
in the subject line on the first page of 
your comment. 

1. By mail: OPPT Document Control 
Office, Environmental Protection 
Agency, 7407M, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Avenue, NW, Washington, DC 20460– 
0001. 

2. Electronically: At http:// 
www.epa.gov/edocket/, search for 
OPPT–2002–0001, and follow the 
directions to submit comments. 

3. Hand delivery/courier: OPPT 
Document Control Office in EPA East 
Bldg., Rm. M6428, 1201 Constitution 
Ave., NW, Washington DC. 

II. Background 
The proposed agenda for the NPPTAC 

meeting includes: The High Production 
(HPV) Volume Challenge Program; 
Pollution Prevention; Risk Assessment; 
Risk Management; Risk Communication; 
Nanoscale Material and Coordination 
with Tribes and other Stakeholders. The 
meeting is open to the public. 

III. How Can I Request to Participate in 
this Meeting? 

You may submit a request to 
participate in this meeting to the 
technical person listed under FOR 
FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT. Do not 
submit any information in your request 
that is considered CBI. Requests to 
participate in the meeting, identified by 
docket ID number OPPT–2002–0001, 
must be received on or before October 
5, 2005. 

For information on access or services 
for individuals with disabilities, please 
contact John Alter at (202) 564–9891 or 
npptac.oppt@epa.gov. To request 
accommodation of a disability, please 
contact John Alter, preferably at least 10 
days prior to the meeting, to give EPA 
as much time as possible to process 
your request. 

List of Subjects 

Environmental protection, NPPTAC, 
pollution prevention, toxics, toxic 
chemicals, chemical health and safety, 
and nanoscale materials. 

Dated: September 29, 2005. 
Wendy C. Hamnett, 
Acting Director, Office of Pollution Prevention 
and Toxics. 
[FR Doc. 05–20006 Filed 10–4–05; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6560–50–S 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

Notice of Public Information 
Collection(s) Being Reviewed by the 
Federal Communications Commission, 
Comments Requested 

September 20, 2005. 
SUMMARY: The Federal Communications 
Commission, as part of its continuing 
effort to reduce paperwork burden 
invites the general public and other 
Federal agencies to take this 
opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection(s), as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995, Public Law 104–13. 
An agency may not conduct or sponsor 
a collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid control 
number. No person shall be subject to 
any penalty for failing to comply with 
a collection of information subject to the 
Paperwork Reduction Act that does not 
display a valid control number. 
Comments are requested concerning (a) 
whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; (c) ways to enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; and (d) ways to 
minimize the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 
DATES: Written Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) comments should be 
submitted on or before December 5, 
2005. If you anticipate that you will be 

submitting comments, but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contact listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit your 
Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) 
comments by e-mail or U.S. postal mail. 
To submit you comments by e-mail send 
them to: PRA@fcc.gov. To submit your 
comments by U.S. mail, mark it to the 
attention of Judith B. Herman, Federal 
Communications Commission, 445 12th 
Street, SW., Room 1–C804, Washington, 
DC 20554. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection(s) send an e-mail 
to PRA@fcc.gov or contact Judith B. 
Herman at 202–418–0214. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

OMB Control No.: 3060–0207. 
Title: Part 11—Emergency Alert 

System (EAS). 
Form No.: N/A. 
Type of Review: Revision of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit, not-for-profit institutions. 
Number of Respondents: 22,000 

respondents; 1,188,761 responses. 
Estimated Time Per Response: .017 

hours–40 hours. 
Frequency of Response: On occasion 

reporting requirement and 
recordkeeping requirement. 

Total Annual Burden: 22,068 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: N/A. 
Privacy Act Impact Assessment: N/A. 
Needs and Uses: Part 11 contains 

rules and regulations providing for an 
EAS. The EAS provides the President 
with the capability to provide 
immediate communications and 
information to the general public at the 
national, state, and local area level 
during periods of national emergency. 
The EAS also provides state and local 
governments and the National Weather 
Service with the capability to provide 
immediate communications and 
information to the general public 
concerning emergency situations 
posting a threat to life and property. 

Part 11 describes the required 
technical standards and operational 
procedures of the EAS for AM, FM, and 
TV broadcast stations, cable systems, 
wireless cable systems and other 
participating entities and includes 
recordkeeping and reporting 
requirements. 

This information is used by FCC staff 
as part of routine inspections of 
broadcast stations. Accurate 
recordkeeping of this data is vital in 
determining the location and nature of 
possible equipment failure on the part 
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