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determination or standard and the 
burden to the EPA to review the 
applications. The information collection 
activities discussed in this ICR do not 
require the submission of any 
confidential information. 

Form Numbers: None. 
Respondents/affected entities: States. 
Respondent’s obligation to respond: 

The responses to this collection of 
information are required to obtain the 
benefit of a vessel sewage NDZ (CWA 
section 312(f)) or an UNDS NDZ or 
review of a discharge determination or 
standard (CWA section 312(n)). 

Estimated number of respondents: 11 
(total). 

Frequency of response: One time. 
Total estimated burden: 577 hours 

(per year). Burden is defined at 5 CFR 
1320.03(b) 

Total estimated cost: $34,713 (per 
year), includes $548 annualized capital 
or operation & maintenance costs. 

Changes in the Estimates: There is a 
decrease of 337 hours in the total 
estimated respondent burden compared 
with the ICR currently approved by 
OMB. This estimated decrease is 
attributable to a downward adjustment 
in the estimated number of anticipated 
total actions during the upcoming 3-year 
period. 

Courtney Kerwin, 
Director, Regulatory Support Division. 
[FR Doc. 2022–17385 Filed 8–11–22; 8:45 am] 
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AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Toxic Substances Control 
Act (TSCA) requires EPA to publish in 
the Federal Register a statement of its 
findings after its review of certain TSCA 
submissions when EPA makes a finding 
that a new chemical substance or 
significant new use is not likely to 
present an unreasonable risk of injury to 
health or the environment. Such 
statements apply to premanufacture 
notices (PMNs), microbial commercial 
activity notices (MCANs), and 
significant new use notices (SNUNs) 
submitted to EPA under TSCA. This 
document presents statements of 
findings made by EPA on such 

submissions during the period from 
March 1, 2022 to April 30, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: The docket for this action, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPPT–2022–0116, is 
available online at https://
www.regulations.gov or in-person at the 
Office of Pollution Prevention and 
Toxics Docket (OPPT Docket), 
Environmental Protection Agency 
Docket Center (EPA/DC), West William 
Jefferson Clinton Bldg., Rm. 3334, 1301 
Constitution Ave. NW, Washington, DC. 
The Public Reading Room is open from 
8:30 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., Monday through 
Friday, excluding legal holidays. The 
telephone number for the Public 
Reading Room is (202) 566–1744, and 
the telephone number for the OPPT 
Docket is (202) 566–0280. For the latest 
status information on EPA/DC services 
and docket access, visit https://
www.epa.gov/dockets. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 

For technical information contact: 
Rebecca Edelstein, New Chemical 
Division (7405M), Office of Pollution 
Prevention and Toxics, Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave. NW, Washington, DC 20460–0001; 
telephone number: (202) 564–1667 
email address: edelstein.rebecca@
epa.gov. 

For general information contact: The 
TSCA-Hotline, ABVI-Goodwill, 422 
South Clinton Ave., Rochester, NY 
14620; telephone number: (202) 554– 
1404; email address: TSCA-Hotline@
epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Executive Summary 

A. Does this action apply to me? 
This action provides information that 

is directed to the public in general. 

B. What action is the Agency taking? 
This document lists the statements of 

findings made by EPA after review of 
submissions under TSCA section 5(a) 
that certain new chemical substances or 
significant new uses are not likely to 
present an unreasonable risk of injury to 
health or the environment. This 
document presents statements of 
findings made by EPA during the 
reporting period. 

C. What is the Agency’s authority for 
taking this action? 

TSCA section 5(a)(3) requires EPA to 
review a submission under TSCA 
section 5(a) and make one of the 
following specific findings: 

• The chemical substance or 
significant new use presents an 
unreasonable risk of injury to health or 
the environment; 

• The information available to EPA is 
insufficient to permit a reasoned 
evaluation of the health and 
environmental effects of the chemical 
substance or significant new use; 

• The information available to EPA is 
insufficient to permit a reasoned 
evaluation of the health and 
environmental effects and the chemical 
substance or significant new use may 
present an unreasonable risk of injury to 
health or the environment; 

• The chemical substance is or will 
be produced in substantial quantities, 
and such substance either enters or may 
reasonably be anticipated to enter the 
environment in substantial quantities or 
there is or may be significant or 
substantial human exposure to the 
substance; or 

• The chemical substance or 
significant new use is not likely to 
present an unreasonable risk of injury to 
health or the environment. 

Under TSCA, the unreasonable risk 
findings must be made without 
consideration of costs or other non-risk 
factors, including an unreasonable risk 
to a potentially exposed or susceptible 
subpopulation identified as relevant 
under the conditions of use. The term 
‘‘conditions of use’’ is defined in TSCA 
section 3 to mean ‘‘the circumstances, as 
determined by the Administrator, under 
which a chemical substance is intended, 
known, or reasonably foreseen to be 
manufactured, processed, distributed in 
commerce, used, or disposed of.’’ 

TSCA section 5(g) requires EPA to 
publish in the Federal Register a 
statement of its findings after its review 
of a submission under TSCA section 
5(a) when EPA makes a finding that a 
new chemical substance or significant 
new use is not likely to present an 
unreasonable risk of injury to health or 
the environment. Such statements apply 
to PMNs, MCANs, and SNUNs 
submitted to EPA under TSCA section 
5. 

Anyone who plans to manufacture 
(which includes import) a new chemical 
substance for a non-exempt commercial 
purpose and any manufacturer or 
processor wishing to engage in a use of 
a chemical substance designated by EPA 
as a significant new use must submit a 
notice to EPA at least 90 days before 
commencing manufacture of the new 
chemical substance or before engaging 
in the significant new use. 

The submitter of a notice to EPA for 
which EPA has made a finding of ‘‘not 
likely to present an unreasonable risk of 
injury to health or the environment’’ 
may commence manufacture of the 
chemical substance or manufacture or 
processing for the significant new use 
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notwithstanding any remaining portion 
of the applicable review period. 

II. Statements of Findings Under TSCA 
Section 5(a)(3)(C) 

In this unit, EPA provides the 
following information (to the extent that 
such information is not claimed as 
Confidential Business Information 
(CBI)) on the PMNs, MCANs and 
SNUNs for which, during this period, 
EPA has made findings under TSCA 
section 5(a)(3)(C) that the new chemical 
substances or significant new uses are 
not likely to present an unreasonable 
risk of injury to health or the 
environment: 

The following list provides the EPA 
case number assigned to the TSCA 
section 5(a) submission and the 
chemical identity (generic name if the 
specific name is claimed as CBI). 

• J–21–0020, J–21–0021, J–21–0022, 
J–21–0023, J–21–0024, J–21–0025, 
CinderBio-1 (Generic Name). 

• J–22–0009, J–22–0010, Genetically 
modified microorganism for the 
production of a chemical substance 
(Generic Name). 

• P–21–0189, Fats and Glyceridic 
oils, algae; CASRN: 1353573–84–8. 

• J–22–0011, Biofuel producing 
Saccharomyces cerevisiae modified, 
genetically stable (Genetic Name). 

• P–21–0176, Alkane dioic acid, bis 
(poly aromatic triazine) alkanoic ether 
phenoxy ester (Genetic Name). 

To access EPA’s decision document 
describing the basis of the ‘‘not likely to 
present an unreasonable risk’’ finding 
made by EPA under TSCA section 
5(a)(3)(C), look up the specific case 
number at https://www.epa.gov/ 
reviewing-new-chemicals-under-toxic- 
substances-control-act-tsca/chemicals- 
determined-not-likely. 

Authority: 15 U.S.C. 2601 et seq. 

Dated: July 28, 2022. 

Madison Le, 
Director, New Chemicals Division, Office of 
Pollution Prevention and Toxics. 
[FR Doc. 2022–17393 Filed 8–11–22; 8:45 am] 
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AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
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ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Insecticide, Fungicide, and 
Rodenticide Act (FIFRA), EPA is issuing 
a notice of receipt of requests by 
registrants through 2022 Pesticide 
Registration Maintenance Fee responses 
to voluntarily cancel certain pesticide 
registrations. EPA intends to grant these 
requests at the close of the comment 
period for this announcement unless the 
Agency receives substantive comments 
within the comment period that would 
merit its further review of the requests, 
or unless the registrants withdraw its 
requests. If these requests are granted, 
any sale, distribution, or use of products 
listed in this notice will be permitted 
after the registrations have been 
cancelled only if such sale, distribution, 
or use is consistent with the terms as 
described in the final order. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before September 12, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPP–2022–0544, 
through the Federal eRulemaking Portal 
at https://www.regulations.gov. Follow 
the online instructions for submitting 
comments. Do not submit electronically 
any information you consider to be 
Confidential Business Information (CBI) 
or other information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Additional 
instructions on commenting and visiting 
the docket, along with more information 
about dockets generally, is available at 
https://www.epa.gov/dockets. 

Submit written withdrawal request by 
mail to: Registration Division (7504M), 
Office of Pesticide Programs, 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 
Pennsylvania Ave. NW, Washington, DC 
20460–0001. ATTN: Brenda Minnema. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Brenda Minnema, Registration Division 
(7504M), Office of Pesticide Programs, 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 

Pennsylvania Ave. NW, Washington, DC 
20460–0001; telephone number: (202) 
566–2840; email address: 
minnema.brenda@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. General Information 

A. Does this action apply to me? 

This action is directed to the public 
in general and may be of interest to a 
wide range of stakeholders including 
environmental, human health, and 
agricultural advocates; the chemical 
industry; pesticide users; and members 
of the public interested in the sale, 
distribution, or use of pesticides. 

B. What should I consider as I prepare 
my comments for EPA? 

1. Submitting CBI. Do not submit this 
information to EPA through 
regulations.gov or email. Clearly mark 
the part or all of the information that 
you claim to be CBI. For CBI 
information in a disk or CD–ROM that 
you mail to EPA, mark the outside of the 
disk or CD–ROM as CBI and then 
identify electronically within the disk or 
CD–ROM the specific information that 
is claimed as CBI. In addition to one 
complete version of the comment that 
includes information claimed as CBI, a 
copy of the comment that does not 
contain the information claimed as CBI 
must be submitted for inclusion in the 
public docket. Information so marked 
will not be disclosed except in 
accordance with procedures set forth in 
40 CFR part 2. 

2. Tips for preparing your comments. 
When preparing and submitting your 
comments, see the commenting tips at 
https://www.epa.gov/dockets/ 
commenting-epa-dockets. 

II. What action is the Agency taking? 

This notice announces receipt by the 
Agency of requests from registrants to 
cancel 149 pesticide products registered 
under FIFRA section 3 (7 U.S.C. 136a) 
or section 24(c) (7 U.S.C. 136v(c)). These 
registrations are listed in sequence by 
registration number (or company 
number and 24(c) number) in Table 1 of 
this unit. 

Unless the Agency determines that 
there are substantive comments that 
warrant further review of the requests or 
the registrants withdraw their requests, 
EPA intends to issue an order in the 
Federal Register canceling all the 
affected registrations. 
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