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for well workover, recompletion, or 
abandonment operations. Because of 
this we have included the rig movement 
notification with the other general 
information collection requirements of 
these regulations under OMB control 
numbers 1010–0141, 1010–0067, and 
1010–0043 (30 CFR part 250, subparts 
D, E, and F, respectively). The MMS 
District Offices use the information 
reported to ascertain the precise arrival 
and departure of all rigs in OCS waters. 
The accurate location of these rigs is 
necessary to better facilitate the 
scheduling of inspections by MMS 
personnel. 

We will protect information from 
respondents considered proprietary 
under the Freedom of Information Act 
(5 U.S.C. 552) and its implementing 
regulations (43 CFR part 2) and under 
regulations at 30 CFR 250.196, ‘‘Data 
and information to be made available to 
the public.’’ No items of a sensitive 
nature are collected. Responses are 
mandatory. 

Frequency: The frequency is on 
occasion. 

Estimated Number and Description of 
Respondents: Approximately 130 
Federal OCS oil and gas lessees. 

Estimated Reporting and 
Recordkeeping ‘‘Hour’’ Burden: We 
estimate respondents will average 6 
minutes to fill out and complete Form 
MMS–144. The total annual estimate is 
180 burden hours. 

Estimated Reporting and 
Recordkeeping ‘‘Non-Hour Cost’’ 
Burden: We have identified no cost 
burdens associated for this collection. 

Public Disclosure Statement: The PRA 
(44 U.S.C. 3501, et seq.) provides that an 
agency may not conduct or sponsor a 
collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. Until OMB approves a 
collection of information, you are not 
obligated to respond. 

Comments: Before submitting an ICR 
to OMB, PRA section 3506(c)(2)(A) 
requires each agency ‘‘* * * to provide 
notice * * * and otherwise consult 
with members of the public and affected 
agencies concerning each proposed 
collection of information * * *’’. 
Agencies must specifically solicit 
comments to: (a) Evaluate whether the 
proposed collection of information is 
necessary for the agency to perform its 
duties, including whether the 
information is useful; (b) evaluate the 
accuracy of the agency’s estimate of the 
burden of the proposed collection of 
information; (c) enhance the quality, 
usefulness, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (d) 
minimize the burden on the 
respondents, including the use of 

automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

Agencies must also estimate the ‘‘non-
hour cost’’ burdens to respondents or 
recordkeepers resulting from the 
collection of information. Therefore, if 
you have costs to generate, maintain, 
and disclose this information, you 
should comment and provide your total 
capital and startup cost components or 
annual operation, maintenance, and 
purchase of service components. You 
should describe the methods you use to 
estimate major cost factors, including 
system and technology acquisition, 
expected useful life of capital 
equipment, discount rate(s), and the 
period over which you incur costs. 
Capital and startup costs include, 
among other items, computers and 
software you purchase to prepare for 
collecting information, monitoring, and 
record storage facilities. You should not 
include estimates for equipment or 
services purchased: (i) Before October 1, 
1995; (ii) to comply with requirements 
not associated with the information 
collection; (iii) for reasons other than to 
provide information or keep records for 
the Government; or (iv) as part of 
customary and usual business or private 
practices. 

We will summarize written responses 
to this notice and address them in our 
submission for OMB approval. As a 
result of your comments, we will make 
any necessary adjustments to the burden 
in our submission to OMB. 

Public Comment Policy: MMS’s 
practice is to make comments, including 
names and addresses of respondents, 
available for public review during 
regular business hours. If you wish your 
name and/or address to be withheld, 
you must state this prominently at the 
beginning of your comment. MMS will 
honor this request to the extent 
allowable by law; however, anonymous 
comments will not be considered. All 
submissions from organizations or 
businesses, and from individuals 
identifying themselves as 
representatives or officials of 
organizations or businesses, will be 
made available for public inspection in 
their entirety. 

MMS Information Collection 
Clearance Officer: Arlene Bajusz (202) 
208–7744.

Dated: September 17, 2004. 

E.P. Danenberger, 
Chief, Engineering and Operations Division.
[FR Doc. 04–21638 Filed 9–27–04; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4310–MR–P

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Parole Commission 

Sunshine Act; Record of Vote of 
Meeting Closure (Public Law 94–409) 
(5 U.S.C. Sec. 552b) 

I, Edward F. Reilly, Jr., Chairman of 
the United States Parole Commission, 
was present at a meeting of said 
Commission, which started at 
approximately 10:30 a.m. on Tuesday, 
September 21, 2004, at the U.S. Parole 
Commission, 5550 Friendship 
Boulevard, 4th Floor, Chevy Chase, 
Maryland 20815. The purpose of the 
meeting was to decide seven petitions 
for reconsideration pursuant to 28 CFR 
Section 2.27. Three Commissioners 
were present, constituting a quorum 
when the vote to close the meeting was 
submitted. 

Public announcement further 
describing the subject matter of the 
meeting and certifications of General 
Counsel that this meeting may be closed 
by vote of the Commissioners present 
were submitted to the Commissioners 
prior to the conduct of any other 
business. Upon motion duly made, 
seconded, and carried, the following 
Commissioners voted that the meeting 
be closed: Edward F. Reilly, Jr., 
Cranston J. Mitchell, and Deborah A. 
Spagnoli. 

In witness whereof, I make this official 
record of the vote taken to close this 
meeting and authorize the record to be 
made available to the public.

Dated: September 22, 2004. 
Edward F. Reilly, Jr., 
Chairman, U.S. Parole Commission.
[FR Doc. 04–21811 Filed 9–24–04; 1:49 pm] 
BILLING CODE 4410–01–M

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR

Office of the Secretary 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

September 21, 2004. 
The Department of Labor (DOL) has 

submitted the following public 
information collection request (ICR) to 
the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (Pub. L. 104–13, 
44 U.S.C. Chapter 35). A copy of each 
ICR, with applicable supporting 
documentation, may be obtained by 
contacting the Department of Labor 
(DOL). To obtain documentation, 
contact Ira Mills on 202–693–4122 (this 
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