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• Miami International Airport, 
Miami, Florida (MIA); 

• Newark Liberty International 
Airport, Newark, New Jersey (EWR); 

• San Francisco International Airport, 
San Francisco, California (SFO); 

• Orlando International Airport, 
Orlando, Florida (MCO); 

• Detroit Metropolitan Wayne County 
Airport, Romulus, Michigan (DTW); 

• Dallas Fort Worth International 
Airport, Dallas, Texas (DFW); 

• Honolulu International Airport, 
Honolulu, Hawaii (HNL); 

• Boston—Logan International 
Airport, Boston, Massachusetts (BOS); 

• Las Vegas—McCarran International 
Airport, Las Vegas, Nevada (LAS); 

• Sanford—Orlando International 
Airport, Sanford, Florida (SSB); 

• Seattle—Tacoma International 
Airport-SEATAC, Seattle, Washington 
(STT); 

• Philadelphia International Airport, 
Philadelphia, Pennsylvania (PHL); 

• San Juan—Luis Munos Marin 
International Airport, San Juan, Puerto 
Rico (SAJ); 

• Ft. Lauderdale Hollywood 
International Airport, Fort Lauderdale, 
Florida (FLL), including the General 
Aviation Facility private aircraft 
terminal. 

The preamble to the final rule states 
that when CBP is ready to expand 
Global Entry to additional airports and 
has selected the airports, CBP will 
publish an announcement in the 
Federal Register and in a posting on the 
Web site, http://www.globalentry.gov. 

Expansion of Global Entry Program to 
Additional Airports 

CBP is expanding the Global Entry 
program to include the following four 
additional airports: St. Paul 
International Airport, Minneapolis, 
Minnesota (MSP); Charlotte Douglas 
International Airport, Charlotte, North 
Carolina (CLT); Phoenix Sky Harbor 
International Airport, Phoenix, Arizona 
(PHX); and Denver International 
Airport, Denver, Colorado (DEN). Global 
Entry will become operational at all four 
airports on or before September 22, 
2012. The exact starting dates of the 
expansion of Global Entry to each 
airport location will be announced on 
the Web site at http:// 
www.globalentry.gov. 

Dated: March 21, 2012. 
Kevin K. McAleenan, 
Acting Assistant Commissioner, Office of 
Field Operations. 
[FR Doc. 2012–7227 Filed 3–23–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9111–14–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

Office of the Secretary 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request; DOI Generic 
Clearance for the Collection of 
Qualitative Feedback on Agency 
Service Delivery 

AGENCY: Department of the Interior. 
ACTION: 30-Day notice of submission of 
information collection to the Office of 
Management and Budget and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of a Federal 
Government-wide effort to streamline 
the process to seek feedback from the 
public on service delivery, the U.S. 
Department of the Interior has 
submitted a Generic Information 
Collection Request (Generic ICR): ‘‘DOI 
Generic Clearance for the Collection of 
Qualitative Feedback on Agency Service 
Delivery’’ to OMB for approval under 
the Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) (44 
U.S.C. 3501 et seq.). 
DATES: Comments must be submitted by 
April 25, 2012. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments may be 
submitted to the Desk Officer for the 
Department of the Interior (DOI) at the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) via email to 
OIRA_DOCKET@omb.eop.gov or via 
facsimile (202) 395–5806. Please also 
send a copy of your comments to Don 
Bieniewicz at DOI via email at 
Donald_Bieniewicz@ios.doi.gov or via 
facsimile (202) 208–4867. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Don 
Bieniewicz (202) 208–4915. You may 
also review the submitted ICR online at 
http://www.reginfo.gov. Follow the 
instructions to review Department of the 
Interior collections under review by 
OMB. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Abstract 
The information collection activity 

will garner qualitative customer and 
stakeholder feedback in an efficient, 
timely manner, in accordance with the 
Administration’s commitment to 
improving service delivery. By 
qualitative feedback we mean 
information that provides useful 
insights on perceptions and opinions, 
but are not statistical surveys that yield 
quantitative results that can be 
generalized to the population of study. 
This feedback will provide insights into 
customer or stakeholder perceptions, 
experiences and expectations, provide 
an early warning of issues with service, 
or focus attention on areas where 

communication, training or changes in 
operations might improve delivery of 
products or services. These collections 
will allow for ongoing, collaborative and 
actionable communications between the 
Agency and its customers and 
stakeholders. It will also allow feedback 
to contribute directly to the 
improvement of program management. 

Feedback collected under this generic 
clearance will provide useful 
information, but it will not yield data 
that can be generalized to the overall 
population. This generic clearance for 
qualitative information will not be used 
for quantitative information collections 
that are designed to yield reliably 
actionable results, such as monitoring 
trends over time or documenting 
program performance. Such data uses 
require more rigorous designs that 
address: the target population to which 
generalizations will be made, the 
sampling frame, the sample design 
(including stratification and clustering), 
the precision requirements or power 
calculations that justify the proposed 
sample size, the expected response rate, 
methods for assessing potential non- 
response bias, the protocols for data 
collection, and any testing procedures 
that were or will be undertaken prior to 
fielding the study. 

II. Request for Comments 
No comments were received in 

response to the 60-day notice published 
in the Federal Register of December 22, 
2010 (75 FR 80542). We again request 
public comments on this proposed 
information collection. Your comments 
should address: (a) The necessity of the 
information collection for the proper 
performance of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; (b) the accuracy of our 
estimate of the burden; (c) ways we 
could enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (d) ways we could 
minimize the burden of the collection 
on the respondents, such as through the 
use of automated collection techniques 
or other information technology. 

A Federal agency may not conduct or 
sponsor, and a person is not required to 
respond to, a collection of information 
unless it displays a currently valid 
Office of Management and Budget 
control number. 

III. Data 
OMB Control Number: 1090—NEW. 
Title: DOI Generic Clearance for the 

Collection of Qualitative Feedback on 
Agency Service Delivery. 

Type of Review: New Collection. 
Affected Public: Individuals and 

Households, Businesses and 
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Organizations, State, Local or Tribal 
Government. 

Expected Annual Number of 
Activities: 400. 

Annual Respondents: 100,000 for 
surveys, 60,000 for comment cards, 
1,000 for focus groups. 

Frequency of Response: Once per 
request. 

Annual Responses: 100,000 for 
surveys, 60,000 for comment cards, 
1,000 for focus groups. 

Average Time per Response: 15 
minutes for surveys, 2 minutes for 
comment cards, 2 hours for focus 
groups. 

Estimated Total Annual Burden 
Hours: 29,000. 

Dated: March 19, 2012. 
Benjamin Simon, 
Assistant Director, Office of Policy Analysis, 
U.S. Department of the Interior. 
[FR Doc. 2012–7100 Filed 3–23–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4310–RK–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

Fish and Wildlife Service 

[FWS–R9–IA–2012–N074; 
FXIA16710900000P5–123–FF09A30000] 

Endangered Species; Receipt of 
Applications for Permit 

AGENCY: Fish and Wildlife Service, 
Interior. 

ACTION: Notice of receipt of applications 
for permit. 

SUMMARY: We, the U.S. Fish and 
Wildlife Service, invite the public to 
comment on the following applications 
to conduct certain activities with 
endangered species. With some 
exceptions, the Endangered Species Act 
(ESA) prohibits activities with listed 
species unless Federal authorization is 
acquired that allows such activities. 

DATES: We must receive comments or 
requests for documents on or before 
April 25, 2012. 

ADDRESSES: Brenda Tapia, Division of 
Management Authority, U.S. Fish and 
Wildlife Service, 4401 North Fairfax 
Drive, Room 212, Arlington, VA 22203; 
fax (703) 358–2280; or email 
DMAFR@fws.gov. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Brenda Tapia, (703) 358–2104 
(telephone); (703) 358–2280 (fax); 
DMAFR@fws.gov (email). 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Public Comment Procedures 

A. How do I request copies of 
applications or comment on submitted 
applications? 

Send your request for copies of 
applications or comments and materials 
concerning any of the applications to 
the contact listed under ADDRESSES. 
Please include the Federal Register 
notice publication date, the PRT- 
number, and the name of the applicant 
in your request or submission. We will 
not consider requests or comments sent 
to an email or address not listed under 
ADDRESSES. If you provide an email 
address in your request for copies of 
applications, we will attempt to respond 
to your request electronically. 

Please make your requests or 
comments as specific as possible. Please 
confine your comments to issues for 
which we seek comments in this notice, 
and explain the basis for your 
comments. Include sufficient 
information with your comments to 
allow us to authenticate any scientific or 
commercial data you include. 

The comments and recommendations 
that will be most useful and likely to 
influence agency decisions are: (1) 
Those supported by quantitative 
information or studies; and (2) Those 
that include citations to, and analyses 
of, the applicable laws and regulations. 
We will not consider or include in our 
administrative record comments we 
receive after the close of the comment 
period (see DATES) or comments 
delivered to an address other than those 
listed above (see ADDRESSES). 

B. May I review comments submitted by 
others? 

Comments, including names and 
street addresses of respondents, will be 
available for public review at the 
address listed under ADDRESSES. The 
public may review documents and other 
information applicants have sent in 
support of the application unless our 
allowing viewing would violate the 
Privacy Act or Freedom of Information 
Act. Before including your address, 
phone number, email address, or other 
personal identifying information in your 
comment, you should be aware that 
your entire comment—including your 
personal identifying information—may 
be made publicly available at any time. 
While you can ask us in your comment 
to withhold your personal identifying 
information from public review, we 
cannot guarantee that we will be able to 
do so. 

II. Background 
To help us carry out our conservation 

responsibilities for affected species, and 

in consideration of section 10(a)(1)(A) of 
the Endangered Species Act of 1973, as 
amended (16 U.S.C. 1531 et seq.), along 
with Executive Order 13576, 
‘‘Delivering an Efficient, Effective, and 
Accountable Government,’’ and the 
President’s Memorandum for the Heads 
of Executive Departments and Agencies 
of January 21, 2009—Transparency and 
Open Government (74 FR 4685; January 
26, 2009), which call on all Federal 
agencies to promote openness and 
transparency in Government by 
disclosing information to the public, we 
invite public comment on these permit 
applications before final action is taken. 

III. Permit Applications 

Applicant: University of California, UC 
Davis Stable Isotope Facility, Davis, CA; 
PRT–60610A 

The applicant requests a permit to 
import biological specimens of 
loggerhead sea turtles (Caretta caretta), 
leatherback sea turtles (Dermochelys 
coriacea), and leatherback sea turtles 
from Argentina for the purpose of 
scientific research. This notification 
covers activities to be conducted by the 
applicant over a 5-year period. 

Applicant: University of Georgia, 
College of Veterinary Medicine, 
Infectious Diseases Laboratory, Athens, 
GA; PRT–009445 

The applicant requests a renewal of 
their permit to import tissue or blood 
samples of any avian species (class 
Aves), reptile species (class Reptilia), 
and any fish (within the taxonomic 
phylum Chordata), from worldwide 
locations for the purpose of diagnostic 
testing for infectious diseases/scientific 
research. This notification covers 
activities to be conducted by the 
applicant over a 5-year period. 

Applicant: Harkey Ranch, Eldorado, TX; 
PRT–67611A 

The applicant requests a captive-bred 
wildlife registration under 50 CFR 
17.21(g) for the Eld’s deer (Rucervus 
eldii), barasingha (Rucervus duvaucelii), 
Arabian oryx (Oryx leucoryx), scimitar- 
horned oryx (Oryx dammah), addax 
(Addax nasomaculatus), and Dama 
gazelle (Nanger dama), to enhance their 
propagation or survival. This 
notification covers activities to be 
conducted by the applicant over a 5- 
year period. 

Applicant: Michelle Rod Crawford, 
Sugarland, TX; PRT–67541A 

The applicant requests a captive-bred 
wildlife registration under 50 CFR 
17.21(g) for the scimitar-horned oryx 
(Oryx dammah), to enhance their 
propagation or survival. This 
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