
43909 Federal Register / Vol. 87, No. 140 / Friday, July 22, 2022 / Notices 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Obtaining Information and 
Submitting Comments 

A. Obtaining Information 

Please refer to Docket ID NRC–2022– 
0026 when contacting the NRC about 
the availability of information for this 
action. You may obtain publicly 
available information related to this 
action by any of the following methods: 

• Federal Rulemaking Website: Go to 
https://www.regulations.gov and search 
for Docket ID NRC–2022–0026. 

• NRC’s Agencywide Documents 
Access and Management System 
(ADAMS): You may obtain publicly 
available documents online in the 
ADAMS Public Documents collection at 
https://www.nrc.gov/reading-rm/ 
adams.html. To begin the search, select 
‘‘Begin Web-based ADAMS Search.’’ For 
problems with ADAMS, please contact 
the NRC’s Public Document Room (PDR) 
reference staff at 1–800–397–4209, 301– 
415–4737, or by email to 
PDR.Resource@nrc.gov. The draft 
supporting statement is available in 
ADAMS under Accession No. 
ML22078A003. 

• NRC’s PDR: You may examine and 
purchase copies of public documents, 
by appointment, at the NRC’s PDR, 
Room P1 B35, One White Flint North, 
11555 Rockville Pike, Rockville, 
Maryland 20852. To make an 
appointment to visit the PDR, please 
send an email to PDR.Resource@nrc.gov 
or call 1–800–397–4209 or 301–415– 
4737, between 8:00 a.m. and 4:00 p.m. 
Eastern Time (ET), Monday through 
Friday, except Federal holidays. 

• NRC’s Clearance Officer: A copy of 
the collection of information and related 
instructions may be obtained without 
charge by contacting the NRC’s 
Clearance Officer, David Cullison, 
Office of the Chief Information Officer, 
U.S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission, 
Washington, DC 20555–0001; telephone: 
301–415–2084; email: 
Infocollects.Resource@nrc.gov. 

B. Submitting Comments 

The NRC encourages electronic 
comment submission through the 
Federal rulemaking website (https://
www.regulations.gov). Please include 
Docket ID NRC–2022–0026 in your 
comment submission. 

The NRC cautions you not to include 
identifying or contact information in 
comment submissions that you do not 
want to be publicly disclosed in your 
comment submission. All comment 
submissions are posted at https://
www.regulations.gov and entered into 
ADAMS. Comment submissions are not 

routinely edited to remove identifying 
or contact information. 

If you are requesting or aggregating 
comments from other persons for 
submission to the OMB, then you 
should inform those persons not to 
include identifying or contact 
information that they do not want to be 
publicly disclosed in their comment 
submission. Your request should state 
that comment submissions are not 
routinely edited to remove such 
information before making the comment 
submissions available to the public or 
entering the comment into ADAMS. 

II. Background 

In accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 
Chapter 35), the NRC is requesting 
public comment on its intention to 
request the OMB’s approval for the 
information collection summarized 
below. 

1. The title of the information 
collection: Part 30 of title 10 of the Code 
of Federal Regulations (10 CFR) ‘‘Rules 
of General Applicability to Domestic 
Licensing of Byproduct Material.’’ 

2. OMB approval number: 3150–0017. 
3. Type of submission: Extension. 
4. The form number, if applicable: 

Not applicable. 
5. How often the collection is required 

or requested: Required reports are 
collected and evaluated on a continuing 
basis as events occur. There is a onetime 
submittal of information to receive a 
license. Renewal applications are 
submitted every 15 years. Information 
submitted in previous applications may 
be referenced without being 
resubmitted. In addition, recordkeeping 
must be performed on an ongoing basis. 

6. Who will be required or asked to 
respond: All persons applying for or 
holding a license to manufacture, 
produce, transfer, receive, acquire, own, 
possess, or use radioactive byproduct 
material. 

7. The estimated number of annual 
responses: 144,734 (17,445 NRC 
Licensee responses [1,049 reporting 
responses + 2,200 for recordkeepers + 
14,196 third-party disclosures] and 
(127,289 Agreement State Licensee 
responses [7,658 reporting responses + 
16,000 for recordkeepers + 103,631 
third-party disclosures]). 

8. The estimated number of annual 
respondents: 18,200 (2,200 NRC 
Licensees and 16,000 Agreement State 
Licensees). 

9. The estimated number of hours 
needed annually to comply with the 
information collection requirement or 
request: 229,100 hours (113,042 
reporting hours + 103,708 

recordkeeping hours + 12,350 third- 
party disclosure hours). 

10. Abstract: 10 CFR part 30 
establishes requirements that are 
applicable to all persons in the United 
States governing domestic licensing of 
radioactive byproduct material. The 
application, reporting and 
recordkeeping requirements are 
necessary to permit the NRC to make a 
determination whether the possession, 
use, and transfer of byproduct material 
is in conformance with the 
Commission’s regulations for protection 
of the public health and safety. 

III. Specific Requests for Comments 

The NRC is seeking comments that 
address the following questions: 

1. Is the proposed collection of 
information necessary for the NRC to 
properly perform its functions? Does the 
information have practical utility? 

2. Is the estimate of the burden of the 
information collection accurate? 

3. Is there a way to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected? 

4. How can the burden of the 
information collection on respondents 
be minimized, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology? 

Dated: July 19, 2022. 
For the Nuclear Regulatory Commission. 

David C. Cullison, 
NRC Clearance Officer, Office of the Chief 
Information Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2022–15722 Filed 7–21–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7590–01–P 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

[Docket Nos. 50–255–LT–2, 50–155–LT–2, 
72–007–LT, and 72–043–LT–2; ASLBP No. 
22–974–01–LT–BD01] 

Entergy Nuclear Operations, Inc., 
Entergy Nuclear Palisades, LLC, Holtec 
International, and Holtec 
Decommissioning International, LLC 
(Palisades Nuclear Plant and Big Rock 
Point Site); Establishment of Atomic 
Safety and Licensing Board 

Pursuant to the Commission’s 
regulations, see, e.g., 10 CFR 2.104, 
2.105, 2.300, 2.309, 2.313, 2.318, and 
2.321, and in accordance with 
Commission Memorandum and Order 
CLI–22–08 issued on July 15, 2022, 
notice is hereby given that an Atomic 
Safety and Licensing Board (Board), 
consisting of a single administrative 
judge serving as Presiding Officer, is 
being appointed for the purpose of 
compiling the hearing record, ruling on 
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1 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(1). 
2 17 CFR 240.19b–4. 

3 15 U.S.C. 78f(b). 
4 15 U.S.C. 78f(b)(5). 

motions related to developing the 
factual record, presiding at any oral 
hearing, and certifying the completed 
record to the Commission in the 
following license transfer proceeding: 

Entergy Nuclear Operations, Inc., 
Entergy Nuclear Palisades, LLC, Holtec 
International, and Holtec 
Decommissioning International, LLC 
(Palisades Nuclear Plant and Big Rock 
Point Site) 

This proceeding concerns a license 
transfer application involving (1) the 
renewed facility operating license for 
the Palisades Nuclear Plant (Palisades) 
and the general license for the Palisades 
Independent Spent Fuel Storage 
Installation (ISFSI); and (2) the facility 
operating license for Big Rock Point and 
the general license for the Big Rock 
Point ISFSI. Entergy Nuclear 
Operations, Inc., Entergy Nuclear 
Palisades, LLC, Holtec International, 
and Holtec Decommissioning 
International, LLC (HDI) seek NRC 
consent to the indirect transfer of 
control of the licenses to Holtec 
International and to the transfer of 
operating authority to HDI to conduct 
licensed activities at the sites. They also 
seek NRC approval of conforming 
administrative license amendments to 
reflect the requested transfers. 

In CLI–22–08, the Commission stated, 
inter alia, that (1) the hearing shall be 
limited to the four issues specified in 
CLI–22–08; (2) the Presiding Officer 
should endeavor to adhere to the Model 
Milestones to the extent practicable; and 
(3) the Presiding Officer shall certify the 
hearing record to the Commission 
within twenty-five days of the 
conclusion of the hearing. See CLI–22– 
08, slip op. at 133–36. 

The administrative judge who will 
serve as Presiding Officer is: Paul S. 
Ryerson, Atomic Safety and Licensing 
Board Panel, U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission, Washington, DC 20555– 
0001. 

All correspondence, documents, and 
other materials shall be filed in 
accordance with the NRC E-Filing rule, 
10 CFR 2.302. 

Rockville, Maryland. 

Dated: July 18, 2022. 

Edward R. Hawkens, 
Chief Administrative Judge, Atomic Safety 
and Licensing Board Panel. 
[FR Doc. 2022–15664 Filed 7–21–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7590–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[Release No. 34–95310; File No. SR– 
PEARL–2022–27] 

Self-Regulatory Organizations: MIAX 
PEARL, LLC; Notice of Filing and 
Immediate Effectiveness of a Proposed 
Rule Change To Amend Exchange 
Rule 2613, Usage of Data Feeds 

July 18, 2022. 

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 
19(b)(1) of the Securities Exchange Act 
of 1934 (‘‘Act’’) 1 and Rule 19b–4 
thereunder,2 notice is hereby given that 
on July 7, 2022, MIAX PEARL, LLC 
(‘‘MIAX Pearl’’ or the ‘‘Exchange’’) filed 
with the Securities and Exchange 
Commission (‘‘Commission’’) a 
proposed rule change as described in 
Items I and II below, which Items have 
been prepared by the Exchange. The 
Commission is publishing this notice to 
solicit comments on the proposed rule 
change from interested persons. 

I. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Terms of Substance of 
the Proposed Rule Change 

The Exchange proposes to amend 
Exchange Rule 2613(a), Usage of Data 
Feeds, to disclose that the Exchange will 
utilize direct data feeds from MEMX 
LLC (‘‘MEMX’’) when performing order 
handling, order execution, routing, and 
related compliance processes for equity 
securities. 

The text of the proposed rule change 
is available on the Exchange’s website at 
http://www.miaxoptions.com/rule- 
filings/pearl at MIAX PEARL’s principal 
office, and at the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room. 

II. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Purpose of, and 
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule 
Change 

In its filing with the Commission, the 
Exchange included statements 
concerning the purpose of and basis for 
the proposed rule change and discussed 
any comments it received on the 
proposed rule change. The text of these 
statements may be examined at the 
places specified in Item IV below. The 
Exchange has prepared summaries, set 
forth in sections A, B, and C below, of 
the most significant aspects of such 
statements. 

A. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Purpose of, and 
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule 
Change 

1. Purpose 
Exchange Rule 2613 identifies the 

data feeds that the Exchange utilizes for 
the handling, execution, and routing of 
orders in equity securities on the 
Exchange’s equity trading platform 
(‘‘MIAX Pearl Equities’’), as well as for 
surveillance necessary to monitor 
compliance with applicable securities 
laws and Exchange Rules. The Exchange 
currently utilizes MEMX market data 
from the Consolidated Quotation 
System (‘‘CQS’’)/UTP Quotation Data 
Feed (‘‘UQDF’’) for these purposes on 
MIAX Pearl Equities. The Exchange 
intends to begin to utilize MEMX’s 
direct feeds in place of market data from 
the CQS/UQDF. Therefore, the 
Exchange proposes to amend Exchange 
Rule 2613(a) to reflect that the Exchange 
will utilize MEMX’s direct feeds in 
place of market data from the CQS/ 
UQDF when performing order handling, 
order execution, routing, and related 
compliance processes for equity 
securities on MIAX Pearl Equities. The 
Exchange does not currently utilize a 
secondary source for data from MEMX. 
Once it begins to utilize direct feeds for 
data from MEMX, the Exchange will 
also begin to utilize CQS/UQDF as a 
secondary source of data from MEMX 
on MIAX Pearl Equities. 

Implementation 
Due to the technological changes 

associated with this proposed change, 
the Exchange will issue a trading alert 
publicly announcing the 
implementation date of this proposed 
rule change. The Exchange anticipates 
that the implementation date will be in 
either the third or fourth quarter of 
2022. 

2. Statutory Basis 
The proposed rule change is 

consistent with Section 6(b) of the Act,3 
in general, and furthers the objectives of 
Section 6(b)(5),4 in particular, because it 
is designed to prevent fraudulent and 
manipulative acts and practices, to 
promote just and equitable principles of 
trade, to foster cooperation and 
coordination with persons engaged in 
regulating, clearing, settling, processing 
information with respect to, and 
facilitating transactions in securities, to 
remove impediments to and perfect the 
mechanism of a free and open market 
and a national market system, and, in 
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