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appropriate circumstances, high-risk 
conditions on a grant if the applicant or 
grantee is not financially stable; has a 
history of unsatisfactory performance; 
has a financial or other management 
system that does not meet the standards 
in 2 CFR part 200, subpart D; has not 
fulfilled the conditions of a prior grant; 
or is otherwise not responsible. 

2. Administrative and National Policy 
Requirements: We identify 
administrative and national policy 
requirements in the application package 
and reference these and other 
requirements in the Applicable 
Regulations section of this notice. We 
reference the regulations outlining the 
terms and conditions of a grant in the 
Applicable Regulations section of this 
notice. 

3. Reporting: (a) If you apply for a 
grant under this program, you must 
ensure that you have in place the 
necessary processes and systems to 
comply with the reporting requirements 
in 2 CFR part 170 should you receive 
funding. This does not apply if you have 
an exception under 2 CFR 170.110(b). 

(b) You must submit an annual 
performance report (APR) using the 
EDFacts System Portal at https://
eden.ed.gov, including financial 
information, as directed by the 
Secretary, within 90 days after the close 
of the grant year. The APR is located 
within the EDFacts System Portal under 
the EASIE Part III tab. Prior to the 
system being open to users, grantees 
will receive an email from the EDFacts 
PSC identifying the date that the APR 
will be available to grantees and the 
deadline for its transmission. 

(c) Under 34 CFR 75.250(b), the 
Secretary may approve a data collection 
period for a grant for a period of up to 
72 months after the end of the project 
period and may provide a grantee with 
additional funding for the sole purpose 
of collecting, analyzing, and reporting 
performance measurement data 
regarding the project. 

4. Performance Measures: The 
Secretary has established the following 
key performance measures for assessing 
the effectiveness and efficiency of the 
Formula Grants program: (1) The 
percentage of AI/AN students in grades 
four and eight who score at or above the 
basic level in reading on the National 
Assessment of Educational Progress 
(NAEP); (2) the percentage of AI/AN 
students in grades four and eight who 
score at or above the basic level in 
mathematics on the NAEP; (3) the 
percentage of AI/AN students in grades 
three through eight meeting State 
achievement standards by scoring at or 
above the proficient level in reading and 
mathematics on State assessments; (4) 

the difference between the percentage of 
AI/AN students in grades three through 
eight at or above the proficient level in 
reading and mathematics on State 
assessments and the percentage of all 
students scoring at those levels; (5) the 
percentage of AI/AN students who 
graduate from high school as measured 
by the four-year adjusted cohort 
graduation rate; and (6) the percentage 
of funds used by grantees prior to award 
close-out. 

5. Integrity and Performance System: 
If you receive an award under this grant 
program that over the course of the 
project period may exceed the 
simplified acquisition threshold 
(currently $150,000), under 2 CFR 
200.205(a)(2) we must make a judgment 
about your integrity, business ethics, 
and record of performance under 
Federal awards—that is, the risk posed 
by you as an applicant—before we make 
an award. In doing so, we must consider 
any information about you that is in the 
integrity and performance system 
(currently referred to as the Federal 
Awardee Performance and Integrity 
Information System (FAPIIS)), 
accessible through SAM. You may 
review and comment on any 
information about yourself that a 
Federal agency previously entered and 
that is currently in FAPIIS. 

Please note that, if the total value of 
your currently active grants, cooperative 
agreements, and procurement contracts 
from the Federal Government exceeds 
$10,000,000, the requirements in 2 CFR 
part 200, Appendix XII, require you to 
report certain integrity information to 
FAPIIS semiannually. Please review the 
requirements in 2 CFR part 200, 
Appendix XII, if this grant plus all the 
other Federal funds you receive exceed 
$10,000,000. 

VI. Other Information 
Accessible Format: Individuals with 

disabilities can obtain this document 
and a copy of the application package in 
an accessible format (e.g., braille, large 
print, audiotape, or compact disc) by 
contacting the EDFacts PSC listed under 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT. 

Electronic Access to This Document: 
The official version of this document is 
published in the Federal Register. Free 
internet access to the official edition of 
the Federal Register and the Code of 
Federal Regulations is available via the 
Federal Digital System at: www.gpo.gov/ 
fdsys. At this site you can view this 
document, as well as other documents 
of this Department published in the 
Federal Register, in text or PDF. To use 
PDF you must have Adobe Acrobat 
Reader, which is available free at the 
site. 

You may also access documents of the 
Department published in the Federal 
Register by using the article search 
feature at: www.federalregister.gov. 
Specifically, through the advanced 
search feature at this site, you can limit 
your search to documents published by 
the Department. 

Dated: January 29, 2018. 
Jason Botel, 
Principal Deputy Assistant Secretary 
Delegated the Authority to Perform the 
Functions and Duties of Assistant Secretary 
for Elementary and Secondary Education. 
[FR Doc. 2018–02023 Filed 1–31–18; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Notice of Filing 

Take notice that the Commission has 
received the following Natural Gas 
Pipeline Rate and Refund Report filings: 

Docket Numbers: RP17–1015–000. 
Applicants: XTO Energy Inc., et al. 
Description: Joint Petition of XTO 

Energy Inc., et al., for Amendment to, 
and Extension of Limited Waiver 
Request and Request for Expedited 
Action. 

Filed Date: 1/23/18. 
Accession Number: 20180123–5207. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/29/18. 

The filings are accessible in the 
Commission’s eLibrary system by 
clicking on the links or querying the 
docket number. 

Any person desiring to intervene or 
protest in any of the above proceedings 
must file in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s 
Regulations (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 
Protests may be considered, but 
intervention is necessary to become a 
party to the proceeding. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

Dated: January 26, 2018. 
Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2018–01977 Filed 1–31–18; 8:45 am] 
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