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Inter-Regional Planning Advisory 
Committee 

November 29, 2011, 8:30 a.m.–12:30 
p.m., Local Time 
The above-referenced meetings will 

be held at: NYISO’s offices, Rensselaer, 
NY. 

The above-referenced meetings are 
open to stakeholders. 

Further information may be found at 
http://www.nyiso.com. 

The discussions at the meeting 
described above may address matters at 
issue in the following proceedings: 

Docket No. RM10–23, Transmission 
Planning and Cost Allocation by 
Transmission Owning and Operating 
Public Utilities 

Docket No. ER08–1281, New York 
Independent System Operator, Inc. 

For more information, contact James 
Eason, Office of Energy Market 
Regulation, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission at (202) 502–8622 or 
James.Eason@ferc.gov. 

Dated: October 19, 2011. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2011–27527 Filed 10–24–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Notice of Commission Staff 
Attendance 

The Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission hereby gives notice that 
members of the Commission’s staff may 
attend the following meetings: of the 
Organization of MISO States and 
Midwest Independent Transmission 
System Operator, Inc. (MISO): 
MISO Planning Advisory Committee, 

October 25, 2011, 9 a.m.–4 p.m., Local 
Time. 

MISO RECB Task Force, October 27, 
2011, 9 a.m.–3 p.m., Local Time. 
The above-referenced meetings will 

be held at: 

MISO Headquarters, 720 City Center 
Drive, Carmel, IN 46032. 
The above-referenced meeting is open 

to the public. 
Further information may be found at 

http://www.misoenergy.org. 
The discussions at the meeting 

described above may address matters at 
issue in the following proceedings: 

Docket No. ER10–1791, Midwest 
Independent Transmission System 
Operator, Inc. 

Docket No. ER11–3728, Midwest 
Independent Transmission System 
Operator, Inc. 

Docket No. EL11–56, First Energy 
Service Company. 

Docket No. OA08–53, Midwest 
Independent Transmission System 
Operator, Inc. 

For more information, contact 
Christopher Miller, Office of Energy 
Markets Regulation, Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at (317) 249– 
5936 or christopher.miller@ferc.gov. 

Dated: October 19, 2011. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2011–27526 Filed 10–24–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPPT–2011–0699; FRL–8889–4] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In compliance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) (44 
U.S.C. 3501 et seq.), this document 
announces that EPA is planning to 
submit a request to renew an existing 
approved Information Collection 
Request (ICR) to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB). This 
ICR, entitled: ‘‘Recordkeeping and 
Reporting Requirements for Allegations 
of Significant Adverse Reactions to 
Human Health or the Environment 
(TSCA Section 8(c))’’ and identified by 
EPA ICR No. 1031.10 and OMB Control 
No. 2070–0017, is scheduled to expire 
on August 31, 2012. Before submitting 
the ICR to OMB for review and 
approval, EPA is soliciting comments on 
specific aspects of the proposed 
information collection. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before December 27, 2011. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPPT–2011–0699 by 
one of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the on-line 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Mail: Document Control Office 
(7407M), Office of Pollution Prevention 
and Toxics (OPPT), Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave., NW., Washington, DC 20460– 
0001. 

• Hand Delivery: OPPT Document 
Control Office (DCO), EPA East, Rm. 
6428, 1201 Constitution Ave., NW., 
Washington, DC. Attention: Docket ID 
Number EPA–HQ–OPPT–2011–0699. 
The DCO is open from 8 a.m. to 4 p.m., 
Monday through Friday, excluding legal 
holidays. The telephone number for the 
DCO is (202) 564–8930. Such deliveries 
are only accepted during the DCO’s 
normal hours of operation, and special 
arrangements should be made for 
deliveries of boxed information. 

Instructions: Direct your comments to 
docket ID number EPA–HQ–OPPT– 
2011–0699. EPA’s policy is that all 
comments received will be included in 
the docket without change and may be 
made available on-line at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, including any 
personal information provided, unless 
the comment includes information 
claimed to be Confidential Business 
Information (CBI) or other information 
whose disclosure is restricted by statute. 
Do not submit information that you 
consider to be CBI or otherwise 
protected through regulations.gov or e- 
mail. The regulations.gov Web site is an 
‘‘anonymous access’’ system, which 
means EPA will not know your identity 
or contact information unless you 
provide it in the body of your comment. 
If you send an e-mail comment directly 
to EPA without going through 
regulations.gov, your e-mail address 
will be automatically captured and 
included as part of the comment that is 
placed in the docket and made available 
on the Internet. If you submit an 
electronic comment, EPA recommends 
that you include your name and other 
contact information in the body of your 
comment and with any disk or CD–ROM 
you submit. If EPA cannot read your 
comment due to technical difficulties 
and cannot contact you for clarification, 
EPA may not be able to consider your 
comment. Electronic files should avoid 
the use of special characters, any form 
of encryption, and be free of any defects 
or viruses. 

Docket: All documents in the docket 
are listed in the docket index available 
at http://www.regulations.gov. Although 
listed in the index, some information is 
not publicly available, e.g., CBI or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Certain other 
material, such as copyrighted material, 
will be publicly available only in hard 
copy. Publicly available docket 
materials are available electronically at 
http://www.regulations.gov, or, if only 
available in hard copy, at the OPPT 
Docket. The OPPT Docket is located in 
the EPA Docket Center (EPA/DC) at Rm. 
3334, EPA West Bldg., 1301 
Constitution Ave., NW., Washington, 
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