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ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Cathy Williams, FCC, via email to PRA@
fcc.gov and to Cathy.Williams@fcc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection, contact Cathy 
Williams at (202) 418–2918. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0979. 
Title: License Audit Letter. 
Form Number: N/A. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Individuals or 

households, business or other for-profit 
entities, not-for-profit institutions and 
state, local or tribal government. 

Number of Respondents: 25,000 
respondents; 25,000 responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: .50 
hours. 

Frequency of Response: One-time 
reporting requirement. 

Obligation To Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. Statutory 
authority for this information collection 
is contained in 47 U.S.C. 151, 152, 
154(i), 155(c), 157, 201, 202, 208, 214, 
301, 302a, 303, 307, 308, 309, 310, 311, 
314, 316, 319, 324, 331, 332, 333, 336, 
534 and 535. 

Total Annual Burden: 12,500 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: No cost. 
Privacy Impact Assessment: Yes. 

Records of the Wireless Radio Services 
may include information about 
individuals or households, and the 
use(s) and disclosure of this information 
is governed by the requirements of a 
system of records, FCC/WTB–1, 
‘‘Wireless Services Licensing Records’’. 
However, the Commission makes all 
information within the Wireless Radio 
Services publicly available on its 
Universal Licensing System (ULS) web 
page. 

Nature and Extent of Confidentiality: 
Respondents may request materials or 
information submitted to the 
Commission be withheld from public 
inspection under 47 CFR 0.459 of their 
rules. Information within Wireless 
Radio Services is maintained in the 
Commission’s system or records notice 
or ‘SORN’, FCC/WTB–1, ‘‘Wireless 
Services Licensing Records’’. These 
licensee records are publicly available 
and routinely used in accordance with 
subsection b of the Privacy Act of 1973, 
5 U.S.C. 552a(b), as amended. Material 
that is afforded confidential treatment 
pursuant to a request made under 47 
CFR 0.459 of the Commission’s rules 
will not be available for public 
inspection. The Commission has in 
place the following policy and 
procedures for records retention and 
disposal: Records will be actively 

maintained as long as the individual 
remains a licensee. Paper records will 
be archived after being keyed or 
scanned into the system and destroyed 
when 12 years old; electronic records 
will be backed up and deleted twelve 
years after the licenses are no longer 
valid. 

Needs and Uses: The Commission is 
seeking OMB approval for an extension 
of this information collection in order to 
obtain their full three-year approval. 
There is no change to the reporting 
requirement. There is no change to the 
Commission’s burden estimates. The 
Wireless Telecommunications (WTB) 
and Public Safety and Homeland 
Security Bureaus (PSHSB) of the FCC 
periodically conduct audits of the 
construction and/or operational status 
of various Wireless radio stations in its 
licensing database that are subject to 
rule-based construction and operational 
requirements. The Commission’s rules 
for these Wireless services require 
construction within a specified 
timeframe and require a station to 
remain operational in order for the 
license to remain valid. The information 
will be used by FCC personnel to assure 
that licensees’ stations are constructed 
and currently operating in accordance 
with the parameters of the current FCC 
authorization and rules. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2018–15155 Filed 7–16–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The applications will also be 
available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 

writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors not later than August 9, 2018. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of 
Minneapolis (Mark A. Rauzi, Vice 
President) 90 Hennepin Avenue, 
Minneapolis, Minnesota 55480–0291: 

1. WNB Holding Company, Winona, 
Minnesota; to acquire First State Bank of 
Wabasha, Wabasha, Minnesota. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, July 12, 2018. 
Ann Misback, 
Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2018–15236 Filed 7–16–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention 

Determination Concerning a Petition 
To Add a Class of Employees to the 
Special Exposure Cohort 

AGENCY: National Institute for 
Occupational Safety and Health 
(NIOSH), Centers for Disease Control 
and Prevention, Department of Health 
and Human Services (HHS). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: HHS gives notice of a 
determination concerning a petition to 
add a class of employees from the Feed 
Materials Production Center (FMPC), in 
Fernald, Ohio, to the Special Exposure 
Cohort (SEC) under the Energy 
Employees Occupational Illness 
Compensation Program Act of 2000 
(EEOICPA). 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Stuart L. Hinnefeld, Director, Division 
of Compensation Analysis and Support, 
National Institute for Occupational 
Safety and Health (NIOSH), 1090 
Tusculum Avenue, MS C–46, 
Cincinnati, OH 45226–1938, Telephone 
1–877–222–7570. Information requests 
can also be submitted by email to 
DCAS@CDC.GOV. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: On June 
21, 2018, the Secretary of HHS 
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