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invite public comment on these 
documents. 

Background 
The California tiger salamander was 

listed as threatened on August 8, 2004 
(69 FR 47212), and the California red- 
legged frog was listed as threatened on 
May 23, 1996 (61 FR 25813). Section 9 
of the ESA prohibits the ‘‘take’’ of fish 
or wildlife species listed as endangered. 
Pursuant to section 4(d) of the ESA, the 
take prohibition was extended by 
regulation to certain threatened species, 
including, as applicable here, the 
California tiger salamander and 
California red-legged frog. ‘‘Take’’ is 
defined under the ESA to include the 
following activities: ‘‘to harass, harm, 
pursue, hunt, shoot, wound, kill, trap, 
capture, or collect, or to attempt to 
engage in any such conduct’’ (16 U.S.C. 
1532); however, under section 
10(a)(1)(B) of the ESA, we may issue 
permits to authorize incidental take of 
listed species. Incidental take is take 
that is incidental to, and not the 
purpose of, carrying out of an otherwise 
lawful activity. Issuance of an ITP also 
must not jeopardize the existence of 
federally listed fish, wildlife, or plant 
species, pursuant to section 7 of the 
ESA and 50 CFR 402.02. The permittee 
would receive assurances under our 
‘‘No Surprises’’ regulations (50 CFR 
17.22(b)(5)). 

Applicants’ Proposed Activities 
The applicants have applied for a 10- 

year-term permit for incidental take of 
the California tiger salamander and the 
California red-legged frog. The take 
would occur in association with the 
construction of a single-family home 
and associated activities, such as 
vegetation removal, site grubbing, and 
grading for proposed development. The 
proposed development, including the 
home, infrastructure, driveway 
improvements, utility expansions, 
detached underground guest suite, 
underground garage and utility room, an 
equipment room, retaining wall and 
patios, and all associated disturbance 
areas, would be sited on approximately 
2.39 acres (ac) of the 265-ac property. 
Approximately 2.60 ac would be 
temporarily impacted and would be 
restored to pre-construction conditions. 
To mitigate the effects of permanent 
impacts and the taking of California 
tiger salamander and the California red- 
legged frog, the applicants propose to 
purchase 9.56 ac of credits at the 
Sparling Ranch Conservation Bank in 
Santa Clara and San Benito Counties. 

The HCP includes avoidance and 
minimization measures for the 
California tiger salamander and the 

California red-legged frog and mitigation 
for unavoidable loss of habitat. The 
applicants’ conservation strategy 
includes an on-site re-vegetation plan to 
restore temporarily impacted habitat 
suitable for California tiger salamanders 
and California red-legged frogs through 
removal of nonnative plants, planting 
and seeding of locally occurring native 
grassland species, and a monitoring 
program that describes monitoring 
efforts and contingency plans if success 
criteria are not met. 

Public Comments 
If you wish to comment on the draft 

HCP and low-effect ITP screening form, 
you may submit comments by one of the 
methods in ADDRESSES. 

Before including your address, phone 
number, email address, or other 
personal identifying information in your 
comment, you should be aware that 
your entire comment, including your 
personal identifying information, may 
be made publicly available at any time. 
While you can ask us in your comment 
to withhold your personal identifying 
information from public view, we 
cannot guarantee that we will be able to 
do so. 

Authority 
We provide this notice under section 

10 of the ESA (16 U.S.C. 1531 et seq.) 
and NEPA regulations (40 CFR 1506.6). 

Stephen Henry, 
Field Supervisor, Ventura Fish and Wildlife 
Office, Ventura, California. 
[FR Doc. 2022–11227 Filed 5–24–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4333–15–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

Notice of Receipt of Complaint; 
Solicitation of Comments Relating to 
the Public Interest 

AGENCY: U.S. International Trade 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given that 
the U.S. International Trade 
Commission has received a complaint 
entitled Certain Universal Golf Club 
Shaft and Golf Club Head Connection 
Adaptors, Certain Components Thereof, 
and Products Containing the Same, DN 
3622; the Commission is soliciting 
comments on any public interest issues 
raised by the complaint or 
complainant’s filing pursuant to the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Lisa 
R. Barton, Secretary to the Commission, 

U.S. International Trade Commission, 
500 E Street SW, Washington, DC 
20436, telephone (202) 205–2000. The 
public version of the complaint can be 
accessed on the Commission’s 
Electronic Document Information 
System (EDIS) at https://edis.usitc.gov. 
For help accessing EDIS, please email 
EDIS3Help@usitc.gov. 

General information concerning the 
Commission may also be obtained by 
accessing its internet server at United 
States International Trade Commission 
(USITC) at https://www.usitc.gov. The 
public record for this investigation may 
be viewed on the Commission’s 
Electronic Document Information 
System (EDIS) at https://edis.usitc.gov. 
Hearing-impaired persons are advised 
that information on this matter can be 
obtained by contacting the 
Commission’s TDD terminal on (202) 
205–1810. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Commission has received a complaint 
and a submission pursuant to § 210.8(b) 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure filed on behalf of Club- 
Conex, LLC on May 19, 2022. The 
complaint alleges violations of section 
337 of the Tariff Act of 1930 (19 U.S.C. 
1337) in the importation into the United 
States, the sale for importation, and the 
sale within the United States after 
importation of certain universal golf 
club shaft and golf club head connection 
adaptors, certain components thereof, 
and products containing the same. The 
complainant names as respondent: Top 
Golf Equipment Co. Limited of China. 
The complainant requests that the 
Commission issue a limited exclusion 
order, a cease and desist order, and 
impose a bond upon respondents 
alleged infringing articles during the 60- 
day Presidential review period pursuant 
to 19 U.S.C. 1337(j). 

Proposed respondent, other interested 
parties, and members of the public are 
invited to file comments on any public 
interest issues raised by the complaint 
or § 210.8(b) filing. Comments should 
address whether issuance of the relief 
specifically requested by the 
complainant in this investigation would 
affect the public health and welfare in 
the United States, competitive 
conditions in the United States 
economy, the production of like or 
directly competitive articles in the 
United States, or United States 
consumers. 

In particular, the Commission is 
interested in comments that: 

(i) Explain how the articles 
potentially subject to the requested 
remedial orders are used in the United 
States; 
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1 Handbook for Electronic Filing Procedures: 
https://www.usitc.gov/documents/handbook_on_
filing_procedures.pdf. 

2 All contract personnel will sign appropriate 
nondisclosure agreements. 

3 Electronic Document Information System 
(EDIS): https://edis.usitc.gov. 

(ii) identify any public health, safety, 
or welfare concerns in the United States 
relating to the requested remedial 
orders; 

(iii) identify like or directly 
competitive articles that complainant, 
its licensees, or third parties make in the 
United States which could replace the 
subject articles if they were to be 
excluded; 

(iv) indicate whether complainant, 
complainant’s licensees, and/or third 
party suppliers have the capacity to 
replace the volume of articles 
potentially subject to the requested 
exclusion order and/or a cease and 
desist order within a commercially 
reasonable time; and 

(v) explain how the requested 
remedial orders would impact United 
States consumers. 

Written submissions on the public 
interest must be filed no later than by 
close of business, eight calendar days 
after the date of publication of this 
notice in the Federal Register. There 
will be further opportunities for 
comment on the public interest after the 
issuance of any final initial 
determination in this investigation. Any 
written submissions on other issues 
must also be filed by no later than the 
close of business, eight calendar days 
after publication of this notice in the 
Federal Register. Complainant may file 
replies to any written submissions no 
later than three calendar days after the 
date on which any initial submissions 
were due. No other submissions will be 
accepted, unless requested by the 
Commission. Any submissions and 
replies filed in response to this Notice 
are limited to five (5) pages in length, 
inclusive of attachments. 

Persons filing written submissions 
must file the original document 
electronically on or before the deadlines 
stated above. Submissions should refer 
to the docket number (‘‘Docket No. 
3622’’) in a prominent place on the 
cover page and/or the first page. (See 
Handbook for Electronic Filing 
Procedures, Electronic Filing 
Procedures 1). Please note the 
Secretary’s Office will accept only 
electronic filings during this time. 
Filings must be made through the 
Commission’s Electronic Document 
Information System (EDIS, https://
edis.usitc.gov). No in-person paper- 
based filings or paper copies of any 
electronic filings will be accepted until 
further notice. Persons with questions 

regarding filing should contact the 
Secretary at EDIS3Help@usitc.gov. 

Any person desiring to submit a 
document to the Commission in 
confidence must request confidential 
treatment. All such requests should be 
directed to the Secretary to the 
Commission and must include a full 
statement of the reasons why the 
Commission should grant such 
treatment. See 19 CFR 201.6. Documents 
for which confidential treatment by the 
Commission is properly sought will be 
treated accordingly. All information, 
including confidential business 
information and documents for which 
confidential treatment is properly 
sought, submitted to the Commission for 
purposes of this Investigation may be 
disclosed to and used: (i) By the 
Commission, its employees and Offices, 
and contract personnel (a) for 
developing or maintaining the records 
of this or a related proceeding, or (b) in 
internal investigations, audits, reviews, 
and evaluations relating to the 
programs, personnel, and operations of 
the Commission including under 5 
U.S.C. Appendix 3; or (ii) by U.S. 
government employees and contract 
personnel,2 solely for cybersecurity 
purposes. All nonconfidential written 
submissions will be available for public 
inspection at the Office of the Secretary 
and on EDIS.3 

This action is taken under the 
authority of section 337 of the Tariff Act 
of 1930, as amended (19 U.S.C. 1337), 
and of §§ 201.10 and 210.8(c) of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (19 CFR 201.10, 210.8(c)). 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: May 19, 2022. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2022–11197 Filed 5–24–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Drug Enforcement Administration 

[Docket No. DEA–1016] 

Importer of Controlled Substances 
Application: Experic, LLC 

AGENCY: Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Justice. 
ACTION: Notice of application. 

SUMMARY: Experic, LLC has applied to 
be registered as an importer of basic 
class(es) of controlled substance(s). 

Refer to SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION 
listed below for further drug 
information. 
DATES: Registered bulk manufacturers of 
the affected basic class(es), and 
applicants therefore, may submit 
electronic comments on or objections to 
the issuance of the proposed registration 
on or before June 24, 2022. Such 
persons may also file a written request 
for a hearing on the application on or 
before June 24, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: The Drug Enforcement 
Administration requires that all 
comments be submitted electronically 
through the Federal eRulemaking Portal, 
which provides the ability to type short 
comments directly into the comment 
field on the web page or attach a file for 
lengthier comments. Please go to 
https://www.regulations.gov and follow 
the online instructions at that site for 
submitting comments. Upon submission 
of your comment, you will receive a 
Comment Tracking Number. Please be 
aware that submitted comments are not 
instantaneously available for public 
view on https://www.regulations.gov. If 
you have received a Comment Tracking 
Number, your comment has been 
successfully submitted and there is no 
need to resubmit the same comment. All 
requests for a hearing must be sent to: 
(1) Drug Enforcement Administration, 
Attn: Hearing Clerk/OALJ, 8701 
Morrissette Drive, Springfield, Virginia 
22152; and (2) Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Attn: DEA Federal 
Register Representative/DPW, 8701 
Morrissette Drive, Springfield, Virginia 
22152. All requests for a hearing should 
also be sent to: Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Attn: Administrator, 
8701 Morrissette Drive, Springfield, 
Virginia 22152. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with 21 CFR 1301.34(a), this 
is notice that on March 24, 2022, 
Experic, LLC, 2 Clarke Drive, Cranbury, 
New Jersey 08512–3619, applied to be 
registered as an importer of the 
following basic class(es) of controlled 
substance(s): 

Controlled 
substance 

Drug 
code Schedule 

Marihuana Extract ........... 7350 I 
Marihuana ........................ 7360 I 
Tetrahydrocannabinols .... 7370 I 
Psilocybin ........................ 7437 I 
Psilocyn ........................... 7438 I 

The company plans to import 
Psilocybin (7437) and Psilocyn (7438) as 
bulk powder and Marihuana Extract 
(7350), Marihuana (7360), 
Tetrahydrocannabinols (7370) as 
finished dosage units for research and 
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