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Dated: March 6, 2024. 
Sarah L. Stewart, 
Deputy General Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2024–05165 Filed 3–7–24; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Change in Bank Control Notices; 
Acquisitions of Shares of a Bank or 
Bank Holding Company 

The notificants listed below have 
applied under the Change in Bank 
Control Act (Act) (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)) and 
225.41 of the Board’s Regulation Y (12 
CFR 225.41) to acquire shares of a bank 
or bank holding company. The factors 
that are considered in acting on the 
applications are set forth in paragraph 7 
of the Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)(7)). 

The public portions of the 
applications listed below, as well as 
other related filings required by the 
Board, if any, are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank(s) indicated below and at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
This information may also be obtained 
on an expedited basis, upon request, by 
contacting the appropriate Federal 
Reserve Bank and from the Board’s 
Freedom of Information Office at 
https://www.federalreserve.gov/foia/ 
request.htm. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on the 
standards enumerated in paragraph 7 of 
the Act. 

Comments regarding each of these 
applications must be received at the 
Reserve Bank indicated or the offices of 
the Board of Governors, Ann E. 
Misback, Secretary of the Board, 20th 
Street and Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20551–0001, not later 
than March 26, 2024. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Kansas 
City (Jeffrey Imgarten, Assistant Vice 
President) 1 Memorial Drive, Kansas 
City, Missouri 64198–0001. Comments 
can also be sent electronically to 
KCApplicationComments@kc.frb.org: 

1. Jeffry Albers, Wisner, Nebraska; to 
retain voting shares of Citizens National 
Corporation, and thereby indirectly 
retain voting shares of Citizens State 
Bank, both of Wisner, Nebraska. 

2. Amy Skovsende, Omaha, Nebraska; 
Kayla Roth Kuxhausen, West Point, 
Nebraska; Traci Ebel, Wisner, Nebraska; 
and Tyler Roth, Bucyrus, Kansas; to 
become members of the Roth family 
control group, a group acting in concert, 
to retain voting shares of Citizens 
National Corporation, and thereby 
indirectly retain voting shares of 
Citizens State Bank, both of Wisner, 
Nebraska. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System. 
Michele Taylor Fennell, 
Deputy Associate Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2024–05122 Filed 3–8–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

GENERAL SERVICES 
ADMINISTRATION 

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND 
SPACE ADMINISTRATION 

[OMB Control No. 9000–0064; Docket No. 
2024–0053; Sequence No. 1] 

Submission for OMB Review; Certain 
Federal Acquisition Regulation Part 36 
Construction Contract Requirements 

AGENCY: Department of Defense (DOD), 
General Services Administration (GSA), 
and National Aeronautics and Space 
Administration (NASA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act, the 
Regulatory Secretariat Division has 
submitted to the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) a request to review 
and approve a revision of a previously 
approved information collection 
requirement regarding certain Federal 
Acquisition Regulation (FAR) part 36 
construction contract requirements. 
DATES: Submit comments on or before 
April 10, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for this information 
collection should be sent within 30 days 
of publication of this notice to 
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain. 
Find this particular information 
collection by selecting ‘‘Currently under 
Review—Open for Public Comments’’ or 
by using the search function. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Zenaida Delgado, Procurement Analyst, 
at telephone 202–969–7207, or 
zenaida.delgado@gsa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

A. OMB Control Number, Title, and 
Any Associated Form(s) 

9000–0064, Certain Federal 
Acquisition Regulation Part 36 
Construction Contract Requirements. 

B. Need and Uses 

DoD, GSA, and NASA are combining 
OMB Control Nos. by FAR part. This 
consolidation is expected to improve 
industry’s ability to easily and 
efficiently identify burdens associated 
with a given FAR part. This review of 

the information collections by FAR part 
allows improved oversight to ensure 
there is no redundant or unaccounted 
for burden placed on industry. Lastly, 
combining information collections in a 
given FAR part is also expected to 
reduce the administrative burden 
associated with processing multiple 
information collections. 

This justification supports the 
extension of OMB Control No. 9000– 
0064 and combines it with the 
previously approved information 
collection under OMB Control No. 
9000–0062, with the new title ‘‘Certain 
Federal Acquisition Regulation Part 36 
Construction Contract Requirements’’. 
Upon approval of this consolidated 
information collection, OMB Control 
No. 9000–0062 will be discontinued. 
The burden requirements previously 
approved under the discontinued 
number will be covered under OMB 
Control No. 9000–0064. 

This clearance covers the information 
that contractors must submit to comply 
with the following FAR requirements: 

• FAR 52.236–5, Material and 
Workmanship. This clause requires 
contractors to obtain contracting officer 
approval of the machinery, equipment, 
material, or articles to be incorporated 
into the work. The contractor’s request 
must include: the manufacturer’s name, 
the model number, and other 
information concerning the 
performance, capacity, nature, and 
rating of the machinery and mechanical 
and other equipment; and full 
information concerning the material or 
articles. When directed by the 
contracting officer, the contractor must 
submit samples of the items requiring 
approval for incorporating into the 
work. The contracting officer uses this 
information to determine whether the 
machinery, equipment, material, or 
articles meet the standards of quality 
specified in the contract. A contracting 
officer may reject work, if the contractor 
installs machinery, equipment, material, 
or articles in the work without obtaining 
the contracting officer’s approval. 

• FAR 52.236–13, Accident 
Prevention, Alternate I. This alternate to 
the basic clause requires contractors to 
submit a written proposed plan to 
provide and maintain work 
environments and procedures that will 
safeguard the public and Government 
personnel, property, materials, supplies, 
and equipment exposed to contractor 
operations and activities; avoid 
interruptions of Government operations 
and delays in project completion dates; 
and control costs in the performance of 
this contract. The plan must include an 
analysis of the significant hazards to 
life, limb, and property inherent in 
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contract work performance and a plan 
for controlling these hazards. The 
contracting officer and technical 
representatives analyze the Accident 
Prevention Plan to determine if the 
proposed plan will satisfy the safety 
requirements identified in the contract, 
to include certain provisions of the 
Occupational Safety and Health Act (per 
FAR 36.513(c)) and applicable standards 
issued by the Secretary of Labor at 29 
CFR part 1926 and 29 CFR part 1910. 

• FAR 52.236–15, Schedules for 
Construction Contracts. This clause 
requires contractors to prepare and 
submit to the contracting officer for 
approval three copies of a practicable 
schedule showing the order in which 
the contractor proposes to perform the 
work, and the dates on which the 
contractor contemplates starting and 
completing the several salient features 
of the work (including acquiring 
materials, plant, and equipment). The 
contracting officer uses this information 
to monitor progress under a Federal 
construction contract when other 
management approaches for ensuring 
adequate progress are not used. 

• FAR 52.236–19, Organization and 
Direction of the Work. This clause 
requires contractors, under cost- 
reimbursement construction contracts, 
to submit to the contracting officer a 
chart showing the general executive and 
administrative organization, the 
personnel to be employed in connection 
with the work under the contract, and 
their respective duties. The contractor 
must keep the data furnished current by 
supplementing it as additional 
information becomes available. The 
contracting officer uses this information 
to ensure the work is performed by 
qualified personnel at a reasonable cost 
to the Government. 

C. Annual Burden 

Respondents: 3,771. 
Total Annual Responses: 13,267. 
Total Burden Hours: 21,338. 

D. Public Comment 

A 60-day notice was published in the 
Federal Register at 89 FR 786, on 
January 5, 2024. No comments were 
received. 

Obtaining Copies: Requesters may 
obtain a copy of the information 
collection documents from the GSA 
Regulatory Secretariat Division, by 
calling 202–501–4755 or emailing 
GSARegSec@gsa.gov. Please cite OMB 
Control No. 9000–0064, Certain Federal 

Acquisition Regulation Part 36 
Construction Contract Requirements. 

Janet Fry, 
Director, Federal Acquisition Policy Division, 
Office of Governmentwide Acquisition Policy, 
Office of Acquisition Policy, Office of 
Governmentwide Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2024–05107 Filed 3–8–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6820–EP–P 

OFFICE OF GOVERNMENT ETHICS 

Privacy Act of 1974; Systems of 
Records 

AGENCY: Office of Government Ethics 
(OGE). 
ACTION: Notice of a modified system of 
records. 

SUMMARY: OGE proposes to revise an 
existing Governmentwide system of 
records under the Privacy Act, covering 
Executive Branch Personnel Public 
Financial Disclosure Reports and Other 
Name-Retrieved Ethics Program 
Records. 

DATES: This action will be effective 
without further notice on March 11, 
2024 subject to a 30-day period in 
which to comment on the new and 
revised routine uses, described below. 
Please submit any comments by April 
10, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Comments may be 
submitted to OGE by any of the 
following methods: 

Email: usoge@oge.gov (Include 
reference to ‘‘OGE/GOVT–1’’ in the 
subject line of the message.) 

Mail, Hand Delivery/Courier: Office of 
Government Ethics, Suite 750, 250 E 
Street SW, Washington, DC 20024, 
Attention: Jennifer Matis, Associate 
Counsel. 

Instructions: Comments may be 
posted on OGE’s website, www.oge.gov. 
Sensitive personal information, such as 
account numbers or Social Security 
numbers, should not be included. 
Comments generally will not be edited 
to remove any identifying or contact 
information before posting. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Jennifer Matis at the U.S. Office of 
Government Ethics; telephone: 202– 
482–9216; TTY: 800–877–8339; Email: 
jmatis@oge.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with the Privacy Act of 
1974, 5 U.S.C. 552a, this document 
provides public notice that OGE is 
proposing to revise the OGE/GOVT–1 
Governmentwide system of records to 
add a routine use to permit OGE to post 
on its website information regarding 
individuals who have filed a public 

financial disclosure report pursuant to 5 
U.S.C. 13103 and individuals who have 
received a conflict of interest waiver 
pursuant to 18 U.S.C. 208 (‘‘conflict of 
interest waivers’’). OGE also plans to 
update citations to the Ethics in 
Government Act, update its street 
address, clarify language in routine use 
‘‘n,’’ and fix several typographical 
errors. A Governmentwide system of 
records is a system of records where one 
agency (in this case, OGE) has 
regulatory authority over records in the 
custody of multiple agencies and the 
agency with regulatory authority 
publishes a system of records notice that 
applies to all of the records regardless 
of their custodial location. 

Through the process described in 5 
U.S.C. 13107, members of the public 
may obtain both public financial 
disclosure reports and conflict of 
interest waivers from agencies 
authorized to release those documents. 
See 5 U.S.C. 13107, 18 U.S.C. 208(d)(1). 
Although conflict of interest waivers 
may already be requested from the 
waiver recipient’s employing agency 
using this process, currently the public 
has no way to know who has received 
a waiver in order to submit such a 
request. Therefore, OGE is proposing to 
add the waiver recipient’s first and last 
name, government position, the type of 
report filed or waiver issued, and name 
of the employing agency to OGE’s 
website, specifically its Officials’ 
Individual Disclosures Search 
Collection (‘‘search collection’’). 
Although OGE does not and will not 
release conflict of interest waivers 
issued by another agency, the posting of 
this information on the OGE website 
will make it easier for the waivers to be 
requested from the waiver recipient’s 
employing agency and help effectuate 
the purposes of the statutory 
transparency provisions. Accordingly, 
OGE proposes to add a new routine use 
‘‘c’’ to this system of records to permit 
the disclosure. 

The proposed routine use would also 
explicitly permit the disclosure of 
similar information regarding public 
financial disclosure filers. In order to 
allow users to select the documents they 
wish to request, OGE’s search collection 
currently displays the filer’s first and 
last name, government position, the 
type of report available, and name of the 
employing agency. OGE has the 
authority to display this information 
pursuant to current routine use ‘‘a.’’ 
However, the language of routine use 
‘‘a’’ does not make it plain to the public 
that certain information regarding 
public financial disclosure filers will be 
posted on OGE’s website. Therefore, 
OGE proposes to make that fact clear by 
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