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the time for individual oral comments 
may be limited. 

Ruth Welch, 
State Director. 
[FR Doc. 2014–30293 Filed 1–15–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

Bureau of Land Management 

[LLCAC06000.L11500000.DR0000.14X] 

Notice of Availability of the Record of 
Decision for the Bakersfield Field 
Office Resource Management Plan 
Final Environmental Impact Statement, 
California 

AGENCY: Bureau of Land Management, 
Interior. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Bureau of Land 
Management (BLM) announces the 
availability of the Record of Decision 
(ROD) for the Approved Resource 
Management Plan (RMP) for the 
Bakersfield Field Office located in 
Kings, Madera, San Luis Obispo, Santa 
Barbara, Tulare, Ventura, eastern 
Fresno, and western Kern counties in 
south-central California. The California 
State Director signed the ROD on 
December 22, 2014, which constitutes 
the BLM’s final decision and makes the 
Approved RMP effective immediately. 
ADDRESSES: Copies of the ROD/
Approved RMP are available upon 
request from the Field Manager, 
Bakersfield Field Office, Bureau of Land 
Management, 3801 Pegasus Drive, 
Bakersfield, CA 93308 or via the 
internet at www.blm.gov/ca/bakersfield. 
Copies of the ROD/Approved RMP are 
available for public inspection at the 
Bakersfield Field Office and California 
State Office, 2800 Cottage Way, 
Sacramento, CA 95825. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Sue 
Porter, Planning & Environmental 
Coordinator, Bakersfield Field Office, 
telephone: 661–391–6022; address: 
Bakersfield Field Office, 3801 Pegasus 
Drive, Bakersfield, CA 93308; email: 
blm_ca_bakersfield_rmp@blm.gov. 
Persons who use a telecommunications 
device for the deaf (TDD) may call the 
Federal Information Relay Service 
(FIRS) at 1–800–877–8339 to contact the 
above individual during normal 
business hours. The FIRS is available 24 
hours a day, 7 days a week, to leave a 
message or question with the above 
individual. You will receive a reply 
during normal business hours. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Bakersfield Approved RMP addresses 

public land and resources managed by 
the Bakersfield Field Office in an 8 
county, 17-million acre region of central 
California and provides management 
direction for approximately 400,000 
acres of BLM-administered public land 
and 1.2 million acres of Federal mineral 
estate under Federal, State, and private 
surface ownership. 

The Bakersfield Approved RMP— 
• Establishes the goals, objectives, 

and management actions to meet 
desired resource conditions; 

• Identifies comprehensive 
management direction for all resources 
and uses, including application of on- 
site, off-site (including compensation), 
and regional mitigation strategies, as 
applicable, and landscape-level 
conservation and management actions 
to achieve resource objectives; 

• Identifies lands that are open or 
available for certain uses along with 
associated surface restrictions; 

• Identifies lands closed to certain 
uses; and 

• Makes broad-scale decisions to 
guide future site-specific project 
implementation for renewable energy, 
fluid minerals, livestock grazing, and 
recreation management in the 
Bakersfield Field Office. 

The selected alternative for the 
Approved RMP is the agency proposed 
plan (Alternative B) in the Proposed 
RMP/Final Environmental Impact 
Statement (EIS), with the minor 
modifications described below. 

After publication of the Proposed 
RMP/Final EIS on August 31, 2012, the 
BLM received 21 protest letters. The 
BLM modified the proposed plan based 
on protest resolution as reflected in the 
Approved RMP. These changes include, 
but are not limited to, designation of the 
Salinas River as an Area of Critical 
Environmental Concern (ACEC) and 
adoption of the special management 
attention for this area as outlined in 
Alternative C of the Proposed RMP/
Final EIS. The BLM also corrected 
acreages for the Bitter Creek and Chico 
Martinez ACECs, which had been 
modified in the Proposed RMP/Final 
EIS based on public comments to 
exclude lands for which the BLM has no 
authority to apply management 
prescriptions. 

The California Governor’s Office did 
not identify any inconsistencies 
between the Proposed RMP/Final EIS 
and State or local plans, policies, and 
programs during the 60-day Governor’s 
consistency review. 

The ROD/Approved RMP route 
designation decisions are 
implementation decisions and are 
appealable under 43 CFR part 4. Any 
party adversely affected by an 

implementation decision may appeal 
within 30 days of publication of this 
Notice of Availability pursuant to 43 
CFR, part 4, subpart E. The appeal 
should identify the specific route(s) on 
which the decision is being appealed. 
The appeal must be filed with the 
Bakersfield Field Manager at the above 
listed address. Please consult the 
appropriate regulations (43 CFR, part 4, 
subpart E) for further appeal 
requirements. 

Authority: 40 CFR 1506.6. 

Gabriel Garcia, 
Field Manager, Bakersfield Field Office. 
[FR Doc. 2015–00597 Filed 1–15–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4310–40–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

National Park Service 

[NPS–AKR–ANIA–KOVA–WRST–17357; 
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Aniakchak National Monument 
Subsistence Resource Commission 
(SRC), the Kobuk Valley National Park 
SRC, and the Wrangell-St. Elias 
National Park SRC; Meetings 

AGENCY: National Park Service, Interior. 
ACTION: Meeting notice. 

SUMMARY: As required by the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (5 U.S.C. 
Appendix 1–16), the National Park 
Service (NPS) is hereby giving notice 
that the Aniakchak National Monument 
Subsistence Resource Commission 
(SRC), the Kobuk Valley National Park 
SRC, and the Wrangell-St. Elias National 
Park SRC will hold meetings to develop 
and continue work on NPS subsistence 
program recommendations and other 
related regulatory proposals and 
resource management issues. The NPS 
SRC program is authorized under 
Section 808 of the Alaska National 
Interest Lands Conservation Act (16 
U.S.C. 3118), Title VIII. 

Aniakchak National Monument SRC 
Meeting Date and Location: The 
Aniakchak National Monument SRC 
will meet from 1:00 p.m. to 5:00 p.m. or 
until business is completed on Tuesday, 
February 3, 2015, at the Community 
Center in Port Heiden, AK. For more 
detailed information regarding the 
Aniakchak National Monument SRC 
meeting, or if you are interested in 
applying for SRC membership, contact 
Designated Federal Official Diane 
Chung, Superintendent, at (907) 246– 
3305, or via email diane_chung@
nps.gov, or Clarence Summers, 
Subsistence Manager, at (907) 644–3603, 
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or via email clarence_summers@
nps.gov. 

Kobuk Valley National Park Src 
Meeting/Teleconference Dates and 
Location: The Kobuk Valley National 
Park SRC will meet/teleconference from 
9:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. or until business 
is completed on Wednesday, February 
11, 2015, at the Northwest Arctic 
Heritage Center in Kotzebue, AK. The 
teleconference will be open to the 
public. Teleconference participants 
must call Kobuk Valley National Park 
office at (907) 442–3890 by Tuesday, 
February 10, 2015, prior to the meeting 
to receive teleconference passcode 
information. For more detailed 
information regarding the Kobuk Valley 
National Park SRC meetings, or if you 
are interested in applying for SRC 
membership, contact Designated Federal 
Official Frank Hays, Superintendent, at 
(907) 442–3890, or via email frank_
hays@nps.gov, or Clarence Summers, 
Subsistence Manager, at (907) 644–3603, 
or via email clarence_summers@
nps.gov. 

Wrangell-St. Elias National Park SRC 
Meeting/Teleconference Dates and 
Location: The Wrangell-St. Elias 
National Park SRC will meet/
teleconference from 9:00 a.m. to 5:00 
p.m. or until business is completed on 
Thursday, February 26, 2015, and 
Friday, February 27, 2015, at the Buster 
Gene Memorial Facility in Gakona, AK. 
If the work of the SRC is completed on 
Thursday, February 26, 2015, the SRC 
will not meet on Friday, February 27, 
2015. Teleconference participants must 
call the Wrangell-St. Elias National Park 
office at (907) 822–7236 or (907) 822– 
5234, by Friday, February 20, 2015, 
prior to the meeting to receive 
teleconference passcode information. 
For more detailed information regarding 
the Wrangell-St. Elias National Park 
SRC meeting/teleconference, or if you 
are interested in applying for SRC 
membership, contact Designated Federal 
Official Rick Obernesser, 
Superintendent, at (907) 822–3182, or 
via email rick_obernesser@nps.gov, or 
Barbara Cellarius, Subsistence Manager, 
at (907) 822–7236, or via email barbara_
cellarius@nps.gov, or Clarence 
Summers, Subsistence Manager, at (907) 
644–3603, or via email clarence_
summers@nps.gov. 

Proposed Meeting Agenda: The 
agenda may change to accommodate 
SRC business. 

The proposed meeting agenda for 
each meeting includes the following: 
1. Call to Order—Confirm Quorum 
2. Welcome and Introductions 
3. Review and Adoption of Agenda 
4. Approval of Minutes 

5. Superintendent’s Welcome and 
Review of the Commission Purpose 

6. Commission Membership Status 
7. SRC Chair and Members’ Reports 
8. Superintendent’s Report—NPS 
9. Old Business 
10. New Business 
11. Federal Subsistence Board Update 
12. Alaska Boards of Fish and Game 

Update 
13. National Park Service Reports 

a. Ranger Update 
b. Resource Management Update 
c. Subsistence Manager’s Report 

14. Public and Other Agency Comments 
15. Work Session 
16. Set Tentative Date and Location for 

Next SRC Meeting 
17. Adjourn Meeting 

SRC meeting locations and dates may 
change based on inclement weather or 
exceptional circumstances. If the 
meeting date and location are changed, 
the Superintendent will issue a press 
release and use local newspapers and 
radio stations to announce the 
rescheduled meeting. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: These 
meetings are open to the public and will 
have time allocated for public 
testimony. The public is welcome to 
present written or oral comments to the 
SRC. The meetings will be recorded and 
meeting minutes will be available upon 
request from the Superintendent for 
public inspection approximately six 
weeks after the meeting. Before 
including your address, telephone 
number, email address, or other 
personal identifying information in your 
comment, you should be aware that 
your entire comment—including your 
personal identifying information—may 
be made publicly available at any time. 
While you may ask us in your comment 
to withhold your personal identifying 
information from public review, we 
cannot guarantee that we will be able to 
do so. 

Dated: January 9, 2015. 
Alma Ripps, 
Chief, Office of Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2015–00668 Filed 1–15–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4310–EE–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

National Park Service 

[NPS–NERO–GATE–17297; PPNEGATEB0, 
PPMVSCS1Z.Y00000] 

Notice of Meeting for Gateway National 
Recreation Area Fort Hancock 21st 
Century Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: National Park Service, Interior. 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (5 
U.S.C. Appendix 1–16), notice is hereby 
given of the next meeting of the 
Gateway National Recreation Area Fort 
Hancock 21st Century Advisory 
Committee. This meeting will take place 
on Friday, February 20, 2015, beginning 
at 9 a.m. (Eastern). 
ADDRESSES: This meeting will take place 
at the Chapel at Sandy Hook, 
Hartshorne Drive, Middletown, NJ. 

Agenda: The Committee will review 
communication efforts for three 
Requests for Proposal, released 
December 12, 2014, and open through 
April 17, 2015. The final agenda will be 
posted on 
www.forthancock21stcentury.org prior 
to the meeting. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Further information concerning the 
meeting may be obtained by mail from 
John Warren, External Affairs Officer, 
Gateway National Recreation Area, 26 
Hudson Road, Highlands, NJ 07732, or 
by calling (732) 872–5908, or via email 
at forthancock21stcentury@yahoo.com, 
or by visiting the committee Web site at 
http://www.forthancock21stcentury.org. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: As 
provided under section 10(a)(2) of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (5 
U.S.C. Appendix 1–16), the purpose of 
the Committee is to provide advice to 
the Secretary of the Interior, through the 
Director of the National Park Service, on 
the development of a reuse plan and on 
matters relating to future uses of certain 
buildings within the Fort Hancock 
Historic Landmark District, within the 
Sandy Hook Unit of Gateway National 
Recreation Area. 

Meetings are open to the public. 
Interested members of the public may 
present, either orally or through written 
comments, opinions or information for 
the Committee to consider during the 
public meeting. Attendees and those 
wishing to provide comment are 
strongly encouraged to preregister 
through the contact information 
provided. The public will be able to 
comment at the meetings from 1 p.m. to 
1:45 p.m. Written comments will be 
accepted prior to, during or after the 
meeting. Due to time constraints during 
the meeting, the Committee is not able 
to read written public comments 
submitted into the record. Individuals 
or groups requesting to make oral 
comments at the public committee 
meeting will be limited to no more than 
five minutes per speaker. 

Before including your address, 
telephone number, email address, or 
other personal identifying information 
in your written comments, you should 
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