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2. Community First Financial 
Corporation, Lynchburg, Virginia; to 
acquire up to 9.3 percent of the voting 
shares of Highlands Community Bank, 
Covington, Virginia (in organization).

B. Federal Reserve Bank of Chicago 
(Phillip Jackson, Applications Officer) 
230 South LaSalle Street, Chicago, 
Illinois 60690–1414:

1. Marshall & Ilsley Corporation, 
Milwaukee, Wisconsin; to merge with 
Mississippi Valley Bancshares, Inc., St. 
Louis, Missouri, and thereby indirectly 
acquire Southwest Bank of St. Louis, St. 
Louis, Missouri, Southwest Bank, 
Belleville, Illinois, and Southwest Bank 
of Phoenix, Phoenix, Arizona.

In connection with this application, 
Applicant also has applied to engage in 
extending credit and servicing loans, 
through RE Holding Company A, RE 
Holding Company B, RE Holding 
Company C and SWB Real Estate 
Investment Trust, all located in Clayton, 
Missouri, pursuant to section 
225.28(b)(1) of Regulation Y; to engage 
in providing financial and investment 
advisory services, through Eagle Fund, 
L.L.C., St. Louis, Missouri, pursuant to 
sections 225.28(b)(6) of Regulation Y; to 
engage in trust company activities, 
through MVBI Capital Trust, 
Wilmington, Delaware, pursuant to 
section 225.28(b)(5) of Regulation Y.

C. Federal Reserve Bank of St. Louis 
(Randall C. Sumner, Vice President) 411 
Locust Street, St. Louis, Missouri 
63166–2034:

1. State Capital Corporation, 
Greenwood, Mississippi; to acquire up 
to 100 percent of the voting shares of 
Mississippi Southern Bank, Port Gibson, 
Mississippi.

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, July 9, 2002.
Robert deV. Frierson,
Deputy Secretary of the Board.
[FR Doc. 02–17613 Filed 7–12–02; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 6210–01–S

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Notice of Meeting of the Advisory 
Committee on Blood Safety and 
Availability

AGENCY: Office of the Secretary, HHS.
ACTION: Notice of September 5, 2002, 
meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Advisory Committee on 
Blood Safety and Availability will meet 
on Thursday September 5, 2002 from 8 
a.m. to 5 p.m. The meeting will take 
place at the Wyndham Washington 
Hotel, 1400 M Street, NW., Washington, 
DC 20001. The meeting will be entirely 

open to the public. The agenda will be 
announced at a future date. Public 
comment will be limited to five minutes 
per speaker. Those who wish to have 
printed material distributed to Advisory 
Committee members should submit 
thirty (30) copies to the Executive 
Secretary prior to close of business 
August 19, 2002.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Stephen D. Nightingale, MD, Executive 
Secretary, Advisory Committee on 
Blood Safety and Availability, 
Department of Health and Human 
Services, Office of Public Health and 
Science, 200 Independence Ave., SW., 
Room 736–E, Washington, DC 20201. 
Phone (202) 690–5558, FAX (202) 260–
9372, e-mail 
StephenDNightingale@osophs.dhhs.gov.

Dated: July 9, 2002. 
Eve E. Slater, 
Assistant Secretary for Health.
[FR Doc. 02–17677 Filed 7–12–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4150–28–M

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Health Resources and Services 
Administration 

Statement of Organization, Functions 
and Delegations of Authority 

This notice amends Part R of the 
Statement of Organization Functions 
and Delegations of Authority of the 
Department of Health and Human 
Services (HHS), Health Resources and 
Services Administration (HRSA) as most 
recently amended at (60 FR 56605, 
November 6, 1995 as last amended at 66 
FR 56333, dated November 7, 2001). 

This notice reflects organizational 
changes in the Office of Information 
Technology, Office of the Administrator; 
the Division of Management Services, 
Office of Management and Program 
Support; and the HIV/AIDS Bureau. 
Make the following changes: 

A. In the Office of Information 
Technology (RAG), Establish the 
Division of Knowledge Management 
Services 

Division of Knowledge Management 
Services (RAG1) 

Develops and maintains an overall 
knowledge management strategy for 
HRSA that is integrated with HHS and 
government-wide strategies. 
Specifically: (1) Identifies information 
needs across HRSA and develops 
approaches for meeting those needs; (2) 
ensures that data required to satisfy 
enterprise information requirements are 

captured in appropriate enterprise 
applications and summarized in the 
Data Warehouse; (3) manages HRSA-
wide working groups as necessary to 
integrate enterprise data architecture 
with business applications and to re-
engineer business processes; and (4) 
enhances and expands use and 
usefulness of HRSA’s Data Warehouse 
through providing basic analytic 
capacity and user support; developing 
and maintaining a range of information 
products; and demonstrating the 
potential uses of information in 
supporting management decisions. 

B. In the Division of Management 
Services Remove the Tort Claims 
Function and Place It in the HIV/AIDS 
Bureau (RV) 

Division of Management Services (RS1) 
Provides Agency-wide leadership and 

direction in the areas of management 
policies and procedures and property 
management, and serves as the 
Executive Officer for the Office of 
Management and Program Support 
(OMPS) and for the Office of the 
Administrator (OA). Specifically: (1) 
Provides advice and guidance for the 
establishment or modification of 
organizational structures, functions, and 
delegations of authority; (2) conducts 
and coordinates the Agency’s issuances, 
reports and mail management programs; 
(3) manages and maintains a records 
and forms management program for the 
Agency, this includes electronic data; 
(4) manages the intra- and interagency 
agreements process; (5) conducts 
Agency-wide management improvement 
programs; (6) conducts management and 
information studies and surveys; (7) 
oversees and coordinates the 
implementation of directives and 
policies relating to the Privacy Act; (8) 
plans, directs, and coordinates 
administrative management activities 
and services including personnel, 
financial, materiel management, and 
general administrative services for OA 
and OMPS; (9) acts for the Associate 
Administrator for Management and 
Program Support concerning space, 
parking, and communications 
management for headquarters and 
represents him/her in matters relating to 
the management of the Parklawn 
Building complex; (10) advises on and 
coordinates Agency-wide policies and 
procedures required to implement 
General Services Administration and 
Departmental regulations governing 
materiel management, including travel, 
transportation, motor vehicle, and 
utilization and disposal of property; (11) 
oversees and coordinates the Agency’s 
committee management program; and 
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