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Office of the Secretary, U.S. 
International Trade Commission, 500 E 
Street SW., Washington, DC 20436, 
telephone (202) 205–2000. General 
information concerning the Commission 
may also be obtained by accessing its 
Internet server at http://www.usitc.gov. 
The public record for this investigation 
may be viewed on the Commission’s 
electronic docket (EDIS) at http:// 
edis.usitc.gov. Hearing-impaired 
persons are advised that information on 
this matter can be obtained by 
contacting the Commission’s TDD 
terminal on (202) 205–1810. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Commission instituted this investigation 
on January 11, 2012, based on a 
complaint filed by Walker Digital LLC of 
Stamford, Connecticut (‘‘Walker’’), 
alleging a violation of section 337 by 
reason of the infringement of certain 
claims of U.S. Patent No. 6,263,505. 77 
FR 1725 (Jan. 11, 2012). The notice of 
institution named thirty-five 
respondents. Most respondents have 
already been terminated from the 
investigation. 

On August 27, 2012, Walker moved to 
terminate the investigation as to 
respondents Sony Corporation and Sony 
Computer Entertainment Inc., both of 
Tokyo, Japan; Sony Corporation of 
America of New York, New York; Sony 
Electronics Inc. of San Diego, California; 
and Sony Computer Entertainment 
America of Foster City, California 
(collectively, ‘‘Sony’’) based upon 
withdrawal of the complaint against 
Sony. On September 6, 2012, the 
Commission investigative attorney 
(‘‘IA’’) responded in support of the 
motion. On December 12, 2012, Walker 
filed a supplemental memorandum 
indicating that there are no agreements 
between Walker and Sony regarding the 
subject matter of this investigation. See 
19 CFR 210.21(a)(1). On December 14, 
2012, the ALJ granted the motion as an 
ID. Order No. 42. 

On December 6, 2012, Walker and the 
last two respondents, Toshiba 
Corporation of Tokyo, Japan; and 
Toshiba America Information Systems, 
Inc. of Irvine, California (collectively, 
‘‘Toshiba’’) moved to terminate the 
investigation as to Toshiba on the basis 
of a settlement agreement. On December 
17, 2012, the IA responded in support 
of the motion. On December 18, 2012, 
the ALJ granted the motion as an ID. 
Order No. 43. The ALJ determined that 
termination as to Toshiba is in the 
public interest. Id. at 2; see 19 CFR 
210.50(b)(2). 

No petitions for review of the IDs 
were filed. The Commission has 
determined not to review the IDs. 

Termination as to these last remaining 
respondents thereby terminates the 
investigation. 

The authority for the Commission’s 
determination is contained in section 
337 of the Tariff Act of 1930, as 
amended (19 U.S.C. 1337), and in 
sections 210.21 and 210.42 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (19 CFR 210.21, 210.42). 

Issued: January 14, 2013. 
By order of the Commission. 

Lisa R. Barton, 
Acting Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2013–00909 Filed 1–16–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation No. 337–TA–849] 

Certain Rubber Resins & Processes for 
Manufacturing Same; Commission 
Determination Not To Review an Initial 
Determination Granting in Part 
Complainant’s Motion for Leave To File 
an Amended Complaint and To Amend 
the Notice of Investigation 

AGENCY: U.S. International Trade 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given that 
the U.S. International Trade 
Commission has determined not to 
review an initial determination (‘‘ID’’) 
(Order No. 21) of the presiding 
administrative law judge granting in 
part complainant’s motion for leave to 
file an amended complaint and to 
amend the notice of investigation. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
James A. Worth, Office of the General 
Counsel, U.S. International Trade 
Commission, 500 E Street SW., 
Washington, DC 20436, telephone 202– 
205–3065. Copies of non-confidential 
documents filed in connection with this 
investigation are or will be available for 
inspection during official business 
hours (8:45 a.m. to 5:15 p.m.) in the 
Office of the Secretary, U.S. 
International Trade Commission, 500 E 
Street SW., Washington, DC 20436, 
telephone 202–205–2000. General 
information concerning the Commission 
may also be obtained by accessing its 
Internet server (http://www.usitc.gov). 
The public record for this investigation 
may be viewed on the Commission’s 
electronic docket (EDIS) at http:// 
edis.usitc.gov. Hearing-impaired 
persons are advised that information on 
this matter can be obtained by 
contacting the Commission’s TDD 
terminal on 202–205–1810. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Commission instituted this investigation 
on June 26, 2012, based on a complaint 
filed on behalf of SI Group, Inc. of 
Schenectady, New York (‘‘SI Group’’) on 
May 21, 2012, as supplemented on June 
12, 2012. 77 FR 38083 (June 26, 2012). 
The complaint alleged violations of 
section 337 of the Tariff Act of 1930, as 
amended, 19 U.S.C. 1337, in the sale for 
importation, importation, or sale after 
importation into the United States of 
certain rubber resins by reason of 
misappropriation of trade secrets, the 
threat or effect of which is to destroy or 
substantially injure an industry in the 
United States. The Commission’s notice 
of investigation named as respondents 
Red Avenue Chemical Corp. of America 
of Rochester, New York; Thomas R. 
Crumlish, Jr. of Rochester, New York; 
Precision Measurement International 
LLC of Westland, Michigan; Sino 
Legend (Zhangjiagang) Chemical Co., 
Ltd. of Zhangjiagang City, China; Sino 
Legend Holding Group, Inc. c/o Mr. 
Richard A. Peters of Kowloon, Hong 
Kong; Sino Legend Holding Group Ltd. 
of Hong Kong; HongKong Sino Legend 
Group, Ltd. of North Point, Hong Kong; 
Red Avenue Chemical Co. Ltd. of 
Shanghai, China; Ning Zhang of North 
Vancouver, Canada; Quanhai Yang of 
Beijing, China; and Shanghai Lunsai 
International Trading Company of 
Shanghai City, China. 

On October 16, 2012, SI Group filed 
a motion for leave to file an amended 
complaint and to amend the notice of 
investigation. SI Group requested to add 
the following parties as respondents: 
Red Avenue Group Limited of Kowloon, 
Hong Kong (‘‘Red Avenue HK’’); Sino 
Legend Holding Group Inc. of Majuro, 
Marshall Islands (‘‘Sino Marshall 
Islands’’); Gold Dynasty Limited c/o 
ATC Trustees (Cayman) Limited of 
Grand Cayman, Cayman Islands (‘‘Gold 
Dynasty’’); Elite Holding Group Inc. c/ 
o Morgan & Morgan Trust Corporation 
(Belize) Limited of Belize City, Belize 
(‘‘Elite’’); Western Reserve Chemical 
Corporation of Stow, Ohio (‘‘Western 
Chemical’’); Biddle Sawyer Corporation 
of New York, New York (‘‘Biddle 
Sawyer’’). On October 26, 2012, the 
respondents filed a response in 
opposition and the Commission 
investigative attorney filed a response 
supporting the motion in part and 
opposing it in part. 

On December 17, 2012, the ALJ issued 
an ID granting in part, and an order 
denying in part, complainant’s motion 
for leave to file an amended complaint 
and to amend the notice of 
investigation. The ALJ granted the 
motion to amend the complaint and 
notice of investigation to add Red 
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Avenue HK, Sino Marshall Islands, Gold 
Dynasty, and Elite as respondents. The 
ALJ denied the motion as to Western 
Chemical and Biddle Sawyer because it 
would have resulted in delay to the 
investigation. No petitions for review 
were filed. 

The Commission has determined not 
to review the ID. 

The authority for the Commission’s 
determination is contained in section 
337 of the Tariff Act of 1930, as 
amended (19 U.S.C. 1337), and in Part 
210 of the Commission’s Rules of 
Practice and Procedure (19 CFR part 
210). 

Issued: January 14, 2013. 
By order of the Commission. 

Lisa R. Barton, 
Acting Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2013–00910 Filed 1–16–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[USITC SE–13–004] 

Sunshine Act Meeting Notice 

AGENCY HOLDING THE MEETING: United 
States International Trade Commission. 

TIME AND DATE: January 23, 2013 at 
11:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Room 101, 500 E Street SW., 
Washington, DC 20436. Telephone: 
(202) 205–2000. 

STATUS: Open to the public. 

MATTERS TO BE CONSIDERED:  
1. Agendas for future meetings: none. 
2. Minutes. 
3. Ratification List. 
4. Vote in Inv. Nos. 701–TA–488 and 

731–TA–1199–1200 (Final) (Large 
Residential Washers from Korea and 
Mexico). The Commission is currently 
scheduled to transmit its determinations 
and Commissioners’ opinions to the 
Secretary of Commerce on or before 
February 8, 2013. 

5. Outstanding action jackets: none. 
In accordance with Commission 

policy, subject matter listed above, not 
disposed of at the scheduled meeting, 
may be carried over to the agenda of the 
following meeting. 

Issued: January 15, 2013. 
By order of the Commission. 

William R. Bishop, 
Supervisory Hearings and Information 
Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2013–00971 Filed 1–15–13; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration 

[Docket No. OSHA–2012–0026] 

Revision of Approved Information 
Collection (Paperwork) Requirements 
for Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) Approval; Regulations 
Containing Procedures for Handling of 
Retaliation Complaints 

AGENCY: Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration (OSHA), Labor. 
ACTION: Request for public comments. 

SUMMARY: OSHA solicits public 
comments concerning its proposal to 
revise the information collection 
requirements currently approved by the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for handling of retaliation 
complaints filed with OSHA under 
various whistleblower protection 
statutes and the procedural regulations 
described in this notice. These 
regulations contain procedures 
employees must use to file a complaint 
with OSHA alleging that their employer 
violated a whistleblower protection 
provision contained in certain statutes 
that generally prohibit retaliatory action 
by employers against employees who 
engage in activities protected by the 
statutes. The revised information 
collection requirements include a new 
form providing additional methods for 
employees to submit retaliation 
complaints to OSHA, including 
electronic submission. 
DATES: Comments must be submitted 
(postmarked, sent, or received) by 
March 18, 2013. 
ADDRESSES: Electronically: You may 
submit comments and attachments 
electronically at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, which is the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal. Follow the 
instructions online for submitting 
comments. 

Facsimile: If your comments, 
including attachments, are not longer 
than 10 pages, you may fax them to the 
OSHA Docket Office at (202) 693–1648. 

Mail, hand delivery, express mail, 
messenger or courier service: When 
using this method, you must submit 
your comments and attachments to the 
OSHA Docket Office, OSHA Docket No. 
OSHA–2012–0026, U.S. Department of 
Labor, Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration, Room N–2625, 200 
Constitution Avenue NW., Washington, 
DC 20210. Deliveries (hand, express 
mail, messenger and courier service) are 
accepted during the Department of 
Labor’s and Docket Office’s normal 

business hours, 8:15 a.m. to 4:45 p.m., 
e.t. 

Instructions: All submissions must 
include the Agency name and OSHA 
docket number (OSHA–2012–0026) for 
the Information Collection Request 
(ICR). All comments, including any 
personal information you provide, are 
placed in the public docket without 
change, and may be made available 
online at http://www.regulations.gov. 
For further information on submitting 
comments see the ‘‘Public 
Participation’’ heading in the section of 
this notice titled SUPPLEMENTARY 
INFORMATION. 

Docket: To read or download 
comments or other material in the 
docket, go to http://www.regulations.gov 
or the OSHA Docket Office at the 
address above. All documents in the 
docket (including this Federal Register 
notice) are listed in the http:// 
www.regulations.gov index; however, 
some information (e.g., copyrighted 
material) is not publicly available to 
read or download from the Web site. All 
submissions, including copyrighted 
material, are available for inspection 
and copying at the OSHA Docket Office. 
You may also contact the Directorate of 
Whistleblower Protection Programs at 
the address below to obtain a copy of 
the ICR. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Beth 
Slavet, Director, Directorate of 
Whistleblower Protection Programs, 
OSHA, U.S. Department of Labor, Room 
N–4624, 200 Constitution Avenue NW., 
Washington, DC 20210; telephone: (202) 
693–2199. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Background 

The Department of Labor, as part of its 
continuing effort to reduce paperwork 
and respondent (e.g., an employee filing 
a retaliation complaint) burden, 
conducts a preclearance consultation 
program to provide the public with an 
opportunity to comment on proposed 
and continuing information collection 
requirements in accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44 
U.S.C. 3506(c)(2)(A)). This program 
ensures that information is in the 
desired format, reporting burden (time 
and costs) is minimal, collection 
instruments are clearly understood, and 
OSHA’s estimate of the information 
collection burden is accurate. 

The Agency is responsible for 
investigating alleged violations of 
‘‘whistleblower’’ provisions contained 
in a number of statutes. These 
whistleblower provisions generally 
prohibit retaliation by employers against 
employees who report alleged violations 
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