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Healthcare Network Accreditation 
Commission (‘‘EHNAC’’) has filed 
written notifications simultaneously 
with the Attorney General and the 
Federal Trade Commission disclosing 
(1) the name and principal place of 
business of the standards development 
organization and (2) the nature and 
scope of its standards development 
activities. The notifications were filed 
for the purpose of invoking the Act’s 
provisions limiting the recovery of 
antitrust plaintiffs to actual damages 
under specified circumstances. 

Pursuant to section 6(b) of the Act, the 
name and principal place of business of 
the standards development organization 
is: Electronic Healthcare Network 
Accreditation Commission, Farmington, 
CT. The nature and scope of EHNAC’s 
standards development activities are: to 
set standards for electronic health care 
industry participants to facilitate the 
electronic transmission of bills and 
payments in a manner consistent with 
all federal laws and regulations. EHNAC 
establishes criteria to determine 
whether individual electronic industry 
participants are compliant with industry 
standards, and it provides accreditation 
to electronic health care industry 
participants to certify that such 
participants are compliant with 
applicable standards. The standards 
promote excellence, innovation, 
cooperation, open competition and 
timely regulatory compliance within the 
health care industry in order to improve 
the quality of healthcare delivery, to 
protect the security and privacy of 
patient-identifiable information and 
achieve administrative simplification 
and cost savings.

Dorothy B. Fountain, 
Deputy Director of Operations, Antitrust 
Division.
[FR Doc. 05–9528 Filed 5–11–05; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–11–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993—Southwest Research 
Institute: Joint Industry Project for 
Fluid Properties Meter Development 
and Support 

Correction 

In notice document 05–1986 
appearing on pages 5487–5488 in the 
issue of Wednesday, February 2, 2005, 
make the following corrections: 

1. On page 5488, in the first column, 
second through third line, ‘‘SwRI: Fluid 

Properties Meter’’ should read 
‘‘Southwest Research Institute’’. 

2. On the same page, in the same 
column, after the nineteenth line, the 
following paragraph should be added: 
‘‘Membership in this group research 
project remains open, and participants 
intend to file additional written 
notification disclosing all changes in 
membership or planned activities.’’

Dorothy B. Fountain, 
Deputy Director of Operations Antitrust 
Division.
[FR Doc. 05–9524 Filed 5–11–05; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–11–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993—VSI Alliance 

Notice is hereby given that, on April 
6, 2005, pursuant to section 6(a) of the 
National Cooperative Research and 
Production Act of 1993, 15 U.S.C. 4301 
et seq. (‘‘the Act’’), VSI Alliance has 
filed written notifications 
simultaneously with the Attorney 
General and the Federal Trade 
Commission disclosing changes in its 
membership. The notifications were 
filed for the purpose of extending the 
Act’s provisions limiting the recovery of 
antitrust plaintiffs to actual damages 
under specified circumstances. 
Specifically, IPTC Corporation, Tokyo, 
Japan; and Consortium Brazil-IP 
Network, Recife, Brazil have been added 
as parties to this venture. Also, 
Pittsburgh Digital Greenhouse, 
Pittsburgh, PA; Amphion 
Semiconductor, Ltd., Belfast, Ireland; 
Denso Corporation, Aichi, Japan; 
Digitas, Tranby, Normway; and Bitboys 
Oy, Noormarkku, Finland have 
withdrawn as parties to this venture. 

No other changes have been made in 
either the membership or planned 
activity of the group research project. 
Membership in this group research 
project remains open, and VSI Alliance 
intends to file additional written 
notification disclosing all changes in 
membership. 

On November 29, 1996, VSI Alliance 
filed its original notification pursuant to 
section 6(a) of the Act. The Department 
of Justice published a notice in the 
Federal Register pursuant to section 
6(b) of the Act on March 4, 1997 (62 FR 
9812). 

The last notification was filed with 
the Department on January 19, 2005. A 
notice was published in the Federal 

Register pursuant to section 6(b) of the 
Act on February 23, 2005 (70 FR 8823).

Dorothy B. Fountain, 
Deputy Director of Operations, Antitrust 
Division.
[FR Doc. 05–9526 Filed 5–11–05; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993—World Airline 
Entertainment Association 

Notice is hereby given that, on April 
18, 2005, pursuant to section 6(a) of the 
National Cooperative Research and 
Production Act of 1993, 15 U.S.C. 4301 
et seq. (‘‘the Act’’), World Airline 
Entertainment Association (‘‘WAEA’’) 
has filed written notifications 
simultaneously with the Attorney 
General and the Federal Trade 
Commission disclosing additions or 
changes to its standards development 
activities. The notifications were filed 
for the purpose of extending the Act’s 
provisions limiting the recovery of 
antitrust plaintiffs to actual damages 
under specified circumstances. 
Specifically, on February 25, 2005, 
WAEA’s Board of Directors adopted 
WAEA Specification 1289–2. This 
document establishes guidelines for the 
recording and duplication of program 
master tapes for airborne audio 
software, and incorporates guidelines 
for compact disc replication and digital 
encoding of audio files. 

On September 15, 2004, WAEA filed 
its original notification pursuant to 
section 6(a) of the Act. The Department 
of Justice published a notice in the 
Federal Register pursuant to section 
6(b) of the Act on November 3, 2004 (69 
FR 64108).

Dorothy B. Fountain, 
Deputy Director of Operations, Antitrust 
Division.
[FR Doc. 05–9525 Filed 5–11–05; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–11–M

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR

Bureau of Labor Statistics 

Federal Economic Statistics Advisory 
Committee; Notice of Open Meeting 
and Agenda 

The eighth meeting of the Federal 
Economic Statistics Advisory 
Committee will be held on June 10, 
2005, in the Postal Square Building, 2 
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