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to Congress on the cost of operating POVs
will be published in the Federal Register.

[FR Doc. 01–1466 Filed 1–19–01; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 6820–34–U

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS
COMMISSION

47 CFR Part 1

[FCC 00–352]

Waivers, Reductions and Deferrals of
Regulatory Fees; Correction

AGENCY: Federal Communications
Commission.
ACTION: Final rule; correction.

SUMMARY: The Federal Communications
Commission published in the Federal
Register of December 18, 2000, a
document that was to deny the petition
for reconsideration filed by the Cellular
Telecommunications Industry
Association on August 2, 1999 regarding
the Report and Order in the matter of
Assessment and Collection of
Regulatory Fees for Fiscal Year 1999
and also amend the Commission’s rule
regarding petitions for reduction of
regulatory fees. Inadvertently, the
document did not include the paragraph
noting the denial of the petition for
reconsideration. This document corrects
that error.
DATES: Effective January 17, 2001.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Carla Conover, Office of General
Counsel, (202) 418–7882.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In FR Doc.
00–31946, published in the Federal
Register of December 18, 2000 (65 FR
78989), the paragraph noting the denial
of a petition for reconsideration was not
included. This correction includes that
paragraph.

1. This supplementary information is
a summary of the Commission’s
Memorandum Opinion and Order on
Reconsideration (Order) in MD Docket
No. 98–200 (FCC 00–352), adopted
September 21, 2000, and released
October 10, 2000. The complete text of
the Order is available for inspection and
copying during normal business hours
in the FCC Reference Information
Center, Courtyard Level, 445 12th
Street, SW., Washington, DC, and also
may be purchased from the
Commission’s copy contractor,
International Transcription Services
(ITS, Inc.), CY–B400, 445 12th Street,
SW., Washington, DC.

2. In FR Doc. 00–31946, on page
78989, in the first column, in the
Summary, insert this sentence at the
end of the paragraph: This document

also denies the petition for
reconsideration filed by the Cellular
Telecommunications Industry
Association on August 2, 1999 regarding
the Report and Order adopted on June
11, 1999 in the matter of Assessment
and Collection of Regulatory Fees for
Fiscal Year 1999.

3. On page 78989, in the third
column, insert the following before the
List of Subjects in 47 CFR Part 1: 4. The
petition for reconsideration filed by the
Cellular Telecommunications Industry
Association on August 2, 1999 regarding
the Report and Order adopted on June
11, 1999 in the matter of Assessment
and Collection of Regulatory Fees for
Fiscal Year 1999 is denied.
Federal Communications Commission.
Magalie Roman Salas,
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 01–1251 Filed 1–19–01; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 6712–01–U

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

Fish and Wildlife Service

50 CFR Parts 13 and 17

RIN AG44

Response to Public Comments on
Amending General Permitting
Regulations Relating to Habitat
Conservation Plans, Safe Harbor
Agreements and Candidate
Conservation Agreements With
Assurances

AGENCIES: Fish and Wildlife Service,
Department of the Interior.
ACTION: Final rule; affirmation.

SUMMARY: On June 17, 1999, the U.S.
Fish and Wildlife Service (Service)
published a final rule amending parts 13
and 17 of title 50 of the Code of Federal
Regulations (CFR). This rule created
regulations for the new Safe Harbor and
Candidate Conservation Agreements
with Assurances policies, and also
dictated when the permitting
requirements of Habitat Conservation
Plan (HCP), Safe Harbor Agreement
(SHA) and Candidate Conservation
Agreement with Assurances (CCAA)
permits, issued under the authority of
section 10 of the Endangered Species
Act of 1973, as amended (ESA), will
vary from the Service’s general part 13
permitting requirements. On February
11, 2000, we published a request for
additional public comment on seven
specific regulatory changes that altered
the applicability of 50 CFR part 13 to
permits for HCPs, SHAs and CCAAs.
Based on our review of the comments,

we have decided not to repropose any
of the amendments to part 13 or part 17.
DATES: Final rule published on June 17,
1999 remains effective.
ADDRESSES: Chief, Division of
Conservation and Classification, or
Chief, Division of Consultation, Habitat
Conservation Planning and Recovery,
U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service, 4401
North Fairfax Drive, Room 420,
Arlington, Virginia 22203 (Telephone
703/358–2171; Facsimile 703/358–
1735).
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Nancy Gloman, Chief, Division of
Conservation and Classification, U.S.
Fish and Wildlife Service (telephone
703/358–2171, facsimile 703/358–1735),
or Renne Lohoefener, Chief, Division of
Consultation, Habitat Conservation
Planning and Recovery, U.S. Fish and
Wildlife Service (telephone 703/358–
2171, facsimile 703/358–1735).
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION:

Background
The Service administers a variety of

conservation laws that authorize the
issuance of certain permits for otherwise
prohibited activities. In 1974, we
published 50 CFR part 13 to consolidate
the administration of various permitting
programs. Part 13 established a uniform
framework of general administrative
conditions and procedures that would
govern the application, processing, and
issuance of all Service permits. We
intended that the general part 13
permitting provisions would apply to
the various Federal wildlife and plant
programs administered by the Service
and that the specific permitting
requirements applicable to each of these
programs would supplement rather than
replace the general part 13
requirements.

Subsequent to the 1974 publication of
part 13, we added many wildlife
regulatory programs to title 50 of the
CFR. For example, we added part 18 in
1974 to implement the Marine Mammal
Protection Act, modified and expanded
part 17 in 1975 to implement the ESA,
and added part 23 in 1977 to implement
the Convention on International Trade
in Endangered Species of Wild Fauna
and Flora (CITES). These parts
contained their own specific permitting
requirements in addition to the general
permitting provisions of part 13.

With respect to most of the programs
under the ESA, the combination of part
13’s general permitting provisions and
part 17’s specific permitting provisions
have worked well since 1975. However,
in three areas of emerging permitting
policy under the ESA, the general
approach of part 13 has turned out to be
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