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DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

The Department of Agriculture has 
submitted the following information 
collection requirement(s) to OMB for 
review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
Public Law 104–13. Comments are 
requested regarding: whether the 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of burden including 
the validity of the methodology and 
assumptions used; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and ways to 
minimize the burden of the collection of 
information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

Comments regarding this information 
collection received by December 30, 
2022 will be considered. Written 
comments and recommendations for the 
proposed information collection should 
be submitted within 30 days of the 
publication of this notice on the 
following website www.reginfo.gov/ 
public/do/PRAMain. Find this 
particular information collection by 
selecting ‘‘Currently under 30-day 
Review—Open for Public Comments’’ or 
by using the search function. 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless the collection of information 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number and the agency informs 
potential persons who are to respond to 
the collection of information that such 
persons are not required to respond to 
the collection of information unless it 

displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 

Natural Resources and Conservation 
Service 

Title: Volunteer Program—Earth 
Team. 

OMB Control Number: 0578–0024. 
Summary of Collection: Volunteers 

have been a valuable human resource to 
the Natural Resources Conservation 
Service (NRCS) since 1985. Collection of 
this information is necessary to 
document service of volunteers as 
required by 7 U.S.C. 2272: Volunteers 
for Department of Agriculture Programs 
and Departmental Regulation DR 4230– 
001—Volunteer Programs. Agencies are 
authorized to recruit, train and accept, 
with regard to Civil Service 
classification laws, rules, or regulations, 
the services of individuals to serve 
without compensation. Volunteers may 
assist in any agency program/project 
and may perform any activities which 
agency employees are allowed to do. 
Volunteers must be 14 years of age. 
NRCS will collect information using 
NRCS forms NRCS–Per–002 and NRCS– 
PER–004. 

Need and Use of the Information: 
NRCS will collect information on the 
type of skills and type of work the 
volunteers are interested in doing. The 
collected information will be used by 
supervisors of volunteers and the 
International Program Division to 
evaluate potential international 
volunteers and evaluate the 
effectiveness of the volunteer program. 
Without the information, NRCS would 
not know which individuals are 
interested in volunteering. 

Description of Respondents: 
Individuals or households; Business or 
other for-profit; State, Local, or Tribal 
Government. 

Number of Respondents: 8,220. 
Frequency of Responses: Reporting: 

Semi-Annually. 
Total Burden Hours: 1,011. 

Ruth Brown, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2022–26058 Filed 11–29–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–16–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[B–29–2022] 

Foreign-Trade Zone (FTZ) 57— 
Mecklenburg County, North Carolina; 
Authorization of Production Activity; 
Exela Pharma Sciences, LLC 
(Pharmaceutical Products), Lenoir, 
North Carolina 

On July 28, 2022, the Charlotte 
Regional Business Alliance, grantee of 
FTZ 57, submitted a notification of 
proposed production activity to the FTZ 
Board on behalf of Exela Pharma 
Sciences, LLC, within Subzone 57D, in 
Lenoir, North Carolina. 

The notification was processed in 
accordance with the regulations of the 
FTZ Board (15 CFR part 400), including 
notice in the Federal Register inviting 
public comment (87 FR 47962, August 
5, 2022). On November 25, 2022, the 
applicant was notified of the FTZ 
Board’s decision that no further review 
of the activity is warranted at this time. 
The production activity described in the 
notification was authorized, subject to 
the FTZ Act and the FTZ Board’s 
regulations, including Section 400.14. 

Dated: November 25, 2022. 
Andrew McGilvray, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–26100 Filed 11–29–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[B–32–2022] 

Foreign-Trade Zone (FTZ) 27—Boston, 
Massachusetts; Authorization of 
Production Activity; Wyeth 
Pharmaceuticals, LLC (COVID–19 
Vaccine), Andover, Massachusetts 

On July 27, 2022, Wyeth 
Pharmaceuticals, LLC, submitted a 
notification of proposed production 
activity to the FTZ Board for its facility 
within Subzone 27R, in Andover, 
Massachusetts. 

The notification was processed in 
accordance with the regulations of the 
FTZ Board (15 CFR part 400), including 
notice in the Federal Register inviting 
public comment (87 FR 47962, August 
5, 2022). On November 25, 2022, the 
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applicant was notified of the FTZ 
Board’s decision that no further review 
of the activity is warranted at this time. 
The production activity described in the 
notification was authorized, subject to 
the FTZ Act and the FTZ Board’s 
regulations, including Section 400.14. 

Dated: November 25, 2022. 

Andrew McGilvray, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–26101 Filed 11–29–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[B–30–2022] 

Foreign-Trade Zone (FTZ) 167—Green 
Bay, Wisconsin; Authorization of 
Production Activity; Shipbuilders of 
Wisconsin, Inc. d/b/a Burger Boat 
Company (Construction and Repair of 
Vessels and Hulls), Manitowoc, 
Wisconsin 

On July 28, 2022, Shipbuilders of 
Wisconsin, Inc. d/b/a Burger Boat 
Company submitted a notification of 
proposed production activity to the FTZ 
Board for its facility within FTZ 167, in 
Manitowoc, Wisconsin. 

The notification was processed in 
accordance with the regulations of the 
FTZ Board (15 CFR part 400), including 
notice in the Federal Register inviting 
public comment (87 FR 47961, August 
5, 2022). On November 25, 2022, the 
applicant was notified of the FTZ 
Board’s decision that no further review 
of the activity is warranted at this time. 
The production activity described in the 
notification was authorized, subject to 
the FTZ Act and the FTZ Board’s 
regulations, including Section 400.14. 

Dated: November 25, 2022. 

Andrew McGilvray, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–26099 Filed 11–29–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

National Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration 

[RTID 0648–XC403] 

Fisheries of the Exclusive Economic 
Zone Off Alaska; Bering Sea and 
Aleutian Islands Management Area; 
Cost Recovery Fee Notice for the 
Western Alaska Community 
Development Quota and Trawl Limited 
Access Privilege Programs 

AGENCY: National Marine Fisheries 
Service (NMFS), National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA), 
Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice of standard prices and 
fee percentage. 

SUMMARY: NMFS publishes standard 
prices and fee percentages for cost 
recovery for the Amendment 80 
Program, the American Fisheries Act 
(AFA) Program, the Aleutian Islands 
Pollock (AIP) Program, and the Western 
Alaska Community Development Quota 
(CDQ) Program in the Bering Sea 
Aleutian Islands (BSAI) management 
area. The fee percentages for 2022 are 
0.87 percent for the Amendment 80 
Program, 0.32 percent for the AFA 
inshore cooperatives, 0 percent for the 
AIP program, and 0.85 percent for the 
CDQ Program. This notice is intended to 
provide the 2022 standard prices and 
fee percentages to calculate the required 
payment for cost recovery fees due by 
December 31, 2022. 
DATES: The standard prices and fee 
percentages are valid on November 30, 
2022. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Charmaine Weeks, Fee Coordinator, 
907–586–7231. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 
Section 304(d) of the Magnuson- 

Stevens Fishery Conservation and 
Management Act (Magnuson-Stevens 
Act) authorizes and requires that NMFS 
collect cost recovery fees for limited 
access privilege programs and the CDQ 
Program. Cost recovery fees recover 
NMFS’ actual costs directly related to its 
management, data collection, and 
enforcement of the programs. Section 
304(d) of the Magnuson-Stevens Act 
mandates that cost recovery fees not 

exceed 3 percent of the annual ex-vessel 
value of fish harvested under any 
program subject to a cost recovery fee 
and that the fee be collected either at the 
time of landing, filing of a landing 
report, or sale of such fish during a 
fishing season or in the last quarter of 
the calendar year in which the fish is 
harvested. 

NMFS manages the Amendment 80 
Program, AFA Program, and AIP 
Program as limited access privilege 
programs. On January 5, 2016, NMFS 
published a final rule to implement cost 
recovery for these three limited access 
privilege programs and the CDQ 
program (81 FR 150, January 5, 2016). 
The designated representative (for the 
purposes of cost recovery) for each 
program is responsible for submitting 
the fee payment to NMFS on or before 
the due date of December 31 of the year 
in which the landings were made. The 
total dollar amount of the fee due is 
determined by multiplying the NMFS 
published fee percentage by the ex- 
vessel value of all landings under the 
program made during the fishing year. 
NMFS publishes this notice of the fee 
percentages for the Amendment 80, 
AFA, AIP, and CDQ programs in the 
Federal Register by December 1 each 
year. 

Standard Prices 

The fee liability is based on the ex- 
vessel value of fish harvested in each 
program. For purposes of calculating 
cost recovery fees, NMFS calculates a 
standard ex-vessel price (standard price) 
for each species. A standard price is 
determined using information on 
landings purchased (volume) and ex- 
vessel value paid (value). For most 
groundfish species, NMFS annually 
summarizes volume and value 
information for landings of all fishery 
species subject to cost recovery to 
estimate a standard price for each 
species. The standard prices are 
described in U.S. dollars per pound for 
landings made during the year. The 
standard prices for all species in the 
Amendment 80, AFA, AIP, and CDQ 
programs are provided in Table 1. Each 
landing made under each program is 
multiplied by the appropriate standard 
price to arrive at an ex-vessel value for 
each landing. These values are summed 
together to arrive at the ex-vessel value 
of each program (fishery value). 
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