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653–4608, or by email at swebb@
imls.gov, or by teletype (TTY/TDD) for 
persons with hearing difficulty at 202– 
653–4614. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Institute of Museum and Library 
Services is the primary source of federal 
support for the nation’s libraries and 
museums. We advance, support, and 
empower America’s museums, libraries, 
and related organizations through grant 
making, research, and policy 
development. Our vision is a nation 
where museums and libraries work 
together to transform the lives of 
individuals and communities. To learn 
more, visit www.imls.gov. 

Current Actions: This notice proposes 
the clearance of the IMLS Grants to 
States Program ‘‘Five-Year State Plan 
Guidelines for State Library 
Administrative Agencies’’. The 60-day 
Notice for the ‘‘Notice of Proposed 
Information Collection Requests: IMLS 
Grants to States Program ‘‘Five-Year 
State Plan Guidelines for State Library 
Administrative Agencies’’ was 
published in the Federal Register on 
March 1, 2018 (83 FR 8902). The agency 
has taken into consideration the one 
comment that was received under this 
notice. 

The Grants to States program is the 
largest source of Federal funding 
support for library services in the U.S. 
Using a population based formula, more 
than $150 million is distributed among 
the State Library Administrative 
Agencies (SLAAs) every year. SLAAs 
are official agencies charged by law with 
the extension and development of 
library services, and they are located in: 

• Each of the 50 States of the United 
States, and the District of Columbia; 

• The Territories (the Commonwealth 
of Puerto Rico, the U.S. Virgin Islands, 
Guam, American Samoa, and the 
Commonwealth of the Northern Mariana 
Islands); and 

• The Freely Associated States (the 
Republic of the Marshall Islands, the 
Federated States of Micronesia, and the 
Republic of Palau). 

Each year, over 1,500 Grants to States 
projects support the purposes and 
priorities outlined in the Library 
Services and Technology Act (LSTA). 
(See 20 U.S.C. 9121 et seq.) SLAAs may 
use the funds to support statewide 
initiatives and services, and they may 
also distribute the funds through 
competitive subawards (subgrants or 
cooperative agreements) to public, 
academic, research, school, or special 
libraries or library consortia (for-profit 
and Federal libraries are not eligible). 
Each SLAA must submit a plan that 
details library services goals for a five- 

year period. (20 U.S.C. 9134). SLAAs 
must also conduct a five-year evaluation 
of library services based on that plan. 
These plans and evaluations are the 
foundation for improving practice and 
informing policy. Each SLAA receives 
IMLS funding to support the five year 
period through a series of overlapping, 
two year grant awards. 

Agency: Institute of Museum and 
Library Services. 

Title: IMLS Five-Year State Plan 
Guidelines for State Library 
Administrative Agencies. 

OMB Number: 3137–0029. 
Frequency: Once every five years. 
Affected Public: State and Territory 

Library Administrative Agencies. 
Number of Respondents: 59. 
Estimated Average Burden per 

Response: 90 hours. 
Estimated Total Burden: 5310 hours. 
Total Annualized capital/startup 

costs: n/a. 
Total Five Year Costs: $146,928. 
Dated: May 8, 2018. 

Kim Miller, 
Grants Management Specialist, Office of 
Grants Policy and Management. 
[FR Doc. 2018–10045 Filed 5–10–18; 8:45 am] 
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NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

Advisory Committee on Reactor 
Safeguards (ACRS): Meeting of the 
ACRS Subcommittee on Power 
Uprates; Notice of Meeting 

The ACRS Subcommittee on Power 
Uprates will hold a meeting on May 16, 
2018, at 11545 Rockville Pike, Room T– 
2B1, Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

The meeting will be open to public 
attendance with the exception of 
portions that may be closed to protect 
information that is proprietary pursuant 
to 5 U.S.C. 552b(c)(4). The agenda for 
the subject meeting shall be as follows: 

Wednesday, May 16, 2018—8:30 a.m. 
Until 5:00 p.m. 

The Subcommittee will review the 
Brunswick Steam Electric Plant Units 1 
and 2 Maximum Extended Load Line 
Limit Analysis Plus license amendment 
request and associated NRC staff safety 
evaluation. The Subcommittee will hear 
presentations by and hold discussions 
with the NRC staff, Brunswick and other 
interested persons regarding this matter. 
The Subcommittee will gather 
information, analyze relevant issues and 
facts, and formulate proposed positions 
and actions, as appropriate, for 
deliberation by the Full Committee. 

Members of the public desiring to 
provide oral statements and/or written 
comments should notify the Designated 
Federal Official (DFO), Weidong Wang 
(Telephone 301–415–6279 or Email: 
Weidong.Wang@nrc.gov) one day prior 
to the meeting, if possible, so that 
appropriate arrangements can be made. 
Thirty-five hard copies of each 
presentation or handout should be 
provided to the DFO thirty minutes 
before the meeting. In addition, one 
electronic copy of each presentation 
should be emailed to the DFO one day 
before the meeting. If an electronic copy 
cannot be provided within this 
timeframe, presenters should provide 
the DFO with a CD containing each 
presentation at least thirty minutes 
before the meeting. Electronic 
recordings will be permitted only 
during those portions of the meeting 
that are open to the public. Detailed 
procedures for the conduct of and 
participation in ACRS meetings were 
published in the Federal Register on 
October 4, 2017 (82 FR 46312). 

Detailed meeting agendas and meeting 
transcripts are available on the NRC 
website at http://www.nrc.gov/reading- 
rm/doc-collections/acrs. Information 
regarding topics to be discussed, 
changes to the agenda, whether the 
meeting has been canceled or 
rescheduled, and the time allotted to 
present oral statements can be obtained 
from the website cited above or by 
contacting the identified DFO. 
Moreover, in view of the possibility that 
the schedule for ACRS meetings may be 
adjusted by the Chairman as necessary 
to facilitate the conduct of the meeting, 
persons planning to attend should check 
with these references if such 
rescheduling would result in a major 
inconvenience. 

If attending this meeting, please enter 
through the One White Flint North 
building, 11555 Rockville Pike, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. After 
registering with Security, please contact 
Mr. Theron Brown (Telephone 301– 
415–6702) to be escorted to the meeting 
room. 

Dated: May 7, 2018. 

Mark L. Banks, 
Chief, Technical Support Branch, Advisory 
Committee on Reactor Safeguards. 
[FR Doc. 2018–09996 Filed 5–10–18; 8:45 am] 
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