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1 18 CFR 4.34(b)(5). 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 6/10/24. 
Docket Numbers: ER24–2063–000. 
Applicants: Lincoln Power, L.L.C. 
Description: Tariff Amendment: 

Notice of Cancellation of Market-Based 
Rate Tariff to be effective 5/21/2024. 

Filed Date: 5/20/24. 
Accession Number: 20240520–5160. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 6/10/24. 
Docket Numbers: ER24–2064–000. 
Applicants: PJM Interconnection, 

L.L.C. 
Description: 205(d) Rate Filing: Notice 

of Cancellation of WMPA SA No. 7006, 
Queue AF2–221 to be effective 7/20/ 
2024. 

Filed Date: 5/20/24. 
Accession Number: 20240520–5187. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 6/10/24. 
Docket Numbers: ER24–2065–000. 
Applicants: Duke Energy Florida, 

LLC. 
Description: 205(d) Rate Filing: DEF– 

SECI SA No. 143 Amended and Restated 
NITSA to be effective 4/21/2024. 

Filed Date: 5/20/24. 
Accession Number: 20240520–5188. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 6/10/24. 
The filings are accessible in the 

Commission’s eLibrary system (https://
elibrary.ferc.gov/idmws/search/ 
fercgensearch.asp) by querying the 
docket number. 

Any person desiring to intervene, to 
protest, or to answer a complaint in any 
of the above proceedings must file in 
accordance with Rules 211, 214, or 206 
of the Commission’s Regulations (18 
CFR 385.211, 385.214, or 385.206) on or 
before 5:00 p.m. Eastern time on the 
specified comment date. Protests may be 
considered, but intervention is 
necessary to become a party to the 
proceeding. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, environmental justice 
communities, Tribal members and 
others, access publicly available 
information and navigate Commission 
processes. For public inquiries and 
assistance with making filings such as 
interventions, comments, or requests for 
rehearing, the public is encouraged to 
contact OPP at (202) 502–6595 or OPP@
ferc.gov. 

Dated: May 20, 2024. 
Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Acting Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2024–11507 Filed 5–23–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 4472–031] 

Union Falls Hydropower, L.P.; Notice 
of Reasonable Period of Time for 
Water Quality Certification Application 

On May 20, 2024, New York State 
Department of Environmental 
Conservation (New York DEC) 
submitted to the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission (Commission) 
notice that it received a complete 
request for a Clean Water Act section 
401(a)(1) water quality certification from 
Union Falls Hydropower, L.P., in 
conjunction with the above captioned 
project, on April 25, 2024. Pursuant to 
section 4.34(b)(5) of the Commission’s 
regulations,1 we hereby notify New 
York DEC of the following: 

Date of Receipt of the Certification 
Request: April 25, 2024. 

Reasonable Period of Time to Act on 
the Certification Request: One year, 
April 25, 2025. 

If New York DEC fails or refuses to act 
on the water quality certification request 
on or before the above date, then the 
certifying authority is deemed waived 
pursuant to section 401(a)(1) of the 
Clean Water Act, 33 U.S.C. 1341(a)(1). 

Dated: May 20, 2024. 
Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Acting Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2024–11502 Filed 5–23–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[FRL OP–OFA–127] 

Environmental Impact Statements; 
Notice of Availability 

Responsible Agency: Office of Federal 
Activities, General Information 202– 
564–5632 or https://www.epa.gov/nepa. 
Weekly receipt of Environmental Impact 

Statements (EIS) 
Filed May 13, 2024 10 a.m. EST 

Through May 20, 2024 10 a.m. EST 
Pursuant to 40 CFR 1506.9. 

Notice: Section 309(a) of the Clean Air 
Act requires that EPA make public its 

comments on EISs issued by other 
Federal agencies. EPA’s comment letters 
on EISs are available at: https://
cdxapps.epa.gov/cdx-enepa-II/public/ 
action/eis/search. 
EIS No. 20240084, Revised Final, NRCS, 

RI, Pocasset River Flood Damage 
Reduction Project, Review Period 
Ends: 06/24/2024, Contact: R. Phou 
Vongkhamdy 401–822–8815. 

EIS No. 20240085, Final, USAF, TX, B– 
21 Beddown MOB 2/MOB 3, Review 
Period Ends: 06/24/2024, Contact: 
Chris Moore 325–696–4820. 

EIS No. 20240086, Final, BLM, NV, Bald 
Mountain Mine Plan of Operations 
Amendment Juniper Project, Review 
Period Ends: 06/28/2024, Contact: 
Tiera Arbogast 775–289–1803. 

EIS No. 20240087, Final, USACE, FL, 
Lake Okeechobee System Operating 
Manual, Review Period Ends: 06/24/ 
2024, Contact: Jacob Thompson 904– 
232–1893. 

EIS No. 20240088, Final, CHSRA, CA, 
California High-Speed Rail Authority 
Palmdale to Burbank Project Section: 
Final Environmental Impact Report/ 
Environmental Impact Statement, 
Review Period Ends: 06/24/2024, 
Contact: Stefan Galvez-Abadia 800– 
630–1039. 
Dated: May 20, 2024. 

Cindy S. Barger, 
Director, NEPA Compliance Division, Office 
of Federal Activities. 
[FR Doc. 2024–11462 Filed 5–23–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[FRL–11963–01–OA] 

Request for Nominations for the 
Science Advisory Board Microbial and 
Disinfection Byproducts (MDBP) 
Revisions Review Panel 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA) Science Advisory Board 
(SAB) Staff Office requests public 
nominations of scientific experts to form 
a Panel to review the draft analyses to 
support EPA’s revisions of the Microbial 
and Disinfection Byproducts (MDBP) 
National Primary Drinking Water rules. 
EPA is currently conducting analyses to 
evaluate eight (i.e., chlorite, 
Cryptosporidium, haloacetic acids, 
heterotrophic bacteria, Giardia lamblia, 
Legionella, total trihalomethanes, and 
viruses) National Primary Drinking 
Water Regulations (NPDWRs) for 
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potential regulatory revisions with a 
consideration of risk tradeoffs across 
microbial control versus disinfection 
byproduct formation. EPA is exploring 
approaches to determine how public 
water systems (PWSs) can achieve 
enhanced precursor removal to reduce 
disinfection byproduct (DBP) formation 
in drinking water. EPA’s analysis 
summarizes the current literature on 
DBP precursor occurrence and 
treatment, identifies technology based 
on effectiveness and feasibility, and 
determines the unit cost of technologies 
for enhanced removal. EPA is also 
preparing analyses to support a 
numerical disinfectant residual 
requirement within the drinking water 
distribution system. This analysis will 
include an inventory on vulnerable 
PWSs, feasibility studies for 
maintaining a numerical disinfectant 
residual, and methods for assessing 
effectiveness of a numerical residual in 
controlling microbial growth in the 
distribution system including for 
opportunistic pathogens such as 
Legionella. The SAB MDBP Revisions 
Review Panel will consider whether the 
conclusions found in the EPA’s analyses 
are clearly presented and scientifically 
supported. The Panel will also be asked 
to provide recommendations on how the 
analyses may be strengthened. 
DATES: Nominations should be 
submitted by June 14, 2024 per the 
instructions below. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Any 
member of the public wishing further 
information regarding this Notice and 
Request for Nominations may contact 
Carolyn Kilgore, Designated Federal 
Officer (DFO), EPA Science Advisory 
Board via telephone/voice mail (202) 
564–0230, or email at kilgore.carolyn@
epa.gov. General information 
concerning the EPA SAB can be found 
at the EPA SAB website at https://
sab.epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background: The SAB (42 U.S.C. 
4365) is a chartered Federal Advisory 
Committee that provides independent 
scientific and technical peer review, 
advice, and recommendations to the 
EPA Administrator on the technical 
basis for EPA actions. As a Federal 
advisory committee, the SAB conducts 
business in accordance with the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (FACA) (5 
U.S.C. app. 2) and related regulations. 
The SAB Staff Office is forming an 
expert panel, the SAB MDBP Revisions 
Review Panel, under the auspices of the 
Chartered SAB. The SAB MDBP 
Revisions Review Panel will provide 
advice through the chartered SAB. The 
SAB and the SAB MDBP Revisions 

Review Panel will comply with the 
provisions of FACA and all appropriate 
SAB Staff Office procedural policies. 
The SAB MDBP Revisions Review Panel 
will conduct a review of analyses on 
two specific topics under consideration 
for potential regulatory revisions. EPA is 
exploring approaches to determine how 
PWSs can achieve enhanced precursor 
removal to reduce DBP formation in 
drinking water. EPA’s analysis 
summarizes the current literature on 
DBP precursor occurrence and 
treatment, identifies technology based 
on effectiveness and feasibility, and 
determines the unit cost of technologies 
for enhanced removal. EPA is also 
preparing analyses to support a 
numerical disinfectant residual 
requirement within the drinking water 
distribution system. 

This analysis will include an 
inventory on vulnerable PWSs, 
feasibility studies for maintaining a 
numerical disinfectant residual, and 
methods for assessing effectiveness of a 
numerical residual in controlling 
microbial growth in the distribution 
system including for opportunistic 
pathogens such as Legionella. The SAB 
MDBP Revisions Review Panel will 
consider whether the conclusions found 
in the EPA’s draft analyses are clearly 
presented and scientifically supported. 
The Panel will also be asked to provide 
recommendations on how the analyses 
may be strengthened. 

Request for Nominations: The SAB 
Staff Office is seeking nominations of 
nationally and internationally 
recognized scientists with demonstrated 
expertise in the following disciplines: 
Environmental Engineering, specifically: 
design, operation, and maintenance of 
distribution systems used by public 
drinking water systems (PWS); 
Environmental Science; Drinking water 
treatment; Disinfection byproduct 
formation and control; Microbiology; 
Public Health; Water quality; Water 
reuse; Toxicology; Risk assessment; 
Environmental economics; 
Environmental health science. 

Process and Deadline for Submitting 
Nominations: Any interested person or 
organization may nominate qualified 
individuals in the areas of expertise 
described above for possible service on 
the SAB Panel. Individuals may self- 
nominate. Nominations should be 
submitted in electronic format 
(preferred) using the online nomination 
form on the SAB website at https://
sab.epa.gov (see the ‘‘Public Input on 
Membership’’ list under ‘‘Committees, 
Panels, and Membership’’). To be 
considered, nominations should include 
the information requested below. EPA 
values and welcomes diversity. All 

qualified candidates are encouraged to 
apply regardless of sex, race, disability, 
or ethnicity. 

Nominations should be submitted in 
time to arrive no later than June 14, 
2024. The following information should 
be provided on the nomination form: 
contact information for the person 
making the nomination; contact 
information for the nominee; and the 
disciplinary and specific areas of 
expertise of the nominee. Nominees will 
be contacted by the SAB Staff Office and 
will be asked to provide a recent 
curriculum vitae and a narrative 
biographical summary that includes 
current position, educational 
background; research activities; and 
recent service on other national 
advisory committees or national 
professional organizations. Persons 
having questions about the nomination 
procedures, or who are unable to submit 
nominations through the SAB website, 
should contact the DFO at the contact 
information noted above. The names 
and biosketches of qualified nominees 
identified by respondents to this 
Federal Register notice, and additional 
experts identified by the SAB Staff 
Office, will be posted in a List of 
Candidates for the Panel on the SAB 
website at https://sab.epa.gov. Public 
comments on the List of Candidates will 
be accepted for 21 days. The public will 
be requested to provide relevant 
information or other documentation on 
nominees that the SAB Staff Office 
should consider in evaluating 
candidates. 

For the EPA SAB Staff Office, a 
balanced review panel includes 
candidates who possess the necessary 
domains of knowledge, the relevant 
scientific perspectives (which, among 
other factors, can be influenced by work 
history and affiliation), and the 
collective breadth of experience to 
adequately address the charge. In 
forming the expert panel, the SAB Staff 
Office will consider public comments 
on the Lists of Candidates, information 
provided by the candidates themselves, 
and background information 
independently gathered by the SAB 
Staff Office. Selection criteria to be used 
for panel membership include: (a) 
scientific and/or technical expertise, 
knowledge, and experience (primary 
factors); (b) availability and willingness 
to serve; (c) absence of financial 
conflicts of interest; (d) absence of an 
appearance of a loss of impartiality; (e) 
skills working in committees, 
subcommittees and advisory panels; 
and, (f) for the panel as a whole, 
diversity of expertise and scientific 
points of view. 
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The SAB Staff Office’s evaluation of 
an absence of financial conflicts of 
interest will include a review of the 
‘‘Confidential Financial Disclosure 
Form for Environmental Protection 
Agency Special Government 
Employees’’ (EPA Form 3110–48). This 
confidential form is required and allows 
government officials to determine 
whether there is a statutory conflict 
between a person’s public 
responsibilities (which include 
membership on an EPA federal advisory 
committee) and private interests and 
activities, or the appearance of a loss of 
impartiality, as defined by federal 
regulation. The form may be viewed and 
downloaded through the ‘‘Ethics 
Requirements for Advisors’’ link on the 
SAB website at https://sab.epa.gov. This 
form should not be submitted as part of 
a nomination. 

The approved policy under which the 
EPA SAB Office selects members for 
subcommittees and review panels is 
described in the following document: 
Overview of the Panel Formation 
Process at the Environmental Protection 
Agency Science Advisory Board (EPA– 
SAB–EC–02–010), which is posted on 
the SAB website at https://sab.epa.gov. 

V. Khanna Johnston, 
Deputy Director, Science Advisory Board Staff 
Office. 
[FR Doc. 2024–11418 Filed 5–23–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

EXPORT-IMPORT BANK 

[Public Notice: 2024–6041] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request; Generic Clearance 
for the Collection of Qualitative 
Feedback on Agency Service Delivery 

AGENCY: Export-Import Bank of the 
United States. 
ACTION: Submission for OMB review and 
comments request. 

SUMMARY: The Export-Import Bank of 
the United States (EXIM), pursuant to 
the Export-Import Bank Act of 1945, as 
amended, facilitates the finance of the 
export of U.S. goods and services. As 
part of its continuing effort to reduce 
paperwork and respondent burden, 
EXIM invites the general public and 
other Federal agencies to comment on 
the proposed information collection, as 
required by the paperwork Reduction 
Act of 1995. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before July 23, 2024 to be assured of 
consideration. 

ADDRESSES: Comments may be 
submitted electronically on 
www.regulations.gov (EIB 11–01), by 
email to Bryan Rolfe, Bryan.Rolfe@
exim.gov, or by mail to Bryan Rolfe, 
Export-Import Bank of the United 
States, 811 Vermont Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC 20571. 

Comments submitted in response to 
this notice may be made available to the 
public through the www.regulations.gov. 
For this reason, please do not include in 
your comments information of a 
confidential nature, such as sensitive 
personal information or proprietary 
information. If you send an email 
comment, your email address will be 
automatically captured and included as 
part of the comment that is placed in the 
public docket and made available on the 
internet. Please note that responses to 
this public comment request containing 
any routine notice about the 
confidentiality of the communication 
will be treated as public comments that 
may be made available to the public 
notwithstanding the inclusion of the 
routine notice. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: To 
request additional information, please 
Bryan Rolfe, Bryan.Rolfe@exim.gov, 
202–565–3809. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
proposed information collection activity 
provides a means to garner qualitative 
customer and stakeholder feedback in 
an efficient, timely manner, in 
accordance with the Administration’s 
commitment to improving service 
delivery. By qualitative feedback we 
mean information that provides useful 
insights on perceptions and opinions 
but are not statistical surveys that yield 
quantitative results that can be 
generalized to the population of study. 
This feedback will provide insights into 
customer or stakeholder perceptions, 
experiences and expectations, provide 
an early warning of issues with service, 
or focus attention on areas where 
communication, training or changes in 
operations might improve delivery of 
products or services. These collections 
will allow for ongoing, collaborative and 
actionable communications between the 
Agency and its customers and 
stakeholders. It will also allow feedback 
to contribute directly to the 
improvement of program management. 

The solicitation of feedback will target 
areas such as: timeliness, 
appropriateness, accuracy of 
information, courtesy, efficiency of 
service delivery, and resolution of 
issues with service delivery. Responses 
will be assessed to plan and inform 
efforts to improve or maintain the 
quality of service offered to the public. 

If this information is not collected, vital 
feedback from customers and 
stakeholders on the Agency’s services 
will be unavailable. 

The Agency will only submit a 
collection for approval under this 
generic clearance if it meets the 
following conditions: 

• The collections are voluntary; 
• The collections are low-burden for 

respondents (based on considerations of 
total burden hours, total number of 
respondents, or burden-hours per 
respondent) and are low-cost for both 
the respondents and the Federal 
Government; 

• The collections are non- 
controversial and do not raise issues of 
concern to other Federal agencies; 

• Any collection is targeted to the 
solicitation of opinions from 
respondents who have experience with 
the program or may have experience 
with the program in the near future; 

• Personally identifiable information 
(PII) is collected only to the extent 
necessary and is not retained; 

• Information gathered will be used 
only internally for general service 
improvement and program management 
purposes and is not intended for release 
outside of the agency; 

• Information gathered will not be 
used for the purpose of substantially 
informing influential policy decisions; 
and 

• Information gathered will yield 
qualitative information; the collections 
will not be designed or expected to 
yield statistically reliable results or used 
as though the results are generalizable to 
the population of study. 

Feedback collected under this generic 
clearance provides useful information, 
but it does not yield data that can be 
generalized to the overall population. 
This type of generic clearance for 
qualitative information will not be used 
for quantitative information collections 
that are designed to yield reliably 
actionable results, such as monitoring 
trends over time or documenting 
program performance. Such data uses 
require more rigorous designs that 
address: the target population to which 
generalizations will be made, the 
sampling frame, the sample design 
(including stratification and clustering), 
the precision requirements or power 
calculations that justify the proposed 
sample size, the expected response rate, 
methods for assessing potential non- 
response bias, the protocols for data 
collection, and any testing procedures 
that were or will be undertaken prior to 
fielding the study. Depending on the 
degree of influence the results are likely 
to have, such collections may still be 
eligible for submission for other generic 
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