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The center will disseminate information 
regarding what works to prevent and 
intervene with school truancy and 
dropout problems and promote the use 
of evidence-based practices through 
training, technical assistance, and 
resources. 

State Juvenile Justice Formula and 
Block Grants Training and Technical 
Assistance Program 

OJJDP will award a cooperative 
agreement to an organization that will 
provide training and technical 
assistance to national, state, and local- 
level grantees and non-grantees that will 
assist them in planning, establishing, 
operating, coordinating, and evaluating 
delinquency prevention and juvenile 
justice systems improvement projects. 
Training and technical assistance topic 
areas will fall under the Title II Formula 
Grants and Juvenile Accountability 
Block Grants (JABG) program areas. The 
successful applicant shall develop, 
enhance, and refine OJJDP program- 
specific training, on, but not limited to, 
state and local level disproportionate 
minority contact reduction strategies, 
state-level compliance monitoring, 
graduated sanctions, and juvenile 
justice systems improvement efforts. 
Additionally, the selected organization 
will coordinate the State Relations and 
Assistance Division’s national training 
conferences. 

Continuations 

In FY 2011, OJJDP will continue to 
support: 

• Child Abuse Training for Judicial 
and Court Personnel. 

• Engaging Law Enforcement To 
Reduce Juvenile Crime, Victimization, 
and Delinquency. 

• State Advisory Group Training and 
Technical Assistance Project. 

Fellowships 

OJJDP’s fellowship program is 
designed to enhance the Office’s efforts 
to develop and improve innovative 
programs that serve children, youth, and 
families. A secondary goal is to provide 
practitioners an opportunity to work 
closely with career and political Federal 
staff, contractors, grantees, and other 
public and private organizations in 
Washington, DC, and across the country. 
The fellow will provide direct 
operational assistance to OJJDP staff 
through assessment and capacity 
building, design and development of 
innovative initiatives and training 
programs, resource development, 
research and evaluation, policy 
development, and outreach and 
awareness. The fellow will also develop 

articles for publication and other 
products on specific topics. 

Concentration of Federal Efforts 
Fellowship 

OJJDP will fund a fellow in the 
Concentration of Federal Efforts 
program for 2 years to strengthen the 
Office’s cross-agency partnership efforts. 
Currently, OJJDP staff and leadership 
participate in dozens of interagency 
efforts. The fellow will build on related 
ongoing work of other Federal agencies, 
develop new cross-agency partnerships 
and initiatives, identify and assess 
opportunities for cross-agency 
partnerships, and track the impact of 
existing partnership efforts. 

Dated: July 1, 2011. 
Jeff Slowikowski, 
Acting Administrator, Office of Juvenile 
Justice and Delinquency Prevention. 
[FR Doc. 2011–17186 Filed 7–7–11; 8:45 am] 
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Sony Music Holdings, Inc., D/B/A Sony 
DADC Americas, a Subsidiary of Sony 
Corporation of America Including On- 
Site Leased Workers From 
Employment Plus, Aerotek, and Robert 
Half, Pitman, NJ; Notice of Affirmative 
Determination Regarding Application 
for Reconsideration 

By application dated June 15, 2011, a 
petitioner requested administrative 
reconsideration of the negative 
determination regarding workers’ 
eligibility to apply for Trade Adjustment 
Assistance (TAA) applicable to workers 
and former workers of Sony Music 
Holdings, Inc. (‘‘SMHI’’), d/b/a Sony 
DADC Americas, a subsidiary of Sony 
Corporation of America, including on- 
site leased workers from Employment 
Plus, Aerotek, and Robert Half, Pitman, 
New Jersey (subject firm). The negative 
determination was issued on May 19, 
2011. The Department’s Notice of 
Determination was published in the 
Federal Register on June 3, 2011 (76 FR 
32229). The workers were engaged in 
activities related to the production of 
optical discs containing content. 

The negative determination was based 
on the findings that there was no 
increase in imports of optical discs (or 
like or directly competitive articles) by 
the subject firm or its customers and no 
shift to or acquisition from a foreign 
country by the workers’ firm of 

production of articles like or directly 
competitive with the optical discs 
produced by the subject firm. 

In the request for reconsideration, the 
petitioner stated that ‘‘There was a shift 
by the workers’ firm to a foreign country 
in the production of articles like those 
produced by the Song DADC–Pitman 
site. The attached documents illustrate 
the project plan by ‘SMHI’ to expand 
customers and increase capacity and 
services in the Sony Nuevo Laredo plant 
located in Mexico.’’ The documents 
include a ‘‘Sony DADC Communique, 
Volume 3, Issue 1’’ (dated January/ 
February 2010), a ‘‘Sony Nuevo Laredo 
Project Plan’’ (undated), copies of 
shipping documents, and copies of 
electronic mail messages. 

The Department has carefully 
reviewed the petitioner’s request for 
reconsideration and the existing record, 
and has determined that the Department 
will conduct further investigation to 
determine if the petitioning workers 
meet the eligibility requirements of the 
Trade Act of 1974, as amended. 

Conclusion 

After careful review of the 
application, I conclude that the claim is 
of sufficient weight to justify 
reconsideration of the U.S. Department 
of Labor’s prior decision. The 
application is, therefore, granted. 

Signed at Washington, DC, this 28th day of 
June, 2011. 
Del Min Amy Chen, 
Certifying Officer, Office of Trade Adjustment 
Assistance. 
[FR Doc. 2011–17088 Filed 7–7–11; 8:45 am] 
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Notice of Determinations Regarding 
Eligibility To Apply for Worker 
Adjustment Assistance and Alternative 
Trade Adjustment Assistance 

In accordance with Section 223 of the 
Trade Act of 1974, as amended (19 
U.S.C. 2273) the Department of Labor 
herein presents summaries of 
determinations regarding eligibility to 
apply for trade adjustment assistance for 
workers (TA–W) number and alternative 
trade adjustment assistance (ATAA) by 
(TA–W) number issued during the 
period of June 13, 2011 through June 24, 
2011. 

In order for an affirmative 
determination to be made for workers of 
a primary firm and a certification issued 
regarding eligibility to apply for worker 
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