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complaint and the notice of 
investigation. Extensions of time for 
submitting responses to the complaint 
and the notice of investigation will not 
be granted unless good cause therefor is 
shown. 

Failure of a respondent to file a timely 
response to each allegation in the 
complaint and in this notice may be 
deemed to constitute a waiver of the 
right to appear and contest the 
allegations of the complaint and this 
notice, and to authorize the 
administrative law judge and the 
Commission, without further notice to 
the respondent, to find the facts to be as 
alleged in the complaint and this notice 
and to enter an initial determination 
and a final determination containing 
such findings, and may result in the 
issuance of an exclusion order or a cease 
and desist order or both directed against 
the respondent. 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: November 12, 2020. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2020–25377 Filed 11–17–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation No. 337–TA–1217] 

Commission Determination Not To 
Review an Initial Determination 
Terminating the Investigation as to 
Respondents East West 
Manufacturing, LLC and East West 
Industries Based on a Consent Order 
Stipulation; Issuance of Consent Order 
and Termination of the Investigation; 
Certain Blowers and Components 
Thereof 

AGENCY: International Trade 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given that 
the U.S. International Trade 
Commission has determined not to 
review an initial determination (‘‘ID’’) 
(Order No. 6) of the presiding 
administrative law judge (‘‘ALJ’’) 
terminating the investigation with 
respect to respondents East West 
Manufacturing, LLC and East West 
Industries (collectively, ‘‘Respondents’’) 
based on a consent order stipulation. 
The Commission has entered a consent 
order and terminated the investigation 
in its entirety. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Cathy Chen, Office of the General 
Counsel, U.S. International Trade 
Commission, 500 E Street SW, 

Washington, DC 20436, telephone 202– 
205–2392. Copies of non-confidential 
documents filed in connection with this 
investigation may be viewed on the 
Commission’s electronic docket (EDIS) 
at https://edis.usitc.gov. For help 
accessing EDIS, please email 
EDIS3Help@usitc.gov. General 
information concerning the Commission 
may also be obtained by accessing its 
internet server at https://www.usitc.gov. 
Hearing-impaired persons are advised 
that information on this matter can be 
obtained by contacting the 
Commission’s TDD terminal on (202) 
205–1810. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Commission instituted this investigation 
on September 8, 2020, based on a 
complaint filed on behalf of Regal Beloit 
America, Inc (‘‘Regal’’) of Beloit, 
Wisconsin. 85 FR 55491–92 (Sep. 8, 
2020). The complaint alleges violations 
of section 337 of the Tariff Act of 1930, 
as amended, 19 U.S.C. 1337, in the 
importation into the United States, the 
sale for importation, or the sale within 
the United States after importation of 
certain blowers and components thereof 
by reason of infringement of one or 
more of claims 1, 2, 7–10, and 15 of U.S. 
Patent No. 8,079,834. Id. at 55492. The 
complaint further alleges that a 
domestic industry exists. Id. at 55491. 
The Commission’s notice of 
investigation named as respondents: 
East West Manufacturing, LLC of 
Atlanta, Georgia and East West 
Industries of Binh Duong, Vietnam. Id. 
at 55492. The Office of Unfair Import 
Investigations did not participate as a 
party. Id. 

On October 14, 2020, Respondents 
filed a motion to terminate the 
investigation with respect to themselves 
based upon a consent order stipulation. 
The motion included a consent order 
stipulation and a proposed consent 
order. 

On October 22, 2020, the ALJ issued 
the subject ID, granting the motion and 
terminating the investigation with 
respect to Respondents based on the 
entry of a consent order. Order No. 6 at 
3 (Oct. 22, 2020). The ID found that the 
consent order stipulation and proposed 
consent order complied with 
Commission Rule 210.21(c)(3) and (4) 
(19 CFR 210.21(c)(3) and (4)). Id. at 1– 
3. The ID also found that termination of 
the investigation with respect to 
Respondents would not be contrary to 
the public interest. Id. at 3. No petitions 
for review of the ID were received. 

The Commission has determined not 
to review the subject ID and to issue a 
consent order. Respondents are hereby 
terminated from the investigation. The 

investigation is terminated in its 
entirety. 

The Commission vote for this 
determination took place on November 
12, 2020. 

The authority for the Commission’s 
determination is contained in section 
337 of the Tariff Act of 1930, as 
amended, 19 U.S.C. 1337, and in Part 
210 of the Commission’s Rules of 
Practice and Procedure, 19 CFR part 
210. 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: November 12, 2020. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2020–25376 Filed 11–17–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation Nos. 701–TA–639–642 and 
731–TA–1475–1492 (Final)] 

Common Alloy Aluminum Sheet From 
Bahrain, Brazil, Croatia, Egypt, 
Germany, Greece, India, Indonesia, 
Italy, Korea, Oman, Romania, Serbia, 
Slovenia, South Africa, Spain, Taiwan, 
and Turkey; Scheduling of the Final 
Phase of Countervailing Duty and Anti- 
Dumping Duty Investigations 

AGENCY: United States International 
Trade Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Commission hereby gives 
notice of the scheduling of the final 
phase of antidumping and 
countervailing duty investigation Nos. 
701–TA–639–642 and 731–TA–1475– 
1492 (Final) pursuant to the Tariff Act 
of 1930 (‘‘the Act’’) to determine 
whether an industry in the United 
States is materially injured or 
threatened with material injury, or the 
establishment of an industry in the 
United States is materially retarded, by 
reason of imports of common alloy 
aluminum sheet from Bahrain, Brazil, 
Croatia, Egypt, Germany, Greece, India, 
Indonesia, Italy, Korea, Oman, Romania, 
Serbia, Slovenia, South Africa, Spain, 
Taiwan, and Turkey, provided for in 
statistical reporting numbers 
7606.11.3060, 7606.11.6000, 
7606.12.3096, 7606.12.6000, 
7606.91.3095, 7606.91.6095, 
7606.92.3035, and 7606.92.6095 of the 
Harmonized Tariff Schedule of the 
United States, preliminarily determined 
by the Department of Commerce 
(‘‘Commerce’’) to be sold at less-than- 
fair-value, and subsidized by the 
Governments of Bahrain, Brazil, India, 
and Turkey. 
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DATES: October 15, 2020. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Stamen Borisson ((202) 205–3125), 
Office of Investigations, U.S. 
International Trade Commission, 500 E 
Street SW, Washington, DC 20436. 
Hearing-impaired persons can obtain 
information on this matter by contacting 
the Commission’s TDD terminal on 202– 
205–1810. Persons with mobility 
impairments who will need special 
assistance in gaining access to the 
Commission should contact the Office 
of the Secretary at 202–205–2000. 
General information concerning the 
Commission may also be obtained by 
accessing its internet server (https://
www.usitc.gov). The public record for 
these investigations may be viewed on 
the Commission’s electronic docket 
(EDIS) at https://edis.usitc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Scope.—For purposes of these 
investigations, Commerce has defined 
the subject merchandise as ‘‘common 
alloy aluminum sheet, which is a flat- 
rolled aluminum product having a 
thickness of 6.3 mm or less, but greater 
than 0.2 mm, in coils or cut-to-length, 
regardless of width. Common alloy 
sheet within the scope {of these 
investigations} includes both not clad 
aluminum sheet, as well as multi-alloy, 
clad aluminum sheet. With respect to 
not clad aluminum sheet, common alloy 
sheet is manufactured from a 1XXX-, 
3XXX-, or 5XXX-series alloy as 
designated by the Aluminum 
Association. With respect to multi-alloy, 
clad aluminum sheet, common alloy 
sheet is produced from a 3XXX-series 
core, to which cladding layers are 
applied to either one or both sides of the 
core. The use of a proprietary alloy or 
non-proprietary alloy that is not 
specifically registered by the Aluminum 
Association as a discrete 1XXX-, 
3XXX-, or 5XXX-series alloy, but that 
otherwise has a chemistry that is 
consistent with these designations, does 
not remove an otherwise in-scope 
product from the scope . . . Excluded 
from the scope {of these investigations} 
is aluminum can stock, which is 
suitable for use in the manufacture of 
aluminum beverage cans, lids of such 
cans, or tabs used to open such cans.’’ 
For Commerce’s complete scope and 
tariff treatment, see 85 FR 65372, 
October 15, 2020. 

Background.—The final phase of 
these investigations is being scheduled 
pursuant to sections 705(b) and 731(b) 
of the Tariff Act of 1930 (19 U.S.C. 
1671d(b) and 1673d(b)), as a result of 
affirmative preliminary determinations 
by Commerce that imports of common 
alloy aluminum sheet from Bahrain, 

Brazil, Croatia, Egypt, Germany, Greece, 
India, Indonesia, Italy, Korea, Oman, 
Romania, Serbia, Slovenia, South 
Africa, Spain, Taiwan, and Turkey are 
being sold in the United States at less 
than fair value within the meaning of 
§ 733 of the Act (19 U.S.C. 1673b) and 
that certain benefits which constitute 
subsidies within the meaning of § 703 of 
the Act (19 U.S.C. 1671b) are being 
provided to manufacturers, producers, 
or exporters in Bahrain, Brazil, India, 
and Turkey. The investigations were 
requested in petitions filed on March 9, 
2020, by The Aluminum Association 
Common Alloy Aluminum Sheet 
Working Group and its Individual 
Members, Aleris Rolled Products, Inc., 
Beachwood, Ohio; Arconic, Inc., 
Bettendorf, Iowa; Constellium Rolled 
Products Ravenswood, LLC, 
Ravenswood, West Virginia; JW 
Aluminum Company, Daniel Island, 
South Carolina; Novelis Corporation, 
Atlanta, Georgia; and Texarkana 
Aluminum, Inc., Texarkana, Texas. 

For further information concerning 
the conduct of this phase of the 
investigations, hearing procedures, and 
rules of general application, consult the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, part 201, subparts A and B 
(19 CFR part 201), and part 207, 
subparts A and C (19 CFR part 207). 

Participation in the investigations and 
public service list.—Persons, including 
industrial users of the subject 
merchandise and, if the merchandise is 
sold at the retail level, representative 
consumer organizations, wishing to 
participate in the final phase of these 
investigations as parties must file an 
entry of appearance with the Secretary 
to the Commission, as provided in 
§ 201.11 of the Commission’s rules, no 
later than 21 days prior to the hearing 
date specified in this notice. A party 
that filed a notice of appearance during 
the preliminary phase of the 
investigations need not file an 
additional notice of appearance during 
this final phase. The Secretary will 
maintain a public service list containing 
the names and addresses of all persons, 
or their representatives, who are parties 
to the investigations. 

Please note the Secretary’s Office will 
accept only electronic filings during this 
time. Filings must be made through the 
Commission’s Electronic Document 
Information System (EDIS, https://
edis.usitc.gov.) No in-person paper- 
based filings or paper copies of any 
electronic filings will be accepted until 
further notice. 

Limited disclosure of business 
proprietary information (BPI) under an 
administrative protective order (APO) 
and BPI service list.—Pursuant to 

§ 207.7(a) of the Commission’s rules, the 
Secretary will make BPI gathered in the 
final phase of these investigations 
available to authorized applicants under 
the APO issued in the investigations, 
provided that the application is made 
no later than 21 days prior to the 
hearing date specified in this notice. 
Authorized applicants must represent 
interested parties, as defined by 19 
U.S.C. 1677(9), who are parties to the 
investigations. A party granted access to 
BPI in the preliminary phase of the 
investigations need not reapply for such 
access. A separate service list will be 
maintained by the Secretary for those 
parties authorized to receive BPI under 
the APO. 

Staff report.—The prehearing staff 
report in the final phase of these 
investigations will be placed in the 
nonpublic record on February 11, 2021, 
and a public version will be issued 
thereafter, pursuant to § 207.22 of the 
Commission’s rules. 

Hearing.—The Commission will hold 
a hearing in connection with the final 
phase of these investigations beginning 
at 9:30 a.m. on March 2, 2021. 
Information about the place and form of 
the hearing, including about how to 
participate in and/or view the hearing, 
will be posted on the Commission’s 
website at https://www.usitc.gov/ 
calendarpad/calendar.html. Interested 
parties should check the Commission’s 
website periodically for updates. 
Requests to appear at the hearing should 
be filed in writing with the Secretary to 
the Commission on or before February 
22, 2021. A nonparty who has testimony 
that may aid the Commission’s 
deliberations may request permission to 
present a short statement at the hearing. 
All parties and nonparties desiring to 
appear at the hearing and make oral 
presentations should participate in a 
prehearing conference to be held at 9:30 
a.m. on March 1, 2021. Oral testimony 
and written materials to be submitted at 
the public hearing are governed by 
sections 201.6(b)(2), 201.13(f), and 
207.24 of the Commission’s rules. 
Parties must submit any request to 
present a portion of their hearing 
testimony in camera no later than 7 
business days prior to the date of the 
hearing. 

Written submissions.—Each party 
who is an interested party shall submit 
a prehearing brief to the Commission. 
Prehearing briefs must conform with the 
provisions of § 207.23 of the 
Commission’s rules; the deadline for 
filing is February 19, 2021. Parties may 
also file written testimony in connection 
with their presentation at the hearing, as 
provided in § 207.24 of the 
Commission’s rules, and posthearing 
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briefs, which must conform with the 
provisions of § 207.25 of the 
Commission’s rules. The deadline for 
filing posthearing briefs is March 9, 
2021. In addition, any person who has 
not entered an appearance as a party to 
the investigations may submit a written 
statement of information pertinent to 
the subject of the investigations, 
including statements of support or 
opposition to the petition, on or before 
March 9, 2021. On March 24, 2021, the 
Commission will make available to 
parties all information on which they 
have not had an opportunity to 
comment. Parties may submit final 
comments on this information on or 
before March 26, 2021, but such final 
comments must not contain new factual 
information and must otherwise comply 
with § 207.30 of the Commission’s rules. 
All written submissions must conform 
with the provisions of § 201.8 of the 
Commission’s rules; any submissions 
that contain BPI must also conform with 
the requirements of §§ 201.6, 207.3, and 
207.7 of the Commission’s rules. The 
Commission’s Handbook on Filing 
Procedures, available on the 
Commission’s website at https://
www.usitc.gov/documents/handbook_
on_filing_procedures.pdf, elaborates 
upon the Commission’s procedures with 
respect to filings. 

Additional written submissions to the 
Commission, including requests 
pursuant to § 201.12 of the 
Commission’s rules, shall not be 
accepted unless good cause is shown for 
accepting such submissions, or unless 
the submission is pursuant to a specific 
request by a Commissioner or 
Commission staff. 

In accordance with §§ 201.16(c) and 
207.3 of the Commission’s rules, each 
document filed by a party to the 
investigations must be served on all 
other parties to the investigations (as 
identified by either the public or BPI 
service list), and a certificate of service 
must be timely filed. The Secretary will 
not accept a document for filing without 
a certificate of service. 

Authority: These investigations are being 
conducted under authority of title VII of the 
Tariff Act of 1930; this notice is published 
pursuant to § 207.21 of the Commission’s 
rules. 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: November 13, 2020. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2020–25423 Filed 11–17–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

[OMB Number 1125–NEW] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed Collection; 
Comments Requested; FOIAXpress 
Public Access Link 

AGENCY: Executive Office for 
Immigration Review, Department of 
Justice. 
ACTION: 60-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Justice 
(DOJ), Executive Office for Immigration 
Review, will be submitting the 
following information collection request 
to the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 60 days until 
January 19, 2021. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have additional comments 
especially on the estimated public 
burden or associated response time, 
suggestions, or need a copy of the 
proposed information collection 
instrument with instructions or 
additional information, please contact 
Lauren Alder Reid, Assistant Director, 
Office of Policy, Executive Office for 
Immigration Review, 5107 Leesburg 
Pike, Suite 2500, Falls Church, VA 
22041, telephone: (703) 305–0289. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Executive Office for 
Immigration Review, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Evaluate whether and if so how the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected can be 
enhanced; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of this information 
collection: 

1. Type of Information Collection: 
New collection. 

2. The Title of the Form/Collection: 
FOIAXpress Public Access Link. 

3. The agency form number, if any, 
and the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
No agency form, electronic collection. 
The applicable component within the 
Department of Justice is the Office of the 
General Counsel, Executive Office for 
Immigration Review. 

4. Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Members of the public seeking 
to obtain records from the Executive 
Office for Immigration Review (EOIR). 
Abstract: This information collection is 
necessary to communicate with the 
requester community regarding agency 
record requests and deliver agency 
records subject to disclosure to the 
requester community. 

5. An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: It is estimated that 33,984 
respondents will complete FOIA 
requests via FOIAXpress with an 
average of 3 minutes per response. 

6. An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: There are an estimated 1,699 
total annual burden hours associated 
with this collection. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Melody Braswell, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE, 3E.405B, 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: November 13, 2020. 
Melody D. Braswell, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2020–25460 Filed 11–17–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–30–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Employment and Training 
Administration 

Notice of a Change in Status of an 
Extended Benefit (EB) Program for 
Florida, Tennessee, and Wisconsin 

AGENCY: Employment and Training 
Administration, Labor. 
ACTION: Notice. 

This notice announces a change in 
benefit period eligibility under the EB 
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